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request to the contact person listed 
under FOR FURTHER INFORMATION 
CONTACT. 

Electronic Access to This Document: 
The official version of this document is 
the document published in the Federal 
Register. Free internet access to the 
official edition of the Federal Register 
and the Code of Federal Regulations is 
available via the Federal Digital System 
at: www.gpo.gov/fdsys. At this site, you 
can view this document, as well as all 
other documents of this Department 
published in the Federal Register, in 
text or Portable Document Format 
(PDF). To use PDF you must have 
Adobe Acrobat Reader, which is 
available free at this site. 

You may also access documents of the 
Department published in the Federal 
Register by using the article search 
feature at: www.federalregister.gov. 
Specifically, through the advanced 
search feature at this site, you can limit 
your search to documents published by 
the Department. 

Dated: July 27, 2017. 
Kim R. Ford, 
Deputy Assistant Secretary for Career, 
Technical, and Adult Education, delegated 
the duties of the Assistant Secretary for 
Career, Technical, and Adult Education. 
[FR Doc. 2017–16182 Filed 7–31–17; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4000–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

[Docket No. ED–2017–ICCD–0057] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission to the Office of 
Management and Budget for Review 
and Approval; Comment Request; 
Loan Discharge Applications (DL/ 
FFEL/Perkins) 

AGENCY: Federal Student Aid (FSA), 
Department of Education (ED). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, ED is 
proposing an extension of an existing 
information collection. 
DATES: Interested persons are invited to 
submit comments on or before August 
31, 2017. 
ADDRESSES: To access and review all the 
documents related to the information 
collection listed in this notice, please 
use http://www.regulations.gov by 
searching the Docket ID number ED– 
2017–ICCD–0057. Comments submitted 
in response to this notice should be 
submitted electronically through the 
Federal eRulemaking Portal at http://
www.regulations.gov by selecting the 
Docket ID number or via postal mail, 

commercial delivery, or hand delivery. 
Please note that comments submitted by 
fax or email and those submitted after 
the comment period will not be 
accepted. Written requests for 
information or comments submitted by 
postal mail or delivery should be 
addressed to the Director of the 
Information Collection Clearance 
Division, U.S. Department of Education, 
400 Maryland Avenue SW., LBJ, Room 
216–34, Washington, DC 20202–4537. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
specific questions related to collection 
activities, please contact Beth 
Grebeldinger, 202–377–4018. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Department of Education (ED), in 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995 (PRA) (44 U.S.C. 
3506(c)(2)(A)), provides the general 
public and Federal agencies with an 
opportunity to comment on proposed, 
revised, and continuing collections of 
information. This helps the Department 
assess the impact of its information 
collection requirements and minimize 
the public’s reporting burden. It also 
helps the public understand the 
Department’s information collection 
requirements and provide the requested 
data in the desired format. ED is 
soliciting comments on the proposed 
information collection request (ICR) that 
is described below. The Department of 
Education is especially interested in 
public comment addressing the 
following issues: (1) Is this collection 
necessary to the proper functions of the 
Department; (2) will this information be 
processed and used in a timely manner; 
(3) is the estimate of burden accurate; 
(4) how might the Department enhance 
the quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and (5) how 
might the Department minimize the 
burden of this collection on the 
respondents, including through the use 
of information technology. Please note 
that written comments received in 
response to this notice will be 
considered public records. 

Title of Collection: Loan Discharge 
Applications (DL/FFEL/Perkins). 

OMB Control Number: 1845–0058. 
Type of Review: An extension of an 

existing information collection. 
Respondents/Affected Public: 

Individuals or Households. 
Total Estimated Number of Annual 

Responses: 30,051. 
Total Estimated Number of Annual 

Burden Hours: 15,027. 
Abstract: The Department of 

Education is requesting an extension of 
the currently approved information 
collection. This information collection 
is necessary for loan holders in the 

FFEL, Direct Loan, and Perkins Loan 
programs to obtain the information that 
is needed to determine whether a 
borrower qualifies for a closed school or 
false certification loan discharge. The 
loan discharge regulations in all three 
loan programs require borrowers who 
seek discharge of their FFEL, Direct 
Loan, or Perkins Loan program loans to 
request a loan discharge and provide 
their loan holders with certain 
information in writing. This information 
collection includes the following five 
loan discharge applications that are 
used to obtain the information needed 
to determine whether a borrower 
qualifies for a closed school discharge, 
false certification—ATB, false 
certification—disqualifying status, false 
certification—unauthorized signature/ 
unauthorized payment or unpaid refund 
loan discharges. 

Dated: July 27, 2017. 
Kate Mullan, 
Acting Director, Information Collection 
Clearance Division, Office of the Chief Privacy 
Officer, Office of Management. 
[FR Doc. 2017–16147 Filed 7–31–17; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4000–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. CP17–474–000] 

Kinder Morgan Border Pipeline LLC; 
Notice of Application 

Take notice that on July 14, 2017, 
Kinder Morgan Border Pipeline (Kinder 
Morgan), 1001 Louisiana Street, Suite 
1000, Houston, Texas 77002, filed an 
application in Docket No. CP17–474– 
000 under section 3 of the Natural Gas 
Act (NGA), and Part 153 of the 
Commission’s regulations for an 
amendment to the Presidential Permit 
and authorization to Kinder Morgan by 
the Commission under Docket No. 
CP99–564–000. Kinder Morgan is 
seeking authorization to amend its 
current NGA section 3 authorization to 
increase the authorized design capacity 
of its border facilities from 
approximately 300 million cubic feet 
per day (MMcf/d) to 450 MMcf/d, all as 
more fully set forth in the application 
which is on file with the Commission 
and open to public inspection. This 
filing is available for review at the 
Commission in the Public Reference 
Room or may be viewed on the 
Commission’s Web site at http://
www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
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