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further information, contact Kenneth 
Hogan at (202) 502–8434. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E8–31312 Filed 1–2–09; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket Nos. EL03–173–005; EL03–201–007] 

Sempra Energy Trading LLC; Notice of 
Filing 

December 24, 2008. 
Take notice that on December 15, 

2008, Sempra Energy Trading LLC filed 
an amendment to its Agreement and 
Stipulation in compliance with the 
Commission’s November 14, 2008, 
Order Denying Rehearing, Coral Power, 
L.L.C., 125 FERC ¶ 61,176 (2008). 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211, 385.214). 
Protests will be considered by the 
Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed on or before the 
comment date. Anyone filing a motion 
to intervene or protest must serve a copy 
of that document on the Applicant and 
all the parties in this proceeding. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive e-mail notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please e-mail 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 
on January 5, 2009. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E8–31311 Filed 1–2–09; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Project No. 2082–027; Oregon and 
California] 

PacifiCorp; Notice of Public Meetings 
Concerning the Relicensing of the 
Klamath Hydroelectric Project 

December 24, 2008. 
On February 25, 2004, PacifiCorp 

filed an application to relicense its 169- 
MW Klamath Hydroelectric Project. In 
November 2007, Commission staff 
issued its final Environmental Impact 
Statement, in which it analyzed a 
number of alternatives for relicensing 
the project. To date, neither the states of 
Oregon nor California have acted on 
PacifiCorp’s requests for certification 
under section 401 of the Clean Water 
Act, precluding Commission action on 
the license application. 

On November 24, 2008, PacifiCorp 
filed an Agreement in Principle, 
executed among PacifiCorp; the U.S. 
Departments of Agriculture, Commerce, 
and the Interior; and the States of 
California and Oregon, for the continued 
operation and potential future removal 
of Klamath Project dams. 

The Agreement in Principle is 
complex and may have a significant 
effect on the analysis of PacifiCorp’s 
relicense application. The compatibility 
of the Agreement with the licensing 
process and the appropriate procedures 
for the continued processing of the 
application will be discussed. 
Commission staff will hold two public 
meetings to obtain public comment on 
these matters. The meetings will be held 
as follows. 

Date: Thursday, January 29, 2009. 
Time: 1 p.m. and 7 p.m. (PST). 
Place: Best Western Miner’s Inn. 
Address: 122 East Miner Street, Yreka, 

California. 
For further information, please 

contact John Mudre at e-mail address 
john.mudre@ferc.gov or by telephone at 
(202) 502–8902. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E8–31308 Filed 1–2–09; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[EPA–HQ–OPPT–2008–0908; FRL–8397–3] 

Certain New Chemicals; Receipt and 
Status Information 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: Section 5 of the Toxic 
Substances Control Act (TSCA) requires 
any person who intends to manufacture 
(defined by statute to include import) a 
new chemical (i.e., a chemical not on 
the TSCA Inventory) to notify EPA and 
comply with the statutory provisions 
pertaining to the manufacture of new 
chemicals. Under sections 5(d)(2) and 
5(d)(3) of TSCA, EPA is required to 
publish a notice of receipt of a 
premanufacture notice (PMN) or an 
application for a test marketing 
exemption (TME), and to publish 
periodic status reports on the chemicals 
under review and the receipt of notices 
of commencement to manufacture those 
chemicals. This status report, which 
covers the period from November 17, 
2008 through November 28, 2008, 
consists of the PMNs pending or 
expired, and the notices of 
commencement to manufacture a new 
chemical that the Agency has received 
under TSCA section 5 during this time 
period. 
DATES: Comments identified by the 
specific PMN number or TME number, 
must be received on or before February 
4, 2009. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your comments, 
identified by docket identification (ID) 
number EPA–HQ–OPPT–2008–0908, by 
one of the following methods: 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: http:// 
www.regulations.gov. Follow the on-line 
instructions for submitting comments. 

• Mail: Document Control Office 
(7407M), Office of Pollution Prevention 
and Toxics (OPPT), Environmental 
Protection Agency, 1200 Pennsylvania 
Ave., NW., Washington, DC 20460– 
0001. 

• Hand Delivery: OPPT Document 
Control Office (DCO), EPA East Bldg., 
Rm. 6428, 1201 Constitution Ave., NW., 
Washington, DC. Attention: Docket ID 
Number EPA–HQ–OPPT–2008–0908. 
The DCO is open from 8 a.m. to 4 p.m., 
Monday through Friday, excluding legal 
holidays. The telephone number for the 
DCO is (202) 564–8930. Such deliveries 
are only accepted during the DCO’s 
normal hours of operation, and special 
arrangements should be made for 
deliveries of boxed information. 

Instructions: Direct your comments to 
docket ID number EPA–HQ–OPPT– 
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