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program is intended to provide funding 
to providers of advanced 
communications service for the 
removal, replacement and disposal of 
certain communications equipment and 
services that poses an unacceptable 
national security risk (i.e., covered 
equipment and services) from their 
networks. The Commission has 
designated two entities—Huawei 
Technologies Company (Huawei) and 
ZTE Corporation (ZTE), along with their 
affiliates, subsidiaries, and parents—as 
covered companies posing such a 
national security threat. See Protecting 
Against National Security Threats to the 
Communications Supply Chain Through 
FCC Programs—Huawei Designation, PS 
Docket No. 19–351, Memorandum 
Opinion and Order, 35 FCC Rcd 14435 
(2020); Protecting Against National 
Security Threats to the Communications 
Supply Chain Through FCC Programs— 
ZTE Designation, PS Docket No. 19–352, 
Memorandum Opinion and Order, DA 
20–1399 (PSHSB rel. Nov. 24, 2020). 

On December 10, 2020, the 
Commission adopted the Second Report 
and Order implementing the Secure 
Networks Act, which contained new 
information collection requirements. 
See Protecting Against National Security 
Threats to the Communications Supply 
Chain Through FCC Programs, WC 
Docket No. 18–89, Second Report and 
Order, 35 FCC Rcd 14284 (2020) 
(Second Report and Order). These 
requirements allow the Commission to 
receive, review and make eligibility 
determinations and funding decisions 
on applications to participate in the 
Reimbursement Program that are filed 
by certain providers of advanced 
communications service. These 
information collection requirements 
also assist the Commission in 
processing funding disbursement 
requests and in monitoring and 
furthering compliance with applicable 
program requirements to protect against 
waste, fraud, and abuse. Participation in 
the Reimbursement Program is 
voluntary, but compliance with the 
information collection requirements is 
required to obtain Reimbursement 
Program support. 

On August 3, 2021, the Wireline 
Competition Bureau (Bureau) released a 
Public Notice adopting procedures for 
filing and processing applications 
submitted for the Reimbursement 
Program. These procedures largely 
tracked the procedural rules previously 
adopted by the Commission in the 
Second Report and Order, but also 
adopted a new requirement that 
Reimbursement Program participants 
notify the Commission of changes in 
ownership, to ensure accurate 

information is on file for participants 
and to help protect the Reimbursement 
Program against waste, fraud, and abuse. 

This submission proposes to revise 
this currently-approved collection by 
deleting an existing question on FCC 
Form 5640 and replacing it with a more 
detailed query. The new question will 
ask program participants to describe in 
detail how they have spent 
Reimbursement Program funds. The 
addition of this question will allow the 
Bureau to satisfy its statutory 
obligations to collect information about 
how Reimbursement Program funds 
have been spent, including detailed 
accounting of the covered 
communications equipment and 
services permanently removed and 
disposed of, and the replacement 
equipment or services purchased, 
rented, leased, or otherwise obtained 
using Reimbursement Program funds, as 
well as to combat waste, fraud, and 
abuse, as required under the Secure 
Networks Act. The Bureau determined 
that FCC Form 5640 required this 
revision in order to elicit the 
information necessary for the Bureau to 
better satisfy its statutory obligations. 

This proposed addition will increase 
the information collected, and will 
impose an additional burden on 
respondents, which will vary with the 
number of invoices respondents submit 
during the relevant reporting period. 
However, this submission also reflects a 
decrease in the estimated total annual 
responses, total annual burden hours, 
and total annual costs for this 
collection. These adjustments are due to 
a reduction of the number of 
respondents for several categories of 
information to be collected on Form 
5640, based on the Bureau’s experience 
with the Reimbursement Program since 
this collection was first approved. 
Federal Communications Commission. 
Marlene Dortch, 
Secretary, Office of the Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2023–08046 Filed 4–14–23; 8:45 am] 
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FEDERAL DEPOSIT INSURANCE 
CORPORATION 

FDIC Systemic Resolution Advisory 
Committee; Notice of Charter Renewal 

AGENCY: Federal Deposit Insurance 
Corporation (FDIC). 
ACTION: Notice of renewal. 

SUMMARY: Pursuant to the provisions of 
the Federal Advisory Committee Act 
(FACA), and after consultation with the 
General Services Administration, the 

Chairman of the Federal Deposit 
Insurance Corporation has determined 
that renewal of the FDIC Systemic 
Resolution Advisory Committee 
(Committee) is in the public interest in 
connection with the performance of 
duties imposed upon the FDIC by law. 
The Committee has been a successful 
undertaking by the FDIC and has 
provided valuable feedback to the 
agency on a broad range of issues 
regarding the resolution of systemically 
important financial companies (covered 
companies) pursuant to the Dodd-Frank 
Wall Street Reform and Consumer 
Protection Act. The Committee will 
continue to provide advice and 
recommendations on the effects on 
financial stability and economic 
conditions of a covered company’s 
failure and how they arise, the effects on 
markets and stakeholders of the 
activities of a covered company, market 
understanding of the structures and 
tools available to the FDIC to facilitate 
an orderly resolution of a covered 
company, the application of such tools 
to nonbank financial entities, 
international coordination of planning 
and preparation for the resolution of 
internationally active covered 
companies, and harmonization of 
resolution regimes across international 
boundaries. The structure and 
responsibilities of the Committee are 
unchanged from when it was originally 
established in November 2011. The 
Committee will continue to operate in 
accordance with the provisions of the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Debra A. Decker, Committee 
Management Officer of the FDIC, at 
(202) 898–8748. 

Authority: 5 U.S.C. 1001 et seq. 

Dated: April 11, 2023. 
Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation. 
James P. Sheesley, 
Assistant Executive Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2023–07993 Filed 4–14–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6714–01–P 

FEDERAL MARITIME COMMISSION 

Sunshine Act Meetings 

TIME AND DATE: April 19, 2023; 10:00 
a.m. 
PLACE: This meeting will be held at the 
Federal Maritime Commission at the 
address below and also streamed live at 
Federal Maritime Commission’s 
YouTube Channel. 
Federal Maritime Commission, 800 

North Capitol St. NW, 1st Floor 
Hearing Room, Washington, DC 20573 
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