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In contrast to EPA’s electronic public 
docket, EPA’s electronic mail (email) 
system is not an ‘‘anonymous access’’ 
system. If you send an email comment 
directly to the Docket without going 
through http://www.regulations.gov, 
your email address is automatically 
captured and included as part of the 
comment that is placed in the official 
public docket, and made available in 
EPA’s electronic public docket. 

Kevin McLean, 
Acting Associate General Counsel. 
[FR Doc. 2011–31028 Filed 12–1–11; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS 
COMMISSION 

[CC Docket No. 92–237; DA 11–1917] 

Next Meeting of the North American 
Numbering Council 

AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: In this document, the 
Commission released a public notice 
announcing the meeting and agenda of 
the North American Numbering Council 
(NANC). The intended effect of this 
action is to make the public aware of the 
NANC’s next meeting and agenda. 
DATES: Thursday, December 15, 2011, 
9:30 a.m. 
ADDRESSES: Requests to make an oral 
statement or provide written comments 
to the NANC should be sent to Deborah 
Blue, Competition Policy Division, 
Wireline Competition Bureau, Federal 
Communications Commission, Portals 
II, 445 Twelfth Street SW., Room 5– 
C162, Washington, DC 20554. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Deborah Blue, Special Assistant to the 
Designated Federal Officer (DFO) at 
(202) 418–1466 or 
Deborah.Blue@fcc.gov. The fax number 
is: (202) 418–1413. The TTY number is: 
(202) 418–0484. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: This is a 
summary of the Commission’s 
document in CC Docket No. 92–237, DA 
11–1917 released November 18, 2011. 
The complete text in this document is 
available for public inspection and 
copying during normal business hours 
in the FCC Reference Information 
Center, Portals II, 445 12th Street SW., 
Room CY–A257, Washington, DC 20554. 
The document my also be purchased 
from the Commission’s duplicating 
contractor, Best Copy and Printing, Inc., 
445 12th Street SW., Room CY–B402, 
Washington, DC 20554, telephone (800) 

378–3160 or (202) 863–2893, facsimile 
(202) 863–2898, or via the Internet at 
http://www.bcpiweb.com. It is available 
on the Commission’s Web site at http:// 
www.fcc.gov. 

The North American Numbering 
Council (NANC) has scheduled a 
meeting to be held Thursday, December 
15, 2011, from 9:30 a.m. until 2 p.m. 
The meeting will be held at the Federal 
Communications Commission, Portals 
II, 445 Twelfth Street, SW., Room TW– 
C305, Washington, DC. This meeting is 
open to members of the general public. 
The FCC will attempt to accommodate 
as many participants as possible. The 
public may submit written statements to 
the NANC, which must be received two 
business days before the meeting. In 
addition, oral statements at the meeting 
by parties or entities not represented on 
the NANC will be permitted to the 
extent time permits. Such statements 
will be limited to five minutes in length 
by any one party or entity, and requests 
to make an oral statement must be 
received two business days before the 
meeting. 

People with Disabilities: To request 
materials in accessible formats for 
people with disabilities (braille, large 
print, electronic files, audio format), 
send an email to fcc504@fcc.gov or call 
the Consumer and Governmental Affairs 
Bureau at (202) 418–0530 (voice), (202) 
418–0432 (tty). Reasonable 
accommodations for people with 
disabilities are available upon request. 
Include a description of the 
accommodation you will need, 
including as much detail as you can. 
Also include a way we can contact you 
if we need more information. Please 
allow at least five days advance notice; 
last minute requests will be accepted, 
but may be impossible to fill. 

Proposed Agenda: Thursday, 
December 15, 2011, 9:30 a.m.* 

1. Announcements and Recent News. 
2. Approval of Transcript—Meeting of 

September 15, 2011. 
3. Report of the North American 

Numbering Plan Administrator 
(NANPA). 

4. Report of the National Thousands 
Block Pooling Administrator (PA). 

5. Report of the Numbering Oversight 
Working Group (NOWG). 

6. Report of the North American 
Numbering Plan Billing and Collection 
(NANP B&C) Agent. 

7. Report of the Billing and Collection 
Working Group (B&C WG). 

8. Report of the North American 
Portability Management LLC (NAPM 
LLC). 

9. Report of the LNPA Selection 
Working Group (SWG). 

10. Report of the Local Number 
Portability Administration (LNPA) 
Working Group. 

11. Status of the Industry Numbering 
Committee (INC) activities. 

12. Report of the Future of Numbering 
Working Group (FoN WG). 

13. Summary of Action Items. 
14. Public Comments and 

Participation (5 minutes per speaker). 
15. Other Business. 
Adjourn no later than 2 p.m. 
* The Agenda may be modified at the 

discretion of the NANC Chairman with 
the approval of the DFO. 
Federal Communications Commission. 
Marilyn Jones, 
Attorney, Wireline Competition Bureau. 
[FR Doc. 2011–31041 Filed 11–29–11; 4:15 pm] 

BILLING CODE 6712–01–P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Announcement of Board 
Approval Under Delegated Authority 
and Submission to OMB 

AGENCY: Board of Governors of the 
Federal Reserve System. 
SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given of the 
final approval of a proposed information 
collection by the Board of Governors of 
the Federal Reserve System (Board) 
under OMB delegated authority, as per 
5 CFR 1320.16 (OMB Regulations on 
Controlling Paperwork Burdens on the 
Public). Board-approved collections of 
information are incorporated into the 
official OMB inventory of currently 
approved collections of information. 
Copies of the Paperwork Reduction Act 
Submission, supporting statements and 
approved collection of information 
instrument(s) are placed into OMB’s 
public docket files. The Federal Reserve 
may not conduct or sponsor, and the 
respondent is not required to respond 
to, an information collection that has 
been extended, revised, or implemented 
on or after October 1, 1995, unless it 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Federal Reserve Board Clearance 
Officer—Cynthia Ayouch—Division of 
Research and Statistics, Board of 
Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, Washington, DC 20551 (202) 
452–3829). Telecommunications Device 
for the Deaf (TDD) users may contact 
(202) 263–4869), Board of Governors of 
the Federal Reserve System, 
Washington, DC 20551. 

OMB Desk Officer—Shagufta 
Ahmed—Office of Information and 
Regulatory Affairs, Office of 
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Management and Budget, New 
Executive Office Building, Room 10235, 
725 17th Street NW., Washington, DC 
20503. 

Final approval under OMB delegated 
authority of the extension for three 
years, with revision, of the following 
report: 

Report title: Recordkeeping and 
Disclosure Requirements Associated 
with Loans Secured by Real Estate 
Located in Flood Hazard Areas Pursuant 
to Section 208.25 of Regulation H. 

Agency form number: Reg H–2. 
OMB control number: 7100–0280. 
Frequency: Event-generated. 
Reporters: State member banks. 
Estimated annual reporting hours: 

Notice of special flood hazards to 
borrowers and servicers, 5,768 hours; 
notice to FEMA of servicer, 5,768 hours; 
notice to FEMA of change of servicer, 
2,884 hours; notice to borrowers of 
lapsed mandated flood insurance, 1,167 
hours; purchase flood insurance on the 
borrower’s behalf, 824 hours; notice to 
borrowers of lapsed mandated flood 
insurance due to remapping, 549 hours; 
purchase flood insurance on the 
borrower’s behalf due to remapping, 824 
hours; and retention of standard FEMA 
form, 14,420 hours. 

Estimated average hours per response: 
Notice of special flood hazards to 
borrowers and servicers, 5 minutes; 
notice to FEMA of servicer, 5 minutes; 
notice to FEMA of change of servicer, 5 
minutes; notice to borrowers of lapsed 
mandated flood insurance, 5 minutes; 
purchase flood insurance on the 
borrower’s behalf, 15 minutes; notice to 
borrowers of lapsed mandated flood 
insurance due to remapping, 5 minutes; 
purchase flood insurance on the 
borrower’s behalf due to remapping, 15 
minutes; and retention of standard 
FEMA form, 2.5 minutes. 

Number of respondents: 824. 
General description of report: This 

information collection is mandatory 
pursuant to Section 12 of the Flood 
Disaster Protection Act of 1973, as 
amended (42 U.S.C. 4012a) and section 
1364 of the National Flood Insurance 
Act of 1968, as amended (42 U.S.C. 
4104a). Since the Federal Reserve does 
not collect any information associated 
with Reg H–2, confidentiality would not 
generally be an issue. However, 
confidentiality issues may arise should 
the records required by the Reg H–2 
requirements come into possession of 
the Board during an examination of a 
state member bank, those records would 
be protected from disclosure by 
exemption 8 of the Freedom of 
Information Act. (5 U.S.C. 552(b)(8)). 

Abstract: Regulation H requires state 
member banks to notify a borrower and 

servicer when loans secured by real 
estate are determined to be in a special 
flood hazard area and notify them 
whether flood insurance is available; 
notify FEMA of the identity of, and any 
change of, the servicer of a loan secured 
by real estate in a special flood hazard 
area; and retain a completed copy of the 
Standard Flood Hazard Determination 
Form used to determine whether 
property securing a loan is in a special 
flood hazard area. 

Current Actions: On September 19, 
2011 the Federal Reserve published a 
notice in the Federal Register (76 FR 
58003) requesting public comment for 
60 days on the extension, with revision, 
of the Reg H–2 information collection. 
The comment period for this notice 
expired on November 18, 2011. The 
Federal Reserve did not receive any 
comments. The revisions will be 
implemented as proposed. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, November 29, 2011. 
Jennifer J. Johnson, 
Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2011–30991 Filed 12–1–11; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6210–01–P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Change in Bank Control Notices; 
Acquisitions of Shares of a Bank or 
Bank Holding Company 

The notificants listed below have 
applied under the Change in Bank 
Control Act (12 U.S.C. 1817(j)) and 
§ 225.41 of the Board’s Regulation Y (12 
CFR 225.41) to acquire shares of a bank 
or bank holding company. The factors 
that are considered in acting on the 
notices are set forth in paragraph 7 of 
the Act (12 U.S.C. 1817(j)(7)). 

The notices are available for 
immediate inspection at the Federal 
Reserve Bank indicated. The notices 
also will be available for inspection at 
the offices of the Board of Governors. 
Interested persons may express their 
views in writing to the Reserve Bank 
indicated for that notice or to the offices 
of the Board of Governors. Comments 
must be received not later than 
December 16, 2011. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of 
Minneapolis (Jacqueline G. King, 
Community Affairs Officer) 90 
Hennepin Avenue, Minneapolis, 
Minnesota 55480–0291: 

1. Colleen S. Yunker Revocable Trust, 
Sturgis, Michigan (trustees Jack Steele, 
Wolsey, South Dakota, and Sturgis Bank 
and Trust Company, Sturgis, Michigan), 
to retain voting shares of Leackco Bank 
Holding Company, Inc., Wolsey, South 
Dakota, and thereby indirectly retain 

voting shares of American Bank & Trust, 
Wessington Springs, South Dakota. 

2. Eugene Joseph Welle Irrevocable 
HJW Trust, Hugh J. Welle, Trustee, and 
Paulette E. Welle, all of Bemidji, 
Minnesota; to join the Welle Family 
Shareholder Group, which controls 
voting shares of First Bemidji Holding 
Company, and thereby indirectly 
controls voting shares of The First 
National Bank of Bemidji, both in 
Bemidji, Minnesota. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, November 28, 2011. 
Robert deV. Frierson, 
Deputy Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2011–30949 Filed 12–1–11; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6210–01–P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Formations of, Acquisitions by, and 
Mergers of Bank Holding Companies 

The companies listed in this notice 
have applied to the Board for approval, 
pursuant to the Bank Holding Company 
Act of 1956 (12 U.S.C. 1841 et seq.) 
(BHC Act), Regulation Y (12 CFR part 
225), and all other applicable statutes 
and regulations to become a bank 
holding company and/or to acquire the 
assets or the ownership of, control of, or 
the power to vote shares of a bank or 
bank holding company and all of the 
banks and nonbanking companies 
owned by the bank holding company, 
including the companies listed below. 

The applications listed below, as well 
as other related filings required by the 
Board, are available for immediate 
inspection at the Federal Reserve Bank 
indicated. The application also will be 
available for inspection at the offices of 
the Board of Governors. Interested 
persons may express their views in 
writing on the standards enumerated in 
the BHC Act (12 U.S.C. 1842(c)). If the 
proposal also involves the acquisition of 
a nonbanking company, the review also 
includes whether the acquisition of the 
nonbanking company complies with the 
standards in section 4 of the BHC Act 
(12 U.S.C. 1843). Unless otherwise 
noted, nonbanking activities will be 
conducted throughout the United States. 

Unless otherwise noted, comments 
regarding each of these applications 
must be received at the Reserve Bank 
indicated or the offices of the Board of 
Governors not later than December 27, 
2011. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of Atlanta 
(Chapelle Davis, Assistant Vice 
President) 1000 Peachtree Street NE., 
Atlanta, Georgia 30309: 

1. TGR Financial, Inc., Naples, 
Florida; to become a bank holding 
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