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is hereby authorized to issue securities
and assume obligations and liabilities as
guarantor, indorser, surety or otherwise
in respect of any security of another
person; provided that such issue or
assumption is for some lawful object
within the corporate purposes of
Richmond County, compatible with the
public interest, and reasonably
necessary or appropriate for such
purposes.

(G) The Commission reserves the right
to modify this order to require a further
showing that neither public nor private
interests will be adversely affected by
continued Commission approval of
Richmond County’s issuances of
securities or assumptions of liabilities
* * *.

Notice is hereby given that the
deadline for filing motions to intervene
or protests, as set forth above, is August
27, 2001.

Copies of the full text of the Order are
available from the Commission’s Public
Reference Branch, 888 First Street, N.E.,
Washington, DC 20426. The Order may
also be viewed on the on the web at
http://www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘RIMS’’
link, select ‘‘Docket#’’ and follow the
instructions (call 202–208–2222 for
assistance). Comments, protests and
interventions may be filed electronically
via the Internet in lieu of paper. See, 18
CFR 385.2001(a)(1)(iii) and the
instructions on the Commission’s web
site under the ‘‘e-Filing’’ link.

David P. Boergers,
Secretary.
[FR Doc. 01–19444 Filed 8–2–01; 8:45 am]
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY

Federal Energy Regulatory
Commission

[Docket No. RP01–488–000]

Steuben Gas Storage Company, Notice
of Tariff Filing

July 30, 2001.
Take notice that on July 18, 2001,

Steuben Gas Storage Company
(Steuben), tendered for filing as part of
its FERC Gas Tariff, Original Volume
No. 1, Third Revised Sheet No. 1 and
Original Sheet No. 156B, with an
effective date of August 20, 2001.

Steuben states that the revised tariff
sheets are being filed to modify
Steuben’s tariff to provide for a general
waiver of the ‘‘shipper must have title
rule’’ in the event that Steuben is
transporting gas or storing gas for others
on acquired off-system capacity and to
include a general statement that Steuben

will only transport or store gas for
others using off-system capacity
pursuant to its existing Tariff and rates.

Steuben states that copies of the filing
has been mailed to each of Steuben’s
customers and affected state regulatory
commission.

Any person desiring to be heard or to
protest said filing should file a motion
to intervene or a protest with the
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission,
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC
20426, in accordance with Sections
385.214 or 385.211 of the Commission’s
Rules and Regulations. All such motions
or protests must be filed in accordance
with Section 154.210 of the
Commission’s Regulations. Protests will
be considered by the Commission in
determining the appropriate action to be
taken, but will not serve to make
protestants parties to the proceedings.
Any person wishing to become a party
must file a motion to intervene. Copies
of this filing are on file with the
Commission and are available for public
inspection. This filing may also be
viewed on the web at http://
www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘RIMS’’ link,
select ‘‘Docket#’’ and follow the
instructions (call 202–208–2222 for
assistance). Comments, protests and
interventions may be filed electronically
via the Internet in lieu of paper. See, 18
CFR 385.2001(a)(1)(iii) and the
instructions on the Commission’s web
site under the ‘‘e-Filing’’ link.

David P. Boergers,
Secretary.
[FR Doc. 01–19450 Filed 8–2–01; 8:45 am]
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY

Federal Energy Regulatory
Commission

[Docket No. RP01–488–000]

Steuben Gas Storage Company; Notice
of Tariff Filing

July 31, 2001.
Take notice that on July 18, 2001,

Steuben Gas Storage Company
(Steuben), 1001 tendered for filing as
part of its FERC Gas Tariff, Original
Volume No. 1, Third Revised Sheet No.
1 and Original Sheet no. 156B. Steuben
requests that this revised tariff sheet and
this original tariff sheet be made
effective August 20, 2001.

Steuben states that the revised tariff
sheets are being filed to modify
Steuben’s tariff to provide for a general
waiver of the ‘‘shipper must have title
rule’’ in the event that Steuben is
transporting gas or storing gas for others

on acquired off-system capacity and to
include a general statement that Steuben
will only transport or store gas for
others using off-system capacity
pursuant to its existing Tariff and rates.

Any person desiring to be heard or to
protest this filing should file a motion
to intervene or protest with the Federal
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888
first Street, N.E., Washington, D.C.
20426, in accordance with 18 CFR
385.211 and 385.214 of the
Commission’s Rules and Regulations.
All such motions or protests must be
filed as provided in Section 154.210 of
the Commission’s Regulations. Protests
will be considered by the Commission
in determining the appropriate action to
be taken, but will not serve to make
protestants parties to this proceeding.
Any person wishing to become a party
must file a motion to intervene. Copies
of this filing are on file with the
Commission and available for public
inspection. This filing may be viewed
on the Commission’s web site at
http://www.ferc.fed.gov using the
‘‘RIMS’’ link, select ‘‘Docket #’’ and
follow the instructions ((202) 208–2222
for assistance). Comments, protests and
interventions may be filed electronically
via the Internet in lieu of paper. See, 18
CFR 385.2001(a)(1)(iii) and the
instructions on the Commission’s web
site under the ‘‘e-Filing’’ link.

David P. Boergers,
Secretary.
[FR Doc. 01–19545 Filed 8–2–01; 8:45 am]
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY

Office of Energy Efficiency and
Renewable Energy

Energy Conservation Program for
Consumer Products: Granting of the
Application for Interim Waiver and
Publishing of the Petition for Waiver of
Electrolux Home Products from the
DOE Refrigerator and Refrigerator-
Freezer Test Procedure (Case No. RF–
005)

AGENCY: Office of Energy Efficiency and
Renewable Energy, Department of
Energy.
ACTION: Notice.

SUMMARY: Today’s notice grants an
Interim Waiver to Electrolux Home
Products (Electrolux) from the existing
Department of Energy (DOE or
Department) refrigerator test procedure
regarding long-time automatic defrost
for the company’s variable defrost
control products.
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