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submissions may be made to the contact 
person on or before April 2, 2014. Oral 
presentations from the public will be 
scheduled between approximately 1 
p.m. and 1:30 p.m. on April 16; between 
approximately 1 p.m. and 1:30 p.m. on 
April 17; and between approximately 
11:30 a.m. and 12 p.m. on April 18. 
Those individuals interested in making 
formal oral presentations should notify 
the contact person and submit a brief 
statement of the general nature of the 
evidence or arguments they wish to 
present, the names and addresses of 
proposed participants, and an 
indication of the approximate time 
requested to make their presentation on 
or before March 25, 2014. Time allotted 
for each presentation may be limited. If 
the number of registrants requesting to 
speak is greater than can be reasonably 
accommodated during the scheduled 
open public hearing session, FDA may 
conduct a lottery to determine the 
speakers for the scheduled open public 
hearing session. The contact person will 
notify interested persons regarding their 
request to speak by March 24, 2014. 

Persons attending FDA’s advisory 
committee meetings are advised that the 
Agency is not responsible for providing 
access to electrical outlets. 

FDA welcomes the attendance of the 
public at its advisory committee 
meetings and will make every effort to 
accommodate persons with physical 
disabilities or special needs. If you 
require special accommodations due to 
a disability, please contact Caryn Cohen 
at least 7 days in advance of the 
meeting. 

FDA is committed to the orderly 
conduct of its advisory committee 
meetings. Please visit our Web site at 
http://www.fda.gov/
AdvisoryCommittees/
AboutAdvisoryCommittees/
ucm111462.htm for procedures on 
public conduct during advisory 
committee meetings. 

Notice of this meeting is given under 
the Federal Advisory Committee Act (5 
U.S.C. app. 2). 

Dated: February 18, 2014. 

Leslie Kux, 
Assistant Commissioner for Policy. 
[FR Doc. 2014–03705 Filed 2–20–14; 8:45 am] 
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This notice announces a forthcoming 
meeting of a public advisory committee 
of the Food and Drug Administration 
(FDA). The meeting will be open to the 
public. 

Name of Committee: Endocrinologic 
and Metabolic Drugs Advisory 
Committee. 

General Function of the Committee: 
To provide advice and 
recommendations to the Agency on 
FDA’s regulatory issues. 

Date and Time: The meeting will be 
held on April 1, 2014, from 8 a.m. to 5 
p.m. 

Location: The Marriott Inn and 
Conference Center, University of 
Maryland University College (UMUC), 
Potomac Ballroom, 3501 University 
Blvd. East, Hyattsville, MD 20783. The 
conference center’s telephone number is 
301–985–7300. 

Contact Person: Karen Abraham- 
Burrell, Center for Drug Evaluation and 
Research, Food and Drug 
Administration, 10903 New Hampshire 
Ave., Bldg. 31, Rm. 2417, Silver Spring, 
MD 20993–0002, 301–796–9001, FAX: 
301–847–8533, email: EMDAC@
fda.hhs.gov, or FDA Advisory 
Committee Information Line, 1–800– 
741–8138 (301–443–0572 in the 
Washington, DC area). A notice in the 
Federal Register about last minute 
modifications that impact a previously 
announced advisory committee meeting 
cannot always be published quickly 
enough to provide timely notice. 
Therefore, you should always check the 
Agency’s Web site at http://
www.fda.gov/AdvisoryCommittees/
default.htm and scroll down to the 
appropriate advisory committee meeting 
link, or call the advisory committee 
information line to learn about possible 
modifications before coming to the 
meeting. 

Agenda: The committee will discuss 
new drug application (NDA) 22–472, 
proposed trade name AFREZZA 
(TECHNOSPHERE Insulin Inhalation 
System), 3 unit and 6 unit cartridges for 
oral inhalation, manufactured by 
MannKind Corporation. The proposed 
indication (use) for this application is to 
improve glycemic control in adult 

patients with type 1 or type 2 diabetes 
mellitus. 

FDA intends to make background 
material available to the public no later 
than 2 business days before the meeting. 
If FDA is unable to post the background 
material on its Web site prior to the 
meeting, the background material will 
be made publicly available at the 
location of the advisory committee 
meeting, and the background material 
will be posted on FDA’s Web site after 
the meeting. Background material is 
available at http://www.fda.gov/
AdvisoryCommittees/Calendar/
default.htm. Scroll down to the 
appropriate advisory committee meeting 
link. 

Procedure: Interested persons may 
present data, information, or views, 
orally or in writing, on issues pending 
before the committee. Written 
submissions may be made to the contact 
person on or before March 18, 2014. 
Oral presentations from the public will 
be scheduled between approximately 1 
p.m. and 2 p.m. Those individuals 
interested in making formal oral 
presentations should notify the contact 
person and submit a brief statement of 
the general nature of the evidence or 
arguments they wish to present, the 
names and addresses of proposed 
participants, and an indication of the 
approximate time requested to make 
their presentation on or before March 
10, 2014. Time allotted for each 
presentation may be limited. If the 
number of registrants requesting to 
speak is greater than can be reasonably 
accommodated during the scheduled 
open public hearing session, FDA may 
conduct a lottery to determine the 
speakers for the scheduled open public 
hearing session. The contact person will 
notify interested persons regarding their 
request to speak by March 11, 2014. 

Persons attending FDA’s advisory 
committee meetings are advised that the 
Agency is not responsible for providing 
access to electrical outlets. 

FDA welcomes the attendance of the 
public at its advisory committee 
meetings and will make every effort to 
accommodate persons with physical 
disabilities or special needs. If you 
require special accommodations due to 
a disability, please contact Karen 
Abraham-Burrell at least 7 days in 
advance of the meeting. 

FDA is committed to the orderly 
conduct of its advisory committee 
meetings. Please visit our Web site at 
http://www.fda.gov/
AdvisoryCommittees/
AboutAdvisoryCommittees/
ucm111462.htm for procedures on 
public conduct during advisory 
committee meetings. 
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Notice of this meeting is given under 
the Federal Advisory Committee Act (5 
U.S.C. app. 2). 

Dated: February 18, 2014. 
Leslie Kux, 
Assistant Commissioner for Policy. 
[FR Doc. 2014–03704 Filed 2–20–14; 8:45 am] 
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SUMMARY: The Food and Drug 
Administration’s (FDA’s) Center for 
Drug Evaluation and Research (CDER) is 
announcing the continuation of the 
Regulatory Project Management Site 
Tours and Regulatory Interaction 
Program (the Site Tours Program). The 
purpose of this document is to invite 
pharmaceutical companies interested in 
participating in this program to contact 
CDER. 
DATES: Pharmaceutical companies may 
submit proposed agendas to the Agency 
by April 22, 2014. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Dan 
Brum, Center for Drug Evaluation and 
Research, Food and Drug 
Administration, 10903 New Hampshire 
Ave., Bldg. 22, Rm. 5480, Silver Spring, 
MD 20993–0002, 301–796–0578, 
dan.brum@fda.hhs.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Background 

An important part of CDER’s 
commitment to make safe and effective 
drugs available to all Americans is 
optimizing the efficiency and quality of 
the drug review process. To support this 
primary goal, CDER has initiated 
various training and development 
programs to promote high performance 
in its regulatory project management 
staff. CDER seeks to significantly 
enhance review efficiency and review 
quality by providing the staff with a 
better understanding of the 
pharmaceutical industry and its 
operations. To this end, CDER is 
continuing its training program to give 
regulatory project managers the 
opportunity to tour pharmaceutical 
facilities. The goals are to provide the 
following: (1) Firsthand exposure to 

industry’s drug development processes, 
and (2) a venue for sharing information 
about project management procedures 
(but not drug-specific information) with 
industry representatives. 

II. The Site Tours Program 

In this program, over a 2- to 3-day 
period, small groups (five or less) of 
regulatory project managers, including a 
senior level regulatory project manager, 
can observe operations of 
pharmaceutical manufacturing and/or 
packaging facilities, pathology/
toxicology laboratories, and regulatory 
affairs operations. Neither this tour nor 
any part of the program is intended as 
a mechanism to inspect, assess, judge, 
or perform a regulatory function, but is 
meant rather to improve mutual 
understanding and to provide an avenue 
for open dialogue. During the Site Tours 
Program, regulatory project managers 
will also participate in daily workshops 
with their industry counterparts, 
focusing on selective regulatory issues 
important to both CDER staff and 
industry. The primary objective of the 
daily workshops is to learn about the 
team approach to drug development, 
including drug discovery, preclinical 
evaluation, tracking mechanisms, and 
regulatory submission operations. The 
overall benefit to regulatory project 
managers will be exposure to project 
management, team techniques, and 
processes employed by the 
pharmaceutical industry. By 
participating in this program, the 
regulatory project manager will grow 
professionally by gaining a better 
understanding of industry processes and 
procedures. 

III. Site Selection 

All travel expenses associated with 
the Site Tours Program will be the 
responsibility of CDER; therefore, 
selection will be based on the 
availability of funds and resources for 
each fiscal year. Selection will also be 
based on firms having a favorable 
facility status as determined by FDA’s 
Office of Regulatory Affairs District 
Offices in the firms’ respective regions. 
Firms interested in offering a site tour 
or learning more about this training 
opportunity should respond by 
submitting a proposed agenda to Dan 
Brum (see DATES and FOR FURTHER 
INFORMATION CONTACT). 

Dated: February 14, 2014. 

Leslie Kux, 
Assistant Commissioner for Policy. 
[FR Doc. 2014–03679 Filed 2–20–14; 8:45 am] 
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SUMMARY: In compliance with Section 
3507(a)(1)(D) of the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995, the Health 
Resources and Services Administration 
(HRSA) has submitted an Information 
Collection Request (ICR) to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and approval. Comments 
submitted during the first public review 
of this ICR will be provided to OMB. 
OMB will accept further comments from 
the public during the review and 
approval period. 
DATES: Comments on this ICR should be 
received within 30 days of this notice. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your comments, 
including the Information Collection 
Request Title, to the desk officer for 
HRSA, either by email to 
OIRA_submission@omb.eop.gov or by 
fax to 202–395–5806. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: To 
request a copy of the clearance requests 
submitted to OMB for review, email the 
HRSA Information Collection Clearance 
Officer at paperwork@hrsa.gov or call 
(301) 443–1984. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Information Collection Request Title: 
HRSA AIDS Drug Assistance Program 
Quarterly Report OMB No. 0915–0294— 
Extension. 

Abstract: HRSA’s AIDS Drug 
Assistance Program (ADAP) is funded 
through Part B of Title XXVI of the 
Public Health Service Act, as amended 
by the Ryan White HIV/AIDS Treatment 
Extension Act of 2009 (The Ryan White 
HIV/AIDS Program), which provides 
grants to states and territories. ADAP 
provides medications for the treatment 
of HIV disease. Program funds may also 
be used to purchase health insurance for 
eligible clients or for services that 
enhance access, adherence, and 
monitoring of drug treatments. 

Need and Proposed Use of the 
Information: Each of the 50 states, the 
District of Columbia, Puerto Rico, the 
Virgin Islands, and the Pacific territories 
receive ADAP grants. As part of the 
funding requirements, ADAP grantees 
submit quarterly reports that include 
information on patients served, 
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