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(P–14644) in the docket number field to 
access the document. For assistance, 
contact FERC Online Support. 

Dated: December 9, 2014. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2014–29955 Filed 12–22–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. CP15–22–000] 

Dominion Cove Point LNG, LP; Notice 
of Application 

Take notice that on December 3, 2014, 
Dominion Cove Point LNG, LP 
(Dominion) filed an application 
pursuant to section 7(c) of the Natural 
Gas Act and Part 157 of the 
Commission’s Regulations, for a 
certificate of public convenience and 
necessity to construct, install, own, 
operate, and maintain certain facilities 
located in Fairfax County, Virginia and 
Charles County, Maryland (St. Charles 
Transportation Project). The filing may 
be viewed on the web at http://
www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field to access the document. For 
assistance, contact FERC at 
FERCOnlineSupport@gerc.gov or call 
toll-free, (886) 208–3676 or TYY, (202) 
502–8659. 

Any questions regarding this 
application should be directed to 
Tiffany Werts, Regulatory and 
Certificates Analyst, Dominion 
Transmission, Inc., 701 East Cary Street, 
Richmond, VA 23219, telephone: (866) 
319–3382. 

CPV Maryland, LLC (CPV) is 
proposing to build a 725-megawatt 
natural gas-fired combined power plant 
in Charles County, Maryland. In 
response to CPV’s request, Dominion 
proposes to install one new 7,000 
horsepower (hp) electric compressor 
and related facilities at its existing 
Pleasant Valley Compressor Station 
located in Fairfax County, Virginia. 
Dominion also proposes to construct 
and operate two new 16-inch delivery 
taps in Charles County, Maryland. 
These taps are required for customer 
delivery and will be installed on 
Dominion’s TL–522 and TL–532 
pipelines. The St. Charles 
Transportation Project will provide 
132,000 dekatherms per day of 
incremental firm transportation service 
to CPV. Dominion has executed a 

precedent agreement with CPV for all of 
the capacity associated with the project 
for a primary term of twenty years. 
Dominion requests authorization to 
establish an initial recourse rate for firm 
service using the proposed project. The 
cost of the proposed project is 
$30,618,189. Dominion proposes an in- 
service date of June 1, 2016. 

Pursuant to Section 157.9 of the 
Commission’s rules, 18 CFR 157.9, 
within 90 days of this Notice the 
Commission staff will either: complete 
its environmental assessment (EA) and 
place it into the Commission’s public 
record (eLibrary) for this proceeding, or 
issue a Notice of Schedule for 
Environmental Review. If a Notice of 
Schedule for Environmental Review is 
issued, it will indicate, among other 
milestones, the anticipated date for the 
Commission staff’s issuance of the final 
environmental impact statement (FEIS) 
or EA for this proposal. The filing of the 
EA in the Commission’s public record 
for this proceeding or the issuance of a 
Notice of Schedule will serve to notify 
federal and state agencies of the timing 
for the completion of all necessary 
reviews, and the subsequent need to 
complete all federal authorizations 
within 90 days of the date of issuance 
of the Commission staff’s FEIS or EA. 

There are two ways to become 
involved in the Commission’s review of 
this project. First, any person wishing to 
obtain legal status by becoming a party 
to the proceedings for this project 
should, on or before the comment date 
stated below, file with the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE., Washington, DC 20426, 
a motion to intervene in accordance 
with the requirements of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.214 or 385.211) 
and the Regulations under the NGA (18 
CFR 157.10). A person obtaining party 
status will be placed on the service list 
maintained by the Secretary of the 
Commission and will receive copies of 
all documents filed by the applicant and 
by all other parties. A party must submit 
5 copies of filings made with the 
Commission and must mail a copy to 
the applicant and to every other party in 
the proceeding. Only parties to the 
proceeding can ask for court review of 
Commission orders in the proceeding. 

However, a person does not have to 
intervene in order to have comments 
considered. The second way to 
participate is by filing with the 
Secretary of the Commission, as soon as 
possible, an original and two copies of 
comments in support of or in opposition 
to this project. The Commission will 
consider these comments in 
determining the appropriate action to be 

taken, but the filing of a comment alone 
will not serve to make the filer a party 
to the proceeding. The Commission’s 
rules require that persons filing 
comments in opposition to the project 
provide copies of their protests only to 
the party or parties directly involved in 
the protest. 

Persons who wish to comment only 
on the environmental review of this 
project should submit an original and 
two copies of their comments to the 
Secretary of the Commission. 
Environmental commenters will be 
placed on the Commission’s 
environmental mailing list, will receive 
copies of the environmental documents, 
and will be notified of meetings 
associated with the Commission’s 
environmental review process. 
Environmental commenters will not be 
required to serve copies of filed 
documents on all other parties. 
However, the non-party commenters 
will not receive copies of all documents 
filed by other parties or issued by the 
Commission (except for the mailing of 
environmental documents issued by the 
Commission) and will not have the right 
to seek court review of the 
Commission’s final order. 

Motions to intervene, protests and 
comments may be filed electronically 
via the internet in lieu of paper; see, 18 
CFR 385.2001(a)(1)(iii) and the 
instructions on the Commission’s Web 
site under the ‘‘e-Filing’’ link. The 
Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filings. 

Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
Time on January 6, 2015. 

Dated: December 16, 2014. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2014–29962 Filed 12–22–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. CP15–24–000] 

Dominion Cove Point LNG, LP; Notice 
of Application 

Take notice that on December 3, 2014, 
Dominion Cove Point LNG, LP 
(Dominion) filed an application 
pursuant to section 7(c) of the Natural 
Gas Act and Part 157 of the 
Commission’s Regulations, for a 
certificate of public convenience and 
necessity to construct, install, own, 
operate, and maintain certain facilities 
located in Fairfax County, Virginia and 
Charles County, Maryland (Keys Energy 
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Project). The filing may be viewed on 
the Web at http://www.ferc.gov using 
the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. Enter the docket 
number excluding the last three digits in 
the docket number field to access the 
document. For assistance, contact FERC 
at FERCOnlineSupport@gerc.gov or call 
toll-free, (886) 208–3676 or TYY, (202) 
502–8659. 

Any questions regarding this 
application should be directed to 
Tiffany Werts, Regulatory and 
Certificates Analyst, Dominion 
Transmission, Inc., 701 East Cary Street, 
Richmond, VA 23219, telephone: (866) 
319–3382. 

To accommodate the new service 
entitlements for a customer, Keys 
Energy Center (Keys Energy), Dominion 
proposes to install one new 6,000 
horsepower (hp) electric compressor 
and related facilities at its existing 
Pleasant Valley Compressor Station 
located in Fairfax County, Virginia. 
Dominion also proposes to construct a 
new metering and regulating station and 
appurtenant facilities in Charles County, 
Maryland. The Keys Energy Project will 
provide 107,000 dekatherms per day of 
incremental firm transportation service 
to Keys Energy. Dominion has executed 
a precedent agreement with Keys Energy 
for all of the capacity associated with 
the project for a primary term of twenty 
years. Dominion requests authorization 
to establish an initial recourse rate for 
firm service using the proposed project. 
The cost of the proposed project is 
$36,615,014. Dominion proposes an in- 
service date of March 1, 2017. 

Pursuant to Section 157.9 of the 
Commission’s rules, 18 CFR 157.9, 
within 90 days of this Notice the 
Commission staff will either: Complete 
its environmental assessment (EA) and 
place it into the Commission’s public 
record (eLibrary) for this proceeding, or 
issue a Notice of Schedule for 
Environmental Review. If a Notice of 
Schedule for Environmental Review is 
issued, it will indicate, among other 
milestones, the anticipated date for the 
Commission staff’s issuance of the final 
environmental impact statement (FEIS) 
or EA for this proposal. The filing of the 
EA in the Commission’s public record 
for this proceeding or the issuance of a 
Notice of Schedule will serve to notify 
federal and state agencies of the timing 
for the completion of all necessary 
reviews, and the subsequent need to 
complete all federal authorizations 
within 90 days of the date of issuance 
of the Commission staff’s FEIS or EA. 

There are two ways to become 
involved in the Commission’s review of 
this project. First, any person wishing to 
obtain legal status by becoming a party 
to the proceedings for this project 

should, on or before the comment date 
stated below, file with the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE., Washington, DC 20426, 
a motion to intervene in accordance 
with the requirements of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.214 or 385.211) 
and the Regulations under the NGA (18 
CFR 157.10). A person obtaining party 
status will be placed on the service list 
maintained by the Secretary of the 
Commission and will receive copies of 
all documents filed by the applicant and 
by all other parties. A party must submit 
5 copies of filings made with the 
Commission and must mail a copy to 
the applicant and to every other party in 
the proceeding. Only parties to the 
proceeding can ask for court review of 
Commission orders in the proceeding. 

However, a person does not have to 
intervene in order to have comments 
considered. The second way to 
participate is by filing with the 
Secretary of the Commission, as soon as 
possible, an original and two copies of 
comments in support of or in opposition 
to this project. The Commission will 
consider these comments in 
determining the appropriate action to be 
taken, but the filing of a comment alone 
will not serve to make the filer a party 
to the proceeding. The Commission’s 
rules require that persons filing 
comments in opposition to the project 
provide copies of their protests only to 
the party or parties directly involved in 
the protest. 

Persons who wish to comment only 
on the environmental review of this 
project should submit an original and 
two copies of their comments to the 
Secretary of the Commission. 
Environmental commenters will be 
placed on the Commission’s 
environmental mailing list, will receive 
copies of the environmental documents, 
and will be notified of meetings 
associated with the Commission’s 
environmental review process. 
Environmental commenters will not be 
required to serve copies of filed 
documents on all other parties. 
However, the non-party commenters 
will not receive copies of all documents 
filed by other parties or issued by the 
Commission (except for the mailing of 
environmental documents issued by the 
Commission) and will not have the right 
to seek court review of the 
Commission’s final order. 

Motions to intervene, protests and 
comments may be filed electronically 
via the internet in lieu of paper; see, 18 
CFR 385.2001(a)(1)(iii) and the 
instructions on the Commission’s Web 
site under the ‘‘e-Filing’’ link. The 

Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filings. 

Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
Time on January 6, 2015. 

Dated: December 16, 2014. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2014–29957 Filed 12–22–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Project No. 2829–005] 

City of Loveland, Colorado; Notice of 
Application Accepted for Filing, 
Soliciting Comments, Motions To 
Intervene, and Protests 

Take notice that the following 
hydroelectric application has been filed 
with the Commission and is available 
for public inspection: 

a. Types of Application: Surrender of 
License. 

b. Project No.: 2829–005. 
c. Date Filed: November 12, 2014. 
d. Applicants: City of Loveland, 

Colorado. 
e. Name of Projects: Loveland 

Hydroelectric Project. 
f. Location: Big Thompson River, in 

Larimer County, Colorado. 
g. Filed Pursuant to: Federal Power 

Act, 16 U.S.C. 791a–825r. 
h. Applicant Contact: Mr. Steve 

Adams, Loveland Light and Power, 200 
North Wilson St., Building 1, Loveland, 
CO 80537, (303) 962–3400. 

i. FERC Contact: Jennifer Ambler, 
(202) 502–8586, jennifer.ambler@
ferc.gov. 

j. Deadline for filing comments, 
motions to intervene, protests, and 
recommendations is 30 days from the 
issuance date of this notice by the 
Commission. The Commission strongly 
encourages electronic filing. Please file 
motions to intervene, protests, 
comments, or recommendations using 
the Commission’s eFiling system at 
http://www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/
efiling.asp. Commenters can submit 
brief comments up to 6,000 characters, 
without prior registration, using the 
eComment system at http://
www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/
ecomment.asp. You must include your 
name and contact information at the end 
of your comments. For assistance, 
please contact FERC Online Support at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, (866) 
208–3676 (toll free), or (202) 502–8659 
(TTY). In lieu of electronic filing, please 
send a paper copy to: Secretary, Federal 
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