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Controlled substance Drug code Schedule 

Gamma Hydroxybutyric Acid ......................................................................................................................................... 2010 I 

The company plans to manufacture 
the above listed controlled substance for 
internal research and for development 
purposes as part of the process in 
seeking Food and Drug Administration 
approval prior to distribution to 
customers. No other activity for this 
drug code is authorized for this 
registration. 

Marsha L. Ikner, 
Acting Deputy Assistant Administrator. 
[FR Doc. 2024–14910 Filed 7–5–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Drug Enforcement Administration 

[Docket No. DEA–1388] 

Importer of Controlled Substances 
Application: Arizona Department of 
Corrections 

AGENCY: Drug Enforcement 
Administration, Justice. 
ACTION: Notice of application. 

SUMMARY: Arizona Department of 
Corrections has applied to be registered 
as an importer of basic class(es) of 
controlled substance(s). Refer to 
Supplementary Information listed below 
for further drug information. 
DATES: Registered bulk manufacturers of 
the affected basic class(es), and 
applicants, therefore, may submit 
electronic comments on or objections to 
the issuance of the proposed registration 
on or before August 7, 2024. Such 
persons may also file a written request 
for a hearing on the application on or 
before August 7, 2024. 
ADDRESSES: The Drug Enforcement 
Administration requires that all 
comments be submitted electronically 
through the Federal eRulemaking Portal, 
which provides the ability to type short 
comments directly into the comment 
field on the web page or attach a file for 
lengthier comments. Please go to 
https://www.regulations.gov and follow 
the online instructions at that site for 
submitting comments. Upon submission 
of your comment, you will receive a 
Comment Tracking Number. Please be 
aware that submitted comments are not 

instantaneously available for public 
view on https://www.regulations.gov. If 
you have received a Comment Tracking 
Number, your comment has been 
successfully submitted and there is no 
need to resubmit the same comment. All 
requests for a hearing must be sent to: 
(1) Drug Enforcement Administration, 
Attn: Hearing Clerk/OALJ, 8701 
Morrissette Drive, Springfield, Virginia 
22152; and (2) Drug Enforcement 
Administration, Attn: DEA Federal 
Register Representative/DPW, 8701 
Morrissette Drive, Springfield, Virginia 
22152. All requests for a hearing should 
also be sent to: Drug Enforcement 
Administration, Attn: Administrator, 
8701 Morrissette Drive, Springfield, 
Virginia 22152. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: In 
accordance with 21 CFR 1301.34(a), this 
is notice that on June 3, 2024, Arizona 
Department of Corrections, 1305 East 
Butte Avenue, ASPC-Florence, Florence, 
Arizona 85132–9221, applied to be 
registered as an importer of the 
following basic class(es) of controlled 
substance(s): 

Controlled substance Drug code Schedule 

Pentobarbital ........................................................................................................................................................................ 2270 II 

The facility intends to import the 
above-listed controlled substance for 
legitimate needs. This particular 
controlled substance is not available for 
the intended legitimate need within the 
current domestic supply of the United 
States. No other activities for these drug 
codes are authorized for this 
registration. 

Approval of permit applications will 
occur only when the registrant’s 
business activity is consistent with what 
is authorized under 21 U.S.C. 952(a)(2). 
Authorization will not extend to the 
import of Food and Drug 
Administration-approved or non- 
approved finished dosage forms for 
commercial sale. 

Marsha L. Ikner, 
Acting Deputy Assistant Administrator. 
[FR Doc. 2024–14918 Filed 7–5–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–09–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Notice of Lodging of Proposed 
Consent Decree Under the Clean Air 
Act 

On July 1, 2024, the Department of 
Justice lodged a proposed consent 
decree with the United States District 
Court for the Southern District of New 
York in the lawsuit entitled United 
States v. Gristede’s Foods NY, Inc., Civil 
Action No. 24 Civ. 4981. 

The United States filed this lawsuit 
seeking injunctive relief and civil 
penalties for violations of the Clean Air 
Act against defendant Gristede’s Foods 
NY, Inc. (‘‘Gristedes’’) for violations of 
the United States Environmental 
Protection Agency’s (‘‘EPA’’) Recycling 
and Emissions Reduction Rule, 40 CFR 
part 82, subpart F, for failing to take 
actions necessary to monitor, prevent, 
leak, and record refrigerant emissions. 

The consent decree requires Gristedes 
to implement a new Refrigerant 
Compliance Management Plan; to 

reduce its company-wide refrigerant 
leak rates; to repair or replace specified 
appliances; to convert certain stores to 
using more advanced refrigerants; and 
to pay a $400,000 civil penalty to the 
United States. 

The publication of this notice opens 
a period for public comment on the 
consent decree. Comments should be 
addressed to the Assistant Attorney 
General, Environment and Natural 
Resources Division, and should refer to 
United States v. Gristede’s Foods NY, 
Inc., D.J. Ref. No. 90–5–2–1–12759. All 
comments must be submitted no later 
than thirty (30) days after the 
publication date of this notice. 
Comments may be submitted either by 
email or by mail: 

To submit 
comments: Send them to: 

By email ....... pubcomment-ees.enrd@
usdoj.gov. 
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1 https://www.govinfo.gov/content/pkg/FR-2024- 
03-29/pdf/2024-06469.pdf. 

To submit 
comments: Send them to: 

By mail ......... Assistant Attorney General, 
U.S. DOJ—ENRD, P.O. 
Box 7611, Washington, DC 
20044–7611. 

Any comments submitted in writing 
may be filed by the United States in 
whole or in part on the public court 
docket without notice to the commenter. 

During the public comment period, 
the consent decree may be examined 
and downloaded at this Justice 
Department website: http://
www.justice.gov/enrd/consent-decrees. 
If you require assistance accessing the 
consent decree, you may request 
assistance by email or by mail to the 
addresses provided above for submitting 
comments. 

Jeffrey Sands, 
Assistant Section Chief, Environmental 
Enforcement Section, Environment and 
Natural Resources Division. 
[FR Doc. 2024–14916 Filed 7–5–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–15–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Employment and Training 
Administration 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Comment Request; Claims 
and Payment Activities 

ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Labor’s 
(DOL) Employment and Training 
Administration (ETA) is soliciting 
comments concerning a proposed 
extension, with changes, for the 
authority to conduct the information 
collection request (ICR) titled, ‘‘Claims 
and Payment Activities.’’ This comment 
request is part of continuing 
Departmental efforts to reduce 
paperwork and respondent burden in 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995 (PRA). 
DATES: Consideration will be given to all 
written comments received by 
September 6, 2024. 
ADDRESSES: A copy of this ICR with 
applicable supporting documentation, 
including a description of the likely 
respondents, proposed frequency of 
response, and estimated total burden, 
may be obtained free by contacting 
Rachel Beistel by telephone at 202–693– 
2736 (this is not a toll-free number) or 
by email at beistel.rachel@dol.gov. For 
persons with a hearing or speech 
disability who need assistance to use 
the telephone system, please dial 711 to 

access telecommunications relay 
services. 

Submit written comments about, or 
requests for a copy of, this ICR by mail 
or courier to the U.S. Department of 
Labor, Employment and Training 
Administration, Office of 
Unemployment Insurance Room S– 
4519, 200 Constitution Ave. NW, 
Washington, DC 20210; by email: OUI- 
PRA@dol.gov; or by fax 202–693–3975. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Kevin Stapleton by telephone at 202– 
693–3009 (this is not a toll-free number) 
or by email at stapleton.kevin@dol.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: DOL, as 
part of continuing efforts to reduce 
paperwork and respondent burden, 
conducts a pre-clearance consultation 
program to provide the general public 
and Federal agencies an opportunity to 
comment on proposed and/or 
continuing collections of information 
before submitting them to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for final 
approval. This program helps to ensure 
requested data can be provided in the 
desired format, reporting burden (time 
and financial resources) is minimized, 
collection instruments are clearly 
understood, and the impact of collection 
requirements can be properly assessed. 

Section 303(a)(6) of the Social 
Security Act (SSA) specifies that for 
State Unemployment Insurance (UI) 
programs to be certified to receive 
administrative funding from the Federal 
Government, the State’s law must 
include provisions for ‘‘making of such 
reports . . . as the Secretary of Labor 
may from time to time require, and 
compliance with such provisions as the 
Secretary may from time to time find 
necessary to assure the correctness and 
verification of such reports.’’ DOL 
considers the proposed changes and 
updates to the ETA 5159 report to be 
one of those ‘‘provisions . . . necessary 
to assure the correctness and 
verification’’ of the reports submitted by 
States. ETA is proposing changes to the 
ETA 5159 to continue to collect 
information on claim activities, number 
of claims and amount of payments 
under State UI laws and Federal 
unemployment insurance laws for 
Federal workers and ex-service 
members, as well as add additional 
sections on activities for claimants that 
received State UI first payments and 
final payments by race or ethnicity, sex 
and/or gender, level of educational 
attainment following the updated 
definitions proposed for the ETA 203 
Report titled ‘‘Characteristics of the 
Insured Unemployed’’ under OMB 
Control Number 1205–0009 and a new 
field capturing incomplete claims. The 

additional demographic report fields for 
Sex and/or Gender incorporate the most 
recent U.S. State Department’s updated 
passport guidelines. The report fields 
for Race or Ethnicity follow the updated 
guidance/changes set out in the Office 
of Management and Budget’s Revisions 
to its Statistical Policy Directive No. 15: 
Standards for Maintaining, Collecting, 
and Presenting Federal Data on Race 
and Ethnicity,1 which became effective 
on March 29, 2024. The update field for 
Level of Educational Attainment aligns 
with the U.S. Census Bureau. 

These changes will capture 
characteristics that better reflect society 
and the UI population across 
demographic groups. ETA proposes 
adding these categories to increase 
understanding of interactions between 
socio-economic characteristics and 
unemployment insurance receipt, 
benefit exhaustion, and to assist State UI 
program managers seeking to identify 
areas of needs such as barriers to filing 
an application for benefits, hence the 
additional field for ‘‘incomplete 
claims’’. An individual’s refusal to 
disclose claimant demographic 
information will not impact eligibility 
determinations. Also, any responses 
collected and information provided will 
be treated as confidential. This data will 
not be shared beyond aggregate 
reporting to ETA and any demographic 
information associated with a specific 
claimant or employer will be masked or 
hidden from State agency staff. 
Furthermore, an individual’s disclosure 
of demographic information is voluntary 
and a non-response to questions will 
continue to be reported as ‘‘Information 
Not Available’’ or INA. Section 303(a)(6) 
SSA, authorizes this information 
collection. 

This information collection is subject 
to the PRA. A Federal agency generally 
cannot conduct or sponsor a collection 
of information, and the public is 
generally not required to respond to an 
information collection, unless it is 
approved by OMB under the PRA and 
displays a currently valid OMB Control 
Number. In addition, notwithstanding 
any other provisions of law, no person 
shall generally be subject to penalty for 
failing to comply with a collection of 
information that does not display a 
valid Control Number. See 5 CFR 
1320.5(a) and 1320.6. 

Interested parties are encouraged to 
provide comments to the contact shown 
in the ADDRESSES section. Comments 
must be written to receive 
consideration, and they will be 
summarized and included in the request 
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