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5. An estimate of the total number of 
respondents and the amount of time 
estimated for an average respondent to 
respond: The 2023 and 2025 ASJ will 
collect data from approximately 940 
jails (see table 1). For each data 
collection cycle, we estimate an average 
burden of 80 minutes for the updated 
survey form CJ–5. If needed, jail 
respondents will be contacted by email 
or telephone to verify data quality 
issues. We estimate that data quality 
follow-up is needed for 70% of the jails 
(658) in each cycle and will run an 
average of 10 minutes for each jail. In 
addition, we estimate that 10% of the 
jails (94) in each cycle will be contacted 
to verify point-of-contact information, 
which takes 5 minutes each on average. 
In total, the ASJ will incur a burden 
estimate of 1,371 hours, or 88 minutes 
per respondent, each year in 2023 and 
2025. These estimates are based on 
previous estimates of item burden and 
input received from participants in the 
2018 jail collection cognitive test 
(generic OMB clearance, Control No. 
1121–0249). 

If additional information is required, 
contact: John R. Carlson, Department 
Clearance Officer, United States 
Department of Justice, Justice 
Management Division, Policy and 
Planning Staff, Two Constitution 
Square, 145 N Street NE, 4W–218, 
Washington, DC 20530. 

Dated: February 15, 2023. 
John R. Carlson, 
Department Clearance Officer for PRA, Policy 
and Planning Staff, U.S. Department of 
Justice. 
[FR Doc. 2023–03592 Filed 2–21–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–18–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Bureau of Labor Statistics 

Data Users Advisory Committee; 
Request for Nominations 

AGENCY: Bureau of Labor Statistics 
(BLS), Labor. 
ACTION: Request for nominations to the 
BLS Data Users Advisory Committee. 

SUMMARY: The BLS is soliciting new 
members for its Data Users Advisory 
Committee (DUAC). The current 
membership expires on May 1, 2023. 
DATES: Nominations for the DUAC 
membership should be emailed by 
March 8, 2023. 
ADDRESSES: Nominations for the DUAC 
membership should be sent via email to 
DUACMembernominations@bls.gov. 
Nominations are only being accepted 

through email as BLS is in maximum 
telework status pending its relocation to 
Suitland. Please submit in Word or PDF 
format. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Ebony Davis, Program Analyst, U.S. 
Bureau of Labor Statistics. Telephone: 
202–691–6636. This is not a toll-free 
number. Email: Davis.Ebony@bls.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
DUAC provides advice to the Bureau of 
Labor Statistics from the points of view 
of data users from various sectors of the 
U.S. economy, including the labor, 
business, research, academic, and 
government communities, on matters 
related to the analysis, dissemination, 
and use of the Bureau’s statistics, on its 
published reports, and on gaps between 
or the need for new Bureau statistics. 

The Committee consists of 20 
members and will be chosen from a 
cross-section of individuals who 
represent a balance of expertise across a 
broad range of BLS program areas, 
including employment and 
unemployment statistics, occupational 
safety and health statistics, 
compensation measures, price indexes, 
and productivity measures; or other 
areas related to the subject matter of 
BLS programs. BLS invites persons 
interested in serving on the DUAC to 
submit their names for consideration for 
committee membership. 

BLS intends to renew membership in 
the DUAC for another three years. The 
BLS operates over two dozen surveys 
that measure employment and 
unemployment, compensation, worker 
safety, productivity, and consumer and 
producer price movements. BLS 
provides a wealth of economic data and 
analyses to support public and private 
decision making. The DUAC was 
established to provide advice to the 
Commissioner of Labor Statistics on the 
priorities of data users, suggestions 
concerning the addition of new 
programs, changes in emphasis of 
existing programs or cessation of 
obsolete programs, and advice on 
potential innovations in data analysis, 
dissemination, and presentation. 

Nominations: BLS is looking for 
committed DUAC members who have a 
strong interest in, and familiarity with, 
BLS data. The Agency is looking for 
nominees who use and have a 
comprehensive understanding of 
economic statistics. The U.S. Bureau of 
Labor Statistics is committed to bringing 
greater diversity of thought, perspective, 
and experience to its advisory 
committees. Nominees from all races, 
gender, age, and disabilities are 
encouraged to apply. Interested persons 
may nominate themselves or may 

submit the name of another person who 
they believe to be interested in and 
qualified to serve on the DUAC. 
Nominations may also be submitted by 
organizations. Nominations should 
include the name, address, and 
telephone number of the candidate. 
Each nomination should include a 
summary of the candidate’s training or 
experience relating to BLS data 
specifically, or economic statistics more 
generally. BLS will conduct a basic 
background check of candidates before 
their appointment to the DUAC. The 
background check will involve 
accessing publicly available, internet- 
based sources. 

Authority: This notice was prepared 
in accordance with the provisions of the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act 
(FACA), as amended, 5 U.S.C. App. 2. 

Signed at Washington, DC, this 15th day of 
February 2023. 
Eric Molina, 
Acting Chief, Division of Management 
Systems. 
[FR Doc. 2023–03633 Filed 2–21–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4510–24–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Occupational Safety and Health 
Administration 

[Docket No. OSHA–2023–0001] 

PSM On-Site Consultation 
Agreements; in Use Without an OMB 
Number and Seeks Office of 
Management and Budget’s (OMB) 
Approval of Information Collection 
(Paperwork) Requirements 

AGENCY: Occupational Safety and Health 
Administration (OSHA), Labor. 
ACTION: Request for public comments. 

SUMMARY: OSHA solicits public 
comments concerning the proposal of a 
new collection subject to Office of 
Management and Budget’s (OMB) 
approval for the information collection 
requirements specified in the PSM On- 
Site Consultation Agreements. 
DATES: Comments must be submitted 
(postmarked, sent, or received) by April 
24, 2023. 
ADDRESSES:

Electronically: You may submit 
comments and attachments 
electronically at http://
www.regulations.gov, which is the 
Federal eRulemaking Portal. Follow the 
instructions online for submitting 
comments. 

Docket: To read or download 
comments or other material in the 
docket, go to https://
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www.regulations.gov. Documents in the 
docket are listed in the https://
www.regulations.gov index; however, 
some information (e.g., copyrighted 
material) is not publicly available to 
read or download through the website. 
All submissions, including copyrighted 
material, are available for inspection 
through the OSHA Docket Office. 
Contact the OSHA Docket Office at (202) 
693–2350 (TTY (877) 889–5627) for 
assistance in locating docket 
submissions. 

Instructions: All submissions must 
include the agency name and OSHA 
docket number OSHA–2023–0001 for 
the Information Collection Request 
(ICR). OSHA will place all comments, 
including any personal information, in 
the public docket, which may be made 
available online. Therefore, OSHA 
cautions interested parties about 
submitting personal information such as 
social security numbers and birthdates. 

For further information on submitting 
comments, see the ‘‘Public 
Participation’’ heading in the section of 
this notice titled SUPPLEMENTARY 
INFORMATION. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Seleda Perryman or Theda Kenney, 
Directorate of Standards and Guidance, 
OSHA, U.S. Department of Labor; 
telephone (202) 693–2222. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Background 
The Department of Labor, as part of 

the continuing effort to reduce 
paperwork and respondent (i.e., 
employer) burden, conducts a 
preclearance consultation program to 
provide the public with an opportunity 
to comment on proposed and 
continuing information collection 
requirements in accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 (PRA) 
(44 U.S.C. 3506(c)(2)(A)). This program 
ensures that information is in the 
desired format, reporting burden (time 
and costs) is minimal, the collection 
instruments are clearly understood, and 
OSHA’s estimate of the information 
collection burden is accurate. The 
Occupational Safety and Health Act of 
1970 (OSH Act) (29 U.S.C. 651 et seq.) 
authorizes information collection by 
employers as necessary or appropriate 
for enforcement of the OSH Act or for 
developing information regarding the 
causes and prevention of occupational 
injuries, illnesses, and accidents (29 
U.S.C. 657). The OSH Act also requires 
that OSHA obtain such information 
with minimum burden upon employers, 
especially those operating small 
businesses, and to reduce to the 
maximum extent feasible unnecessary 

duplication of effort in obtaining 
information (29 U.S.C. 657). 

Section 7(c)(1) of the Occupational 
Safety and Health Act (i.e., ‘‘the OSH 
Act’’ or ‘‘the Act’’) authorizes the 
Secretary of Labor to, ‘‘with the consent 
of any State or political subdivision 
thereof, accept and use the services, 
facilities, and personnel of any agency 
of such State or subdivision with 
reimbursement.’’ Section 21(c) of the 
Act authorizes the Secretary of Labor to 
‘‘consult with and advise employers and 
workers . . . as to effective means of 
preventing occupational illnesses and 
injuries.’’ To satisfy the intent of these 
and other sections of the Act, the 
Occupational Safety and Health 
Administration (OSHA) codified the 
terms that govern cooperative 
agreements between OSHA and State 
governments or U.S. Territories whereby 
State agencies and U.S. Territories 
provide On-Site Consultation services to 
private sector, small business employers 
to assist them in complying with the 
requirements of the Act. The terms were 
codified as the On-Site Consultation 
Program regulations (29 CFR part 1908). 

OSHA’s Compliance Assistance 
Authorization Act of 1998 (CAAA) 
amended Section 21 of the OSH Act by 
adding paragraph (d), authorizing the 
Secretary of Labor to enter into 
agreements with the States and U.S. 
Territories to provide On-Site 
Consultation services, and established 
rules under which employers may 
qualify for an inspection exemption. To 
achieve the intent of the CAAA, OSHA 
published a final rule to amend 29 CFR 
part 1908. The rule became effective on 
December 26, 2000. The On-Site 
Consultation Program regulations 
specify services to be provided, as well 
as practices and procedures to be 
followed by the State On-Site 
Consultation programs. The Federal 
government provides 90 percent of 
funds for On-Site Consultation services. 

II. Special Issues for Comment 
OSHA has a particular interest in 

comments on the following issues: 
• Whether the proposed information 

collection requirements are necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
agency’s functions to protect workers, 
including whether the information is 
useful; 

• The accuracy of OSHA’s estimate of 
the burden (time and costs) of the 
information collection requirements, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

• The quality, utility, and clarity of 
the information collected; and 

• Ways to minimize the burden on 
employers who must comply; for 

example, by using automated or other 
technological information collection, 
and transmission techniques. 

III. Proposed Actions 

OSHA is requesting that OMB 
approves the new information collection 
requirements contained in the PSM On- 
Site Consultation Agreements. The 
agency is requesting that OMB approves 
26,766 burden hours for this collection. 

OSHA will summarize the comments 
submitted in response to this notice and 
will include this summary in the 
request to OMB to extend the approval 
of the information collection 
requirements. 

Type of Review: In Use Without an 
OMB Number. 

Title: PSM On-Site Consultation 
Agreements. 

OMB Control Number: 1218–0NEW. 
Affected Public: Business or other for- 

profits. 
Number of Respondents: 34. 
Number of Responses: 6,841. 
Frequency of Responses: On occasion. 
Average Time per Response: Varies. 
Estimated Total Burden Hours: 

26,766. 
Estimated Cost (Operation and 

Maintenance): $0. 

IV. Public Participation—Submission of 
Comments on This Notice and Internet 
Access to Comments and Submissions 

You may submit comments in 
response to this document as follows: 
(1) electronically at http://
www.regulations.gov, which is the 
Federal eRulemaking Portal; (2) by 
facsimile (fax); if your comments, 
including attachments, are not longer 
than 10 pages you may fax them to the 
OSHA Docket Office at 202–693–1648; 
or (3) by hard copy. Please note: While 
OSHA’s Docket Office is continuing to 
accept and process submissions by 
regular mail due to the COVID–19 
pandemic, the Docket Office is closed to 
the public and not able to receive 
submissions to the docket by hand, 
express mail, messenger, and courier 
service. All comments, attachments, and 
other material must identify the agency 
name and the OSHA docket number for 
the ICR (OSHA–2023–0001). You may 
supplement electronic submissions by 
uploading document files electronically. 
If you wish to mail additional materials 
in reference to an electronic or a 
facsimile submission, you must submit 
them to the OSHA Docket Office (see 
the section of this notice titled 
ADDRESSES). The additional materials 
must clearly identify your electronic 
comments by your name, date, and the 
docket number so that the agency can 
attach them to your comments. 
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Due to security procedures, the use of 
regular mail may cause a significant 
delay in the receipt of comments. 

Comments and submissions are 
posted without change at http://
www.regulations.gov. Therefore, OSHA 
cautions commenters about submitting 
personal information such as social 
security numbers and dates of birth. 
Although all submissions are listed in 
the https://www.regulations.gov index, 
some information (e.g., copyrighted 
material) is not publicly available to 
read or download from this website. All 
submissions, including copyrighted 
material, are available for inspection 
and copying at the OSHA Docket Office. 
Information on using the https://
www.regulations.gov website to submit 
comments and access the docket is 
available at the website’s ‘‘User Tips’’ 
link. Contact the OSHA Docket Office at 
(202) 693–2350, (TTY (877) 889–5627) 
for information about materials not 
available from the website, and for 
assistance in using the internet to locate 
docket submissions. 

V. Authority and Signature 
James S. Frederick, Deputy Assistant 

Secretary of Labor for Occupational 
Safety and Health, directed the 
preparation of this notice. The authority 
for this notice is the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995 (44 U.S.C. 3506 
et seq.) and Secretary of Labor’s Order 
No. 8–2020 (85 FR 58393). 

Signed at Washington, DC. 
James S. Frederick, 
Deputy Assistant Secretary of Labor for 
Occupational Safety and Health. 
[FR Doc. 2023–03638 Filed 2–21–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4510–26–P 

NATIONAL FOUNDATION ON THE 
ARTS AND THE HUMANITIES 

National Endowment for the Arts 

Subject 60-Day Notice for the 
‘‘ArtsHERE Grant Program Forms’’ 
Proposed Collection; Comment 
Request 

AGENCY: National Endowment for the 
Arts. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The National Endowment for 
the Arts (NEA), as part of its continuing 
effort to reduce paperwork and 
respondent burden, conducts a 
preclearance consultation program to 
provide the general public and Federal 
agencies with an opportunity to 
comment on proposed and/or 
continuing collections of information in 
accordance with the Paperwork 

Reduction Act of 1995. This program 
helps to ensure that requested data can 
be provided in the desired format, 
reporting burden (time and financial 
resources) is minimized, collection 
instruments are clearly understood, and 
the impact of collection requirements on 
respondents can be properly assessed. 
Currently, the NEA is soliciting 
comments concerning the proposed 
collection of subgrantee information for 
the ArtsHERE grant program. A copy of 
the current information collection 
request can be obtained by contacting 
the office listed below in the address 
section of this notice. 

DATES: Written comments must be 
submitted to the office listed in the 
address section below within 60 days 
from the date of this publication in the 
Federal Register. 

ADDRESSES: Send comments to Sunil 
Iyengar, National Endowment for the 
Arts, via email (research@arts.gov). 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The NEA 
is particularly interested in comments 
which: 

• Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

• Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

• Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

• Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 
use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology, 
e.g., permitting electronic submissions 
of responses. 

Dated: February 16, 2023. 

Bonita Smith, 
Director, Office of Administrative Services & 
Contracts, National Endowment for the Arts. 
[FR Doc. 2023–03672 Filed 2–21–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7537–01–P 

NUCLEAR REGULATORY 
COMMISSION 

[Docket Nos. 50–445 and 50–446; NRC– 
2022–0183] 

Notice of Intent To Conduct Scoping 
Process and Prepare Environmental 
Impact Statement; Vistra Operations 
Company LLC; Comanche Peak 
Nuclear Power Plant, Units 1 and 2 

AGENCY: Nuclear Regulatory 
Commission. 
ACTION: Intent to conduct scoping 
process and prepare environmental 
impact statement; public scoping 
meeting, and request for comment. 

SUMMARY: The U.S. Nuclear Regulatory 
Commission (NRC) will conduct an 
extended scoping process to gather 
information necessary to prepare an 
environmental impact statement (EIS) to 
evaluate the environmental impacts for 
the proposed license renewal of the 
operating licenses for Comanche Peak 
Nuclear Power Plant (CPNPP), Units 1 
and 2. The NRC is seeking stakeholder 
input on this action and has scheduled 
an additional public scoping meeting 
that will take place in Glen Rose, Texas. 
DATES: The NRC will hold a public 
scoping meeting on February 23, 2023, 
from 7 p.m. to 9 p.m. local time. Submit 
comments on the scope of the EIS by 
March 13, 2023. Comments received 
after March 13, 2023, will be considered 
if it is practical to do so, but the NRC 
is able to ensure consideration only for 
comments received on or before this 
date. See Section IV, ‘‘Public Scoping 
Meeting,’’ of this notice for additional 
information. 

ADDRESSES: You may submit comments 
by any of the following methods; 
however, the NRC encourages electronic 
comment submission through the 
Federal rulemaking website. 

• Federal Rulemaking Website: Go to 
https://www.nrc.gov and search for 
Docket ID NRC–2022–0183. Address 
questions about Docket IDs in 
Regulations.gov to Stacy Schumann; 
telephone: 301–415–0624; email: Stacy 
Schumann@nrc.gov. For technical 
questions, contact the individual listed 
in the FOR FURTHER INFORMATION 
CONTACT section of this document. 

• Email comments to: 
ComanchePeakEIS@nrc.gov. 

• Attend the transcribed public 
meeting: February 23, 2023. 

• Mail comments to: Office of 
Administration, Mail Stop: TWFN–7– 
A60M, U.S. Nuclear Regulatory 
Commission, Washington, DC 20555– 
0001, ATTN: Program Management, 
Announcements and Editing Staff. 
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