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HISTORY: 
None. 

Eric F. Stein, 
Deputy Assistant Secretary, Global 
Information Services (A/GIS), Department of 
State. 
[FR Doc. 2023–07973 Filed 4–14–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4710–AD–P 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

[Public Notice: 12044] 

Notice of Shipping Coordinating 
Committee Meeting in Preparation for 
International Maritime Organization 
MSC 107 Meeting 

The Department of State will conduct 
a public meeting of the Shipping 
Coordinating Committee at 10:00 a.m. 
on Monday, May 22, 2023, both in- 
person at Coast Guard Headquarters and 
via teleconference. The primary purpose 
of the meeting is to prepare for the one- 
hundred seventh session of the 
International Maritime Organization’s 
(IMO) Maritime Safety Committee (MSC 
107) to be held at IMO Headquarters in 
London, United Kingdom from 
Wednesday, May 31, 2023 to Friday 
June 9, 2023. 

Members of the public may 
participate up to the capacity of the 
teleconference phone line, which can 
handle 500 participants or up to the 
seating capacity of the room if attending 
in person. The meeting location will be 
the United States Coast Guard 
Headquarters, Ray Evans Conference 
Center, Section A, and the 
teleconference line will be provided to 
those who RSVP. To RSVP, participants 
should contact the meeting coordinator, 
LCDR Jessica Anderson, by email at 
jessica.p.anderson@uscg.mil. LCDR 
Anderson will provide access 
information for in-person and virtual 
attendance. 

The agenda items to be considered by 
the advisory committee at this meeting 
mirror those to be considered at MSC 
107, and include: 
• Opening of the session 
• Adoption of the agenda; report on 

credentials 
• Decisions of other IMO bodies 
• Consideration and adoption of 

amendments to mandatory 
instruments 

• Goal-based new ship construction 
standards 

• Development of a goal-based 
instrument for Maritime Autonomous 
Surface Ships (MASS) 

• Development of further measures to 
enhance the safety of ships relating to 
the use of fuel oil 

• Measures to enhance maritime 
security 

• Piracy and armed robbery against 
ships 

• Unsafe mixed migration by sea 
• Formal safety assessment 
• Carriage of cargoes and containers 

(Report of the eighth session of the 
Sub-Committee) 

• Human element, training and 
watchkeeping (Report of the ninth 
session of the Sub-Committee) 

• Ship systems and equipment (Report 
of the ninth session of the Sub- 
Committee) 

• Navigation, communications and 
search and rescue (Urgent matters 
emanating from the tenth session of 
the Sub-Committee) 

• Application of the Committee’s 
method of work 

• Work programme 
• Election of the Chair and Vice-Chair 

for 2024 
• Any other business 

Please note: the IMO may, on short 
notice, adjust the MSC 107 agenda to 
accommodate the constraints associated 
with the meeting format. Any changes to 
the agenda will be reported to those 
who RSVP. 

Those who plan to participate should 
contact the meeting coordinator, LCDR 
Jessica Anderson, by email at 
Jessica.P.Anderson@uscg.mil, or in 
writing at 2703 Martin Luther King Jr. 
Ave. SE, Stop 7509, Washington, DC 
20593–7509 no later than May 17, 2023. 
Please note that, due to security 
considerations, two valid, government 
issued photo identifications must be 
presented to gain entrance to the 
Douglas A. Munro Coast Guard 
Headquarters Building at St. Elizabeth’s. 
This building is accessible by taxi, 
public transportation, and privately 
owned conveyance (upon request). 
Additionally, members of the public 
needing reasonable accommodation 
should advise the meeting coordinator 
not later than May 17, 2023. Requests 
made after that date will be considered 
but might not be possible to fulfill. 

Additional information regarding this 
and other IMO public meetings may be 
found at: https://www.dco.uscg.mil/ 
IMO. 
(Authority: 22 U.S.C. 2656 and 5 U.S.C. 
1009.) 

Emily A. Rose, 
Executive Secretary, Shipping Coordinating 
Committee, Office of Ocean and Polar Affairs, 
Department of State. 
[FR Doc. 2023–08016 Filed 4–14–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4710–09–P 

SUSQUEHANNA RIVER BASIN 
COMMISSION 

Public Hearing 

AGENCY: Susquehanna River Basin 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Susquehanna River Basin 
Commission is seeking public comment 
on a new proposed general permit, 
General Permit GP–02 Groundwater 
Withdrawals for Emergency Uses or 
Maintenance (GP–02). The proposed 
General Permit would approve the 
withdrawal of groundwater from wells 
for (1) emergency uses or (2) 
maintenance activities. The Commission 
will take oral testimony on the proposed 
General Permit at its regularly 
scheduled public hearing on May 4, 
2023. The Commission will hold this 
hearing in person and telephonically. 
The deadline for the submission of 
written comments on the General Permit 
is May 30, 2023. 
DATES: The public hearing will convene 
on May 4, 2023, at 6:30 p.m. The public 
hearing will end at 9 p.m. or at the 
conclusion of public testimony, 
whichever is earlier. The deadline for 
submitting written comments on the 
General Permit is Tuesday, May 30, 
2023. 

ADDRESSES: This public hearing will be 
conducted in person and virtually. You 
may attend in person at Susquehanna 
River Basin Commission, 4423 N Front 
St., Harrisburg, Pennsylvania, or join by 
telephone at Toll-Free Number 1–877– 
304–9269 and then enter the guest 
passcode 2619070 followed by #. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Jason Oyler, General Counsel and 
Secretary to the Commission, telephone: 
(717) 238–0423 or joyler@srbc.net. 

The proposed General Permit and 
Fact Sheet are available on the 
Commission’s website at https://
www.srbc.net. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: GP–02 is 
designed to provide a pathway for 
projects that require temporary 
groundwater withdrawals, generally 
from back-up or reserve wells, to 
address an emergency or maintenance 
activity. Under SRBC regulations, these 
wells are subject to full technical review 
under 18 CFR part 806. For drinking 
water wells, they must also be fully 
permitted under the Safe Drinking 
Water laws and regulations of our 
member jurisdictions. 

GP–02 allows for and encourages 
proactive planning for how a project 
conducts and maintains operations 
during emergency or maintenance 
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outages of primary water sources. For 
public water supply sources 
specifically, GP–02 would focus the 
Commission’s role with respect to wells 
needed for emergency or maintenance 
and activities, in part, by deferring to 
the member jurisdictions’ safe drinking 
water permits as the primary sources of 
regulation. The proposed fee for 
coverage under GP–02 is $3,000, which 
includes review of the project’s 
Contingency Plan and project details. 
This is less costly than the current 
regulatory review fees faced by these 
projects when they go through the full 
docket review process. GP–02 has a 
proposed term of fifteen (15) years, in 
keeping with Commission regulations at 
18 CFR 806.31 where projects generally 
have a term of 15 years. 

Opportunity To Appear and Comment 

Interested parties may call into the 
hearing to offer comments to the 
Commission on any business listed 
above required to be the subject of a 
public hearing. Given the nature of the 
meeting, the Commission strongly 
encourages those members of the public 
wishing to provide oral comments to 
pre-register with the Commission by 
emailing Jason Oyler at joyler@srbc.net 
before the hearing date. The presiding 
officer reserves the right to limit oral 
statements in the interest of time and to 
control the course of the hearing 
otherwise. Access to the hearing via 
telephone will begin at 6:15 p.m. 
Guidelines for the public hearing are 
posted on the Commission’s website, 
www.srbc.net, before the hearing for 
review. The presiding officer reserves 
the right to modify or supplement such 
guidelines at the hearing. Written 
comments on any business listed above 
required to be the subject of a public 
hearing may also be mailed to Mr. Jason 
Oyler, Secretary to the Commission, 
Susquehanna River Basin Commission, 
4423 North Front Street, Harrisburg, Pa. 
17110–1788, or submitted electronically 
through https://www.srbc.net/ 
regulatory/public-comment/. Comments 
on the GP–02 mailed or electronically 
submitted must be received by the 
Commission on or before Tuesday, May 
30, 2023, to be considered. 

Authority: Pub. L. 91–575, 84 Stat. 
1509 et seq.; 18 CFR 806.17. 

Dated: April 12, 2023. 

Jason E. Oyler, 
General Counsel and Secretary to the 
Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2023–08067 Filed 4–14–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7040–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

Federal Aviation Administration 

[Docket No. FAA–2023–0975] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Requests for Comments; 
Clearance of Renewed Approval of 
Information Collection: Experimental 
Permits for Reusable Suborbital 
Rockets 

AGENCY: Federal Aviation 
Administration (FAA), DOT. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, FAA 
invites public comments about our 
intention to request the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) 
approval to renew an information 
collection. The FAA collects 
information from applicants for 
experimental permits in order to 
determine whether they satisfy the 
requirements for obtaining an 
experimental permit. 
DATES: Written comments should be 
submitted by June 16, 2023. 
ADDRESSES: Please send written 
comments: 

By Electronic Docket: 
www.regulations.gov (Enter docket 
number into search field). 

By Mail: Charles Huet, 800 
Independence Avenue SW, Room 331, 
Washington, DC 20591. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Charles Huet by email at: charles.huet@
faa.gov or; phone: (202) 267–7427. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Public Comments Invited: You are 
asked to comment on any aspect of this 
information collection, including (a) 
Whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for FAA’s 
performance; (b) the accuracy of the 
estimated burden; (c) ways for FAA to 
enhance the quality, utility and clarity 
of the information collection; and (d) 
ways that the burden could be 
minimized without reducing the quality 
of the collected information. The agency 
will summarize and/or include your 
comments in the request for OMB’s 
clearance of this information collection. 

OMB Control Number: 2120–0722. 
Title: Experimental Permits for 

Reusable Suborbital Rockets. 
Form Numbers: There are no FAA 

forms associated with this collection. 
Type of Review: Renewal of an 

information collection. 
Background: The Federal Register 

Notice with a 60-day comment period 
soliciting comments on the following 

collection of information was published 
on June 19, 2017 (82 FR 27949). There 
were no comments. 14 CFR part 437 
established requirements for the FAA’s 
authority to issue experimental permits 
for reusable suborbital rockets to 
authorize launches for the purpose of 
research and development, crew 
training and showing compliance with 
the regulations. The information 
collected includes data required for 
performing a safety review, which 
includes a technical assessment to 
determine if the applicant can launch a 
reusable suborbital rocket without 
jeopardizing public health and safety 
and the safety of property. This 
information collection requirement is 
intended for incorporating acquired data 
into the experimental permit, which 
then becomes binding on the launch or 
reentry operator. The applicant is 
required to submit information that 
enables FAA to determine, before 
issuing a permit, if issuance of the 
experimental permit would jeopardize 
the foreign policy or national security 
interests of the U.S. 

Respondents: Approximately 10 
applicants for experimental permits. 

Frequency: On occasion. 
Estimated Average Burden per 

Response: 18.6 Hours. 
Estimated Total Annual Burden: 

2,567 Hours. 

James A. Hatt, 
Space Policy Division Manager, Office of 
Commercial Space Transportation. 
[FR Doc. 2023–08042 Filed 4–14–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

Federal Aviation Administration 

[Docket No: FAA–2023–0530] 

Fiscal Year 2023 Competitive Funding 
Opportunity: Airport Improvement 
Program Discretionary Grants 

AGENCY: Federal Aviation 
Administration, U.S. Department of 
Transportation. 
ACTION: Notice of funding opportunity. 

SUMMARY: The U.S. Department of 
Transportation’s Federal Aviation 
Administration (FAA) announces the 
opportunity to apply for an estimated 
$1.5 billion in fiscal year (FY) 2023 
discretionary grants under the Airport 
Improvement Program (AIP). The FAA 
awards these annually appropriated 
discretionary funds through the FAA’s 
long-standing iterative, competitive 
grant process. Prior to the publication of 
this Notice of Funding Opportunity 

VerDate Sep<11>2014 17:29 Apr 14, 2023 Jkt 259001 PO 00000 Frm 00102 Fmt 4703 Sfmt 4703 E:\FR\FM\17APN1.SGM 17APN1lo
tte

r 
on

 D
S

K
11

X
Q

N
23

P
R

O
D

 w
ith

 N
O

T
IC

E
S

1

https://www.srbc.net/regulatory/public-comment/
https://www.srbc.net/regulatory/public-comment/
mailto:charles.huet@faa.gov
mailto:charles.huet@faa.gov
http://www.regulations.gov
mailto:joyler@srbc.net
http://www.srbc.net

		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-04-15T00:54:52-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




