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Liaison Officer has been authorized to 
sign and submit the document in 
electronic format for publication, as an 
official document of the Department of 
Energy. This administrative process in 
no way alters the legal effect of this 
document upon publication in the 
Federal Register. 

Signed in Washington, DC, on January 11, 
2022. 
Treena V. Garrett, 
Federal Register Liaison Officer, U.S. 
Department of Energy. 
[FR Doc. 2022–00668 Filed 1–13–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6450–01–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[ER–FRL–9060–3] 

Environmental Impact Statements; 
Notice of Availability 

Responsible Agency: Office of Federal 
Activities, General Information 202– 
564–5632 or https://www.epa.gov/nepa. 
Weekly receipt of Environmental Impact 

Statements (EIS) 
Filed January 3, 2022 10 a.m. EST 

Through January 10, 2022 10 a.m. EST 
Pursuant to 40 CFR 1506.9. 

Notice 

Section 309(a) of the Clean Air Act 
requires that EPA make public its 
comments on EISs issued by other 
Federal agencies. EPA’s comment letters 
on EISs are available at: https://
cdxnodengn.epa.gov/cdx-enepa-public/ 
action/eis/search. 
EIS No. 20220004, Final, APHIS, OR, 

ADOPTION—Final Bighorn Sheep 
Management Plan Environmental 
Impact Statement, Contact: Kevin 
Christensen 503–820–2751. 
The U.S. Department of Agriculture’s 

Animal and Plant Health Inspection 
Service (APHIS) has adopted the U.S. 
Fish and Wildlife Service (USFWS) 
Final EIS No. 20210178, filed 11/23/ 
2021 with the Environmental Protection 
Agency. The APHIS was a cooperating 
agency on this project. Therefore, 
republication of the document is not 
necessary under Section 1506.3(b)(2) of 
the CEQ regulations. 
EIS No. 20220005, Draft, DOE, NAT, 

Proposed Energy Conservation 
Standards for Manufactured Housing, 
Comment Period Ends: 02/28/2022, 
Contact: Roak Parker 240–562–1645. 

EIS No. 20220007, Final, USACE, LA, 
Upper Barataria Basin Louisiana 
Study, Review Period Ends: 02/14/ 
2022, Contact: Patricia Naquin 504– 
862–1544. 

Dated: January 12, 2022. 
Cindy S. Barger, 
Director, NEPA Compliance Division, Office 
of Federal Activities. 
[FR Doc. 2022–00798 Filed 1–13–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[EPA–HQ–OPPT–2021–0146; FRL–8682–06– 
OCSPP] 

Certain New Chemicals or Significant 
New Uses; Statements of Findings for 
September 2021 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Toxic Substances Control 
Act (TSCA) requires EPA to publish in 
the Federal Register a statement of its 
findings after its review of certain TSCA 
notices when EPA makes a finding that 
a new chemical substance or significant 
new use is not likely to present an 
unreasonable risk of injury to health or 
the environment. Such statements apply 
to premanufacture notices (PMNs), 
microbial commercial activity notices 
(MCANs), and significant new use 
notices (SNUNs) submitted to EPA 
under TSCA. This document presents 
statements of findings made by EPA on 
such submissions during the period 
from September 1, 2021 to September 
30, 2021. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 

For technical information contact: 
Rebecca Edelstein, Chemical Control 
Division (7405M), Office of Pollution 
Prevention and Toxics, Environmental 
Protection Agency, 1200 Pennsylvania 
Ave. NW, Washington, DC 20460–0001; 
telephone number: 202–564–1667; 
email address: Edelstein.rebecca@
epa.gov. 

For general information contact: The 
TSCA-Hotline, ABVI-Goodwill, 422 
South Clinton Ave., Rochester, NY 
14620; telephone number: (202) 554– 
1404; email address: TSCA-Hotline@
epa.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. General Information 

A. Does this action apply to me? 

This action is directed to the public 
in general. As such, the Agency has not 
attempted to describe the specific 
entities that this action may apply to. 
Although others may be affected, this 
action applies directly to the submitters 
of the PMNs addressed in this action. 

B. How can I get copies of this document 
and other related information? 

The docket for this action, identified 
by docket identification (ID) number 
EPA–HQ–OPPT–2021–0146, is available 
at http://www.regulations.gov or at the 
Office of Pollution Prevention and 
Toxics Docket (OPPT Docket), 
Environmental Protection Agency 
Docket Center (EPA/DC), West William 
Jefferson Clinton Bldg., Rm. 3334, 1301 
Constitution Ave. NW, Washington, DC. 
The Public Reading Room is open from 
8:30 a.m. to 4:30 p.m., Monday through 
Friday, excluding legal holidays. The 
telephone number for the Public 
Reading Room is (202) 566–1744, and 
the telephone number for the OPPT 
Docket is (202) 566–0280. 

Due to the public health concerns 
related to COVID–19, the EPA Docket 
Center (EPA/DC) and Reading Room is 
closed to visitors with limited 
exceptions. The staff continues to 
provide remote customer service via 
email, phone, and webform. For the 
latest status information on EPA/DC 
services and docket access, visit https:// 
www.epa.gov/dockets. 

II. What action is the Agency taking? 

This document lists the statements of 
findings made by EPA after review of 
notices submitted under TSCA section 
5(a) that certain new chemical 
substances or significant new uses are 
not likely to present an unreasonable 
risk of injury to health or the 
environment. This document presents 
statements of findings made by EPA 
during the period from September 1, 
2021 to September 30, 2021. 

III. What is the Agency’s authority for 
taking this action? 

TSCA section 5(a)(3) requires EPA to 
review a TSCA section 5(a) notice and 
make one of the following specific 
findings: 

• The chemical substance or 
significant new use presents an 
unreasonable risk of injury to health or 
the environment; 

• The information available to EPA is 
insufficient to permit a reasoned 
evaluation of the health and 
environmental effects of the chemical 
substance or significant new use; 

• The information available to EPA is 
insufficient to permit a reasoned 
evaluation of the health and 
environmental effects and the chemical 
substance or significant new use may 
present an unreasonable risk of injury to 
health or the environment; 

• The chemical substance is or will 
be produced in substantial quantities, 
and such substance either enters or may 
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