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OMB is particularly interested in 
comments that: 

1. Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility: 

2. Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used: 

3. Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

4. Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 
use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology, 
e.g., permitting electronic submissions 
of responses. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Iesha Alexander, 202–440–0834, 
Iesha.Alexander@CISA.DHS.GOV. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Homeland Security Presidential 
Directive-7, Presidential Policy 
Directive-22, and the National 
Infrastructure Protection Plan highlight 
the need for a centrally managed 
repository of infrastructure attributes 
capable of assessing risks and 
facilitating data sharing. The Critical 
Infrastructure Information Act of 2002 
and Title 6 Code of Federal Regulation 
part 29 direct an information protection 
program and a system to record the 
receipt, acknowledgement, and 
validation of submitted critical 
infrastructure information (CII), as well 
as storage, dissemination, and 
destruction of original Protected Critical 
Infrastructure Information (PCII). To 
support these missions, the DHS CISA 
ISD developed the CISA Gateway and 
the Protected Critical Infrastructure 
Information Management System 
(PCIIMS). The CISA Gateway and 
PCIIMS contain several capabilities 
which support the homeland security 
mission in the area of critical 
infrastructure (CI) and information 
protection. 

The purpose of this collection is to 
gather the details pertaining to the users 
of the CISA Gateway and PCIIMS for the 
purpose of creating accounts to access 
the CISA Gateway and PCIIMS. This 
information is also used to verify a need 
to know to access the CISA Gateway and 
PCIIMS. After being vetted and granted 
access, users are prompted and required 
to take an online training course upon 
first logging into the system. After 

completing the training, users are 
permitted full access to the systems. In 
addition, this collection will gather 
feedback from the users of the CISA 
Gateway to determine any future system 
improvements. 

The information gathered will be used 
by the CISA Gateway Program 
Management Team and the PCII 
Program Office for PCIIMS to vet users 
for a need to know and grant access to 
the system. For the CISA Gateway, as 
part of the registration process, users are 
required to take a one-time online 
training course. When logging into the 
system for the first time, the system 
prompts users to take the training 
courses. Users cannot opt out of the 
training and are required to take the 
course in order to gain and maintain 
access to the system. When users 
complete the training, the system 
automatically logs that the training is 
complete and allows full access to the 
system. For PCIIMS, after registration 
and vetting, users are directed to take 
PCII Authorized User training, which 
must be retaken annually to maintain 
their active status. 

The collection of information uses 
automated electronic forms. During the 
online registration process, there is an 
electronic form used to create a user 
account and an online training course 
required to grant access. 

The collection was initially approved 
on October 9, 2007, and the most recent 
approval was on December 19, 2023, 
with an expiration date of June 30, 2024. 
The changes to the collection since the 
previous OMB approval include 
updating the title of the collection, 
decrease in burden estimates and 
decrease in costs. 

The total annual burden cost for the 
collection has changed by $3,096.40, 
from $4,128 to $7,224.40 due to the 
removal of the utilization survey, and 
the addition of PCIIMS respondents. For 
the CISA Gateway, the total number of 
responses has increased from 350 to 700 
due to the updated metrics resulting 
from the awareness campaign and due 
to the registration process changing 
which does not include the training 
registration. The annual government 
cost for this collection has changed by 
$8,340.92 from $5,723 to $14,063.92 due 
to the removal of the utilization survey, 
and the addition of PCIIMS 
respondents. This is a renewal of an 
information collection. 

Analysis 

Agency: Cybersecurity and 
Infrastructure Security Agency (CISA), 
Department of Homeland Security 
(DHS). 

Title of Collection: CISA Gateway 
User Registration. 

OMB Control Number: 1670–0009. 
Frequency: Annually. 
Affected Public: State, local, Tribal, 

and Territorial governments and private 
sector individuals. 

Number of Annualized Respondents: 
700. 

Estimated Time per Respondent: 
0.167 hours for registration, 0.167 hours 
for training. 

Total Annualized Burden Hours: 
116.679 hours. 

Total Annualized Respondent 
Opportunity Cost: $7,224.40. 

Total Annualized Respondent Out-of- 
Pocket Cost: $0. 

Total Annualized Government Cost: 
$14,063.92. 

Robert J. Costello, 
Chief Information Officer, Department of 
Homeland Security, Cybersecurity and 
Infrastructure Security Agency. 
[FR Doc. 2024–14286 Filed 6–27–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 9111–LF–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HOMELAND 
SECURITY 

U.S. Citizenship and Immigration 
Services 

[OMB Control Number 1615–0102] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Extension, Without Change, 
of a Currently Approved Collection: 
Form G–639; Freedom of Information/ 
Privacy Act Request 

AGENCY: U.S. Citizenship and 
Immigration Services, Department of 
Homeland Security. 
ACTION: 60-Day notice. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Homeland 
Security (DHS), U.S. Citizenship and 
Immigration Services (USCIS) invites 
the general public and other Federal 
agencies to comment upon this 
proposed extension. In accordance with 
the Paperwork Reduction Act (PRA) of 
1995, the information collection notice 
is published in the Federal Register to 
obtain comments regarding the nature of 
the information collection, the 
categories of respondents, the estimated 
burden (i.e., the time, effort, and 
resources used by the respondents to 
respond), the estimated cost to the 
respondent, and the actual information 
collection instruments. 
DATES: Comments are encouraged and 
will be accepted for 60 days until 
August 27, 2024. 
ADDRESSES: All submissions received 
must include the OMB Control Number 
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1615–0102 in the body of the letter, the 
agency name and Docket ID USCIS– 
2008–0028. Submit comments via the 
Federal eRulemaking Portal website at 
https://www.regulations.gov under e- 
Docket ID number USCIS–2008–0028. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
USCIS, Office of Policy and Strategy, 
Regulatory Coordination Division, 
Samantha Deshommes, Chief, telephone 
number (240) 721–3000 (This is not a 
toll-free number. Comments are not 
accepted via telephone message). Please 
note contact information provided here 
is solely for questions regarding this 
notice. It is not for individual case 
status inquiries. Applicants seeking 
information about the status of their 
individual cases can check Case Status 
Online, available at the USCIS website 
at https://www.uscis.gov, or call the 
USCIS Contact Center at 800–375–5283 
(TTY 800–767–1833). 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Comments 

You may access the information 
collection instrument with instructions 
or additional information by visiting the 
Federal eRulemaking Portal site at: 
https://www.regulations.gov and 
entering USCIS–2008–0028 in the 
search box. Comments must be 
submitted in English, or an English 
translation must be provided. All 
submissions will be posted, without 
change, to the Federal eRulemaking 
Portal at https://www.regulations.gov, 
and will include any personal 
information you provide. Therefore, 
submitting this information makes it 
public. You may wish to consider 
limiting the amount of personal 
information that you provide in any 
voluntary submission you make to DHS. 
DHS may withhold information 
provided in comments from public 
viewing that it determines may impact 
the privacy of an individual or is 
offensive. For additional information, 
please read the Privacy Act notice that 
is available via the link in the footer of 
https://www.regulations.gov. 

Written comments and suggestions 
from the public and affected agencies 
should address one or more of the 
following four points: 

(1) Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

(2) Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

(3) Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

(4) Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 
use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology, 
e.g., permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 

(1) Type of Information Collection: 
Extension, Without Change, of a 
Currently Approved Collection. 

(3) Agency form number, if any, and 
the applicable component of the DHS 
sponsoring the collection: Form G–639; 
Freedom of Information/Privacy Act 
Request; USCIS. 

(4) Affected public who will be asked 
or required to respond, as well as a brief 
abstract: Primary: Individuals or 
households. Form G–639 is used to 
request access to U.S. Citizenship and 
Immigration Services (USCIS) records 
under the Freedom of Information Act 
(FOIA) and the Privacy Act of 1974 
(PA), if applicable. This form is also 
used to request amendment or 
correction of records under the PA, if 
applicable. USCIS created Form G–639 
as a convenient and expeditious option 
that individuals can use in lieu of 
submitting written FOIA requests. Form 
G–639 can be submitted electronically 
using the online FOIA Immigration 
Records System (FIRST) or printed and 
submitted by mail. 

(5) An estimate of the total number of 
respondents and the amount of time 
estimated for an average respondent to 
respond: The estimated total number of 
respondents for the information 
collection Form G–639 (paper) is 74,558 
and the estimated hour burden per 
response is 0.67 hours. The estimated 
total number of respondents for the 
information collection Online FOIA 
Request is 365,872 and the estimated 
hour burden per response is 0.5 hours. 

(6) An estimate of the total public 
burden (in hours) associated with the 
collection: The total estimated annual 
hour burden associated with this 
collection is 232,890 hours. 

(7) An estimate of the total public 
burden (in cost) associated with the 
collection: The estimated total annual 
cost burden associated with this 
collection of information is 
$4,155,376.50. 

Dated: June 25, 2024. 
Samantha L. Deshommes, 
Chief, Regulatory Coordination Division, 
Office of Policy and Strategy, U.S. Citizenship 
and Immigration Services, Department of 
Homeland Security. 
[FR Doc. 2024–14282 Filed 6–27–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 9111–97–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND 
URBAN DEVELOPMENT 

[Docket No. FR–7086–N–18] 

60-Day Notice of Proposed Information 
Collection: Personal Financial and 
Credit Statement; OMB Control No.: 
2502–0001 

AGENCY: Office of the Assistant 
Secretary for Housing—Federal Housing 
Commissioner, HUD. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: HUD is seeking approval from 
the Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) for the information collection 
described below. In accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act, HUD is 
requesting comment from all interested 
parties on the proposed collection of 
information. The purpose of this notice 
is to allow for 60 days of public 
comment. 
DATES: Comments Due Date: August 27, 
2024. 
ADDRESSES: Interested persons are 
invited to submit comments regarding 
this proposal. 

Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection can be sent 
within 60 days of publication of this 
notice to www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAMain. Find this particular 
information collection by selecting 
‘‘Currently under 60-day Review—Open 
for Public Comments’’ or by using the 
search function. Interested persons are 
also invited to submit comments 
regarding this proposal by name and/or 
OMB Control Number and should be 
sent to: Colette Pollard, Reports 
Management Officer, REE, Department 
of Housing and Urban Development, 
451 7th Street SW, Room 8210, 
Washington, DC 20410–5000; telephone 
(202) 402–3400 (this is not a toll-free 
number) or email: 
PaperworkReductionActOffice@
hud.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Colette Pollard, Reports Management 
Officer, REE, Department of Housing 
and Urban Development, 451 7th Street 
SW, Washington, DC 20410; email 
Colette Pollard at Colette.Pollard@
hud.gov or telephone 202–402–3400. 
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