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1 15 U.S.C. 78s(b)(1). 
2 17 CFR 240.19b–4. 

Medicare program for persons covered 
by the railroad retirement system. Under 
Section 1843 of the Social Security Act, 
states may enter into ‘‘buy-in 
agreements’’ with the Secretary of 
Health and Human Services for the 
purpose of enrolling certain groups of 
low-income individuals under the 
Medicare medical insurance (Part B) 
program and paying the premiums for 

their insurance coverage. Generally, 
these individuals are categorically 
needy under Medicaid and meet the 
eligibility requirements for Medicare 
Part B. States can also include in their 
buy-in agreements, individuals who are 
eligible for medical assistance only. The 
RRB uses Form RL–380–F, Report to 
State Medicaid Office, to obtain 
information needed to determine if 

certain railroad beneficiaries are entitled 
to receive Supplementary Medical 
Insurance program coverage under a 
state buy-in agreement in states in 
which they reside. Completion of Form 
RL–380–F is voluntary. One response is 
received from each respondent. The 
RRB proposes no changes to Form RL– 
380–F. 

ESTIMATE OF ANNUAL RESPONDENT BURDEN 
[The estimated annual respondent burden is as follows] 

Form No. Annual 
responses 

Time 
(minutes) 

Burden 
(hours) 

RL–380–F .................................................................................................................................... 600 10 100 

Additional Information or Comments: 
To request more information or to 
obtain a copy of the information 
collection justification, forms, and/or 
supporting material, contact Dana 
Hickman at (312) 751–4981 or 
Dana.Hickman@RRB.GOV. Comments 
regarding the information collection 
should be addressed to Charles 
Mierzwa, Railroad Retirement Board, 
844 North Rush Street, Chicago, Illinois 
60611–2092 or emailed to 
Charles.Mierzwa@RRB.GOV. Written 
comments should be received within 60 
days of this notice. 

Charles Mierzwa, 
Chief of Information Resources Management. 
[FR Doc. 2013–31502 Filed 1–3–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7905–01–P 

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE 
COMMISSION 

Sunshine Act Meeting 

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to 
the provisions of the Government in the 
Sunshine Act, Public Law 94–409, that 
the Securities and Exchange 
Commission will hold a Closed Meeting 
on Wednesday, January 8, 2014 at 2:00 
p.m. 

Commissioners, Counsel to the 
Commissioners, the Secretary to the 
Commission, and recording secretaries 
will attend the Closed Meeting. Certain 
staff members who have an interest in 
the matters also may be present. 

The General Counsel of the 
Commission, or her designee, has 
certified that, in her opinion, one or 
more of the exemptions set forth in 5 
U.S.C. 552b(c)(3), (5), (7), 9(B) and (10) 
and 17 CFR 200.402(a)(3), (5), (7), 9(ii) 
and (10), permit consideration of the 
scheduled matter at the Closed Meeting. 

Commissioner Stein, as duty officer, 
voted to consider the items listed for the 
Closed Meeting in a closed session. 

The subject matter of the Closed 
Meeting will be: 

Institution and settlement of 
injunctive actions; 

Institution and settlement of 
administrative proceedings; and 

Other matters relating to enforcement 
proceedings. 

At times, changes in Commission 
priorities require alterations in the 
scheduling of meeting items. 

For further information and to 
ascertain what, if any, matters have been 
added, deleted or postponed, please 
contact the Office of the Secretary at 
(202) 551–5400. 

Dated: January 2, 2014. 
Kevin M. O’Neill, 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2014–00018 Filed 1–2–14; 4:15 pm] 

BILLING CODE 8011–01–P 

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE 
COMMISSION 

[Release No. 71200; File No. SR–NASDAQ– 
2013–157] 

Self-Regulatory Organizations; The 
NASDAQ Stock Market LLC; Notice of 
Filing and Immediate Effectiveness of 
a Proposed Rule Change To Modify the 
Existing Fees in NASDAQ Rule 7034 

December 30, 2013. 
Pursuant to Section 19(b)(1) of the 

Securities Exchange Act of 1934 
(‘‘Act’’),1 and Rule 19b–4 2 thereunder, 
notice is hereby given that on December 
16, 2013, The NASDAQ Stock Market 
LLC (‘‘NASDAQ’’ or ‘‘Exchange’’) filed 
with the Securities and Exchange 
Commission (‘‘Commission’’) the 

proposed rule change as described in 
Items I, II, and III below, which Items 
have been prepared by NASDAQ. The 
Commission is publishing this notice to 
solicit comments on the proposed rule 
change from interested persons. 

I. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement of the Terms of Substance of 
the Proposed Rule Change 

NASDAQ is proposing changes to 
modify the existing fees that clients co- 
located in NASDAQ’s Carteret data 
center pay for cabinet space, 
connectivity, and additional services as 
set forth in NASDAQ Rule 7034. 
NASDAQ intends to make these fees 
effective on January 2, 2014. 

The text of the proposed rule change 
is available on the Exchange’s Web site 
at http://nasdaq.cchwallstreet.com, at 
the principal office of the Exchange, at 
the Commission’s Public Reference 
Room, and at the Commission’s Web 
site at http://sec.gov. 

II. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement of the Purpose of, and 
Statutory Basis for, the Proposed Rule 
Change 

In its filing with the Commission, the 
Exchange included statements 
concerning the purpose of and basis for 
the proposed rule change. The text of 
these statements may be examined at 
the places specified in Item IV below. 
The Exchange has prepared summaries, 
set forth in sections A, B, and C below, 
of the most significant aspects of such 
statements. 

A. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement of the Purpose of, and 
Statutory Basis for, the Proposed Rule 
Change 

1. Purpose 

NASDAQ is proposing five 
modifications to the current fee 
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3 See, e.g., Exchange Act Release No. 69887 (June 
29, 2013), 78 FR 40527 (July 5, 2013). 

4 15 U.S.C. 78f(b). 
5 15 U.S.C. 78f(b)(4), (5) and (8). 

schedule for colocation offerings set 
forth in NASDAQ Rule 7034. 

1. NASDAQ is proposing to modify 
Rule 7034(a) to reduce cabinet fees for 
all cabinet users. Specifically, NASDAQ 
is proposing to reduce from $7,000 to 
$4,500 the fee for installing a new Super 
High Density Cabinet. Additionally, 
NASDAQ is proposing to reduce the 
ongoing monthly fees for all cabinets: 
Super High Density from $13,000 to 
$8,000; High Density from $7,000 to 
$4,500; Medium High Density from 
$6,000 to $3,500; Medium Density from 
$5,000 to $2,500; Low Density from 
$4,000 to $2,000; and Half Cabinets 
from $3,000 to $2,000. These changes 
largely cement a temporary fee 
reduction that NASDAQ offered at 
various times in 2013. The language 
describing the temporary fee reduction 
is being deleted from the Exchange 
rulebook.3 

2. NASDAQ is modifying Rule 7034(a) 
to clarify that the Multi-Firm Cabinets 
Fee is assessed for each firm that 
occupies space in a cabinet other than 
the firm that contracts with NASDAQ 
Technology Services for that cabinet. 
This language is intended to better 
reflect the original intent of the Multi- 
Firm Cabinets fee and represents no 
change in NASDAQ’s billing practice. 

3. NASDAQ is increasing by $50 four 
connectivity fees set forth in Rule 
7034(b): The Category 6 Cable Patch, the 
DS–3 Connection, and the Fiber fee 
(each from $300 to $350), and also the 
POTS Line fee (from $0 to $50). These 
are previously filed offerings that users 
request to connect to various 
telecommunications providers or other 
colocation cabinets. 

4. NASDAQ is increasing the Ongoing 
Monthly Fee for four forms of 
connectivity to NASDAQ currently set 
forth in Rule 7034(b). Specifically, 
NASDAQ is increasing from $15,000 to 
$20,000 the monthly fee for the 40Gb 
Fiber connection to NASDAQ; from 
$5,000 to $10,000 the monthly fee for 
the 10Gb Fiber connection to NASDAQ; 
from $1,000 to $2,500 the monthly fee 
for the 1Gb Fiber connection to 
NASDAQ; and from $1,000 to $2,500 
the monthly fee for the 1Gb Copper 
connection to NASDAQ. 

5. Finally, NASDAQ is reducing from 
$7,000 to $4,500 the installation fee for 
the Super High Density Cabinet Kit set 
forth in Rule 7034(d). A user installing 
a new Super High Density Cabinet pays 
this ‘‘Kit’’ fee for various necessary 
cabinet accessories, in addition to the 
$4,500 installation fee set forth in Rule 
7034(a) which covers the labor and 

materials costs for the actual cabinet 
installation service. 

2. Statutory Basis 
The Exchange believes that its 

proposal is consistent with Section 6(b) 
of the Act 4 in general, and with 
Sections 6(b)(4), (b)(5) and (b)(8) of the 
Act,5 in particular, in that it provides for 
the equitable allocation of reasonable 
dues, fees and other charges among 
members and issuers and other persons 
using any facility or system which the 
Exchange operates or controls, and is 
designed to promote just and equitable 
principles of trade, to remove 
impediments to and perfect the 
mechanism of a free and open market 
and a national market system, and, in 
general to protect investors and the 
public interest. 

The Exchange believes that the 
proposed fees changes are consistent 
with Section 6(b)(4) of the Act for 
multiple reasons. The Exchange 
operates in a highly competitive market 
in which exchanges offer co-location 
services as a means to facilitate the 
trading activities of those members who 
believe that co-location enhances the 
efficiency of their trading. Accordingly, 
fees charged for co-location services are 
constrained by the active competition 
for the order flow of such members. If 
a particular exchange charges excessive 
fees for co-location services, affected 
members will opt to terminate their co- 
location arrangements with that 
exchange, and adopt a possible range of 
alternative strategies, including co- 
locating with a different exchange, 
placing their servers in a physically 
proximate location outside the 
exchange’s data center, or pursuing 
trading strategies not dependent upon 
co-location. Accordingly, the exchange 
charging excessive fees would stand to 
lose not only co-location revenues but 
also revenues associated with the 
execution of orders routed to it by 
affected members. 

The fees are fair and equitable 
whether considered in total or 
individually. First, NASDAQ is 
proposing a major fee reduction for all 
colocation users by reducing ongoing 
monthly fees for all cabinets and the 
fees for installing new Super High 
Density Cabinets (both the standard 
installation fee set forth in subsection 
(a) and the ‘‘Kit’’ fee set forth in 
subsection (d)). These fee reduction [sic] 
range from 35 to 50 percent, and they 
will benefit each cabinet user for each 
month in the future. These fee 
reductions are offset in part by minor 

increases of $50 per month for four 
connectivity fees set forth in Rule 
7034(b) (the Category 6 Cable Patch, the 
DS–3 Connection, and the Fiber fee 
(from $300 to $350), and also the POTS 
Line fee from $0 to $50) and also to the 
Ongoing Monthly Fee for three forms on 
connectivity set forth in Rule 7034(b) 
(the 40Gb Fiber connection, the 10Gb 
Fiber connection, the 1Gb Fiber 
connection; and the 1Gb Copper 
connection to NASDAQ). 

Moreover, the Exchange believes the 
proposed fees [sic] changes are 
reasonable because they are based on 
the Exchange’s costs to cover hardware, 
installation, testing and connection, as 
well expenses involved in maintaining 
and managing the colocation facilities. 
The proposed fees allow the Exchange 
to recoup these costs and make a profit, 
while providing customers the ability to 
reduce latency in a well-maintained and 
operated environment. The Exchange 
believes that the proposed fees are 
reasonable in that they reflect the costs 
and the benefit of the lower latency to 
clients. 

The Exchange also believes that the 
proposed fees are consistent with 
Section 6(b)(5) of the Act in that the fees 
are equitably allocated and non- 
discriminatory. All Exchange members 
that voluntarily select various service 
options will be charged the same 
amount for the same services. As is true 
of all co-location services, all co-located 
clients have the option to select any 
cabinet or connectivity option, and 
there is no differentiation among 
customers with regard to the fees 
charged for the service. Further, the 
benefits of selecting such services are 
the same for all co-located clients, 
irrespective of the locations of their 
cabinets within the data center. 

The Exchange’s proposal is also 
consistent with the requirement of 
Section 6(b)(5) of the Act that Exchange 
rules be designed to prevent fraudulent 
and manipulative acts and practices, to 
promote just and equitable principles of 
trade, to foster cooperation and 
coordination with persons engaged in 
regulating, clearing, settling, processing 
information with respect to, and 
facilitating transactions in securities, to 
remove impediments to and perfect the 
mechanism of a free and open market 
and a national market system, and, in 
general, to protect investors and the 
public interest; and are not designed to 
permit unfair discrimination between 
customers, issuers, brokers, or dealers. 
The proposal is consistent with these 
requirements insomuch as it makes 
available to market participants, at a 
reasonable fee and on a non- 
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6 15 U.S.C. 78s(b)(3)(A). 
7 17 CFR 240.19b–4(f). 8 17 CFR 200.30–3(a)(12). 

1 15 U.S.C. 78s(b)(1). 
2 17 CFR 240.19b–4. 
3 Changes are marked to the rules of NASDAQ 

OMX BX, Inc. found at http:// 
nasdaqomxbx.cchwallstreet.com. 

discriminatory basis, access to low 
latency means of trading. 

Finally, for the reasons stated below 
in Section 4 of Form 19b–4, the 
proposed fees [sic] changes are 
consistent with Section 6(b)(8) of the 
Act in that they do not impose a burden 
on competition not necessary or 
appropriate in furtherance of the 
purposes of the Act. 

B. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement on Burden on Competition 

NASDAQ does not believe that the 
proposed rule change will result in any 
burden on competition that is not 
necessary or appropriate in furtherance 
of the purposes of the Act, as amended. 
To the contrary, as discussed above, the 
Exchange believes that fees for co- 
location services are constrained by the 
robust competition for order flow among 
exchanges and non-exchange markets, 
because co-location exists to advance 
that competition. Further, excessive fees 
for co-location services would serve to 
impair an exchange’s ability to compete 
for order flow rather than burdening 
competition. In fact, NASDAQ believes 
that the proposal reflects the positive 
effects of robust competition but for 
which NASDAQ would no incentive to 
reduce fees for any colocation offerings. 

C. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement on Comments on the 
Proposed Rule Change Received From 
Members, Participants, or Others 

No written comments were either 
solicited or received. 

III. Date of Effectiveness of the 
Proposed Rule Change and Timing for 
Commission Action 

The foregoing rule change has become 
effective pursuant to Section 19(b)(3)(A) 
of the Act 6 and paragraph (f) of Rule 
19b–4 thereunder.7 At any time within 
60 days of the filing of the proposed rule 
change, the Commission summarily may 
temporarily suspend such rule change if 
it appears to the Commission that such 
action is necessary or appropriate in the 
public interest, for the protection of 
investors, or otherwise in furtherance of 
the purposes of the Act. 

IV. Solicitation of Comments 

Interested persons are invited to 
submit written data, views, and 
arguments concerning the foregoing, 
including whether the proposed rule 
change is consistent with the Act. 
Comments may be submitted by any of 
the following methods: 

Electronic Comments 

• Use the Commission’s Internet 
comment form (http://www.sec.gov/
rules/sro.shtml); or 

• Send an email to rule-comments@
sec.gov. Please include File Number SR– 
NASDAQ–2013–157 on the subject line. 

Paper Comments 

• Send paper comments in triplicate 
to Elizabeth M. Murphy, Secretary, 
Securities and Exchange Commission, 
100 F Street NE., Washington, DC 
20549–1090. 

All submissions should refer to File 
Number SR–NASDAQ–2013–157. This 
file number should be included on the 
subject line if email is used. To help the 
Commission process and review your 
comments more efficiently, please use 
only one method. The Commission will 
post all comments on the Commission’s 
Internet Web site (http://www.sec.gov/
rules/sro.shtml). Copies of the 
submission, all subsequent 
amendments, all written statements 
with respect to the proposed rule 
change that are filed with the 
Commission, and all written 
communications relating to the 
proposed rule change between the 
Commission and any person, other than 
those that may be withheld from the 
public in accordance with the 
provisions of 5 U.S.C. 552, will be 
available for Web site viewing and 
printing in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room, 100 F Street NE., 
Washington, DC 20549, on official 
business days between the hours of 
10:00 a.m. and 3:00 p.m. Copies of the 
filing also will be available for 
inspection and copying at the principal 
office of the Exchange. All comments 
received will be posted without change; 
the Commission does not edit personal 
identifying information from 
submissions. You should submit only 
information that you wish to make 
available publicly. All submissions 
should refer to File Number SR– 
NASDAQ–2013–157 and should be 
submitted on or before January 27, 2014. 

For the Commission, by the Division of 
Trading and Markets, pursuant to delegated 
authority.8 

Elizabeth M. Murphy, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2013–31517 Filed 1–3–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8011–01–P 

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE 
COMMISSION 

[Release No. 34–71197; File No. SR–BX– 
2013–063] 

Self-Regulatory Organizations; 
NASDAQ OMX BX, Inc.; Notice of Filing 
and Immediate Effectiveness of 
Proposed Rule Change to Modify the 
Extranet Access Fee 

December 30, 2013. 
Pursuant to Section 19(b)(1) of the 

Securities Exchange Act of 1934 
(‘‘Act’’),1 and Rule 19b–4 thereunder,2 
notice is hereby given that on December 
19, 2013, NASDAQ OMX BX, Inc. (‘‘BX’’ 
or ‘‘Exchange’’) filed with the Securities 
and Exchange Commission (‘‘SEC’’ or 
‘‘Commission’’) the proposed rule 
change as described in Items I, II, and 
III below, which Items have been 
prepared by the Exchange. The 
Commission is publishing this notice to 
solicit comments on the proposed rule 
change from interested persons. 

I. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement of the Terms of the Substance 
of the Proposed Rule Change 

The Exchange [sic] to modify the 
extranet access fee (‘‘Extranet Access 
Fee’’) set forth in BX Rule 7025, as well 
as to clarify its applicability. BX will 
implement the proposed revised fee on 
January 2, 2014. 

The text of the proposed rule change 
is below. Proposed new language is 
italicized; proposed deletions are 
bracketed.3 
* * * * * 

7025. Extranet Access Fee 
Extranet providers that establish a 

connection with the Exchange to offer 
direct access connectivity to market data 
feeds shall be assessed a monthly access 
fee of $1,000 [750] per client 
organization Customer Premises 
Equipment (‘‘CPE’’) Configuration. If an 
extranet provider uses multiple CPE 
Configurations to provide market data 
feeds to any client organization, the 
monthly fee shall apply to each such 
CPE Configuration. For purposes of this 
Rule 7025, the term ‘‘Customer Premises 
Equipment Configuration’’ shall mean 
any line, circuit, router package, or 
other technical configuration used by an 
extranet provider to provide a direct 
access connection to the Exchange 
market data feeds to a recipient’s site. 
No extranet access fee will be charged 
for connectivity to market data feeds 
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