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DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request 

May 8, 2019. 
The Department of Agriculture has 

submitted the following information 
collection requirement(s) to OMB for 
review and clearance under the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, 
Public Law 104–13. Comments are 
requested regarding; whether the 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of burden including 
the validity of the methodology and 
assumptions used; ways to enhance the 
quality, utility and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and ways to 
minimize the burden of the collection of 
information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology. 

Comments regarding this information 
collection received by June 12, 2019 
will be considered. Written comments 
should be addressed to: Desk Officer for 
Agriculture, Office of Information and 
Regulatory Affairs, Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB), New 
Executive Office Building, 725 17th 
Street NW, Washington, DC 20502. 
Commenters are encouraged to submit 
their comments to OMB via email to: 
OIRA_Submission@OMB.EOP.GOV or 
fax (202) 395–5806 and to Departmental 
Clearance Office, USDA, OCIO, Mail 
Stop 7602, Washington, DC 20250– 
7602. Copies of the submission(s) may 
be obtained by calling (202) 720–8958. 

An agency may not conduct or 
sponsor a collection of information 
unless the collection of information 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number and the agency informs 

potential persons who are to respond to 
the collection of information that such 
persons are not required to respond to 
the collection of information unless it 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number. 

Animal and Plant Health Inspection 
Service 

Title: Location of Irradiation 
Treatment Facilities in the United 
States. 

OMB Control Number: 0579–0383. 
Summary of Collection: The United 

States Department of Agriculture 
(USDA) is responsible for preventing 
plant diseases or insect pests from 
entering into the United States, 
preventing the spread of pests and 
noxious weeds not widely distributed 
into the United States, and eradicating 
those imported pests when eradication 
is feasible. The Plant Protection Act (7 
U.S.C. 7701—et seq.) authorizes USDA 
to carry out this mission. Under the 
Plant Protection Act, the Animal and 
Plant Health Inspection Service (APHIS) 
is authorized, among other things, to 
regulate the importation of plants, plant 
products, and other articles to prevent 
the introduction of plant pests in the 
United States. 

Need and Use of the Information: 
APHIS will use the following 
information collection activities to 
provide criteria for the approval/ 
certification of irradiation treatment 
facilities in an effort to prevent the 
introduction or spread of plant pests 
and plant diseases in the United States: 
Request for Initial Certification and 
Inspection of Facility; Certification and 
Recertification of Facility; Denial and 
Withdrawal of Certification; Compliance 
Agreement; Irradiation Facilities 
Treating Imported Articles; Irradiation 
Treatment Framework Equivalency 
Work plan; Irradiation Facilities 
Notification; Recordkeeping; Facility to 
Maintain and Provide Updated Map 
Identifying Places Horticultural/Crops 
are Grown; Facility Contingency Plan; 
Letter of Concurrence or Non- 
Agreement; Treatment Arrangements; 
Pest Management Plan; and Facility 
Map—Detailed Layout of Facility. If the 
information is not collected, APHIS 
would have no practical way of 
determining that any given commodity 
had actually been irradiated. 

Description of Respondents: Business 
or other for-profits; Federal 

Government; State, Local or Tribal 
Government. 

Number of Respondents: 24. 
Frequency of Responses: Reporting: 

On occasion. 
Total Burden Hours: 988. 

Ruth Brown, 
Departmental Information Collection 
Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2019–09758 Filed 5–10–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3410–34–P 

COMMISSION ON CIVIL RIGHTS 

Agenda and Notice of Public Meeting 
of the New Jersey Advisory Committee 

AGENCY: Commission on Civil Rights. 
ACTION: Announcement of meeting. 

SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given, 
pursuant to the provisions of the rules 
and regulations of the U.S. Commission 
on Civil Rights (Commission), and the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act 
(FACA), that a planning meeting of the 
New Jersey Advisory Committee to the 
Commission will convene by conference 
call, on Friday, May 17, 2019 at 11:30 
a.m. (EDT). The purpose of the meeting 
is to announce the selection of the topic 
of the Committee’s civil rights project, 
identify the members appointed to the 
Planning Workgroup and to discuss 
plans for the Briefing Meeting. 
DATES: Friday, May 17, 2019, at 11:30 
a.m. (EDT). 
ADDRESSES: Public Call-In Information: 
Conference call number: 1–888–394– 
8218 and conference call ID number: 
6970676. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Ivy 
L. Davis, at ero@usccr.gov or by phone 
at 202–376–7533. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Interested 
members of the public may listen to the 
discussion by calling the following toll- 
free conference call number: 1–888– 
394–8218 and conference call ID 
number: 6970676. Please be advised that 
before placing them into the conference 
call, the conference call operator may 
ask callers to provide their names, their 
organizational affiliations (if any), and 
email addresses (so that callers may be 
notified of future meetings). Callers can 
expect to incur charges for calls they 
initiate over wireless lines, and the 
Commission will not refund any 
incurred charges. Callers will incur no 
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charge for calls they initiate over land- 
line connections to the toll-free 
telephone number herein. 

Persons with hearing impairments 
may also follow the discussion by first 
calling the Federal Relay Service at 
1–800–877–8339 and providing the 
operator with the toll-free conference 
call number: 1–888–394–8218 and 
conference call ID number: 6970676. 

Members of the public are invited to 
make statements during the Public 
Comment section of the meeting or to 
submit written comments. The 
comments must be received in the 
regional office approximately 30 days 
after each scheduled meeting. Written 
comments may be mailed to the Eastern 
Regional Office, U.S. Commission on 
Civil Rights, 1331 Pennsylvania 
Avenue, Suite 1150, Washington, DC 
20425, or emailed to Evelyn Bohor at 
ero@usccr.gov. Persons who desire 
additional information may contact the 
Eastern Regional Office at (202) 376– 
7533. 

Records and documents discussed 
during the meeting will be available for 
public viewing as they become available 
at: https://gsageo.force.com/FACA/ 
FACAPublicViewCommitteeDetails?id=
a10t0000001gzjVAAQ; click the 
‘‘Meeting Details’’ and ‘‘Documents’’ 
links. Records generated from this 
meeting may also be inspected and 
reproduced at the Eastern Regional 
Office, as they become available, both 
before and after the meetings. Persons 
interested in the work of this advisory 
committee are advised to go to the 
Commission’s website, www.usccr.gov, 
or to contact the Eastern Regional Office 
at the above phone number, email or 
street address. 

Agenda: Friday, May 17, 2019 at 11:30 
a.m. (EDT) 

I. Welcome and Roll Call 
II. Planning Meeting 

—Announce Committee Selection of 
Civil Rights Project 

—Identify members Appointed to the 
Planning Workgroup 

—Discuss Plans for the Briefing 
Meeting 

III. Other Business 
IV. Next Meeting 
V. Public Comment 
VI. Adjourn 

Exceptional Circumstance: Pursuant 
to 41 CFR 102–3.150, the notice for this 
meeting is given less than 15 calendar 
days prior to the meeting because of the 
exceptional circumstances of the federal 
government shutdown. 

Dated: May 7, 2019. 
David Mussatt, 
Supervisory Chief, Regional Programs Unit. 
[FR Doc. 2019–09749 Filed 5–10–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

COMMISSION ON CIVIL RIGHTS 

Agenda and Notice of Public Meeting 
of the Delaware Advisory Committee 

AGENCY: Commission on Civil Rights. 
ACTION: Announcement of meeting. 

SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given, 
pursuant to the provisions of the rules 
and regulations of the U.S. Commission 
on Civil Rights (Commission), and the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act 
(FACA), that a planning meeting of the 
Delaware Advisory Committee to the 
Commission will convene by conference 
call, on Monday, May 20, 2019 at 4:00 
p.m. (EDT). The purpose of the meeting 
is to discuss and vote on the 
Committee’s report on implicit bias and 
policing in communities of color in 
Delaware. 

DATES: Monday, May 20, 2019 at 4:00 
p.m. (EDT). 

Public Call-In Information: 
Conference call number: 1–888–254– 
3590 and conference call ID: 4124362. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Ivy 
L. Davis, at ero@usccr.gov or by phone 
at 202–376–7533 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Interested 
members of the public may listen to the 
discussion by calling the following toll- 
free conference call number: 1–888– 
254–3590 and conference call ID: 
4124362. Please be advised that before 
placing them into the conference call, 
the conference call operator may ask 
callers to provide their names, their 
organizational affiliations (if any), and 
email addresses (so that callers may be 
notified of future meetings). Callers can 
expect to incur charges for calls they 
initiate over wireless lines, and the 
Commission will not refund any 
incurred charges. Callers will incur no 
charge for calls they initiate over land- 
line connections to the toll-free 
telephone number herein. 

Persons with hearing impairments 
may also follow the discussion by first 
calling the Federal Relay Service at 1– 
800–877–8339 and providing the 
operator with the toll-free conference 
call number:1–888–254–3590 and 
conference call ID: 4124362. 

Members of the public are invited 
make statements during the Public 
Comment section of the meeting or to 
submit written comments; the written 
comments must be received in the 

regional office approximately 30 days 
after each scheduled meeting. Written 
comments may be mailed to the Eastern 
Regional Office, U.S. Commission on 
Civil Rights, 1331 Pennsylvania 
Avenue, Suite 1150, Washington, DC 
20425 or emailed to Evelyn Bohor at 
ero@usccr.gov. Persons who desire 
additional information may contact the 
Eastern Regional Office at (202) 376– 
7533. 

Records and documents discussed 
during the meeting will be available for 
public viewing as they become available 
at: https://gsageo.force.com/FACA/ 
FACAPublicViewCommitteeDetails?id=
a10t0000001gzlEAAQ click the 
‘‘Meeting Details’’ and ‘‘Documents’’ 
links. Records generated from this 
meeting may also be inspected and 
reproduced at the Eastern Regional 
Office, as they become available, both 
before and after the meetings. Persons 
interested in the work of this advisory 
committee are advised to go to the 
Commission’s website, www.usccr.gov, 
or to contact the Eastern Regional Office 
at the above phone number, email or 
street address. 

Agenda: Monday, May 20, 2019 at 4:00 
p.m. (EDT) 
I. Welcome and Roll Call 
II. Project Planning 

—Discuss and Vote on Draft Report 
III. Other Business 
IV. Public Comment 
V. Next Meeting 
VI. Adjourn 

Exceptional Circumstance: Pursuant 
to 41 CFR 102–3.150, the notice for this 
meeting is given less than 15 calendar 
days prior to the meeting because of the 
exceptional circumstances of the federal 
government shutdown. 

Dated: May 7, 2019. 
David Mussatt, 
Supervisory Chief, Regional Programs Unit. 
[FR Doc. 2019–09744 Filed 5–10–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

COMMISSION ON CIVIL RIGHTS 

Agenda and Notice of Public Meeting 
of the District of Columbia Advisory 
Committee 

AGENCY: Commission on Civil Rights. 
ACTION: Announcement of meeting. 

SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given, 
pursuant to the provisions of the rules 
and regulations of the U.S. Commission 
on Civil Rights (Commission), and the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act 
(FACA), that a meeting of the District of 
Columbia Advisory Committee to the 
Commission will convene by conference 
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