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ADDRESSES: You may submit comments, 
identified by the title of the information 
collection activity, by any of the 
following methods: 

(1) By mail sent to: Corporation for 
National and Community Service; 
Attention Amy Borgstrom, Associate 
Director for Policy, Room 9515; 1201 
New York Avenue NW., Washington, 
DC 20525. 

(2) By hand delivery or by courier to 
the Corporation’s mailroom at Room 
8100 at the mail address given in 
paragraph (1) above, between 9:00 a.m. 
and 4:00 p.m. Monday through Friday, 
except Federal holidays. 

(3) By fax to: (202) 606–3476, 
Attention Amy Borgstrom, Associate 
Director for Policy. 

(4) Electronically through the 
Corporation’s email address system: 
aborgstrom@cns.gov or 
www.regulations.gov. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Amy Borgstrom, (202) 606–6930, or by 
email at aborgstrom@cns.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

The Corporation is particularly 
interested in comments that: 

• Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the Corporation, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

• Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

• Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

• Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are expected to respond, including the 
use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology 
(e.g., permitting electronic submissions 
of responses). 

Background: These application 
instructions will be used by applicants 
for funding through AmeriCorps State 
and National grant competitions. 

Current Action: The Corporation seeks 
to renew and revise the current 
AmeriCorps State and National 
Application Instructions. The 
Application Instructions are being 
revised to accurately describe new 
performance measurement screens. The 
Application Instructions will be used in 
the same manner as the existing 
Application Instructions. The 
Corporation also seeks to continue using 
the current Application Instructions 

until the revised Application 
Instructions are approved by OMB. The 
current Application Instructions are due 
to expire on April 30, 2015. 

Type of Review: Renewal. 
Agency: Corporation for National and 

Community Service. 
Title: AmeriCorps Application 

Instructions: State Commissions; State 
and National Competitive; Professional 
Corps; Indian Tribes; States and 
Territories without Commissions; and 
State and National Planning. 

OMB Number: 3045–0047. 
Agency Number: None. 
Affected Public: Nonprofit 

organizations, State, Local and Tribal. 
Total Respondents: 654. 
Frequency: Annually. 
Average Time per Response: 24 hours. 
Estimated Total Burden Hours: 15,696 

hours. 
Total Burden Cost (capital/startup): 

None. 
Total Burden Cost (operating/ 

maintenance): None. 
Comments submitted in response to 

this notice will be summarized and/or 
included in the request for Office of 
Management and Budget approval of the 
information collection request; they will 
also become a matter of public record. 

Dated: May 7, 2012. 
Rosa Moreno-Mahoney, 
Acting Director, AmeriCorps State and 
National. 
[FR Doc. 2012–11554 Filed 5–11–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6050–$$–P 

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 

Office of the Secretary 

Renewal of Department of Defense 
Federal Advisory Committees 

AGENCY: DoD. 
ACTION: Renewal of Federal Advisory 
Committee. 

SUMMARY: Under the provisions of 10 
U.S.C. 2166(e), the Federal Advisory 
Committee Act of 1972 (5 U.S.C. 
Appendix), the Government in the 
Sunshine Act of 1976 (5 U.S.C. 552b), 
and 41 CFR 102–3.50(a), the Department 
of Defense gives notice that it is 
renewing the charter for the Missouri 
River (North Dakota) Task Force 
(hereafter referred to as ‘‘the Task 
Force’’). 

The Task Force shall provide 
independent advice and 
recommendations on plans and projects 
to reduce siltation of the Missouri River 
in the State of North Dakota, as 
described in this notice and in Section 
705 of Title VII, the Missouri River 

Protection and Improvement Act of 
2000, Public Law 106–541. 

The Task Force shall provide 
independent advice and 
recommendations to the Secretary of the 
Army on plans and projects to reduce 
siltation of the Missouri River in the 
State of North Dakota and to meet the 
objectives of the Pick-Sloan Program. 
Specifically, the Task Force shall: 
Prepare and approve, by a majority of 
the members, a plan for the use of the 
funds made available under Public Law 
106–541, to promote conservation 
practices in the Missouri River 
watershed, control and remove the 
sediment from the Missouri River, 
protect recreation on the Missouri River 
from sedimentation, and protect Indian 
and non-Indian historical and cultural 
sites along the Missouri River from 
erosion; develop and recommend to the 
Secretary of the Army for 
implementation critical restoration 
projects meeting the goals of the plan; 
and determine if these projects 
primarily benefit the Federal 
Government. 

The Task Force shall report to the 
Secretary of the Army and the U.S. 
Army Corps of Engineers. As prescribed 
by Public Law 106–541, the Task Force 
shall be composed of not more than 
twenty members. Specifically, the Task 
Force membership shall be composed 
of: The Secretary of the Army or 
designee, who shall serve as the 
Chairperson; the Secretary of 
Agriculture or designee; the Secretary of 
Energy or designee; the Secretary of the 
Interior or designee; and The Trust. 

The Trust is composed of sixteen 
members to be appointed by the 
Secretary of the Army, including: 
Twelve members recommended by the 
Governor of North Dakota that represent 
equally the various interest of the 
public. Included in these twelve 
members, there shall be 
recommendations of representatives of 
the North Dakota Department of Health, 
the North Dakota Parks and Recreation 
Department, the North Dakota 
Department of Game and Fish, the North 
Dakota State Water Commission, the 
North Dakota Indian Affairs 
Commission, agricultural groups, 
environmental or conservation groups, 
the hydroelectric power industry, 
recreation user groups, local 
governments, and other appropriate 
interests. The Trust also shall include 
one member recommended by each of 
the four Indian Tribes in the State of 
North Dakota. 

These individuals recommended for 
The Trust shall be appointed by the 
Secretary of the Army as representative 
members to the Task Force. All Task 
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Force members shall be appointed for 
two-year terms and generally will serve 
no more than four years total on the 
Task Force, or as determined by the 
Secretary of the Army or designee. In 
addition, all Task Force members shall, 
with the exception of travel and per 
diem for official travel, serve without 
compensation. This same term of 
service limitation also applies to any 
DoD authorized subcommittees. 

With DoD approval, the Task Force is 
authorized to establish subcommittees, 
as necessary and consistent with its 
mission. These subcommittees or 
working groups shall operate under the 
provisions of the FACA, the 
Government in the Sunshine Act, and 
other appropriate Federal statutes and 
regulations. 

Such subcommittees or working 
groups shall not work independently of 
the chartered Task Force, and shall 
report all their recommendations and 
advice to the Task Force for full 
deliberation and discussion. 
Subcommittees or working groups have 
no authority to make decisions on 
behalf of the chartered Task Force; nor 
can they report directly to the 
Department of Defense or any Federal 
officers or employees. 

All subcommittees operate under the 
provisions of FACA, the Government in 
the Sunshine Act of 1976 (5 U.S.C. 
§ 552b), governing Federal statutes and 
regulations, and governing DoD 
policies/procedures. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Jim 
Freeman, Advisory Committee 
Management Officer for the Department 
of Defense, 703–692–5952. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The Task 
Force shall meet at the call of the Task 
Force’s Designated Federal Officer, in 
consultation with the Task Force’s 
Chairperson. The estimated number of 
Task Force meetings is no less than two 
per year. 

In addition, the Designated Federal 
Officer is required to be in attendance 
at all Task Force and subcommittee 
meetings for the entire duration of each 
and every meeting; however, in the 
absence of the Designated Federal 
Officer, the Alternate Designated 
Federal Officer shall attend the entire 
duration of the Task Force or 
subcommittee meeting. 

Pursuant to 41 CFR §§ 102–3.105(j) 
and 102–3.140, the public or interested 
organizations may submit written 
statements to Task Force membership 
about the Task Force’s mission and 
functions. Written statements may be 
submitted at any time or in response to 
the stated agenda of planned meeting of 
the Task Force. 

All written statements shall be 
submitted to the Designated Federal 
Officer for the Task Force, and this 
individual will ensure that the written 
statements are provided to the 
membership for their consideration. 
Contact information for the Task Force 
Designated Federal Officer can be 
obtained from the GSA’s FACA 
Database—https://www.fido.gov/ 
facadatabase/public.asp. 

The Designated Federal Officer, 
pursuant to 41 CFR 102–3.150, will 
announce planned meetings of the Task 
Force. The Designated Federal Officer, 
at that time, may provide additional 
guidance on the submission of written 
statements that are in response to the 
stated agenda for the planned meeting 
in question. 

Dated: May 8, 2012. 
Aaron Siegel, 
Alternate OSD Federal Register Liaison 
Officer, Department of Defense. 
[FR Doc. 2012–11482 Filed 5–11–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 5001–06–P 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

Notice of Submission for OMB Review; 
Office of Planning, Evaluation and 
Policy Development; Evaluation of the 
21st Century Community Learning 
Centers State Competitions 

SUMMARY: This study will examine state 
subgrant competitions conducted under 
the 21st Century Community Learning 
Centers (CCLC) program in order to 
glean ‘‘lessons learned’’ that can inform 
efforts to improve the state capacity for 
conducting state competitions for 
similarly-structured grant programs 
under the Elementary and Secondary 
Education Act of 1965, as amended. 
More specifically, the study will 
examine how states conduct their 21st 
CCLC competitions; state-level 
conditions and capacity issues affecting 
the conduct of such competitions; how 
states evaluate the quality of local 
applications and plans; and potential 
strategies for improvement. 
DATES: Interested persons are invited to 
submit comments on or before June 13, 
2012. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments 
regarding burden and/or the collection 
activity requirements should be 
electronically mailed to 
ICDocketMgr@ed.gov or mailed to U.S. 
Department of Education, 400 Maryland 
Avenue SW., LBJ, Washington, DC 
20202–4537. Copies of the proposed 
information collection request may be 
accessed from http://edicsweb.ed.gov, 
by selecting the ‘‘Browse Pending 

Collections’’ link and by clicking on 
link number 04807. When you access 
the information collection, click on 
‘‘Download Attachments’’ to view. 
Written requests for information should 
be addressed to U.S. Department of 
Education, 400 Maryland Avenue SW., 
LBJ, Washington, DC 20202–4537. 
Requests may also be electronically 
mailed to ICDocketMgr@ed.gov or faxed 
to 202–401–0920. Please specify the 
complete title of the information 
collection and OMB Control Number 
when making your request. 

Individuals who use a 
telecommunications device for the deaf 
(TDD) may call the Federal Information 
Relay Service (FIRS) at 1–800–877– 
8339. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Section 
3506 of the Paperwork Reduction Act of 
1995 (44 U.S.C. chapter 35) requires that 
Federal agencies provide interested 
parties an early opportunity to comment 
on information collection requests. The 
Acting Director, Information Collection 
Clearance Division, Privacy, Information 
and Records Management Services, 
Office of Management, publishes this 
notice containing proposed information 
collection requests at the beginning of 
the Departmental review of the 
information collection. The Department 
of Education is especially interested in 
public comment addressing the 
following issues: (1) Is this collection 
necessary to the proper functions of the 
Department; (2) will this information be 
processed and used in a timely manner; 
(3) is the estimate of burden accurate; 
(4) how might the Department enhance 
the quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and (5) how 
might the Department minimize the 
burden of this collection on the 
respondents, including through the use 
of information technology. Please note 
that written comments received in 
response to this notice will be 
considered public records. 

Title of Collection: Evaluation of the 
21st Century Community Learning 
Centers State Competitions. 

OMB Control Number: Pending. 
Type of Review: New. 
Total Estimated Number of Annual 

Responses: 153. 
Total Estimated Number of Annual 

Burden Hours: 153. 
Abstract: Evaluation findings will 

support federal- and state-level staff in 
developing a deeper understanding of 
the capacity of states to carry out 
subgrant competitions, highlight factors 
that are important to consider in 
administering a state grant competition, 
and assist states in developing high- 
quality grant programs that meet the 
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