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Dated: April 9, 2019. 
Melanie O’Brien, 
Manager, National NAGPRA Program. 
[FR Doc. 2019–09036 Filed 5–2–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4312–52–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

[OMB Number 1110–0006] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Proposed eCollection 
eComments Requested; Law 
Enforcement Officers Killed or 
Assaulted: Extension of a Currently 
Approved Collection 

AGENCY: Federal Bureau of 
Investigation, Department of Justice. 
ACTION: 60-Day notice. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Justice 
(DOJ), Federal Bureau of Investigation 
(FBI), Criminal Justice Information 
Services Division (CJIS), will be 
submitting the following information 
collection request to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and approval in accordance with 
the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995. 
DATES: Comments are encouraged and 
will be accepted for 60 days until July 
2, 2019. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Written comments and/or suggestions 
regarding the items contained in this 
notice, especially the estimated burden 
and associated response time, should be 
directed to Mrs. Amy C. Blasher, Unit 
Chief, Federal Bureau of Investigation, 
Criminal Justice Information Services 
Division, Module E–3, 1000 Custer 
Hollow Road, Clarksburg, West Virginia 
26306. Written comments and/or 
suggestions can also be sent to the 
Office of Management and Budget, 
Office of Information and Regulatory 
Affairs, Attention: Department of Justice 
Desk Officer, Washington, DC 20503 or 
send to OIRA_submissions@
omb.eop.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Written 
comments and suggestions from the 
public and affected agencies concerning 
the proposed collection of information 
are encouraged. Your comments should 
address one or more of the following 
four points: 
—Evaluate whether the proposed 

collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

—Evaluate the accuracy of the agency’s 
estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 

including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

—Evaluate the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

—Minimize the burden of the collection 
of information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms 
of information technology, e.g., 
permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 

1. Type of Information Collection: 
Extension of a currently approved 
collection. 

2. The Title of the Form/Collection: 
Law Enforcement Officers Killed or 
Assaulted. 

3. The agency form number, if any, 
and the applicable component of the 
Department sponsoring the collection: 
Form Number: 1110–0006. Sponsor: 
Criminal Justice Information Services 
Division, Federal Bureau of 
Investigation, Department of Justice. 

4. Affected public who will be asked 
or required to respond, as well as a brief 
abstract: City, county, state, tribal and 
federal law enforcement agencies. 
Abstract: Under Title 28, U.S. Code 534, 
Acquisition, Preservation, and Exchange 
of Identification Records; Appointments 
of Officials, 1930, this collection 
requests Law Enforcement Officers 
Killed and Assaulted data from city, 
county, state, federal, and tribal law 
enforcement agencies in order for the 
FBI UCR Program to serve as the 
national clearinghouse for the collection 
and dissemination of crime data and to 
publish these statistics in the Law 
Enforcement Officers Killed and 
Assaulted annual publication. 

5. An estimate of the total number of 
respondents and the amount of time 
estimated for an average respondent to 
respond: There are approximately 
18,547 law enforcement agency within 
the universe of potential respondents. 
Based on current reporting patterns, 
10,721 law enforcement agencies would 
submit monthly resulting in 128,652 
responses with an estimated response 
time of 7 minutes per response on this 
form. The remaining 7,826 agencies 
would provide responses through the 
National Incident-Based Reporting 
System covered under a different data 
collection. 

6. An estimate of the total public 
burden (in hours) associated with the 
collection: There are approximately 
15,009 hours, annual burden, associated 
with this information collection. 

If additional information is required 
contact: Melody Braswell, Department 
Clearance Officer, United States 
Department of Justice, Justice 
Management Division, Policy and 
Planning Staff, Two Constitution 
Square, 145 N Street NE, 3E.405A, 
Washington, DC 20530. 

Dated: April 29, 2019. 
Melody Braswell, 
Department Clearance Officer for PRA, U.S. 
Department of Justice. 
[FR Doc. 2019–08999 Filed 5–2–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–02–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

[OMB Number 1110–0069] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Proposed eCollection 
eComments Requested; Revision of a 
Currently Approved Collection Flash/ 
Cancellation/Transfer Notice (I–12) 

AGENCY: Department of Justice, Federal 
Bureau of Investigation, Criminal Justice 
Information Services Division. 
ACTION: 30-Day notice. 

SUMMARY: Department of Justice (DOJ), 
Federal Bureau of Investigation (FBI), 
Criminal Justice Information Services 
(CJIS) Division will be submitting the 
following information collection request 
to the Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) for review and approval in 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995. This proposed 
information collection was previously 
published in the Federal Register 
Volume xx, Number xxx, pages xx–xx, 
on Month xx, 2019, allowing for a 60 
day comment period. 
DATES: Comments are encouraged and 
will be accepted for an additional 30 
days until June 3, 2019. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Written comments and/or suggestions 
regarding the items contained in this 
notice, especially the estimated public 
burden and associated response time, 
should be directed to Gerry Lynn 
Brovey, Supervisory Information 
Liaison Specialist, Federal Bureau of 
Investigation, Criminal Justice 
Information Services Division, 1000 
Custer Hollow Road, Clarksburg, WV 
26306, phone: 304–625–4320 or email 
glbrovey@ic.fbi.gov. Written comments 
and/or suggestions can also be sent to 
the Office of Management and Budget, 
Office of Information and Regulatory 
Affairs, Attention Department of Justice 
Desk Officer, Washington, DC 20503 or 
sent to OIRA_submissions@
omb.eop.gov. 

VerDate Sep<11>2014 16:41 May 02, 2019 Jkt 247001 PO 00000 Frm 00089 Fmt 4703 Sfmt 4703 E:\FR\FM\03MYN1.SGM 03MYN1am
oz

ie
 o

n 
D

S
K

9F
9S

C
42

P
R

O
D

 w
ith

 N
O

T
IC

E
S

mailto:OIRA_submissions@omb.eop.gov.
mailto:OIRA_submissions@omb.eop.gov.
mailto:OIRA_submissions@omb.eop.gov.
mailto:OIRA_submissions@omb.eop.gov.
mailto:glbrovey@ic.fbi.gov


19119 Federal Register / Vol. 84, No. 86 / Friday, May 3, 2019 / Notices 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Written 
comments and suggestions from the 
public and affected agencies concerning 
the proposed collection of information 
are encouraged. Your comments should 
address one or more of the following 
four points: 
—Evaluate whether the proposed 

collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

—Evaluate the accuracy of the agency’s 
estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

—Evaluate whether and if so how the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected can be 
enhanced; and 

—Minimize the burden of the collection 
of information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or technological 
collection techniques or other forms 
of information technology, e.g., 
permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 

(1) Type of Information Collection: 
Revision of a currently approved 
collection. 

(2) Title of the Form/Collection: 
Flash/Cancellation/Transfer Notice. 

(3) The agency form number, if any, 
and the applicable component of the 
Department sponsoring the collection: 
Agency form number I–12. 

Sponsoring component: Department 
of Justice, Federal Bureau of 
Investigation, Criminal Justice 
Information Services Division. 

(4) Affected public who will be asked 
or required to respond, as well as a brief 
abstract: Primary: City, county, state, 
federal and tribal law enforcement 
agencies. This collection is needed to 
indicate on an individual’s identity 
history that the individual is being 
supervised to ensure the supervisory 
agency is notified of any additional 
criminal activity. Acceptable data is 
stored as part of the Next Generation 
Identification (NGI) system of the FBI. 

(5) An estimate of the total number of 
respondents and the amount of time 
estimated for an average respondent to 
respond: It is estimated that 1,171 
respondents will complete each form 
within approximately 8 minutes. 

(6) An estimate of the total public 
burden (in hours) associated with the 
collection: There are an estimated 

25,905 total annual burden hours 
associated with this collection. 

If additional information is required 
contact: Melody Braswell, Department 
Clearance Officer, United States 
Department of Justice, Justice 
Management Division, Policy and 
Planning Staff, Two Constitution 
Square, 145 N Street NE, Suite 3E.405B, 
Washington, DC 20530. 

Dated: April 29, 2019. 
Melody Braswell, 
Department Clearance Officer for PRA, U.S. 
Department of Justice. 
[FR Doc. 2019–09000 Filed 5–2–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–02–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

EMPLOYMENT AND TRAINING 
ADMINISTRATION 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Comment Request; Worker 
Profiling and Reemployment Services 
Activity and Worker Profiling and 
Reemployment Services Outcomes 

ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Labor’s 
(DOL’s) Employment and Training 
Administration (ETA) is soliciting 
comments concerning a proposed 
extension for the authority to conduct 
the information collection request (ICR) 
titled, ‘‘Worker Profiling and 
Reemployment Services Activity and 
Worker Profiling and Reemployment 
Services Outcomes.’’ This comment 
request is part of continuing 
Departmental efforts to reduce 
paperwork and respondent burden in 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995 (PRA). 
DATES: Consideration will be given to all 
written comments received by July 2, 
2019. 

ADDRESSES: A copy of this ICR with 
applicable supporting documentation, 
including a description of the likely 
respondents, proposed frequency of 
response, and estimated total burden, 
may be obtained free by contacting 
Lawrence Burns by telephone at 202– 
693–3141 (this is not a toll-free 
number), TTY 1–877–889–5627 (this is 
not a toll-free number), or by email at 
Burns.Lawrence@dol.gov. 

Submit written comments about, or 
requests for a copy of, this ICR by mail 
or courier to the U.S. Department of 
Labor, Employment and Training 
Administration, Office of 
Unemployment Insurance Room 
S–4520, 200 Constitution Avenue NW, 
Washington, DC 20210, by email at 

Burns.Lawrence@dol.gov, or by Fax at 
202–693–3975. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: DOL, as 
part of continuing efforts to reduce 
paperwork and respondent burden, 
conducts a pre-clearance consultation 
program to provide the general public 
and Federal agencies an opportunity to 
comment on proposed and/or 
continuing collections of information 
before submitting them to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for final 
approval. This program helps to ensure 
requested data can be provided in the 
desired format, reporting burden (time 
and financial resources) is minimized, 
collection instruments are clearly 
understood, and the impact of collection 
requirements can be properly assessed. 

ETA is soliciting comments 
concerning the collection of data in the 
ETA 9048, Worker Profiling and 
Reemployment Services Activity Report, 
and the ETA 9049, Worker Profiling and 
Reemployment Services Outcomes 
Report. Authorization for both reports 
expires on November 30, 2019. The 
Worker Profiling and Reemployment 
Services (WPRS) program, mandated by 
the Unemployment Compensation 
Amendments of 1993, Public Law 103– 
152, identifies and ranks unemployment 
insurance (UI) claimants by their 
potential for exhausting their benefits 
before returning to work and refers these 
claimants to appropriate reemployment 
services. 

WPRS is a required UI activity that 
each state may operate as a standalone 
program or integrated within the state’s 
Reemployment Services and Eligibility 
Assessment Program (RESEA), which is 
a voluntary reemployment program 
authorized by Section 306 of the Social 
Security Act (SSA). Specifically, states 
participating in the RESEA program 
may opt to integrate WPRS into the 
RESEA participant selection process. 
Additional information about the 
integration of WPRS into RESEA is 
available in Unemployment Insurance 
Program Letter No. 07–19, ‘‘Fiscal Year 
(FY) 2019 Funding Allotments and 
Operating Guidance for Unemployment 
Insurance (UI) Reemployment Services 
and Eligibility Assessment (RESEA) 
Grants.’’ 

The ETA 9048 and ETA 9049 reports 
are the only means of tracking the 
activities in the WPRS program. The 
ETA 9048 report describes the number 
of claimants at various points in the 
WPRS system from initial profiling 
through the completion of specific 
reemployment services. The ETA 9049 
describes the reemployment experience 
of profiled claimants selected for 
referral to services by examining the 
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