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must file in accordance with Rules 211 
and 214 of the Commission’s 
Regulations (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214) on or before 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
time on the specified comment date. 
Protests may be considered, but 
intervention is necessary to become a 
party to the proceeding. 

eFiling is encouraged. More detailed 
information relating to filing 
requirements, interventions, protests, 
service, and qualifying facilities filings 
can be found at: http://www.ferc.gov/ 
docs-filing/efiling/filing-req.pdf. For 
other information, call (866) 208–3676 
(toll free). For TTY, call (202) 502–8659. 

Dated: September 22, 2020. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2020–21350 Filed 9–25–20; 8:45 am] 
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Take notice that on September 21, 
2020, pursuant to Rule 207(a)(2) of the 
Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission’s (Commission) Rules of 
Practice and Procedure, 18 CFR 
385.207(a)(2) (2020), Midship Pipeline 
Company, LLC (Midship Pipeline or 
Petitioner) filed a petition for a 
declaratory order seeking a Commission 
order holding that if Gulfport Energy 
Corporation (Gulfport) files for 
bankruptcy, the Commission will have 
concurrent jurisdiction, under sections 
4 and 5 of the Natural Gas Act, 15 U.S.C. 
717c and 717d (2018), with U.S. 
Bankruptcy Courts with respect to a 
firm transportation service agreement, 
negotiated rate agreement, and 
associated surviving terms in a 
precedent agreement between Midship 
Pipeline and Gulfport. In addition, 
Midship Pipeline requests that the 
Commission establish a process in this 
proceeding in which to evaluate the 
public interest implications of a 
potential rejection of the agreement, 
should Gulfport initiate bankruptcy 
proceedings and propose to reject the 
agreement. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211, 385.214). 
Protests will be considered by the 
Commission in determining the 

appropriate action to be taken but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed on or before the 
comment date. Anyone filing a motion 
to intervene, or protest must serve a 
copy of that document on the Petitioner. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically may 
mail similar pleadings to the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE, Washington, DC 20426. 
Hand delivered submissions in 
docketed proceedings should be 
delivered to Health and Human 
Services, 12225 Wilkins Avenue, 
Rockville, Maryland 20852. 

In addition to publishing the full text 
of this document in the Federal 
Register, the Commission provides all 
interested persons an opportunity to 
view and/or print the contents of this 
document via the internet through the 
Commission’s Home Page (http://
www.ferc.gov) using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field to access the document. At this 
time, the Commission has suspended 
access to the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room, due to the 
proclamation declaring a National 
Emergency concerning the Novel 
Coronavirus Disease (COVID–19), issued 
by the President on March 13, 2020. For 
assistance, contact the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or call 
toll-free, (886) 208–3676 or TYY, (202) 
502–8659. 

Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern time 
on September 28, 2020. 

Dated: September 21, 2020. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2020–21374 Filed 9–25–20; 8:45 am] 
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ACTION: Notice of rate order extending 
Central Arizona Project transmission 
service formula rates. 

SUMMARY: The extension of existing 
Central Arizona Project (CAP) 
transmission service formula rates has 
been confirmed, approved, and placed 
into effect on an interim basis. The 
existing formula rates under Rate 
Schedules CAP–FT3, CAP–NFT3, and 
CAP–NITS3 were set to expire on 
December 31, 2020. This rate extension, 
which makes no change to the existing 
formula rates, extends them through 
December 31, 2025. 

DATES: The extended formula rates 
under Rate Schedules CAP–FT3, CAP– 
NFT3, and CAP–NITS3 will be placed 
into effect on an interim basis on 
January 1, 2021. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Tracey A. LeBeau, Regional Manager, 
Desert Southwest Region, Western Area 
Power Administration, P.O. Box 6457, 
Phoenix, AZ 85005–6457, telephone 
(602) 605–2525, or email: dswpwrmrk@
wapa.gov; or Tina Ramsey, Rates 
Manager, Desert Southwest Region, 
Western Area Power Administration, 
telephone (602) 605–2565, or email: 
ramsey@wapa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Legal Authority 

By Delegation Order No. 00–037.00B, 
effective November 19, 2016, the 
Secretary of Energy delegated: (1) The 
authority to develop power and 
transmission rates to the Western Area 
Power Administration’s (WAPA) 
Administrator; (2) the authority to 
confirm, approve, and place such rates 
into effect on an interim basis to the 
Deputy Secretary of Energy; and (3) the 
authority to confirm, approve on a final 
basis, remand, or disapprove such rates 
to the Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission (FERC). In Delegation 
Order No. 00–002.00S, effective January 
15, 2020, the Secretary of Energy also 
delegated the authority to confirm, 
approve, and place such rates into effect 
on an interim basis to the Under 
Secretary of Energy. By Redelegation 
Order No. 00–002.10E, effective 
February 14, 2020, the Under Secretary 
of Energy further delegated the authority 
to confirm, approve, and place such 
rates into effect on an interim basis to 
the Assistant Secretary for Electricity. 
By Redelegation Order No. 00–002.10– 
05, effective July 8, 2020, the Assistant 
Secretary for Electricity further 
delegated the authority to confirm, 
approve, and place such rates into effect 
on an interim basis to WAPA’s 
Administrator. This extension is issued 
under Redelegation Order No. 00– 
002.10–05 and the Department of 
Energy’s (DOE) rate extension 
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