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Dated: December 30, 2011. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2012–200 Filed 1–9–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. NJ12–4–000] 

Notice of Filing; City of Pasadena, CA 

Take notice that on December 14, 
2011, City of Pasadena, California 
submitted its tariff filing per 35.28(e): 
2012 TRBAA Update Filing, to be 
effective 1/1/2012. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211, 385.214). 
Protests will be considered by the 
Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed on or before the 
comment date. On or before the 
comment date, it is not necessary to 
serve motions to intervene or protests 
on persons other than the Applicant. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
web site that enables subscribers to 
receive email notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please email 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 
on January 11, 2012. 

Dated: December 30, 2011. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2012–198 Filed 1–9–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. ER12–726–000] 

Spring Valley Wind LLC; Supplemental 
Notice That Initial Market-Based Rate 
Filing Includes Request for Blanket 
Section 204 Authorization 

This is a supplemental notice in the 
above-referenced proceeding of Spring 
Valley Wind LLC’s application for 
market-based rate authority, with an 
accompanying rate tariff, noting that 
such application includes a request for 
blanket authorization, under 18 CFR 
part 34, of future issuances of securities 
and assumptions of liability. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest should file with the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE., Washington, DC 20426, 
in accordance with Rules 211 and 214 
of the Commission’s Rules of Practice 
and Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Anyone filing a motion to 
intervene or protest must serve a copy 
of that document on the Applicant. 

Notice is hereby given that the 
deadline for filing protests with regard 
to the applicant’s request for blanket 
authorization, under 18 CFR part 34, of 
future issuances of securities and 
assumptions of liability, is January 23, 
2012. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper, using the 
FERC Online links at http:// 
www.ferc.gov. To facilitate electronic 
service, persons with Internet access 
who will eFile a document and/or be 
listed as a contact for an intervenor 
must create and validate an 
eRegistration account using the 
eRegistration link. Select the eFiling 
link to log on and submit the 
intervention or protests. 

Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the intervention or protest to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

The filings in the above-referenced 
proceeding are accessible in the 
Commission’s eLibrary system by 
clicking on the appropriate link in the 
above list. They are also available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 

Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an eSubscription link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive email notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please email 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Dated: January 3, 2012. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2012–197 Filed 1–9–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[EPA–HQ–OW–2011–0424; FRL 9510–3] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission to OMB for 
Review and Approval; Comment 
Request; State Water Quality Program 
Management Resource Analysis (New) 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: In compliance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act (PRA) (44 
U.S.C. 3501 et seq.), this document 
announces that an Information 
Collection Request (ICR) has been 
forwarded to the Office of Management 
and Budget (OMB) for review and 
approval. This is a request for a new 
collection. The ICR, which is abstracted 
below, describes the nature of the 
information collection and its estimated 
burden and cost. 
DATES: Additional comments may be 
submitted on or before February 9, 2012. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your comments, 
referencing Docket ID No. EPA–HQ– 
OW–2011–0424, to (1) EPA online using 
www.regulations.gov (our preferred 
method), by email to ow- 
docket@epa.gov, or by mail to: EPA 
Docket Center, Environmental 
Protection Agency, Water Docket, Mail 
Code: 28221T, 1200 Pennsylvania Ave. 
NW., Washington, DC 20460, and (2) 
OMB by mail to: Office of Information 
and Regulatory Affairs, Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB), 
Attention: Desk Officer for EPA, 725 
17th Street NW., Washington, DC 20503. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Kit 
Farber, Planning, Information, and 
Resource Management Staff, Office of 
Wastewater Management, Mail Code 
4201M, Environmental Protection 
Agency, 1200 Pennsylvania Ave. NW., 
Washington, DC 20460; telephone 
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