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ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[FRL–7660–8] 

Request for Nominations to the 
National Advisory Council for 
Environmental Policy and Technology 
(NACEPT)

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA).
ACTION: Notice of request for 
nominations. 

SUMMARY: The U.S. Environmental 
Protection Agency invites nominations 
to fill vacancies on its National 
Advisory Council for Environmental 
Policy and Technology (NACEPT). The 
Agency seeks qualified senior-level 
decision makers from diverse sectors 
throughout the United States to be 
considered for appointments. EPA 
encourages interested applicants to send 
their resumes and qualifications as soon 
as possible.
ADDRESSES: Submit nominations to: Ms. 
Sonia Altieri, Designated Federal 
Officer, Office of Cooperative 
Environmental Management, U.S. 
Environmental Protection Agency 
(1601E), 1200 Pennsylvania Avenue, 
NW., Washington, DC 20460.
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Sonia Altieri, Designated Federal Officer 
for NACEPT, U.S. Environmental 
Protection Agency (1601E), 1200 
Pennsylvania Avenue, NW., 
Washington, DC 20460; telephone (202) 
233–0061, e-mail: altieri.sonia@epa.gov
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: NACEPT 
is a federal advisory committee under 
the Federal Advisory Committee Act, PL 
92463. The U.S. Environmental 
Protection Agency established NACEPT 
in 1988 to provide independent advice 
to the EPA Administrator on a broad 
range of environmental policy, 
technology and management issues. 
NACEPT consists of a representative 
cross-section of EPA’s partners, 
stakeholders, and constituents who 
provide timely advice and 
recommendations on environmental 
issues, and serve as a sounding board 
for new strategies that EPA is 
developing. 

We anticipate the Council addressing 
issues related to environmental 
technology, environmental foresight, 
and collaborative approaches to 
environmental problems. NACEPT will 
provide advice in a timely manner and 
operate as a proactive and strategic body 
that will alert EPA to potential 
environmental challenges and issues 
that could impact the Agency’s ability to 
protect public health and the 

environment, and options to address 
them. 

Members are appointed by the 
Administrator of EPA for two year terms 
with the possibility of reappointment. 
The Council usually meets 3–4 times 
annually and the average workload for 
the members is approximately 10 to 15 
hours per month. Members serve on the 
Council in a voluntary capacity; 
however, EPA does provide 
reimbursement for travel expenses 
associated with official government 
business. 

Maintaining a balance and diversity of 
expertise, knowledge, and judgement is 
an important consideration in the 
selection of members. Potential 
candidates should possess the following 
qualifications:
Occupy a senior position within their 

organization 
Broad experience outside of their 

current position 
Experience dealing with public policy 

issues 
Membership in broad-based networks 
Extensive experience in the 

environmental field
Recognized expert in the subject 

matter to be addressed by NACEPT 
EPA is seeking nominees for 

representation from all sectors, in 
particular federal, state, local and tribal 
agencies, academia, industry, 
environmental justice, and non-
governmental organizations. 
Nominations for membership must 
include a resume and short biography 
describing the educational and 
professional qualifications of the 
nominee and the nominee’s current 
business address and daytime telephone 
number.

Dated: May 6, 2004. 
Sonia Altieri, 
Designated Federal Officer.
[FR Doc. 04–10878 Filed 5–12–04; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6560–50–P

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[FRL–7660–7] 

Good Neighbor Environmental Board 
Meeting

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA).
ACTION: Notice of meeting.

SUMMARY: The next meeting of the Good 
Neighbor Environmental Board, a 
Federal advisory committee that reports 
to the President and Congress on 
environmental and infrastructure 
projects along the U.S. border with 

Mexico, will take place in McAllen, 
Texas on June 9 and 10, 2004. It is open 
to the public.
DATES: On June 9, the meeting will 
begin at 8:30 a.m. (registration at 8 a.m.) 
and end at 5:30 p.m. On June 10, the 
Board will hold a routine business 
meeting from 8 a.m. until 12 noon. 
(registration at 7:30 a.m.).
ADDRESSES: The meeting site is the 
Mesquite Room of the Holiday Inn Civic 
Center, 200 West Expressway 83, 
McAllen, Texas 78501. The phone 
number is 956–686–2471.
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Elaine M. Koerner, Designated Federal 
Officer for the Good Neighbor 
Environmental Board. U.S. 
Environmental Protection Agency 
Region 9 Office, 75 Hawthorne St., San 
Francisco, California 94105. Tel: Region 
9 office: (415) 972–3437; D.C. office 
(202) 233–0069. E-mail: 
koerner.elaine@epa.gov.
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Agenda: 
On the first day of the two-day meeting, 
which begins at 8:30 a.m. (registration at 
9 a.m.), the Board has invited a number 
of water resources experts to speak on 
water management challenges and 
opportunities in the border region. The 
first day of the meeting will also include 
a public comment session and an 
update from Board members on recent 
projects being carried out by their 
respective organizations. It will 
conclude at 5:30 p.m. The second day 
of the meeting, June 10, begins at 8 a.m., 
with registration at 7:30 a.m. It will take 
the form of a routine business meeting, 
including the status of disseminating 
the latest report as well as discussion 
about the next report. The meeting will 
end at noon. 

Public Attendance: The public is 
welcome to attend all portions of the 
meeting. Members of the public who 
plan to file written statements and/or 
make brief (suggested 5-minute limit) 
oral statements at the public comment 
session are encouraged to contact the 
Designated Federal Officer for the Board 
prior to the meeting. 

Meeting Access: Individuals requiring 
special accommodation at this meeting, 
including wheelchair access to the 
conference room, should contact the 
Designated Federal Officer at least five 
business days prior to the meeting so 
that appropriate arrangements can be 
made. 

Background: The Good Neighbor 
Environmental Board meets three times 
each calendar year at different locations 
along the U.S.-Mexico border and in 
Washington, DC. It was created by the 
Enterprise for the Americas Initiative 
Act of 1992. An Executive Order 
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delegates implementing authority to the 
Administrator of EPA. The Board is 
responsible for providing advice to the 
President and the Congress on 
environmental and infrastructure issues 
and needs within the States contiguous 
to Mexico in order to improve the 
quality of life of persons residing on the 
United States side of the border. The 
statute calls for the Board to have 
representatives from U.S. Government 
agencies; the governments of the States 
of Arizona, California, New Mexico and 
Texas; and private organizations with 
expertise on environmental and 
infrastructure problems along the 
southwest border. The U.S. 
Environmental Protection Agency gives 
notice of this meeting of the Good 
Neighbor Environmental Board 
pursuant to the Federal Advisory 
Committee Act (Pub. L. 92–463).

Dated: May 6, 2004. 
Oscar Carrillo, 
Associate Designated Federal Officer.
[FR Doc. 04–10890 Filed 5–12–04; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6560–50–M

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY

[OPP–2004–0150; FRL–7359–8]

Pesticide Program Dialogue 
Committee; Notice of Public Meeting

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA).
ACTION: Notice.

SUMMARY: EPA’s Office of Pesticide 
Programs will hold a public meeting of 
the Pesticide Program Dialogue 
Committee on May 25 and 26, 2004. An 
agenda is being developed and will be 
posted by May 18, 2004, on EPA’s 
website at www.epa.gov/pesticides/. 
PPDC meetings provide a public forum 
for discussion and feedback to the 
Agency regarding evolving public policy 
and program implementation issues 
associated with evaluating and reducing 
risks from use of pesticides. The agenda 
for this meeting will include the 
following topics: A report from the 
PPDC Registration Review Work Group, 
Endangered Species, Environmental 
Marketing Claims and Fees Legislation. 
Program updates will be included on 
Human testing, Alternative non-animal 
testing, Mosquito labeling, the 
Reregistration roadmap to 2006–2008 
and the Public Participation Process.
DATES: The meeting will be held on 
Tuesday, May 25, 2004, from 9 a.m. to 
5 p.m., and Wednesday, May 26, 2004, 
from 9 a.m. to noon.

ADDRESSES: The meeting will be held at 
the National Rural Electric Cooperative 
Association (NRECA) Conference 
Center, 4301 Wilson Boulevard, 
Arlington, Virginia (703) 907–5500. The 
NRECA Conference Center is located 
approximately three blocks from the 
Ballston Metro Station and about a 
fifteen minute taxi ride from Ronald 
Reagan National Airport.
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Margie Fehrenbach, Office of Pesticide 
Programs (7501C), Environmental 
Protection Agency, 1200 Pennsylvania 
Avenue, NW., Washington, DC 20460; 
telephone number: (703) 308–4775; fax 
number: (703) 308–4776; e-mail address: 
fehrenbach.margie@epa.gov.
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. General Information 

A. Does this Action Apply to Me?
This action is directed to the public 

in general; however, persons may be 
interested who work in agricultural 
settings or persons who are concerned 
about implementation of the Federal 
Insecticide, Fungicide and Rodenticide 
Act (FIFRA); the Federal Food, Drug, 
and Cosmetic Act (FFDCA); and the 
amendments to both of these major 
pesticide laws by the Food Quality 
Protection Act (FQPA), (Public Law 
104–170) of 1996. Potentially affected 
entities may include but are not limited 
to: Agricultural workers and farmers; 
pesticide industry and trade 
associations; environmental, consumer 
and farmworker groups; pesticide users 
and growers; pest consultants; State, 
local and tribal governments; academia; 
public health organizations; food 
processors; and the public. Since other 
entities may also be interested, the 
Agency has not attempted to describe all 
the specific entities that may be affected 
by this action. If you have any questions 
regarding the applicability of this action 
to a particular entity, consult the person 
listed under FOR FURTHER INFORMATION 
CONTACT. 

B. How Can I Get Copies of this 
Document and Other Related 
Information?

1. Docket. EPA has established an 
official public docket for this action 
under docket ID number OPP–2004–
0150. The official public docket consists 
of the documents specifically referenced 
in this action, any public comments 
received, and other information related 
to this action. Although, a part of the 
official docket, the public docket does 
not include Confidential Business 
Information (CBI) or other information 
whose disclosure is restricted by statute. 
The official public docket is the 

collection of materials that is available 
for public viewing at the Public 
Information and Records Integrity 
Branch (PIRIB), Rm. 119, Crystal Mall 
#2, 1921 Jefferson Davis Hwy., 
Arlington, VA. This docket facility is 
open from 8:30 a.m. to 4 p.m., Monday 
through Friday, excluding legal 
holidays. The docket telephone number 
is (703) 305–5805.

2. Electronic access. You may access 
this Federal Register document 
electronically through the EPA Internet 
under the ‘‘Federal Register’’ listings at 
http://www.epa.gov/fedrgstr/.

An electronic version of the public 
docket is available through EPA’s 
electronic public docket and comment 
system, EPA Dockets. You may use EPA 
Dockets at http://www.epa.gov/edocket/
to view public comments, access the 
index listing of the contents of the 
official public docket, and to access 
those documents in the public docket 
that are available electronically. 
Although, not all docket materials may 
be available electronically, you may still 
access any of the publicly available 
docket materials through the docket 
facility identified in Unit I.B.1. Once in 
the system, select ‘‘search,’’ then key in 
the appropriate docket ID number.

II. Background 
The Office of Pesticide Programs is 

entrusted with responsibilities for 
helping to ensure the safety of the 
American food supply, providing 
protection and education of those who 
apply or are exposed to pesticides 
occupationally or through use of 
products from unreasonable risk, and 
providing general protection of the 
environment and special ecosystems 
from potential risks posed by pesticides. 

PPDC was established under the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act 
(FACA), Public Law 92–463, in 1995 
and has been renewed every 2–years 
since that time. The current Charter was 
approved in November 2003 for another 
2–year term and a copy of the PPDC 
Charter has been filed with appropriate 
Committees of Congress and the Library 
of Congress. New members to the PPDC 
have been appointed for this term. The 
PPDC Charter and list of new members 
can be found at EPA’s website at: 
www.epa.gov/pesticides/ppdc.

The PPDC provides advice and 
recommendations to the Office of 
Pesticide Programs on a broad range of 
pesticide regulatory, policy and program 
implementation issues associated with 
evaluating and reducing risks from use 
of pesticides. The following sectors are 
represented on the PPDC: Pesticide 
industry and trade associations; 
environmental/public interest groups; 
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