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Rule 26(c)(1)(G) of the Federal Rules of 
Civil Procedure,’’ then the United States 
shall give Defendants ten (10) calendar 
days notice prior to divulging such 
material in any legal proceeding (other 
than a grand jury proceeding). 

XI. No Reacquisition or Other 
Prohibited Activities 

Defendants may not (1) reacquire any 
part of the Divestiture Assets, (2) 
acquire any option to reacquire any part 
of the Divestiture Assets or to assign the 
Divestiture Assets to any other person, 
(3) enter into any local marketing 
agreement, joint sales agreement, other 
cooperative selling arrangement, or 
shared services agreement, or conduct 
other business negotiations jointly with 
the Acquirers with respect to the 
Divestiture Assets, or (4) provide 
financing or guarantees of financing 
with respect to the Divestiture Assets, 
during the term of this Final Judgment. 
The shared services prohibition does 
not preclude Defendants from 
continuing or entering into agreements 
in a form customarily used in the 
industry to (1) share news helicopters or 
(2) pool generic video footage that does 
not include recording a reporter or other 
on-air talent, and does not preclude 
Defendants from entering into any non- 
sales-related shared services agreement 
or transition services agreement that is 
approved in advance by the United 
States in its sole discretion. 

XII. Retention of Jurisdiction 

This Court retains jurisdiction to 
enable any party to this Final Judgment 
to apply to this Court at any time for 
further orders and directions as may be 
necessary or appropriate to carry out or 
construe this Final Judgment, to modify 
any of its provisions, to enforce 
compliance, and to punish violations of 
its provisions. 

XIII. Expiration of Final Judgment 

Unless this Court grants an extension, 
this Final Judgment shall expire ten 
years from the date of its entry. 

XIV. Public Interest Determination 

Entry of this Final Judgment is in the 
public interest. The parties have 
complied with the requirements of the 
Antitrust Procedures and Penalties Act, 
15 U.S.C. 16, including making copies 
available to the public of this Final 
Judgment, the Competitive Impact 
Statement, and any comments thereon, 
and the United States’ responses to 
comments. Based upon the record 
before the Court, which includes the 
Competitive Impact Statement and any 
comments and response to comments 

filed with the Court, entry of this Final 
Judgment is in the public interest. 
Date: 
lllllllllllllllllllll

Court approval subject to procedures of 
Antitrust Procedures and Penalties Act, 15 
U.S.C. § 16 
lllllllllllllllllllll

United States District Judge 

[FR Doc. 2014–26886 Filed 11–12–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Efforts by Certain Foreign Countries 
To Eliminate the Worst Forms of Child 
Labor 

AGENCY: The Bureau of International 
Labor Affairs, United States Department 
of Labor. 
ACTION: Notice: Request for information 
and invitation to comment. 

SUMMARY: This notice is a request for 
information and/or comment on the 
2013 Findings on the Worst Forms of 
Child Labor report (TDA report) issued 
by the Bureau of International Labor 
Affairs (ILAB) on October 7, 2014, 
regarding child labor in certain foreign 
countries. The recently published TDA 
report assessed efforts by more than 140 
countries to reduce the worst forms of 
child labor and reported whether 
countries made significant, moderate, 
minimal, or no advancement. It also 
suggested actions foreign countries can 
take to eliminate the worst forms of 
child labor through legislation, 
enforcement, coordination, policies and 
social programs. This year’s report 
introduced a new streamlined format for 
country profiles to make it more user- 
friendly and a better policy tool for 
engagement. Relevant information will 
be used by the Department of Labor 
(DOL) in preparation of its ongoing 
reporting mandated under the Trade 
and Development Act of 2000. In 
addition, ILAB will use relevant 
information to conduct assessments of 
each country’s advancement toward 
eliminating the worst forms of child 
labor during the current calendar year 
compared to previous years. 
DATES: Submitters of information are 
requested to provide their submission to 
the Office of Child Labor, Forced Labor, 
and Human Trafficking (OCFT) at the 
email or physical address below by 5 
p.m. January 15, 2015. 

To Submit Information: Information 
submitted to DOL should be submitted 
directly to OCFT, Bureau of 
International Labor Affairs, U.S. 
Department of Labor, at (202) 693–4843 
(this is not a toll free number). 

Comments, identified as ‘‘Docket No. 
DOL–2014–0009’’, may be submitted by 
any of the following methods: 

Federal eRulemaking Portal: http://
www.regulations.gov. 

The portal includes instructions for 
submitting comments. Parties 
submitting responses electronically are 
encouraged not to submit paper copies. 

Facsimile (fax): OCFT at 202–693– 
4830. 

Mail, Express Delivery, Hand Delivery, 
and Messenger Service (1 copy): Chanda 
Uluca and Charita Castro at U.S. 
Department of Labor, OCFT, Bureau of 
International Labor Affairs, 200 
Constitution Avenue NW., Room S– 
5317, Washington, DC 20210. 

Email: Email submissions should be 
addressed to both Chanda Uluca 
(Uluca.Chanda@dol.gov) and Charita 
Castro (Castro.Charita.L@dol.gov). 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Chanda Uluca and Charita Castro (see 
contact information above). 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

The Trade and Development Act of 
2000 (TDA), Public Law 106–200 (2000), 
established a new eligibility criterion for 
receipt of trade benefits under the 
Generalized System of Preferences 
(GSP), Caribbean Basin Trade and 
Partnership Act (CBTPA), and Africa 
Growth and Opportunity Act (AGOA) 
and the Andean Trade Preference Act/ 
Andean Trade Promotion and Drug 
Eradication Act (ATPA/ATPDEA). 

The TDA amended the GSP reporting 
requirements of Section 504 of the 
Trade Act of 1974, 19 U.S.C. 2464, to 
require that the President’s annual 
report on the status of internationally 
recognized worker rights include 
‘‘findings by the Secretary of Labor with 
respect to the beneficiary country’s 
implementation of its international 
commitments to eliminate the worst 
forms of child labor.’’ Title II of the TDA 
and the TDA Conference Report, Joint 
Explanatory Statement of the Committee 
of Conference, 106th Cong.2d.Sess. 
(2000), indicate that the same criterion 
applies for the receipt of benefits under 
CBTPA and AGOA, respectively. In 
addition, the Andean Trade Preference 
Act, as amended and expanded by the 
Andean Trade Promotion and Drug 
Eradication Act, Public Law 107–210, 
Title XXXI (2002), includes as a 
criterion for receiving benefits 
‘‘[w]hether the country has 
implemented its commitments to 
eliminate the worst forms of child labor 
as defined in section 507(6) of the Trade 
Act of 1974.’’ 

DOL fulfills these reporting mandates 
through annual publication of the U.S. 
Department of Labor’s Findings on the 
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Worst Forms of Child Labor with 
respect to countries eligible for the 
aforementioned programs. The 2013 
report and additional background 
information are available on the Internet 
at http://www.dol.gov/ilab/reports/
child-labor/findings/. 

Information Requested and Invitation 
to Comment: Interested parties are 
invited to comment and provide 
information regarding DOL’s 2013 TDA 
Report which may be found on the 
Internet at http://www.dol.gov/ilab/
reports/child-labor/findings/ or 
obtained from OCFT. DOL requests 
comments or information to update the 
findings and suggestions for government 
action for countries reviewed in the 
TDA Report, as well as to assess each 
country’s individual advancement 
toward eliminating the worst forms of 
child labor during the current reporting 
period compared to previous years. For 
more information on the types of issues 
covered in the TDA Report, please see 
Appendix II of the report. Materials 
submitted should be confined to the 
specific topics of the TDA report. DOL 
will generally consider sources with 
dates up to five years old (i.e., data not 
older than January 1, 2010). DOL 
appreciates the extent to which 
submissions clearly indicate the time 
period to which they apply. In the 
interest of transparency, classified 
information will not be accepted. Where 
applicable, information submitted 
should indicate its source or sources, 
and copies of the source material should 
be provided. If primary sources are 
utilized, such as research studies, 
interviews, direct observations, or other 
sources of quantitative or qualitative 
data, details on the research or data- 
gathering methodology should be 
provided. Please see the 2013 TDA 
Report for a complete explanation of 
relevant terms, definitions, and 
reporting guidelines employed by DOL. 

This notice is a general solicitation of 
comments from the public. 

Signed at Washington, DC, this 6th day of 
November 2014. 

Carol Pier, 
Deputy Undersecretary for International 
Affairs. 
[FR Doc. 2014–26845 Filed 11–12–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4510–28–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Occupational Safety and Health 
Administration 

[Docket No. OSHA–2011–0194] 

Cotton Dust Standard; Extension of 
the Office of Management and 
Budget’s (OMB) Approval of 
Information Collection (Paperwork) 
Requirements 

AGENCY: Occupational Safety and Health 
Administration (OSHA), Labor. 
ACTION: Request for public comments. 

SUMMARY: OSHA solicits public 
comments concerning its proposal to 
extend the Office of Management and 
Budget’s (OMB) approval of the 
information collection requirements 
specified in the Cotton Dust Standard 
(29 CFR 1910.1043). 
DATES: Comments must be submitted 
(postmarked, sent, or received) by 
January 12, 2015. 
ADDRESSES: 

Electronically: You may submit 
comments and attachments 
electronically at http://
www.regulations.gov, which is the 
Federal eRulemaking Portal. Follow the 
instructions online for submitting 
comments. 

Facsimile: If your comments, 
including attachments, are not longer 
than 10 pages you may fax them to the 
OSHA Docket Office at (202) 693–1648. 

Mail, hand delivery, express mail, 
messenger, or courier service: When 
using this method, you must submit a 
copy of your comments and attachments 
to the OSHA Docket Office, OSHA 
Docket No. OSHA–2011–0194, 
Occupational Safety and Health 
Administration, U.S. Department of 
Labor, Room N–2625, 200 Constitution 
Avenue NW., Washington, DC 20210. 
Deliveries (hand, express mail, 
messenger, and courier service) are 
accepted during the Department of 
Labor’s and Docket Office’s normal 
business hours, 8:15 a.m. to 4:45 p.m., 
e.t. 

Instructions: All submissions must 
include the Agency name and the OSHA 
docket number (OSHA–2011–0194) for 
the Information Collection Request 
(ICR). All comments, including any 
personal information you provide, are 
placed in the public docket without 
change, and may be made available 
online at http://www.regulations.gov. 
For further information on submitting 
comments see the ‘‘Public 
Participation’’ heading in the section of 
this notice titled SUPPLEMENTARY 
INFORMATION. 

Docket: To read or download 
comments or other material in the 
docket, go to http://www.regulations.gov 
or the OSHA Docket Office at the 
address above. All documents in the 
docket (including this Federal Register 
notice) are listed in the http://
www.regulations.gov index; however, 
some information (e.g., copyrighted 
material) is not publicly available to 
read or download from the Web site. All 
submissions, including copyrighted 
material, are available for inspection 
and copying at the OSHA Docket Office. 
You may also contact Theda Kenney at 
the address below to obtain a copy of 
the ICR. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Theda Kenney or Todd Owen, 
Directorate of Standards and Guidance, 
OSHA, U.S. Department of Labor, Room 
N–3468, 200 Constitution Avenue NW., 
Washington, DC 20210; telephone (202) 
693–2222. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Background 

The Department of Labor, as part of its 
continuing effort to reduce paperwork 
and respondent (i.e., employer) burden, 
conducts a preclearance consultation 
program to provide the public with an 
opportunity to comment on proposed 
and continuing information collection 
requirements in accord with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(PRA–95) (44 U.S.C. 3506(c)(2)(A)). This 
program ensures that information is in 
the desired format, reporting burden 
(time and costs) is minimal, collection 
instruments are clearly understood, and 
OSHA’s estimate of the information 
collection burden is accurate. The 
Occupational Safety and Health Act of 
1970 (the OSH Act) (29 U.S.C. 651 et 
seq.) authorizes information collection 
by employers as necessary or 
appropriate for enforcement of the OSH 
Act or for developing information 
regarding the causes and prevention of 
occupational injuries, illnesses, and 
accidents (29 U.S.C. 657). The OSH Act 
also requires that OSHA obtain such 
information with minimum burden 
upon employers, especially those 
operating small businesses, and to 
reduce to the maximum extent feasible 
unnecessary duplication of efforts in 
obtaining information (29 U.S.C. 657). 

The information collection 
requirements specified in the Cotton 
Dust Standard protect workers from the 
adverse health effects that may result 
from their exposure to cotton dust. The 
major information collection 
requirements of the Cotton Dust 
Standard include: performing exposure 
monitoring, including initial, periodic, 
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