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N.Y. Application for renewal of 
groundwater withdrawal of up to 0.181 
mgd (30-day average) from Well 3 
(Docket No. 19970303). 

7. Project Sponsor: New York State 
Office of Parks, Recreation and Historic 
Preservation. Project Facility: Indian 
Hills State Golf Course (Irrigation Pond), 
Towns of Erwin and Lindley, Steuben 
County, N.Y. Applications (30-day 
averages) for surface water withdrawal 
of up to 0.300 mgd and consumptive use 
of up to 0.300 mgd. 

8. Project Sponsor and Facility: 
Pennsylvania State University, Ferguson 
Township, Centre County, Pa. 
Applications for renewal of 
groundwater withdrawal of up to 0.960 
mgd (30-day average) from Well UN–37 
and consumptive use of up to 1.620 mgd 
(peak day) (Docket No. 19890106–1). 

9. Project Sponsor and Facility: 
Selinsgrove Municipal Authority, 
Borough of Selinsgrove and Penn 
Township, Snyder County, Pa. 
Applications for groundwater 
withdrawals (30-day averages) of up to 
0.465 mgd from Well 3 and renewal of 
up to 0.707 mgd from Well 4 (Docket 
No. 19910904). 

10. Project Sponsor: SUEZ Water 
Pennsylvania, Inc. Project Facility: 
Newberry Operation, Newberry 
Township, York County, Pa. 
Application for renewal of groundwater 
withdrawal of up to 0.043 mgd (30-day 
average) from the Eden Well (Docket No. 
19910102). 

11. Project Sponsor and Facility: 
Transcontinental Gas Pipe Line 
Company, LLC (Susquehanna River), 
Wyoming Borough, Luzerne County, Pa. 
Applications (peak day) for surface 
water withdrawal of up to 5.760 mgd 
and consumptive use of up to 0.100 
mgd. 

Commission-Initiated Project 
Approval Modification: 

1. Project Sponsor: Knouse Foods 
Cooperative, Inc. Project Facility: 
Gardners Plant, Tyrone Township, 
Adams County, Pa. Conforming the 
grandfathered quantity with the 
forthcoming determination for a 
groundwater withdrawal of up to 0.183 
mgd (30-day average) from Wells 3, 5, 6, 
8, and 10 (Docket No. 20041211). 

Opportunity To Appear and Comment 
Interested parties may call into the 

hearing to offer comments to the 
Commission on any business listed 
above required to be the subject of a 
public hearing. Given the telephonic 
nature of the meeting, the Commission 
strongly encourages those members of 
the public wishing to provide oral 
comments to pre-register with the 
Commission by emailing Jason Oyler at 

joyler@srbc.net prior to the hearing date. 
The presiding officer reserves the right 
to limit oral statements in the interest of 
time and to otherwise control the course 
of the hearing. Access to the hearing via 
telephone will begin at 6:15 p.m. 
Guidelines for the public hearing are 
posted on the Commission’s website, 
www.srbc.net, prior to the hearing for 
review. The presiding officer reserves 
the right to modify or supplement such 
guidelines at the hearing. Written 
comments on any business listed above 
required to be the subject of a public 
hearing may also be mailed to Mr. Jason 
Oyler, Secretary to the Commission, 
Susquehanna River Basin Commission, 
4423 North Front Street, Harrisburg, Pa. 
17110–1788, or submitted electronically 
through https://www.srbc.net/ 
regulatory/public-comment/. Comments 
mailed or electronically submitted must 
be received by the Commission on or 
before August 23, 2021, to be 
considered. 

Authority: Pub. L. 91–575, 84 Stat. 
1509 et seq., 18 CFR parts 806, 807, and 
808. 

Dated: July 14, 2021. 
Jason E. Oyler, 
General Counsel and Secretary to the 
Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2021–15262 Filed 7–16–21; 8:45 am] 
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Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Requests for Comments; 
Clearance of a Renewed Approval of 
Information Collection: Agricultural 
Aircraft Operations (Formerly 
‘‘Agricultural Aircraft Operator 
Certificate Application’’) 

AGENCY: Federal Aviation 
Administration (FAA), DOT. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, FAA 
invites public comments about our 
intention to request Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) 
approval to renew an information 
collection. The Federal Register Notice 
with a 60-day comment period soliciting 
comments on the following collection of 
information was published on March 1, 
2021. The collection involves the 
submission of FAA Form 8710–3 for the 
certification process of agricultural 
aircraft operators, and other reporting 

and recordkeeping activities required of 
agricultural aircraft operators. The 
information to be collected is necessary 
to evaluate the applicants’ qualifications 
for certification. This collection also 
involves plans for operations over 
congested areas and recordkeeping 
requirements for agricultural aircraft 
operators. In addition, the FAA is 
changing the name of this collection to 
more accurately reflect its scope. 
DATES: Written comments should be 
submitted by August 18, 2021. 
ADDRESSES: Interested persons are 
invited to submit written comments on 
the proposed information collection to 
the Office of Information and Regulatory 
Affairs, Office of Management and 
Budget. Comments should be addressed 
to the attention of the Desk Officer, 
Department of Transportation/FAA, and 
sent via electronic mail to oira_
submission@omb.eop.gov, or faxed to 
(202) 395–6974, or mailed to the Office 
of Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
Office of Management and Budget, 
Docket Library, Room 10102, 725 17th 
Street NW, Washington, DC 20503. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Raymond Plessinger by email at: 
raymond.plessinger@faa.gov; phone: 
717–443–7296. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Public Comments Invited: You are 
asked to comment on any aspect of this 
information collection, including (a) 
Whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for FAA’s 
performance; (b) the accuracy of the 
estimated burden; (c) ways for FAA to 
enhance the quality, utility and clarity 
of the information collection; and (d) 
ways that the burden could be 
minimized without reducing the quality 
of the collected information. The agency 
will summarize and/or include your 
comments in the request for OMB’s 
clearance of this information collection. 

OMB Control Number: 2120–0049. 
Title: Agricultural Aircraft 

Operations. 
Form Numbers: FAA Form 8710–3. 
Type of Review: Renewal. 
Background: The Federal Register 

Notice with a 60-day comment period 
soliciting comments on the following 
collection of information was published 
on March 1, 2021 (86 FR 12074). This 
collection involves the application for 
issuance or amendment of a 14 CFR part 
137 Agricultural Aircraft Operator 
Certificate. Application for an original 
certificate or amendment of a certificate 
issued under 14 CFR part 137 is made 
on a form, and in a manner prescribed 
by the Administrator. The FAA form 
8710–3 may be obtained from an FAA 
Flight Standards District Office, or 
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online at https://www.faa.gov/forms/ 
index.cfm/go/document.information/ 
documentID/1020386. The completed 
application is sent to the district office 
that has jurisdiction over the area in 
which the applicant’s home base of 
operation is located. 

The information collected includes: 
Type of application, operator’s name/ 
DBA, telephone number, mailing 
address, physical address of the 
principal base of operations, chief pilot/ 
designee name, airman certificate grade 
and number, and aircraft make/model 
and registration numbers to be used. 

This information collection also 
includes safety mitigation plans; plans 
for operations over congested areas; and 
recordkeeping requirements. 

Respondents: There are 1,763 active 
agricultural aircraft operators. 
Approximately 50 operators are 
certificated annually, and 
approximately 50 certificates are 
surrendered or revoked. 

Frequency: New applications when 
needed; current 14 CFR part 137 
certificate do not expire, but may need 
to be amended on occasion. 

Estimated Average Burden per 
Response: The FAA anticipates 100 
applications for new certificates, at 0.5 
hours each; 100 applications for 
amendment, at 0.5 hours each; 100 
petitions for exemption, at 0.5 hours 
each; and 350 submissions of plans for 
operations over congested areas, at 0.5 
hours each. The total reporting burden 
is thus 650 responses and 325 hours. 

All operators certificated under part 
137 are required to maintain certain 
records for a minimum of 12 months. 
The FAA estimates this recordkeeping 
burden at 4.5 hours per operator. 
Assuming a universe of 1,763 operators, 
the annual recordkeeping burden is 
7,934 hours. 

Estimated Total Annual Burden: 325 
reporting hours + 7,934 recordkeeping 
hours = 8,259 total hours. 

Issued in Washington, DC, on July 14, 
2021. 

Dwayne C. Morris, 
Project Manager, Flight Standards Service, 
General Aviation and Commercial Division. 
[FR Doc. 2021–15235 Filed 7–16–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4910–13–P 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

Federal Aviation Administration 

Federal Aviation Administration 
Aviation Rulemaking Advisory 
Committee; Meeting 

AGENCY: Federal Aviation 
Administration (FAA), Transportation 
(DOT). 
ACTION: Notice of Aviation Rulemaking 
Advisory Committee (ARAC) meeting. 

SUMMARY: This notice announces a 
meeting of the ARAC. 
DATES: The meeting will be held on 
Thursday, September 16, 2021, from 
1:00 p.m. to 4:00 p.m. Eastern Daylight 
Time. 

Requests to attend the meeting must 
be received by Tuesday, August 31, 
2021. 

Requests for accommodations to a 
disability must be received by Tuesday, 
August 31, 2021. 

Requests to submit written materials 
to be reviewed during the meeting must 
be received no later than Tuesday, 
August 31, 2021. 
ADDRESSES: The meeting will be held 
virtually. Members of the public who 
wish to observe the meeting must RSVP 
by emailing 9-awa-arac@faa.gov. 
General committee information 
including copies of the meeting minutes 
will be available on the FAA Committee 
website at https://www.faa.gov/ 
regulations_policies/rulemaking/ 
committees/documents/. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Lakisha Pearson, Federal Aviation 
Administration, 800 Independence 
Avenue SW, Washington, DC 20591, 
telephone (202) 267–4191; email 9-awa- 
arac@faa.gov. Any committee-related 
request should be sent to the person 
listed in this section. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Background 

ARAC was created under the Federal 
Advisory Committee Act (FACA), in 
accordance with Title 5 of the United 
States Code (5 U.S.C. App. 2) to provide 
advice and recommendations to the 
FAA concerning rulemaking activities, 
such as aircraft operations, airman and 
air agency certification, airworthiness 
standards and certification, airports, 
maintenance, noise, and training. 

II. Agenda 

At the meeting, the agenda will cover 
the following topics: 
• Status Report from the FAA 
• Status Updates: 

Æ Active Working Groups 
Æ Transport Airplane and Engine 

(TAE) Subcommittee 
• Recommendation Reports 
• Any Other Business 

The detailed agenda will be posted on 
the FAA Committee website address 
listed in the ADDRESSES section at least 
one week in advance of the meeting. 

III. Public Participation 
This virtual meeting will be open to 

the public on a first-come, first-served 
basis. Members of the public who wish 
to attend are asked to register via email 
by submitting the following 
information: Full legal name, country of 
citizenship, and name of your industry 
association, or applicable affiliation, to 
the email listed in the ADDRESSES 
section. When registration is confirmed, 
registrants will be provided the virtual 
meeting information/teleconference 
call-in number and passcode. Callers are 
responsible for paying associated long- 
distance charges. 

The U.S. Department of 
Transportation is committed to 
providing equal access to this meeting 
for all participants. If you need 
alternative formats or services because 
of a disability, such as sign language, 
interpretation, or other ancillary aids, 
please contact the person listed in the 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT 
section. 

The FAA is not accepting oral 
presentations at this meeting due to 
time constraints. Any member of the 
public may present a written statement 
to the committee at any time. The public 
may present written statements to 
ARAC by providing a copy to the 
Designated Federal Officer via the email 
listed in the FOR FURTHER INFORMATION 
CONTACT section. 

Issued in Washington, DC. 
Timothy R. Adams, 
Acting Executive Director Office of 
Rulemaking. 
[FR Doc. 2021–15277 Filed 7–16–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4910–13–P 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

Federal Highway Administration 

Notice of Final Federal Agency Actions 
on Proposed Highway Projects in 
Texas 

AGENCY: Texas Department of 
Transportation (TxDOT), Federal 
Highway Administration (FHWA), U.S. 
Department of Transportation. 
ACTION: Notice of limitation on claims 
for judicial review of actions by TxDOT 
and Federal agencies. 

SUMMARY: This notice announces actions 
taken by TxDOT and Federal agencies 
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