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Affected Public: Businesses or other 
for-profits, Not-for-profit institutions. 

Respondents: 315. 
Responses: 2,834. 
Estimated Total Burden Hours: 3,290. 
Estimated Total Burden Cost 

(Operating and Maintenance): $14,000. 
Description: The Interim Final Rule 

on Statutory Exemption for Cross- 
Trading of Securities implements the 
content requirements for the written 
cross-trading policies and procedures 
required under section 408(b)(19)(H) of 
ERISA, as added by section 611(g) of the 
Pension Protection Act of 2006, Public 
Law 109–280 (PPA). Section 611(g)(1) of 
the PPA created a new statutory 
exemption, added to section 408(b) of 
ERISA as subsection 408(b)(19), that 
exempts from the prohibitions of 
sections 406(a)(1)(A) and 406(b)(2) of 
ERISA those cross-trading transactions 
involving the purchase and sale of a 
security between an account holding 
assets of a pension plan and any other 
account managed by the same 
investment manager, provided that 
certain conditions are satisfied. Section 
611(g)(3) of the PPA further directed the 
Secretary to issue regulations, within 
180 days after enactment, regarding the 
content of the policies and procedures 
to be adopted by an investment manager 
to satisfy the conditions of the new 
statutory exemption. 

The Department issued a final cross- 
trading regulation on October 7, 2008. 
The recordkeeping requirement in the 
regulation constitutes an information 
collection within the meaning of the 
PRA, for which the Department has 
obtained approval from OMB under 
OMB Control No. 1210–0130. The 
current approval is scheduled to expire 
on July 31, 2016. 

Agency: Employee Benefits Security 
Administration, Department of Labor. 

Title: Plan Asset Transactions 
Determined by In-House Asset Managers 
under Prohibited Transaction Class 
Exemption 96–23. 

Type of Review: Extension of a 
currently approved collection of 
information. 

OMB Number: 1210–0145. 
Affected Public: Businesses or other 

for-profits. 
Respondents: 40. 
Responses: 20. 
Estimated Total Burden Hours: 940. 
Estimated Total Burden Cost 

(Operating and Maintenance): $400,000. 
Description: PTE 96–23, a class 

exemption, permits various transactions 
involving employee benefit plans whose 
assets are managed by in-house asset 
managers (INHAMs), provided the 
conditions of the exemption are met. 
The Department submitted the ICR 

included in the Proposed Amendment 
to PTE 96–23 for Plan Asset 
Transactions Determined by In-House 
Asset Managers to OMB for review and 
clearance at the time the Notice of the 
proposed exemption was published in 
the Federal Register (June 14, 2010, 75 
FR 33642). OMB most recently 
approved the amendment under OMB 
control number 1210–0145, on July 26, 
2013. The current approval will expire 
on July 31, 2016. 

II. Focus of Comments 

The Department is particularly 
interested in comments that: 

• Evaluate whether the collections of 
information are necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
agency, including whether the 
information will have practical utility; 

• Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the collections of 
information, including the validity of 
the methodology and assumptions used; 

• Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

• Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 
use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology, 
e.g., by permitting electronic 
submissions of responses. 

Comments submitted in response to 
this notice will be summarized and/or 
included in the ICRs for OMB approval 
of the extension of the information 
collection; they will also become a 
matter of public record. 

Joseph S. Piacentini, 
Director, Office of Policy and Research, 
Employee Benefits Security Administration. 
[FR Doc. 2015–29746 Filed 11–20–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4510–29–P 

NATIONAL AERONAUTICS AND 
SPACE ADMINISTRATION 

[Notice: (15–110)] 

NASA Aerospace Safety Advisory 
Panel; Meeting 

AGENCY: National Aeronautics and 
Space Administration (NASA). 
ACTION: Notice of Meeting. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act, Public 
Law 92–463, as amended, the National 
Aeronautics and Space Administration 
announces a forthcoming meeting of the 
Aerospace Safety Advisory Panel. 

DATES: Monday, December 14, 2015, 
3:30 p.m. to 3:45 p.m., Eastern Standard 
Time. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Ms. 
Carol Hamilton, Aerospace Safety 
Advisory Panel Interim Executive 
Director, NASA Headquarters, 
Washington, DC 20546, (202) 358–1857, 
or email at carol.j.hamilton@nasa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Aerospace Safety Advisory Panel 
(ASAP) will hold a brief meeting via 
teleconference. This discussion is 
pursuant to carrying out its statutory 
duties for which the Panel reviews, 
identifies, evaluates, and advises on 
those program activities, systems, 
procedures, and management activities 
that can contribute to program risk. 
Priority is given to those programs that 
involve the safety of human flight. The 
agenda will include: 

• Discussion on possible ASAP 
Recommendation(s) for the 2015 ASAP 
Annual Report. 

This meeting is open to the public 
telephonically. Any interested person 
may call the USA toll free conference 
call number (800) 857–5746; passcode 
4124668. Attendees will be required to 
give their name and affiliation at the 
beginning of the teleconference. Note: 
please ‘‘mute’’ your telephone. It is 
imperative that the meeting be held on 
this date to accommodate the 
scheduling priorities of the key 
participants. 

Patricia D. Rausch, 
Advisory Committee Management Officer, 
National Aeronautics and Space 
Administration. 
[FR Doc. 2015–29767 Filed 11–20–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7510–13–P 

NUCLEAR REGULATORY 
COMMISSION 

Advisory Committee on Reactor 
Safeguards (ACRS); Meeting of the 
ACRS Subcommittee on Reliability and 
Probabilistic Risk Assessment; Notice 
of Meeting 

The ACRS Subcommittee on 
Reliability and Probabilistic Risk 
Assessment will hold a meeting on 
December 1, 2015, Room T–2B1, 11545 
Rockville Pike, Rockville, Maryland. 

The meeting will be open to public 
attendance. 

The agenda for the subject meeting 
shall be as follows: 

Tuesday, December 1, 2015—8:30 a.m. 
Until 5:00 p.m. 

The Subcommittee will hold a 
meeting to discuss if a potential societal 
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safety goal needs to be revisited after the 
Fukushima Dai-ichi accident. The 
Subcommittee will hear presentations 
by and hold discussions with all 
interested persons regarding this matter. 
The Subcommittee will gather 
information, analyze relevant issues and 
facts, and formulate proposed positions 
and actions, as appropriate, for 
deliberation by the Full Committee. 

Members of the public desiring to 
provide oral statements and/or written 
comments should notify the Designated 
Federal Official (DFO), John Lai 
(Telephone 301–415–5197 or Email: 
John.Lai@nrc.gov) five days prior to the 
meeting, if possible, so that appropriate 
arrangements can be made. Thirty-five 
hard copies of each presentation or 
handout should be provided to the DFO 
thirty minutes before the meeting. In 
addition, one electronic copy of each 
presentation should be emailed to the 
DFO one day before the meeting. If an 
electronic copy cannot be provided 
within this timeframe, presenters 
should provide the DFO with a CD 
containing each presentation at least 
thirty minutes before the meeting. 
Electronic recordings will be permitted 
only during those portions of the 
meeting that are open to the public. 
Detailed procedures for the conduct of 
and participation in ACRS meetings 
were published in the Federal Register 
on October 21, 2015 (80 FR 63846). 

Detailed meeting agendas and meeting 
transcripts are available on the NRC 
Web site at http://www.nrc.gov/reading- 
rm/doc-collections/acrs. Information 
regarding topics to be discussed, 
changes to the agenda, whether the 
meeting has been canceled or 
rescheduled, and the time allotted to 
present oral statements can be obtained 
from the Web site cited above or by 
contacting the identified DFO. 
Moreover, in view of the possibility that 
the schedule for ACRS meetings may be 
adjusted by the Chairman as necessary 
to facilitate the conduct of the meeting, 
persons planning to attend should check 
with these references if such 
rescheduling would result in a major 
inconvenience. 

If attending this meeting, please enter 
through the One White Flint North 
building, 11555 Rockville Pike, 
Rockville, Maryland. After registering 
with security, please contact Mr. Theron 
Brown (Telephone 240–888–9835) to be 
escorted to the meeting room. 

Dated: November 13, 2015. 
Michael Snodderly, 
Acting Chief, Technical Support Branch, 
Advisory Committee on Reactor Safeguards. 
[FR Doc. 2015–29773 Filed 11–20–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7590–01–P 

NUCLEAR REGULATORY 
COMMISSION 

Advisory Committee on Reactor 
Safeguards (ACRS); Meeting of the 
ACRS Subcommittee on Planning and 
Procedures; Notice of Meeting 

The ACRS Subcommittee on Planning 
and Procedures will hold a meeting on 
December 2, 2015, Room T–2B3, 11545 
Rockville Pike, Rockville, Maryland. 

The meeting will be open to public 
attendance with the exception of a 
portion that may be closed pursuant to 
5 U.S.C. 552b (c)(2) and (6) to discuss 
organizational and personnel matters 
that relate solely to the internal 
personnel rules and practices of the 
ACRS, and information the release of 
which would constitute a clearly 
unwarranted invasion of personal 
privacy. 

The agenda for the subject meeting 
shall be as follows: 

Wednesday, December 2, 2015—12:00 
p.m. Until 1:00 p.m. 

The Subcommittee will discuss 
proposed ACRS activities and related 
matters. The Subcommittee will gather 
information, analyze relevant issues and 
facts, and formulate proposed positions 
and actions, as appropriate, for 
deliberation by the Full Committee. 

Members of the public desiring to 
provide oral statements and/or written 
comments should notify the Designated 
Federal Official (DFO), Quynh Nguyen 
(Telephone 301–415–5844 or Email: 
Quynh.Nguyen@nrc.gov) five days prior 
to the meeting, if possible, so that 
arrangements can be made. Thirty-five 
hard copies of each presentation or 
handout should be provided to the DFO 
thirty minutes before the meeting. In 
addition, one electronic copy of each 
presentation should be emailed to the 
DFO one day before the meeting. If an 
electronic copy cannot be provided 
within this timeframe, presenters 
should provide the DFO with a CD 
containing each presentation at least 
thirty minutes before the meeting. 
Electronic recordings will be permitted 
only during those portions of the 
meeting that are open to the public. 
Detailed procedures for the conduct of 
and participation in ACRS meetings 
were published in the Federal Register 
on October 21, 2015 (80 FR 63846). 

Information regarding changes to the 
agenda, whether the meeting has been 
canceled or rescheduled, and the time 
allotted to present oral statements can 
be obtained by contacting the identified 
DFO. Moreover, in view of the 
possibility that the schedule for ACRS 
meetings may be adjusted by the 

Chairman as necessary to facilitate the 
conduct of the meeting, persons 
planning to attend should check with 
the DFO if such rescheduling would 
result in a major inconvenience. 

If attending this meeting, please enter 
through the One White Flint North 
building,11555 Rockville Pike, 
Rockville, MD. After registering with 
security, please contact Mr. Theron 
Brown (240–888–9835) to be escorted to 
the meeting room. 

Dated: November 13, 2015. 
Michael Snodderly, 
Acting Chief, Technical Support Branch, 
Advisory Committee on Reactor Safeguards. 
[FR Doc. 2015–29774 Filed 11–20–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7590–01–P 

NUCLEAR REGULATORY 
COMMISSION 

[NRC–2013–0203] 

Ultimate Heat Sink for Nuclear Power 
Plants 

AGENCY: Nuclear Regulatory 
Commission. 
ACTION: Regulatory Guide Issuance. 

SUMMARY: The U.S. Nuclear Regulatory 
Commission (NRC) is issuing Revision 3 
to Regulatory Guide (RG) 1.27, 
‘‘Ultimate Heat Sink for Nuclear Power 
Plants.’’ This RG describes methods and 
procedures acceptable to the NRC staff 
that nuclear power plant facility 
licensees and applicants may use to 
implement general design criteria (GDC) 
that are applicable to the ultimate heat 
sink (UHS) features of plant systems. 
DATES: Revision 3 to RG 1.27 is available 
on November 23, 2015. 
ADDRESSES: Please refer to Docket ID 
NRC–2013–0203 when contacting the 
NRC about the availability of 
information regarding this document. 
You may obtain pubically-available 
information related to this document 
using the following methods: 

• Federal Rulemaking Web site: Go to 
http://www.regulations.gov and search 
for Docket ID NRC–2013–0203. Address 
questions about NRC dockets to Carol 
Gallagher; telephone: 301–415–3463; 
email: Carol.Gallagher@nrc.gov. For 
technical questions, contact the 
individuals listed in the FOR FURTHER 
INFORMATION CONTACT section of this 
document. 

• NRC’s Agencywide Documents 
Access and Management System 
(ADAMS): You may obtain publicly- 
available documents online in the 
ADAMS Public Document collection at 
http://www.nrc.gov/reading-rm/
adams.html. To begin the search, select 
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