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3 15 U.S.C. 781(b).
4 15 U.S.C. 781(g).
5 17 CFR 200.30–3(a)(1).
1 15 U.S.C. 78l(d).
2 17 CFR 240.12d2–2(d).
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4 15 U.S.C. 78l(g).
5 17 CFR 200.30–3(a)(1).

obtained stockholders approval of the 
plan by the written consent of the 
holders of a majority of the voting 
power of the Issuer’s Security in 
accordance with the requirements of 
Delaware law and the Issuer’s certificate 
of incorporation. 

The Issuer’s application relates solely 
to the withdrawal of the Securities from 
listing on the Amex and from 
registration under Section 12(b) of the 
Act 3 and shall not affect its obligation 
to be registered under Section 12(g) of 
the Act.4

Any interested person may, on or 
before December 19, 2003, submit by 
letter to the Secretary of the Securities 
and Exchange Commission, 450 Fifth 
Street, NW, Washington, DC 20549–
0609, facts bearing upon whether the 
application has been made in 
accordance with the rules of the Amex 
and what terms, if any, should be 
imposed by the Commission for the 
protection of investors. The 
Commission, based on the information 
submitted to it, will issue an order 
granting the application after the date 
mentioned above, unless the 
Commission determines to order a 
hearing on the matter.

For the Commission, by the Division of 
Market Regulation, pursuant to delegated 
authority.5 
Jonathan G. Katz, 
Secretary.
[FR Doc. 03–30052 Filed 12–2–03; 8:45 am] 
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The Thai Capital Fund Inc., a 
Maryland corporation (‘‘Issuer’’), has 
filed an application with the Securities 
and Exchange Commission 
(‘‘Commission’’), pursuant to Section 
12(d) of the Securities Exchange Act of 
1934 (‘‘Act’’)1 and Rule 12d2–2(d) 
thereunder,2 to withdraw its common 
stock, $.01 par value, (‘‘Security’’), from 
listing and registration on the Pacific 
Exchange, Inc. (‘‘PCX’’ or ‘‘Exchange’’).

The Board of Directors (‘‘Board’’) of 
the Issuer adopted a resolution on 
October 22, 2003 to withdraw its 
Security from listing on the Exchange. 
The Board determined that it would be 
in the best interest of the Issuer and its 
shareholders to voluntarily withdraw 
from listing and registration on the PCX. 
The Board is currently seeking to list its 
Security on the American Stock 
Exchange LLC (‘‘Amex’’). The Board 
states that in its judgment, listing on the 
Amex will afford investors greater 
exposure on a larger exchange. 

The Issuer stated in its application 
that it has complied with PCX Rule 
5.4(b) that governs the removal of 
securities from listing and registration 
on the Exchange. The Issuer’s 
application relates solely to the 
withdrawal of the Security from listing 
and registration on the PCX and from 
registration under Section 12(b)3 of the 
Act and shall not affect its obligation to 
be registered under Section 12(g) of the 
Act.4

Any interested person may, on or 
before December 19, 2003, submit by 
letter to the Secretary of the Securities 
and Exchange Commission, 450 Fifth 
Street, NW., Washington, DC 20549–
0609, facts bearing upon whether the 
application has been made in 
accordance with the rules of the PCX 
and what terms, if any, should be 
imposed by the Commission for the 
protection of investors. The 
Commission, based on the information 
submitted to it, will issue an order 
granting the application after the date 
mentioned above, unless the 
Commission determines to order a 
hearing on the matter.

For the Commission, by the Division of 
Market Regulation, pursuant to delegated 
authority. 5

Jonathan G. Katz, 
Secretary.
[FR Doc. 03–30053 Filed 12–2–03; 8:45 am] 
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November 26, 2003. 
Notice is hereby given that the 

following filing(s) has/have been made 
with the Commission pursuant to 
provisions of the Act and rules 

promulgated under the Act. All 
interested persons are referred to the 
application(s) and/or declaration(s) for 
complete statements of the proposed 
transaction(s) summarized below. The 
application(s) and/or declaration(s) and 
any amendment(s) is/are available for 
public inspection through the 
Commission’s Branch of Public 
Reference. 

Interested persons wishing to 
comment or request a hearing on the 
application(s) and/or declaration(s) 
should submit their views in writing by 
December 22, 2003, to the Secretary, 
Securities and Exchange Commission, 
Washington, DC 20549–0609, and serve 
a copy on the relevant applicant(s) and/
or declarant(s) at the address(es) 
specified below. Proof of service (by 
affidavit or, in the case of an attorney at 
law, by certificate) should be filed with 
the request. Any request for hearing 
should identify specifically the issues of 
facts or law that are disputed. A person 
who so requests will be notified of any 
hearing, if ordered, and will receive a 
copy of any notice or order issued in the 
matter. After December 22, 2003, the 
application(s) and/or declaration(s), as 
filed or as amended, may be granted 
and/or permitted to become effective. 

SCANA Corporation, et al. (70–9533) 
SCANA Corporation (‘‘SCANA’’), a 

registered public-utility holding 
company under the Act, its three public-
utility subsidiaries, South Carolina 
Electric & Gas Company (‘‘SCE&G’’), 
South Carolina Generating Company, 
Inc. (‘‘GENCO’’) and Public Service 
Company of North Carolina, 
Incorporated (‘‘PSNC’’) and its 
nonutility subsidiaries, South Carolina 
Fuel Company, Inc. (‘‘SC Fuel’’), South 
Carolina Pipeline Corporation (‘‘SCPC’’), 
SCG Pipeline, Inc., SCANA Energy 
Marketing, Inc. (‘‘SCANA Marketing’’), 
SCANA Energy Trading, LLC, SCANA 
Public Service Company, LLC, SCANA 
Communications, Inc., an exempt 
telecommunications company under 
section 34 of the Act, Servicecare, Inc. 
(‘‘ServiceCare’’), Primesouth, Inc., 
Palmark, Inc., SCANA Resources, Inc., 
SCANA Development Corporation, 
SCANA Petroleum Resources, Inc., 
SCANA Services, Inc. (‘‘SCANA 
Services’’), PSNC Blue Ridge 
Corporation, PSNC Cardinal Pipeline 
Company, LLC, and Clean Energy 
Enterprises Inc. (collectively 
‘‘Applicants’’), all located at 1426 Main 
Street, Columbia, South Carolina 29201, 
have filed a post-effective amendment to 
their application-declaration 
(‘‘Application’’) under sections 12(b) 
and (c) of the Act and rules 45, 46 and 
54. 
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