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20460; telephone number: (202) 564– 
2970; fax number: (202) 564–0050; 
email address: yellin.patrick@epa.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Supporting documents, which explain 
in detail the information that the EPA 
will be collecting, are available in the 
public docket for this ICR. The docket 
can be viewed online at 
www.regulations.gov or in person at the 
EPA Docket Center, WJC West, Room 
3334, 1301 Constitution Ave. NW, 
Washington, DC. The telephone number 
for the Docket Center is 202–566–1744. 
For additional information about EPA’s 
public docket, visit: http://
www.epa.gov/dockets. 

Abstract: The New Source 
Performance Standards (NSPS) for 
Nitric Acid Plants (40 CFR part 60, 
subpart G) were proposed on August 17, 
1971, promulgated on June 14, 1974, 
and amended on August 14, 2012. The 
NSPS for Nitric Acid Plants (40 CFR 
part 60, subpart Ga) were proposed on 
October 14, 2011, promulgated on 
August 14, 2012, and were amended on 
May 6, 2014 in order to correct a minor 
error. Subpart G applies to nitric acid 
production units, producing weak (30 to 
70 percent) nitric acid, which 
commenced construction, modification 
or reconstruction either on or after 
August 17, 1971 and prior to October 
14, 2011. Subpart G limits the emissions 
of nitrogen oxides, expressed as 
nitrogen dioxide (NO2), to 1.5 kilograms 
per metric ton of acid produced (3.0 lb. 
per ton), and limits opacity to 10 
percent. Subpart Ga applies to nitric 
acid production units, producing weak 
(30 to 70 percent) nitric acid, for which 
construction, reconstruction, or 
modification commenced after October 
14, 2011, and limits nitrogen oxides 
(expressed as NO2) to 0.50 lb per ton of 
100 percent nitric acid produced. This 
information is being collected to assure 
compliance with 40 CFR part 60, 
subparts G and Ga. 

In general, all NSPS standards require 
initial notifications, performance tests, 
and periodic reports by the owners/ 
operators of the affected facilities. They 
are also required to maintain records of 
the occurrence and duration of any 
startup, shutdown, or malfunction in 
the operation of an affected facility, or 
any period during which the monitoring 
system is inoperative. These 
notifications, reports, and records are 
essential in determining compliance, 
and are required of all affected facilities 
subject to NSPS. 

Form Numbers: None. 
Respondents/affected entities: Nitric 

acid production units. 

Respondent’s obligation to respond: 
Mandatory (40 CFR part 60, subparts G 
and Ga). 

Estimated number of respondents: 32 
(total). 

Frequency of response: Initially, 
occasionally, and semiannually. 

Total estimated burden: 2,530 hours 
(per year). Burden is defined at 5 CFR 
1320.3(b). 

Total estimated cost: $3,040,000 (per 
year), which includes $2,750,000 in 
annualized capital/startup and/or 
operation & maintenance costs. 

Changes in the Estimates: There is an 
adjustment increase in the total 
estimated burden as currently identified 
in the OMB Inventory of Approved 
Burdens. This increase is not due to any 
program changes. The change in the cost 
estimates is due to adjustments for 
growth in the industry. There is an 
increase in the number of responses, 
labor hours, and operation and 
maintenance costs due to an increase in 
the number of respondents based on 
growth. 

Courtney Kerwin, 
Director, Regulatory Support Division. 
[FR Doc. 2019–15266 Filed 7–17–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

EXECUTIVE OFFICE OF THE 
PRESIDENT 

Office of National Drug Control Policy 

Paperwork Reduction Act; Proposed 
Collection; Comment Request 

AGENCY: Office of National Drug Control 
Policy. 
ACTION: Notice of submission to OMB 
and 30-day public comment period. 
Reinstatement with change of 
previously approved collection: Drug- 
Free Communities (DFC) Support 
Program national evaluation. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, the 
Office of National Drug Control Policy 
(ONDCP) announces it will submit to 
the Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) and Office of Information and 
Regulatory Affairs (OIRA) an 
information collection request. The 
purpose of this notice is to allow for an 
additional 30 days of public comment. 
DATES: Public comments will be 
accepted until August 29, 2019. 
ADDRESSES: Interested persons are 
invited to submit comments regarding 
this proposal. Comments should refer to 
the collection title by name or OMB 
Control Number, and should be sent to: 
Desk Officer for ONDCP, Office of 

Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
Office of Management and Budget, 725 
17th Street NW, Room 10235, New 
Executive Office Building, Washington, 
DC 20503 or electronically mailed to 
oira_submission@omb.eop.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Helen Hernandez, Associate Director, 
Drug-Free Communities (DFC) Support 
Program. Email is the most reliable 
means of communication. Ms. 
Hernandez’s email address is 
HHernandez@ondcp.eop.gov. Mailing 
address is: Executive Office of the 
President, Office of National Drug 
Control Policy, Drug-Free Communities 
(DFC) Support Program, 1800 G Street 
NW, Suite 9110, Washington, DC 20006. 
Copies of documents submitted to OMB 
and other information is available from 
Ms. Hernandez who may be contacted at 
202–395–6665. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: This 
notice informs the public that ONDCP 
has submitted to OMB a request for 
approval of the information collection 
described in Section A. The Federal 
Register notice that solicited public 
comment on the information collection 
for a period of 60 days was published 
May 9, 2019, 84 FR 20357. 

A. Overview of Information Collection 

Title of Information Collection: Web- 
based data collection, surveys and 
interviews of Drug-Free Communities 
(DFC) Support Program and 
Community-Based Coalition 
Enhancement Grants to Address Local 
Drug Crisis (CARA Local Drug Crisis) 
Program grant award recipients. 

Title: Drug-Free Communities (DFC) 
Support Program National Evaluation. 

OMB Approval Number: 3201–0012. 
Type of Request: Reinstatement with 

change of a previously approved 
collection. 

Form Number: NA. 
Description of the need for the 

information and proposed use: ONDCP 
administers the Drug-Free Communities 
(DFC) Support Program and 
Community-Based Coalition 
Enhancement Grants to Address Local 
Drug Crisis (CARA Local Drug Crisis) 
Programs. The DFC Program has two 
primary goals: To reduce youth 
substance abuse, and to support 
community anti-drug coalitions by 
establishing, strengthening, and 
fostering collaboration among public 
and private agencies. The CARA Local 
Drug Crisis grant program funds current 
or former DFC grant award recipients to 
focus on preventing and reducing the 
abuse of opioids or methamphetamines 
and the abuse of prescription 
medications among youth ages 12–18 in 
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communities throughout the United 
States. 

Congress mandates an evaluation of 
the DFC program to determine its 
effectiveness in meeting objectives (see 
21 U.S.C. 1521 et al.). Under the CARA 
Local Drug Crisis program statute, 
CARA Local Drug Crisis data collection 
is authorized and required by Public 
Law 114–198 Sec. 103, ‘‘a grant under 
this section shall be subject to the same 
evaluation requirements and procedures 
as the evaluation requirements and 
procedures imposed on the recipients of 
a grant under the Drug-Free 
Communities Act of 1997, and may also 
include an evaluation of the 
effectiveness at reducing abuse of 
opioids or methamphetamines’’. ONDCP 
awarded a contract for a DFC grant 
oversight system at the end of 2014, 
following a competitive request for 
proposals process. The DFC 
Management and Evaluation (DFC Me) 
system was launched in 2016 and 
continues to be used (www.dfcme.ondcp 
.eop.gov). The development and 
implementation of the new DFC Me 
system provided an improved platform 
for DFC recipients to meet data 
reporting requirements of the grant, 
introduced a DFC Learning Center 
where resources and success stories can 
be shared, and strengthened ONDCP’s 
continued oversight of the DFC 
program. The data collected through 
this system is more user friendly and 
validates data during entry, therefore 
reducing the burden on grant award 
recipients. 

ONDCP will continue to utilize the 
case study protocols previously 
approved by OMB to document 
coalition practices, successes and 
challenges. Approximately nine DFC 
grant award recipients are selected each 
year to highlight in the case studies. The 
information from the case studies will 
be used to illustrate not only what 
works to reduce drug use in a 
community setting, but also how and 
why it works. 

The CARA Local Drug Crisis program 
evaluation will make use of the 
monitoring and tracking questionnaire 
to serve as a semi-annual report for 
grant award recipients and will provide 
information to ONDCP and the 
Administration’s effort to address the 
opioid crisis. 

Respondents: DFC current grant 
award recipients and CARA Local Drug 
Crisis grant award recipients (includes 
both current and former DFC grant 
award recipients). 

Estimated Number of Respondents: 
737 (724 DFC and 13 CARA only). 

Estimated Number of Responses: 
2,181. 

Frequency of Response: Semi- 
annually, annually and biennially. 
Progress reports semi-annually by DFC 
and CARA Local Drug Crisis Program 
Directors via DFC Me, core measures 
biennially by DFC and CARA Local 
Drug Crisis Program Directors via DFC 
Me and CCT annually for DFC Program 
Directors via DFC Me. Case study 
interviews of Program Directors and 
selected coalition members will be 
accomplished one time per site at nine 
sites. 

Average Hours per Response: Varies. 
ONDCP expects that the time required 
for DFC grant award recipients to 
complete each semi-annual progress 
report will be approximately six hours, 
and each CCT report will take 
approximately one hour to complete. 
Face to face interviews and focus groups 
with DFC grant award recipients 
selected for site visits will take 1.5–2 
hours each to complete. CARA Local 
Drug Crisis grant award recipients will 
also complete semi-annual progress 
reports at an estimated six hours. The 
estimate of time for DFC and CARA 
Local Drug Crisis grant award recipients 
includes biennial core measure data 
submission. 

Total Estimated Burden: 9,388 
(Comprehensive of all respondents over 
one year, including: DFC Program 
Directors and grant award recipients to 
complete progress reports, CCT surveys, 
and interviews; and CARA Local Drug 
Crisis grant award recipients.) 

Solicitation of Public Comment 

No comments were received during 
the 60-day notice. This notice is 
soliciting comments from members of 
the public and affected parties 
concerning the collection of information 
described in Section A on the following: 

(1) Whether the proposed data are 
proper for the functions of the agency; 

(2) Whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

(3) The accuracy of ONDCP’s estimate 
of the burden of the proposed collection 
of information, including the validity of 
the methodology and assumptions; 

(4) Ways to enhance the quality, 
utility, and clarity of the information to 
be collected; and, ways to ease the 
burden on proposed respondents, 
including the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology. 

ONDCP encourages interested parties 
to submit comments in response to 
these questions. 

Authority: The Paperwork Reduction Act 
of 1995, 44 U.S.C. Chapter 35. 

Dated: July 15, 2019. 
Michael Passante, 
Deputy General Counsel. 
[FR Doc. 2019–15303 Filed 7–17–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3180–F5–P 

FEDERAL DEPOSIT INSURANCE 
CORPORATION 

Sunshine Act Meeting 

TIME AND DATE: Pursuant to the 
provisions of the ‘‘Government in the 
Sunshine Act’’ (5 U.S.C. 552b), notice is 
hereby given that at 10:41 a.m. on 
Tuesday, July 16, 2019, the Board of 
Directors of the Federal Deposit 
Insurance Corporation met in closed 
session to consider matters related to 
the Corporation’s supervision, 
corporate, and resolution activities. 

PLACE: The meeting was held in the 
Board Room located on the sixth floor 
of the FDIC Building located at 550 17th 
Street, NW, Washington, DC. 

STATUS: The meeting was closed to the 
public. 

MATTERS CONSIDERED: In calling the 
meeting, the Board determined, on 
motion of Director Martin J. Gruenberg, 
seconded by Director Kathleen L. 
Kraninger (Director, Consumer 
Financial Protection Bureau), and 
concurred in by Joseph M. Otting 
(Comptroller of the Currency) and 
Chairman Jelena McWilliams, that 
Corporation business required its 
consideration of the matters which were 
to be the subject of this meeting on less 
than seven days’ notice to the public; 
that no earlier notice of the meeting was 
practicable; that the public interest did 
not require consideration of the matters 
in a meeting open to public observation; 
and that the matters could be 
considered in a closed meeting by 
authority of subsections (c)(4), (c)(6), 
(c)(8), (c)(9)(A)(ii), and (c)(9)(B) of the 
‘‘Government in the Sunshine Act’’ (5 
U.S.C. 552b(c)(4), (c)(6), (c)(8), 
(c)(9)(A)(ii), and (c)(9)(B). 

CONTACT PERSON FOR MORE INFORMATION: 
Requests for further information 
concerning the meeting may be directed 
to Robert E. Feldman, Executive 
Secretary of the Corporation, at 202– 
898–7043. 

Dated at Washington, DC, on July 16, 2019. 
Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation. 
Robert E. Feldman, 
Executive Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2019–15411 Filed 7–16–19; 4:15 pm] 

BILLING CODE 6714–01–P 
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