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1 18 CFR [4.34(b)(5)/5.23(b)/153.4/157.22]. 

consultation, we intend to waive 
scoping and expedite the exemption 
process. Commission staff determined 
that the issues that need to be addressed 
in the environmental document have 
been adequately identified during the 
pre-filing period, which included a 
public meeting and site visit, and no 
new issues are likely to be identified 
through additional scoping. Staff’s 
environmental document will evaluate 
the potential effects of project 
construction and operation on geology 
and soils, aquatic, terrestrial, threatened 
and endangered species, recreation, 
land use, aesthetic, cultural, and 
developmental resources. 

n. A copy of the application can be 
viewed on the Commission’s website at 
https://www.ferc.gov using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link. Enter the docket 
number excluding the last three digits in 
the docket number field to access the 
document. You may also register online 
at https://ferconline.ferc.gov/ 
FERCOnline.aspx to be notified via 
email of new filings and issuances 
related to this or other pending projects. 
For assistance, contact FERC Online 
Support. 

o. Anyone may submit comments, a 
protest, or a motion to intervene in 
accordance with the requirements of 
Rules of Practice and Procedure, 18 CFR 
385.210, .211, .214. In determining the 
appropriate action to take, the 
Commission will consider all protests or 
other comments filed, but only those 
who file a motion to intervene in 
accordance with the Commission’s 
Rules may become a party to the 
proceeding. Any comments, protests, or 
motions to intervene must be received 
on or before the specified comment date 
for the particular application. 

p. Any qualified applicant desiring to 
file a competing application must 
submit to the Commission, on or before 
the specified intervention deadline date, 
a competing development application, 
or a notice of intent to file such an 
application. Submission of a timely 
notice of intent allows an interested 
person to file the competing 
development application no later than 
120 days after the specified intervention 
deadline date. Applications for 
preliminary permits will not be 
accepted in response to this notice. 

A notice of intent must specify the 
exact name, business address, and 
telephone number of the prospective 
applicant, and must include an 
unequivocal statement of intent to 
submit a development application. A 
notice of intent must be served on the 
applicant(s) named in this public notice. 

q. All filings must (1) bear in all 
capital letters the title ‘‘PROTEST’’, 

‘‘MOTION TO INTERVENE’’, ‘‘NOTICE 
OF INTENT TO FILE COMPETING 
APPLICATION,’’ ‘‘COMPETING 
APPLICATION,’’ ‘‘COMMENTS,’’ 
‘‘REPLY COMMENTS,’’ 
‘‘RECOMMENDATIONS,’’ or ‘‘TERMS 
AND CONDITIONS;’’ (2) set forth in the 
heading the name of the applicant and 
the project number of the application to 
which the filing responds; (3) furnish 
the name of the person submitting the 
filing; and (4) otherwise comply with 
the requirements of 18 CFR 385.2001 
through 385.2005. All comments, 
recommendations, or terms and 
conditions must set forth their 
evidentiary basis and otherwise comply 
with the requirements of 18 CFR 4.34(b). 
Agencies may obtain copies of the 
application directly from the applicant. 
A copy of any protest or motion to 
intervene must be served upon each 
representative of the applicant specified 
in the particular application. A copy of 
all other filings in reference to this 
application must be accompanied by 
proof of service on all persons listed on 
the service list prepared by the 
Commission in this proceeding, in 
accordance with 18 CFR 4.34(b) and 
385.2010. 

The Commission’s Office of Public 
Participation (OPP) supports meaningful 
public engagement and participation in 
Commission proceedings. OPP can help 
members of the public, including 
landowners, community organizations, 
Tribal members and others, access 
publicly available information and 
navigate Commission processes. For 
public inquiries and assistance with 
making filings such as interventions, 
comments, or requests for rehearing, the 
public is encouraged to contact OPP at 
(202) 502–6595 or OPP@ferc.gov. 

r. The applicant must file no later 
than 60 days following the date of 
issuance of this notice: (1) a copy of the 
water quality certification; (2) a copy of 
the request for certification, including 
proof of the date on which the certifying 
agency received the request; or (3) 
evidence of waiver of water quality 
certification. 

s. Final amendments to the 
application must be filed with the 
Commission no later than 30 days from 
the issuance date of this notice. 

Dated: March 13, 2025. 

Carlos D. Clay, 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2025–04560 Filed 3–18–25; 8:45 am] 
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PE Hydro Generation, LLC; Notice of 
Reasonable Period of Time for Water 
Quality Certification Application 

On February 28, 2025, PE Hydro 
Generation, LLC (PE Hydro) submitted 
to the Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission (Commission) 
documentation from Virginia 
Department of Environmental Quality 
(Virginia DEQ) that it received PE 
Hydro’s request for a Clean Water Act 
section 401(a)(1) water quality 
certification as required by 40 CFR 
121.5, for the above captioned project 
on December 17, 2024. Pursuant to 
section [4.34(b)(5), 5.23(b), 153.4, or 
157.22] of the Commission’s 
regulations,1 we hereby notify Virginia 
DEQ of the following: 

Date of Receipt of the Certification 
Request: December 17, 2024. 

Reasonable Period of Time to Act on 
the Certification Request: One year, 
December 17, 2025. 

If Virginia DEQ fails or refuses to act 
on the water quality certification request 
on or before the above date, then the 
certifying authority is deemed waived 
pursuant to section 401(a)(1) of the 
Clean Water Act, 33 U.S.C. 1341(a)(1). 

Dated: March 12, 2025. 
Debbie-Anne A. Reese, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2025–04487 Filed 3–18–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

Combined Notice of Filings #1 

Take notice that the Commission 
received the following exempt 
wholesale generator filings: 

Docket Numbers: EG25–221–000. 
Applicants: Big Sampson Wind 

Project, LLC, Bracewell LLP. 
Description: Big Sampson Wind 

Project, LLC submits Notice of Self- 
Certification of Exempt Wholesale 
Generator Status. 

Filed Date: 3/11/25. 
Accession Number: 20250311–5301. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 4/1/25. 
Docket Numbers: EG25–222–000. 
Applicants: I-eye Storage LLC. 

VerDate Sep<11>2014 18:11 Mar 18, 2025 Jkt 265001 PO 00000 Frm 00029 Fmt 4703 Sfmt 4703 E:\FR\FM\19MRN1.SGM 19MRN1lo
tte

r 
on

 D
S

K
11

X
Q

N
23

P
R

O
D

 w
ith

 N
O

T
IC

E
S

1

https://ferconline.ferc.gov/FERCOnline.aspx
https://ferconline.ferc.gov/FERCOnline.aspx
https://www.ferc.gov
mailto:OPP@ferc.gov

		Superintendent of Documents
	2025-03-19T01:36:30-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	U.S. Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




