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Estimated Time Per Respondent: 80 
minutes. 

Estimated Total Annual Burden 
Hours: 667. 

Estimated Total Annualized Cost on 
the Public: $13,340. 

If additional information is required 
contact: Tracey Denning, Bureau of 
Customs and Border Protection, 1300 
Pennsylvania Avenue NW., Room 3.2.C, 
Washington, DC 20229, at 202–344–
1429.

Dated: August 25, 2004. 
Tracey Denning, 
Agency Clearance Officer, Information 
Services Branch.
[FR Doc. 04–19871 Filed 8–30–04; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4820–02–P

DEPARTMENT OF HOMELAND 
SECURITY 

Secret Service 

Appointment of Performance Review 
Board (PRB) Members 

This notice announces the 
appointment of members of the Senior 
Executive Service Performance Review 
Boards in accordance with 5 U.S.C. 
4314(c)(4) for the rating period 
beginning October 1, 2003, and ending 
September 30, 2004. Each PRB will be 
composed of at least three of the Senior 
Executive Service members listed 
below. 

Name and Title 

Carlton D. Spriggs—Deputy Director, 
U.S. Secret Service 

Barbara S. Riggs—Chief of Staff (USSS) 
Brian K. Nagel—Assistant Director, 

Investigation (USSS) 
Mark J. Sullivan—Assistant Director 

Protective Operations (USSS) 
Michael C. Stenger—Assistant Director, 

Protective Research (USSS) 
Keith W. Young—Assistant Director, 

Administration (USSS) 
Donald A. Flynn—Assistant Director, 

Inspection (USSS) 
Keith L. Prewitt—Assistant Director, 

Human Resources and Training 
(USSS) 

George D. Rogers—Assistant Director, 
Government and Public Affairs 
(USSS) 

Paul D. Irving—Assistant Director, 
Homeland Security (USSS) 

John J. Kelleher—Chief Counsel (USSS)

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Charles R. Tozier, Acting Chief, 
Personnel Division, 950 H St., NW., 

Suite 7400, Washington, DC 20223, 
Telephone No. (202) 406–5309.

W. Ralph Basham, 
Director.
[FR Doc. 04–19784 Filed 8–30–04; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4810–42–M

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

Fish and Wildlife Service 

Notice of Availability of the Final 
Comprehensive Conservation Plan and 
Environmental Impact Statement for 
Nisqually National Wildlife Refuge

AGENCY: Fish and Wildlife Service, 
Department of the Interior.
ACTION: Notice of Availability of the 
Final Comprehensive Conservation Plan 
and Environmental Impact Statement 
for Nisqually National Wildlife Refuge. 

SUMMARY: The U.S. Fish and Wildlife 
Service (Service) announces that a Final 
Comprehensive Conservation Plan and 
Environmental Impact Statement (Final 
CCP/EIS) for Nisqually National 
Wildlife Refuge (Refuge) is available for 
review and comment. This Final CCP/
EIS, prepared pursuant to the National 
Wildlife Refuge System Administration 
Act of 1966, as amended and the 
National Environmental Policy Act of 
1969, describes the Service’s proposal 
for management of the Refuge for the 
next 15 years. Proposed changes to the 
Refuge being considered include the 
restoration of historic estuarine habitat 
and dike removal; a proposed expansion 
of the approved Refuge boundary; 
changes to the trail system; opening the 
Refuge to waterfowl hunting; and 
establishing a speed limit of five miles 
per hour in Refuge waters for all water 
craft.
DATES: A Record of Decision may be 
signed no sooner than 30 days after 
publication of this notice (40 CFR 
1506.10(b)(2)).
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
further information or to request a copy 
of the Summary of Changes and 
Appendix M (Comments and 
Responses) document, contact Jean 
Takekawa, Refuge Manager, via 
telephone at (360) 753–9467, fax at (360) 
534–9302, or in writing at Nisqually 
National Wildlife Refuge Complex, 100 
Brown Farm Road, Olympia, 
Washington 98516. Copies of the Final 
CCP/EIS may be viewed at Nisqually 
National Wildlife Refuge and at the 
following libraries in Washington State: 
Timberland Community Library in 
Olympia, Tacoma Public Library; 
University of Washington’s Suzallo 

Library in Seattle; William J. Reed 
Library in Shelton; and the Evergreen 
State College Library in Olympia. The 
Final CCP/EIS will be available for 
viewing and downloading online at 
http://pacific.fws.gov/planning.
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Nisqually 
National Wildlife Refuge is located in 
western Washington at the southern end 
of Puget Sound in Thurston and Pierce 
counties. The Refuge protects one of the 
few relatively undeveloped large 
estuaries remaining in Puget Sound. It 
provides crucial habitat for migratory 
birds of the Pacific Flyway, including 
many waterfowl, shorebirds, waterbirds, 
and seabirds. The Refuge also contains 
regionally important migration and 
rearing habitat for salmon, particularly 
the federally threatened fall chinook 
salmon. Each year, more than 100,000 
visitors come to view wildlife and enjoy 
and learn about Refuge habitats and the 
wildlife they support. 

The Proposed Action is to adopt and 
implement a Comprehensive 
Conservation Plan (CCP) that best 
achieves the purposes for which the 
Refuge was established; furthers its 
vision and goals; contributes to the 
mission of the National Wildlife Refuge 
System; addresses significant issues and 
applicable mandates; and is consistent 
with principles of sound fish and 
wildlife management. Implementing the 
CCP will enable the Refuge to fulfill its 
critical role in the conservation and 
management of fish and wildlife 
resources of the Nisqually River delta 
and lower watershed, and to provide 
high quality environmental education 
and wildlife-dependent recreation 
opportunities for Refuge visitors. The 
Service analyzed four alternatives for 
future management of the Refuge; of 
these, Alternative D has been identified 
as the preferred alternative. 

Alternative D, modified from the Draft 
CCP/EIS, would provide a Refuge 
boundary expansion of 3,479 acres. 
Restoration of 699 acres of estuarine 
habitat would be accomplished through 
removal of a large portion of the exterior 
Brown Farm Dike. The remaining 263-
acre area within a newly constructed 
dike system would be managed to 
provide greatly improved freshwater 
wetland and riparian habitats. Thirty-
eight acres of valuable forested surge 
plain habitat would be restored along 
the Nisqually River. The environmental 
education program would be improved 
and expanded to serve 15,000 students 
per year. Due to dike removal, the 
existing 5.5-mile wildlife observation 
loop trail would be reduced to a 3.5-
mile round trip trail, and bank fishing 
on McAllister Creek would no longer be 
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