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www.regulations.gov as they are 
received without change, including any 
personal identifiers or contact 
information. 

Any associated form(s) for this 
collection may be located within this 
same electronic docket and downloaded 
for review/testing. Follow the 
instructions at http://
www.regulations.gov for submitting 
comments. Please submit comments on 
any given form identified by docket 
number, form number, and title. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: To 
request more information on this 
proposed information collection or to 
obtain a copy of the proposal and 
associated collection instruments, 
please write to the Office of the 
Administrative Assistant to the 
Secretary of the Army, Logistics 
Services Washington, Travel Services 
Division, 9301 Chapek Road, Fort 
Belvoir, VA 22060, ATTN: Ms. Nicole 
Jungermann, LSW, at (703) 545–0376. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Title; Associated Form; and OMB 

Number: Department of Defense (DoD) 
Passport and Passport Agent Services, 
Authorization to apply for ‘‘No-Fee’’ 
Passport and/or request for Visa, DD 
Form 1056, 0702–XXXX. 

Needs and Uses: The information 
collection requirement is necessary to 
obtain and record the personally 
identifiable information of official 
passport and/or visa applicants. This 
information is used to process, track, 
and verify no-fee passport and visa 
applications and requests for additional 
visa pages and Status of Forces 
Agreement (SOFA) endorsements. 

Affected Public: Individuals or 
Households and Federal Government. 

Annual Burden Hours: 175,000. 
Number of Respondents: 175,000. 
Responses per Respondent: 1. 
Average Burden per Response: 60 

minutes. 
Frequency: On occasion 
Respondents are DoD civilian and 

military personnel and eligible 
accompanying family members traveling 
on official government orders to a 
country requiring a no-fee passport and/ 
or visa. Authorization to apply for a no- 
fee passport is granted to those who can 
verify U.S. citizenship and legitimate 
official travel needs. Authorization to 
request a visa may also be granted to 
non-U.S. citizen family members, whose 
names are listed on the sponsor’s 
official travel orders. The information 
collected on this form is shared with the 
Department of State (DoS) and the 
designated foreign embassies. 

Dated: February 23, 2015. 
Aaron Siegel, 
Alternate OSD Federal Register Liaison 
Officer, Department of Defense. 
[FR Doc. 2015–04076 Filed 2–26–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 5001–06–P 

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 

Defense Acquisition Regulation 
System 

[Docket Number 2015–0005] 

Information Collection Requirement; 
Defense Federal Acquisition 
Regulation Supplement; DFARS 234.2, 
Earned Value Management System. 

AGENCY: Defense Acquisition 
Regulations System, Department of 
Defense (DoD). 
ACTION: Notice correction. 

SUMMARY: This document corrects the 
date in a notice published in the 
Federal Register on February 23, 2015, 
(80 FR 9445) concerning request for 
comments on the proposed extension of 
OMB control number 0704–0479, 
DFARS 234.2, Earned Value 
Management System. The document 
contained an incorrect date for 
submission of public comments. The 
new date is April 24, 2015. 

Correction 

DATES: DoD will consider all comments 
received by April 24, 2015. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Mr. 
Mark Gomersall, at (571) 372–6099. 

Manuel Quinones, 
Editor, Defense Acquisition Regulations 
System. 
[FR Doc. 2015–04051 Filed 2–26–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 5001–06–P 

DELAWARE RIVER BASIN 
COMMISSION 

Notice of Public Hearing and Business 
Meeting; March 10–11, 2015 

Notice is hereby given that the 
Delaware River Basin Commission will 
hold a public hearing on Tuesday, 
March 10, 2015. A business meeting 
will be held the following day on 
Wednesday, March 11, 2015. The 
hearing and business meeting are open 
to the public and will be held at the 
Washington Crossing Historic Park 
Visitor Center, 1112 River Road, 
Washington Crossing, Pennsylvania. 

Public Hearing. The public hearing on 
March 10, 2015 will begin at 1:30 p.m. 
Hearing items will include draft dockets 

for withdrawals, discharges and other 
water-related projects subject to the 
Commission’s review, and resolutions: 
(1) Authorizing the Executive Director 
to award a contract to the lowest 
responsible bidder for taxonomic 
identification of benthic 
macroinvertebrates in samples collected 
from the Delaware River and its 
tributaries; (2) authorizing the Executive 
Director to award a contract to the 
lowest responsible bidder for analysis of 
water, sediment and tissue samples 
from ambient waters of the Delaware 
River Basin for organic chemicals 
including PCBs, and mercury; (3) 
delegating limited authority to the 
Executive Director to enter into 
settlement agreements and to waive 
administrative late fees for good cause 
shown; and (4) authorizing and 
directing the Executive Director to 
initiate rulemaking to provide for the 
One Process—One Permit Program and 
to enter into an Administrative 
Agreement with the New Jersey 
Department of Environmental Protection 
for demonstration of the program. The 
list of projects scheduled for hearing, 
including project descriptions, will be 
posted on the Commission’s Web site, 
www.drbc.net, in a long form of this 
notice at least ten days before the 
hearing date. Written comments on draft 
dockets and resolutions scheduled for 
hearing on March 10 will be accepted 
through the close of the hearing that 
day. After the hearing on all scheduled 
matters has been completed, there will 
be an opportunity for public dialogue. 

The public is advised to check the 
Commission’s Web site periodically 
prior to the hearing date, as items 
scheduled for hearing may be 
postponed if additional time is deemed 
necessary to complete the Commission’s 
review, and items may be added up to 
ten days prior to the hearing date. In 
reviewing docket descriptions, the 
public is also asked to be aware that 
project details commonly change in the 
course of the Commission’s review, 
which is ongoing. 

Public Meeting. The public business 
meeting on March 11, 2015 will begin 
at 1:00 p.m. and will include: adoption 
of the Minutes of the Commission’s 
December 10, 2014 business meeting, 
announcements of upcoming meetings 
and events, a report on hydrologic 
conditions, reports by the Executive 
Director and the Commission’s General 
Counsel, and consideration of any items 
for which a hearing has been completed 
or is not required. In the latter category, 
the meeting will include resolutions for 
the Minutes: (a) Authorizing the 
Executive Director to execute an 
agreement for the preparation of the 
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