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c. $100,000 in favor of the Group 
Against Smog and Pollution (GASP) for 
an environmental project developed by 
the Hazelwood Initiative to rejuvenate 
the Hazelwood, Pennsylvania 
community;
and in LTV Steel-Cleveland for $1.25 in 
civil penalties to the United States. On 
December 29, 2000, LTV Steel filed for 
bankruptcy protection in In re: LTV 
Steel Company, Inc. (the LTV 
Bankruptcy), Bankruptcy No. 00–43866 
(N.D. Ohio). The Stipulation and Order 
also provides that plaintiffs shall have 
allowed general unsecured claims 
against LTV Steel for the amounts 
specified above and that LTV Steel will 
use its best efforts to obtain approval by 
the Bankruptcy Court of its entry into 
the Stipulation and Order. Because of 
the pendency of the LTV Bankruptcy, it 
is unclear whether the specified 
amounts will be available after 
payments to other, secured creditors. 

For thirty (30) days following this 
publication, the Department of Justice 
will receive comments relating to the 
proposed Stipulation and Order. 
Comments should be addressed to the 
Assistant Attorney General of the 
Environment and Natural Resources 
Division, United States Department of 
Justice, Post Office Box 7611, 
Washington, D.C. 20044–7611, and 
should refer to United States, ACHD 
and GASP v. LTV Steel Company, Inc., 
Civil No. 98–570 (W.D. Pa.), and United 
States v. LTV Steel Company, Inc., Civil 
No. 1: 98CV3012 (N.D. Ohio), DOJ nos. 
90–5–2–1–2193 and 90–7–1–919. 
Alternatively, because of potential mail 
delays associated with recent events, 
comments may be sent by facsimile to 
(202) 514–4180, with attention to the 
Environmental Enforcement Section. 

The Stipulation and Order may be 
examined at the offices of the United 
States Attorney for the Western District 
of Pennsylvania, 633 U.S. Post Office 
and Courthouse, Pittsburgh, 
Pennsylvania 15219, and the offices of 
the United States Attorney for the 
Northern District of Ohio, 1800 Bank 
One Center, 600 Superior Avenue, East, 
Cleveland, Ohio 44114–2600. A copy of 
the Stipulation and Order may be 
obtained by mail from the United States 
Department of Justice Consent Decree 
Library, Post Office Box 7611, 
Washington, D.C. 20044–7611 or by 
faxing a request to Tonia Fleetwood, fax 
no. (202) 514–0097, phone confirmation 
number (202) 514–1547. In requesting a 
copy, please reference the Stipulation of 
Settlement and Order of Dismissal in 
United States, ACHD and GASP v. LTV 
Steel Company, Inc., Civil No. 98–570 
(W.D. Pa.), and United States v. LTV 

Steel Company, Inc., Civil No. 1: 
98CV3012 (N.D. Ohio), DOJ nos. 90–5–
2–1–2193 and 90–7–1–919, and enclose 
a check made payable to the United 
States Treasury in the amount of $3.75 
(25 cents per page reproduction cost).

Bruce S. Gelber, 
Chief, Environmental Enforcement Section, 
Environmental and Natural Resources 
Division.
[FR Doc. 02–12877 Filed 5–22–02; 8:45 am] 
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DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

Notice of Lodging of a Consent Decree 
Pursuant to the Comprehensive 
Environmental Response, 
Compensation, and Liability Act 

Notice is hereby given that a proposed 
partial consent decree in United States 
and State of California v. Oil & Solvent 
Process Company, Chemical Waste 
Management, Inc., Fairchild Holding 
Corporation, and R. H. Peterson 
Company, Consolidated Cases: CV 98–
0760, CV 97–8230, CV 96–6634 TJH was 
lodged on April 22, 2002, with the 
United States District Court for Central 
District of California. The proposed 
Consent Decree would resolve certain 
claims against Oil & Solvent Process 
Company, Chemical Waste 
Management, Inc., and R. H. Peterson 
Company under Sections 107 of the 
Comprehensive Environmental 
Response, Compensation, and Liability 
Act of 1980, 42 U.S.C. 9606 & 9607, as 
amended brought against all of the 
above captioned defendants to recover 
response costs incurred by the 
Environmental Protection Agency in 
connection with the release of 
hazardous substances at the San Gabriel 
Valley Superfund Sites, Suburban 
Operable Unit (‘‘Site’’) in Los Angeles, 
California. The United States alleges 
that Settling Defendants are liable as 
persons who currently own or owned a 
portion of the Site at the time of 
disposal of a hazardous substance. 
Under the proposed partial Consent 
Decree, the Settling Defendants will pay 
$950,000, of which $47,500 will be paid 
to the State of California and $902,500 
will be paid to the Hazardous 
Substances Superfund to reimburse the 
United States for response costs 
incurred and to be incurred at the Site. 

The Department of Justice will 
receive, for a period of thirty (30) days 
from the date of this publication, 
comments relating to the proposed 
Consent Decree. Comments should be 
addressed to the Assistant Attorney 
General for the Environment and 

Natural Resources Division, Department 
of Justice, P.O. Box 7611, Washington, 
D.C. 20530, and should refer to United 
States and State of California v. Oil & 
Solvent Process Company, Chemical 
Waste Management, Inc., Fairchild 
Holding Corporation, and R. H. Peterson 
Company., Consolidated Cases: CV 98–
0760, CV 97–8230, CV 96–6634 TJH, 
DOJ Ref. # 90–11–3–1691. 

The Consent Decree may be examined 
at the Region 9 Office of the 
Environmental Protection Agency, 75 
Hawthorne Street, San Francisco, CA 
94105 and the United States Attorney’s 
Office for the Central District of 
California, Federal Building, 300 North 
Los Angeles Street, Los Angeles, 
California 90012 c/o Assistant United 
States Attorney Suzette Clover. A copy 
of the proposed consent decree may be 
obtained by mail from the Consent 
Decree Library, Post Office Box 7611, 
Washington, D.C. 20044. In requesting 
copies please refer to the referenced 
case and enclose a check in the amount 
of $12.00 (25 cents per page 
reproduction costs), payable to the 
United States Treasury.

Ellen Mahan, 
Assistant Section Chief, Environmental 
Enforcement Section, Environment and 
Natural Resources Division.
[FR Doc. 02–12875 Filed 5–22–02; 8:45 am] 
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DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

Office of Justice Programs 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Proposed Collection; 
Comment Request

ACTION: 60-Day notice of information 
collection under review: Reinstatement, 
without change, of a previously 
approved collection for which approval 
has expired; Crime Victim 
Compensation State Certification Form. 

The Department of Justice, Office of 
Justice Programs, Office of Victims of 
Crime, has submitted the following 
information collection request for 
review and clearance in accordance 
with the Paperwork Reduction Act of 
1995. This proposed information 
collection is published to obtain 
comments from the public and affected 
agencies. Comments are encouraged and 
will be accepted for ‘‘sixty days’’ until 
July 22, 2002. 

If you have written comments, 
suggestions, or need a copy of the 
proposed information collection 
instrument with instructions or 
additional information, please contact
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