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Cocoa Palm Way, Fair Oaks, CA 95628, 
Telephone (301) 401–5978 

FERC Contact: Joseph Hassell; phone: 
(202) 502–8079. 

Deadline for filing comments, motions 
to intervene, competing applications 
(without notices of intent), or notices of 
intent to file competing applications: 60 
days from the issuance of this notice. 
Competing applications and notices of 
intent must meet the requirements of 18 
CFR 4.36. 

The Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filing. Please file comments, 
motions to intervene, notices of intent, 
and competing applications using the 
Commission’s eFiling system at http:// 
www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/efiling.asp. 
Commenters can submit brief comments 
up to 6,000 characters, without prior 
registration, using the eComment system 
at http://www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/ 
ecomment.asp. You must include your 
name and contact information at the end 
of your comments. For assistance, 
please contact FERC Online Support at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, (866) 
208–3676 (toll free), or (202) 502–8659 
(TTY). In lieu of electronic filing, please 
send a paper copy to: Secretary, Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE., Washington, DC 20426. 
The first page of any filing should 
include docket number P–14512–000. 

More information about this project, 
including a copy of the application, can 
be viewed or printed on the ‘‘eLibrary’’ 
link of Commission’s Web site at http:// 
www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/elibrary.asp. 
Enter the docket number (P–14512) in 
the docket number field to access the 
document. For assistance, contact FERC 
Online Support. 

Dated: February 19, 2014. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2014–04040 Filed 2–25–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[ Project No. 14515–000] 

Fall River Valley Community Service 
District; Notice of Preliminary Permit 
Application Accepted for Filing and 
Soliciting Comments, Motions To 
Intervene, and Competing Applications 

On April 22, 2013, Fall River Valley 
Community Service District filed an 
application for a preliminary permit, 
pursuant to section 4(f) of the Federal 
Power Act (FPA), proposing to study the 

feasibility of the Old Cow Creek Open- 
Channel Hydro Project (Old Cow Creek 
Project or project) to be located on Old 
Cow Creek, near Whitmore, California. 
The sole purpose of a preliminary 
permit, if issued, is to grant the permit 
holder priority to file a license 
application during the permit term. A 
preliminary permit does not authorize 
the permit holder to perform any land- 
disturbing activities or otherwise enter 
upon lands or waters owned by others 
without the owners’ express permission. 

The proposed project would consist of 
the following: (1) A diversion intake on 
Old Cow Creek located just above 
Pacific Gas & Electric Company’s 
(PG&E) existing diversion; (2) a new 100 
cubic feet per second canal that would 
run parallel to PG&E’s existing 3-mile 
long canal; (3) a powerhouse located 
adjacent to the existing PG&E 
powerhouse; (4) two 3 MW 
conventional hydroelectric turbines, 
and; (5) appurtenant facilities. The 
estimated average generating capacity of 
the project would be 31 gigawatt hours. 

Applicant Contact: Mr. David Hall, 
Fall River Valley Community Service 
District, P.O. Box 427, Fall River Mills, 
CA 96208, Telephone (530) 336–5263. 

FERC Contact: Joseph Hassell; phone: 
(202) 502–8079. 

Deadline for filing comments, motions 
to intervene, competing applications 
(without notices of intent), or notices of 
intent to file competing applications: 60 
days from the issuance of this notice. 
Competing applications and notices of 
intent must meet the requirements of 18 
CFR 4.36. 

The Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filing. Please file comments, 
motions to intervene, notices of intent, 
and competing applications using the 
Commission’s eFiling system at http://
www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/efiling.asp. 
Commenters can submit brief comments 
up to 6,000 characters, without prior 
registration, using the eComment system 
at http://www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/
ecomment.asp. You must include your 
name and contact information at the end 
of your comments. For assistance, 
please contact FERC Online Support at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, (866) 
208–3676 (toll free), or (202) 502–8659 
(TTY). In lieu of electronic filing, please 
send a paper copy to: Secretary, Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE., Washington, DC 20426. 
The first page of any filing should 
include docket number P–14515–000. 

More information about this project, 
including a copy of the application, can 
be viewed or printed on the ‘‘eLibrary’’ 
link of Commission’s Web site at http:// 
www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/elibrary.asp. 
Enter the docket number (P–14515) in 

the docket number field to access the 
document. For assistance, contact FERC 
Online Support. 

Dated: February 19, 2014. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2014–04041 Filed 2–25–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Project No. 1888–030] 

York Haven Power Company, LLC; 
Notice of Settlement Agreement 

Take notice that the following 
settlement agreement has been filed 
with the Commission and is available 
for public inspection. 

a. Type of Application: Settlement 
Agreement. 

b. Project No.: P–1888–030. 
c. Date filed: January 30, 2014. 
d. Applicant: York Haven Power 

Company, LLC. 
e. Name of Project: York Haven 

Hydroelectric Project. 
f. Location: On the Susquehanna 

River, in Dauphin, Lancaster, and York 
Counties, Pennsylvania. The project 
does not occupy any federal lands. 

g. Filed Pursuant to: Rule 602 of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure, 18 CFR 385.602. 

h. Applicant Contact: David R. David, 
York Haven Power Company, York 
Haven Hydro Station, P.O. Box 67, York 
Haven, PA 17370, at (717) 266–9475 or 
email at DDavid@yorkhavenpower.com 
and Dennis T. O’Donnell, Olympus 
Power, LLC, 67 Park Place East, 
Morristown, NJ 07960. 

i. FERC Contact: Emily Carter, (202) 
502–6512 or emily.carter@ferc.gov. 

j. The York Haven Power Company, 
LLC (York Haven) filed the Settlement 
Agreement on behalf of itself, the U.S. 
Fish and Wildlife Service (FWS), 
Pennsylvania Fish and Boat 
Commission (PFBC), Maryland 
Department of Natural Resources 
(MDNR), and the Susquehanna River 
Basin Commission (SRBC). The purpose 
of the Settlement Agreement is to 
resolve among the signatories all issues 
associated with issuance of a new 
license for the project regarding 
upstream passage of American eels, 
downstream passage of post-spawning 
American shad, downstream passage of 
juvenile American shad, downstream 
passage of silver stage American eel, 
resident fish passage, flow management, 
water quality and debris management, 
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