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DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

[Public Notice: 10532] 

In the Matter of the Designation of 
Jama’at Nusrat al-Islam wal-Muslimin 
(JNIM), aka Jamaat Nosrat al-Islam wal- 
Mouslimin, aka Group for the Support 
of Islam and Muslims, aka Group to 
Support Islam and Muslims, aka GSIM, 
aka GNIM, aka Nusrat al-Islam wal- 
Muslimeen, as a Specially Designated 
Global Terrorist 

Acting under the authority of and in 
accordance with section 1(b) of 
Executive Order 13224 of September 23, 
2001, as amended by Executive Order 
13268 of July 2, 2002, and Executive 
Order 13284 of January 23, 2003, I 
hereby determine that the person known 
as Jama’at Nusrat al-Islam wal-Muslimin 
(JNIM), also known as Jamaat Nosrat al- 
Islam wal-Mouslimin, also known as 
Group for the Support of Islam and 
Muslims, also known as Group to 
Support Islam and Muslims, also known 
as GSIM, also known as GNIM, also 
known as Nusrat al-Islam wal- 
Muslimeen, committed, or poses a 
significant risk of committing, acts of 
terrorism that threaten the security of 
U.S. nationals or the national security, 
foreign policy, or economy of the United 
States. 

Consistent with the determination in 
section 10 of Executive Order 13224 that 
prior notice to persons determined to be 
subject to the Order who might have a 
constitutional presence in the United 
States would render ineffectual the 
blocking and other measures authorized 
in the Order because of the ability to 
transfer funds instantaneously, I 
determine that no prior notice needs to 
be provided to any person subject to this 
determination who might have a 
constitutional presence in the United 
States, because to do so would render 
ineffectual the measures authorized in 
the Order. 

This notice shall be published in the 
Federal Register. 

Dated: July 15, 2018. 

Michael R. Pompeo, 
Secretary of State. 
[FR Doc. 2018–19274 Filed 9–5–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4710–AD–P 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

[Public Notice: 10530] 

In the Matter of the Designation of 
Jama’at Nusrat al-Islam wal-Muslimin 
(JNIM), aka Jamaat Nosrat al-Islam wal- 
Mouslimin, aka Group for the Support 
of Islam and Muslims, aka Group to 
Support Islam and Muslims, aka GSIM, 
aka GNIM, aka Nusrat al-Islam wal- 
Muslimeen, as a Foreign Terrorist 
Organization Pursuant to Section 219 
of the Immigration and Nationality Act, 
as Amended 

Based upon a review of the 
Administrative Record assembled in 
this matter, and in consultation with the 
Attorney General and the Secretary of 
the Treasury, I conclude that there is a 
sufficient factual basis to find that the 
relevant circumstances described in 
section 219 of the Immigration and 
Nationality Act, as amended (hereinafter 
‘‘INA’’) (8 U.S.C. 1189), exist with 
respect to Jama’at Nusrat al-Islam wal- 
Muslimin (JNIM), also known as Jamaat 
Nosrat al-Islam wal-Mouslimin, also 
known as Group for the Support of 
Islam and Muslims, also known as 
Group to Support Islam and Muslims, 
also known as GSIM, also known as 
GNIM, also known as Nusrat al-Islam 
wal-Muslimeen. 

Therefore, I hereby designate the 
aforementioned organization and its 
aliases as a foreign terrorist organization 
pursuant to section 219 of the INA. 

This determination shall be published 
in the Federal Register. 

Dated: July 15, 2018. 
Michael R. Pompeo, 
Secretary of State. 
[FR Doc. 2018–19277 Filed 9–5–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4710–AD–P 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

[Public Notice: 10534] 

Notice of Meeting of Advisory 
Committee on International Law 

A meeting of the Department of 
State’s Advisory Committee on 
International Law will take place on 
Thursday, September 27, 2018, from 
9:30 a.m. to 5:00 p.m. at the George 
Washington University Law School, 
Michael K. Young Faculty Conference 
Center, 716 20th St. NW, 5th Floor, 
Washington, DC. Legal Adviser Jennifer 
Newstead will chair the meeting, which 
will be open to the public up to the 
capacity of the meeting room. It is 
anticipated that the meeting will 
include discussions on international 
law and contemporary issues in outer 

space, the role of economic security 
considerations in international and 
domestic trade law, international law 
and privacy in the context of data 
transfers, and the work of the 
International Law Commission. 

Members of the public who wish to 
attend should contact the Office of the 
Legal Adviser by September 21 at 
kellybm@state.gov or 202–647–0359 and 
provide their name, professional 
affiliation, address, and phone number. 
A valid photo ID is required for 
admission to the meeting. Attendees 
who require reasonable accommodation 
should make their requests by 
September 18. Requests received after 
that date will be considered but might 
not be possible to accommodate. 

Brian Kelly, 
Attorney-Adviser, Office of the Legal Adviser, 
Executive Director, Advisory Committee on 
International Law, Department of State. 
[FR Doc. 2018–19334 Filed 9–5–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4710–08–P 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

[Public Notice 10533] 

Notice of Determinations; Culturally 
Significant Objects Imported for 
Exhibition—Determinations: ‘‘The 
Charterhouse of Bruges: Jan Van 
Eyck, Petrus Christus, and Jan Vos’’ 
Exhibition 

SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given of the 
following determinations: I hereby 
determine that certain objects to be 
included in the exhibition ‘‘The 
Charterhouse of Bruges: Jan Van Eyck, 
Petrus Christus, and Jan Vos,’’ imported 
from abroad for temporary exhibition 
within the United States, are of cultural 
significance. The objects are imported 
pursuant to loan agreements with the 
foreign owners or custodians. I also 
determine that the exhibition or display 
of the exhibit objects at The Frick 
Collection, New York, New York, from 
on or about September 18, 2018, until 
on or about January 13, 2019, and at 
possible additional exhibitions or 
venues yet to be determined, is in the 
national interest. I have ordered that 
Public Notice of these determinations be 
published in the Federal Register. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Elliot Chiu, Attorney-Adviser, Office of 
the Legal Adviser, U.S. Department of 
State (telephone: 202–632–6471; email: 
section2459@state.gov). The mailing 
address is U.S. Department of State, 
L/PD, SA–5, Suite 5H03, Washington, 
DC 20522–0505. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
foregoing determinations were made 
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