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seeker with a selectable attack profile. 
The Harpoon Block II upgrade 
incorporates software and hardware 
changes that will add an improved Anti- 
Surface Warfare (ASUW) capability 
against ships in the open ocean and in 
the littoral. Harpoon Block II hardware 
improvements include a new Guidance 
Control Unit (GCU) that uses GPS aided 
inertial navigation. This improves the 
missile’s overall navigation accuracy. 
GPS accuracy also gives Harpoon Block 
II an inherent secondary role against 
land-based targets, making Block II 
useful in coastal target suppression 
roles. Harpoon Block II software 
improvements includes changes to the 
launching system that provides the 
operator with the ability to superimpose 
a geographic coastline on the mission 
planning screen. This allows the user to 
shape the search pattern of the Harpoon 
seeker in ASUW mode, enhancing its 
performance in littoral areas. The 
information on the Harpoon is classified 
Secret. 

19. The AIM–9X–2 Sidewinder 
missile is a 5th generation air-to-air 
guided missile that employs a passive 
infrared (IR) target acquisition system 
that features digital technology and 
micro-miniature solid-state electronics. 
The AIM–9X–2 AUR is Confidential, 
major components and subsystems 
range from Unclassified to Confidential, 
and technical data and other 
documentation are classified up to 
Secret. 

20. If a technologically advanced 
adversary obtained knowledge of the 
specific hardware or software in the 
proposed sale, the information could be 
used to develop countermeasures which 
might reduce weapons system 
effectiveness or be used in the 
development of a system with similar or 
advanced capabilities. 

21. A determination has been made 
that the recipient country can provide 
the same degree of protection for the 
sensitive technology being released as 
the U.S. Government. This sale is 
necessary in furtherance of the U.S. 
foreign policy and national security 
objectives outlined in the Policy 
Justification. Moreover, the benefits to 
be derived from this sale, as outlined in 
the Policy Justification, outweigh the 
potential damage that could result if the 
sensitive technology were revealed to 
unauthorized persons. 

22. All defense articles and services 
listed in this transmittal have been 
authorized for release and export to the 
Government of Korea. 
[FR Doc. 2015–17774 Filed 7–20–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 5001–06–P 

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 

Office of the Secretary 

[Docket ID: DoD–2014–HA–0162] 

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request 

ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Defense 
has submitted to OMB for clearance, the 
following proposal for collection of 
information under the provisions of the 
Paperwork Reduction Act. 
DATES: Consideration will be given to all 
comments received by August 20, 2015. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Fred 
Licari, 571–372–0493. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Title, Associated Form and OMB 
Number: Surveys on Viability of 
TRICARE Standard and TRICARE Extra; 
OMB Control Number 0720–0031. 

Type of Request: Reinstatement. 
Number of Respondents: 50000. 
Responses Per Respondent: 1. 
Annual Responses: 50000. 
Average Burden Per Response: 5 

minutes. 
Annual Burden Hours: 4167. 
Needs and Uses: The survey will 

gather data on providers (physicians 
and mental health providers) to assess 
the extent to which they are aware of 
the overall TRICARE program, accept 
new TRICARE Standard patients 
specifically, and the extent to which 
these physicians accept Medicare 
patients. The information gathered 
through this project will be used to 
generate reports to address the 
legislative requirements specified in 
section 711 of the FY08 NDAA and 
section 721 of the FY 2012 NDAA. 
Information resulting from the 
collection efforts of this project will 
assist DoD in developing policies and 
initiatives to improve TRICARE 
beneficiaries’ access to civilian 
providers. The results of the previous 
survey efforts have been briefed to, or 
provided in written communication to 
the Defense Health Agency and senior 
DoD personnel, TRICARE Regional 
Office Directors and their staff, members 
of Congress, selected state leaders and 
selected medical societies, staff 
members of the Government 
Accountability Office, TRICARE 
Beneficiary Groups, at the Military 
Health Service (MHS) Conferences. The 
results have also been referenced in 
public media such as the Military 
Officers Association of America. None 
of these audiences have ever been 
provided information that would permit 
them to identify individual providers, 

but instead were briefed using aggregate 
measures of provider knowledge or 
behavior within specific analysis groups 
such as health care markets or provider 
areas of specialization. 

Affected Public: Individuals or 
households. 

Frequency: Annually. 
Respondent’s Obligation: Voluntary. 
OMB Desk Officer: Ms. Jasmeet 

Seehra. 
Written comments and 

recommendations on the proposed 
information collection should be 
emailed to Ms. Jasmeet Seehra at the 
Office of Management and Budget, DoD 
Desk Officer, at Oira_submission@
omb.eop.gov. Please identify the 
proposed information collection by DoD 
Desk Officer and the Docket ID number 
and title of the information collection. 

You may also submit comments and 
recommendations, identified by Docket 
ID number and title, by the following 
method: 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: http:// 
www.regulations.gov. Follow the 
instructions for submitting comments. 

Instructions: All submissions received 
must include the agency name, Docket 
ID number and title for this Federal 
Register document. The general policy 
for comments and other submissions 
from members of the public is to make 
these submissions available for public 
viewing on the Internet at http://
www.regulations.gov as they are 
received without change, including any 
personal identifiers or contact 
information. 

DoD Clearance Officer: Mr. Frederick 
Licari. 

Written requests for copies of the 
information collection proposal should 
be sent to Mr. Licari at WHS/ESD 
Directives Division, 4800 Mark Center 
Drive, East Tower, Suite 02G09, 
Alexandria, VA 22350–3100. 

Dated: July 16, 2015. 
Aaron Siegel, 
Alternate OSD Federal Register Liaison 
Officer, Department of Defense. 
[FR Doc. 2015–17844 Filed 7–20–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 5001–06–P 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

[Docket No.: ED–2015–ICCD–0062] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission to the Office of 
Management and Budget for Review 
and Approval; Comment Request; 
Federal Perkins Loan Program Master 
Promissory Note 

AGENCY: Federal Student Aid (FSA), 
Department of Education (ED). 
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ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 (44 
U.S.C. chapter 3501 et seq.), ED is 
proposing a revision of an existing 
information collection. 
DATES: Interested persons are invited to 
submit comments on or before August 
20, 2015. 
ADDRESSES: To access and review all the 
documents related to the information 
collection listed in this notice, please 
use http://wwww.regulations.gov by 
searching the Docket ID number ED– 
2015–ICCD–0062. Comments submitted 
in response to this notice should be 
submitted electronically through the 
Federal eRulemaking Portal at http://
www.regulations.gov by selecting the 
Docket ID number or via postal mail, 
commercial delivery, or hand delivery. 
Please note that comments submitted by 
fax or email and those submitted after 
the comment period will not be 
accepted. Written requests for 
information or comments submitted by 
postal mail or delivery should be 
addressed to the Director of the 
Information Collection Clearance 
Division, U.S. Department of Education, 
400 Maryland Avenue SW, LBJ, Room 
2E103, Washington, DC 20202–4537. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
specific questions related to collection 
activities, please contact Beth 
Grebeldinger, 202–377–4018. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Department of Education (ED), in 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995 (PRA) (44 U.S.C. 
3506(c)(2)(A)), provides the general 
public and Federal agencies with an 
opportunity to comment on proposed, 
revised, and continuing collections of 
information. This helps the Department 
assess the impact of its information 
collection requirements and minimize 
the public’s reporting burden. It also 
helps the public understand the 
Department’s information collection 
requirements and provide the requested 
data in the desired format. ED is 
soliciting comments on the proposed 
information collection request (ICR) that 
is described below. The Department of 
Education is especially interested in 
public comment addressing the 
following issues: (1) Is this collection 
necessary to the proper functions of the 
Department; (2) will this information be 
processed and used in a timely manner; 
(3) is the estimate of burden accurate; 
(4) how might the Department enhance 
the quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and (5) how 
might the Department minimize the 
burden of this collection on the 

respondents, including through the use 
of information technology. Please note 
that written comments received in 
response to this notice will be 
considered public records. 

Title of Collection: Federal Perkins 
Loan Program Master Promissory Note. 

OMB Control Number: 1845–0074. 
Type of Review: A revision of an 

existing information collection. 
Respondents/Affected Public: 

Individuals or Households. 
Total Estimated Number of Annual 

Responses: 276, 934. 
Total Estimated Number of Annual 

Burden Hours: 138, 467. 
Abstract: The Federal Perkins Loan 

Master Promissory Note (MPN) provides 
the terms and conditions of the Perkins 
Loan program and is prepared by the 
participating eligible institution and 
signed by the borrower. The borrower 
may receive loans for a single academic 
year or multiple academic years. The 
adoption of the MPN in the Perkins 
Loan Program has simplified the loan 
process by eliminating the need for 
institutions to prepare and students to 
sign, a promissory note each award year. 

Dated: July 16, 2015. 
Kate Mullan, 
Acting Director, Information Collection 
Clearance Division, Office of the Chief Privacy 
Officer, Office of Management. 
[FR Doc. 2015–17829 Filed 7–20–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4000–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. ER15–2149–000] 

Century Marketer LLC; Supplemental 
Notice That Initial Market-Based Rate 
Filing Includes Request for Blanket 
Section 204 Authorization 

This is a supplemental notice in the 
above-referenced proceeding of Century 
Marketer LLC’s application for market- 
based rate authority, with an 
accompanying rate tariff, noting that 
such application includes a request for 
blanket authorization, under 18 CFR 
part 34, of future issuances of securities 
and assumptions of liability. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest should file with the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street, NE., Washington, DC 20426, 
in accordance with Rules 211 and 214 
of the Commission’s Rules of Practice 
and Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Anyone filing a motion to 
intervene or protest must serve a copy 
of that document on the Applicant. 

Notice is hereby given that the 
deadline for filing protests with regard 
to the applicant’s request for blanket 
authorization, under 18 CFR part 34, of 
future issuances of securities and 
assumptions of liability, is August 3, 
2015. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper, using the 
FERC Online links at http://
www.ferc.gov. To facilitate electronic 
service, persons with Internet access 
who will eFile a document and/or be 
listed as a contact for an intervenor 
must create and validate an 
eRegistration account using the 
eRegistration link. Select the eFiling 
link to log on and submit the 
intervention or protests. 

Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 5 copies 
of the intervention or protest to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

The filings in the above-referenced 
proceeding are accessible in the 
Commission’s eLibrary system by 
clicking on the appropriate link in the 
above list. They are also available for 
electronic review in the Commission’s 
Public Reference Room in Washington, 
DC. There is an eSubscription link on 
the Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive email notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please email 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov. or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Dated: July 14, 2015. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2015–17786 Filed 7–20–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Project No. 14675–000] 

Siting Renewables, LLC; Notice of 
Preliminary Permit Application 
Accepted for Filing and Soliciting 
Comments, Motions To Intervene, and 
Competing Applications 

On April 9, 2015, Siting Renewables, 
LLC, filed an application for a 
preliminary permit, pursuant to section 
4(f) of the Federal Power Act (FPA), 
proposing to study the feasibility of a 
hydropower project to be located at the 
existing Chain Dam on the Lehigh River, 
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