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The CSRIC is a Federal Advisory 
Committee that will provide 
recommendations to the Commission to 
improve the security, reliability, and 
interoperability of communications 
systems. On June 30, 2021, the 
Commission, pursuant to the Federal 
Advisory Committee Act, renewed the 
charter for CSRIC VII for a period of two 
years through June 29, 2023. The 
meeting on June 26, 2023, will be the 
eighth and final meeting of CSRIC VIII 
under the current charter. 

The Commission will provide audio 
and/or video coverage of the meeting 
over the internet from the FCC’s web 
page at https://www.fcc.gov/live and on 
the FCC’s YouTube channel. The public 
may submit written comments before 
the meeting to Suzon Cameron, CSRIC 
VIII Designated Federal Officer, by 
email to CSRIC@fcc.gov. 

Open captioning will be provided for 
this event. Other reasonable 
accommodations for people with 
disabilities are available upon request. 
Requests for such accommodations 
should be submitted via email to 
fcc504@fcc.gov or by calling the 
Consumer & Governmental Affairs 
Bureau at (202) 418–0530 (voice), (202) 
418–0432 (tty). Such requests should 
include a detailed description of the 
accommodation needed. In addition, 
please include a way the Commission 
can contact you if it needs more 
information. Please allow at least five 
days’ advance notice; last-minute 
requests will be accepted but may be 
impossible to fill. 
Federal Communications Commission. 
Marlene Dortch, 
Secretary, Office of the Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2023–10919 Filed 5–22–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6712–01–P 

FEDERAL MARITIME COMMISSION 

Notice of Agreements Filed 

The Commission hereby gives notice 
of filing of the following agreements 
under the Shipping Act of 1984. 
Interested parties may submit 
comments, relevant information, or 
documents regarding the agreements to 
the Secretary by email at Secretary@
fmc.gov, or by mail, Federal Maritime 
Commission, 800 North Capitol Street, 
Washington, DC 20573. Comments will 
be most helpful to the Commission if 
received within 12 days of the date this 
notice appears in the Federal Register, 
and the Commission requests that 
comments be submitted within 7 days 
on agreements that request expedited 
review. Copies of agreements are 

available through the Commission’s 
website (www.fmc.gov) or by contacting 
the Office of Agreements at (202) 523– 
5793 or tradeanalysis@fmc.gov. 

Agreement No.: 011290–044. 
Agreement Name: International 

Vessel Operators Dangerous Goods 
Association Agreement. 

Parties: Bermuda Container Line Ltd.; 
Crowley Caribbean Services LLC, 
Crowley Latin American Services, LLC 
(dba a single party); COSCO Shipping 
Lines Company, Ltd.; Evergreen Marine 
Corp (Taiwan) Ltd.; Hapag-Lloyd AG; 
HMM Company Limited; Independent 
Container Line Ltd.; Klinge Corporation 
(associate party); Maersk A/S; Matson 
Navigation Company; National Cargo 
Bureau (associate party); Ocean Network 
Express Pte. Ltd.; Orient Overseas 
Container Line Limited; Seaboard 
Marine Ltd.; Tampa Bay International 
Terminals, Inc. (associate party); 
Tropical Shipping & Construction 
Company Limited, LLC; Wallenius 
Wilhelmensen Ocean AS; Wan Hai 
Lines Ltd.; Yang Ming Marine Transport 
Corporation; and ZIM Integrated 
Shipping Services Ltd. 

Filing Party: Wayne Rohde, Cozen 
O’Connor. 

Synopsis: The amendment adds ZIM 
Integrated Shipping Services, Ltd. as a 
party to the Agreement and corrects the 
names and/or addresses of several of the 
other parties. 

Proposed Effective Date: 6/30/2023. 
Location: https://www2.fmc.gov/ 

FMC.Agreements.Web/Public/
AgreementHistory/1638. 

Agreement No.: 201349–003. 
Agreement Name: World Shipping 

Council Agreement. 
Parties: COSCO Shipping Lines Co., 

Ltd., Orient Overseas Container Line 
Ltd., and OOCL (Europe) Limited 
(acting as a single party); CMA CGM 
S.A., APL Co. Pte. Ltd., American 
President Lines, LLC and ANL 
Singapore Pte Ltd. (acting as a single 
party); Crowley Caribbean Services, LLC 
and Crowley Latin America Services, 
LLC (acting as a single party); Evergreen 
Marine Corporation (Taiwan) Ltd.; 
Hapag-Lloyd AG; HMM Company 
Limited; Independent Container Line, 
Ltd.; Kawasaki Kisen Kaisha Ltd., 
Maersk A/S and Hamburg Sud (acting as 
a single party); Matson Navigation 
Company, Inc.; MSC Mediterranean 
Shipping Company SA; Mitsui O.S.K. 
Lines Ltd.; Nippon Yusen Kaisha; Ocean 
Network Express Pte. Ltd.; Swire 
Shipping, Pte. Ltd.; Wallenius 
Wilhelmsen Ocean AS; Wan Hai Lines 
Ltd. and Wan Hai Lines (Singapore) Pte 
Ltd. (acting as a single party); Yang 
Ming Marine Transport Corp.; and Zim 
Integrated Shipping Services, Ltd. 

Filing Party: Robert Magovern, Cozen 
O’Connor. 

Synopsis: The Amendment authorizes 
the WSC members to (i) discuss and 
agree upon voluntary best practices 
relating to minimum safety standards 
for screening and inspecting dangerous 
cargo, (ii) establish and administer a 
common digital solutions tool for the 
cargo screening process (including 
through a third-party vendor), and (iii) 
create and maintain databases of 
shippers and cargo inspection 
companies that demonstrate 
conformance with minimum safety 
standards. 

Proposed Effective Date: 7/1/2023. 
Location: https://www2.fmc.gov/ 

FMC.Agreements.Web/Public/ 
AgreementHistory/34503. 

Dated: May 18, 2023. 
JoAnne O’Bryant, 
Program Analyst. 
[FR Doc. 2023–10977 Filed 5–22–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6730–02–P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Notice of Proposals To Engage in or 
To Acquire Companies Engaged in 
Permissible Nonbanking Activities 

The companies listed in this notice 
have given notice under section 4 of the 
Bank Holding Company Act (12 U.S.C. 
1843) (BHC Act) and Regulation Y, (12 
CFR part 225) to engage de novo, or to 
acquire or control voting securities or 
assets of a company, including the 
companies listed below, that engages 
either directly or through a subsidiary or 
other company, in a nonbanking activity 
that is listed in § 225.28 of Regulation Y 
(12 CFR 225.28) or that the Board has 
determined by Order to be closely 
related to banking and permissible for 
bank holding companies. Unless 
otherwise noted, these activities will be 
conducted throughout the United States. 

The public portions of the 
applications listed below, as well as 
other related filings required by the 
Board, if any, are available for 
immediate inspection at the Federal 
Reserve Bank(s) indicated below and at 
the offices of the Board of Governors. 
This information may also be obtained 
on an expedited basis, upon request, by 
contacting the appropriate Federal 
Reserve Bank and from the Board’s 
Freedom of Information Office at 
https://www.federalreserve.gov/foia/ 
request.htm. Interested persons may 
express their views in writing on the 
question whether the proposal complies 
with the standards of section 4 of the 
BHC Act. 
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