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FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Formations of, Acquisitions by, and 
Mergers of Bank Holding Companies 

The companies listed in this notice 
have applied to the Board for approval, 
pursuant to the Bank Holding Company 
Act of 1956 (12 U.S.C. 1841 et seq.) 
(BHC Act), Regulation Y (12 CFR part 
225), and all other applicable statutes 
and regulations to become a bank 
holding company and/or to acquire the 
assets or the ownership of, control of, or 
the power to vote shares of a bank or 
bank holding company and all of the 
banks and nonbanking companies 
owned by the bank holding company, 
including the companies listed below. 

The public portions of the 
applications listed below, as well as 
other related filings required by the 
Board, if any, are available for 
immediate inspection at the Federal 
Reserve Bank(s) indicated below and at 
the offices of the Board of Governors. 
This information may also be obtained 
on an expedited basis, upon request, by 
contacting the appropriate Federal 
Reserve Bank and from the Board’s 
Freedom of Information Office at 
https://www.federalreserve.gov/foia/ 
request.htm. Interested persons may 
express their views in writing on the 
standards enumerated in the BHC Act 
(12 U.S.C. 1842(c)). 

Comments received are subject to 
public disclosure. In general, comments 
received will be made available without 
change and will not be modified to 
remove personal or business 
information including confidential, 
contact, or other identifying 
information. Comments should not 
include any information such as 
confidential information that would not 
be appropriate for public disclosure. 

Comments regarding each of these 
applications must be received at the 
Reserve Bank indicated or the offices of 
the Board of Governors, Ann E. 
Misback, Secretary of the Board, 20th 
Street and Constitution Avenue NW, 
Washington DC 20551–0001, not later 
than October 15, 2024. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of New York 
(Ivan Hurwitz, Head of Bank 
Applications) 33 Liberty Street, New 
York, New York 10045–0001. Comments 
can also be sent electronically to 
Comments.applications@ny.frb.org: 

1. The Bank of Nova Scotia, Toronto, 
Canada; to acquire up to 14.99 percent 
of the voting shares of KeyCorp, and 
thereby indirectly acquire voting shares 
of KeyBank National Association, both 
of Cleveland, Ohio. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System. 
Michele Taylor Fennell, 
Associate Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2024–20716 Filed 9–11–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

GENERAL SERVICES 
ADMINISTRATION 

[Notice–ME–2024–04; Docket No.2024– 
0002; Sequence No. 41] 

Seeking Public Input for the 6th U.S. 
Open Government National Action 
Plan 

AGENCY: Office of Government-wide 
Policy (OGP); General Services 
Administration (GSA). 
ACTION: Notice; request for public 
comment. 

SUMMARY: This notice informs the public 
that the United States Federal 
Government is initiating the co-creation 
process for its 6th U.S. Open 
Government National Action Plan. The 
GSA is inviting input from a wide and 
diverse array of stakeholders from the 
public, private, advocacy, not-for-profit, 
and philanthropic sectors, including 
State, local, Tribal, and territorial 
governments. This Request for 
Information (RFI) aims to gather ideas, 
suggestions, and recommendations for 
commitments that could be included in 
the 6th U.S. Open Government National 
Action Plan. 
DATES: Responses to this Request for 
Information should be received by 
Tuesday, November 12, 2024. 
ADDRESSES: Submit comments in 
response to Notice ‘‘Docket GSA–GSA– 
2024–0016’’ by http://
www.regulations.gov. Submit comments 
via the Federal eRulemaking portal by 
searching for ‘‘GSA–GSA–2024–0016.’’ 
Select the link ‘‘Comment Now’’ that 
corresponds with ‘‘GSA–GSA–2024– 
0016.’’ Follow the instructions provided 
at the screen. Please include your name, 
organization name (if any), and ‘‘Docket 
GSA–GSA–2024–0016’’ on your 
attached document. All received public 
comments are subject to the Freedom of 
Information Act and will be posted in 
their entirety at regulations.gov, 
including any personal and business 
confidential information provided. Do 
not include any information you would 
not like to be made publicly available. 

Instructions for Submission: Please 
review and follow the guidelines in the 
attached public commenting policy 
within Docket GSA–GSA–2024–0016. 
Written comments should not exceed 
two (2) pages. Attachments or linked 

resources or documents are not 
included in the two-page limit. Please 
use concise, plain language in a 
narrative or bullet format. GSA has 
provided some key questions on which 
public insights would be most valuable 
(see Supplementary Information, Part 
III). You may respond to some or all of 
these questions. Any links you provide 
to online materials or presentations 
must be publicly accessible. Each 
submitted response should include: 

• The name of the individual(s) or 
organization(s) responding. 

• A brief description of the 
responding individual(s) or 
organization(s)’s mission and areas of 
experience and expertise. 

• Optional—Contact information for 
questions and other follow-up on your 
response. 

• RFI question(s), topic(s), and policy 
suggestions that your submission and 
materials address. 

Please feel free to share this RFI with 
colleagues or others for feedback. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Alexis Masterson, U.S. Open 
Government Secretariat, Office of 
Government-wide Policy, by email at 
opengovernmentsecretariat@gsa.gov or 
by phone at 703–627–4850. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Background 
The United States is a founding 

member of the Open Government 
Partnership (OGP), a voluntary, global 
alliance between governments and civil 
society to bolster democracy through 
openness, transparency, and public 
engagement. At the core of OGP is a 
belief in community-centered 
governance, and a pledge to transform 
the way the public sector serves and is 
accountable to its people. As a multi- 
tiered platform, OGP includes country- 
level and local government-level 
members, as well as thousands of civil 
society organization partners. OGP 
members are required to work and 
collaborate with civil society to create 
national or local action plans every two 
to three years, implement meaningful 
transparency and accountability 
commitments, publicly report on 
progress, and submit to independent 
monitoring and reporting. This RFI will 
provide input into the 6th U.S. Open 
Government National Action Plan the 
United States is developing under this 
initiative. You can access the previous 
U.S. Open Government National Action 
Plans in the resource section of the new 
U.S. Open Government Secretariat 
website at https://www.gsa.gov/ 
usopengov. 

The Open Government Secretariat, in 
collaboration with the White House 
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