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—Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

—Evaluate the accuracy of the agencies 
estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

—Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

—Minimize the burden of the collection 
of information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms 
of information technology, e.g., 
permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 

(1) Type of Information Collection: 
Extension of a currently approved 
collection. 

(2) Title of the Form/Collection: 
Application For An Amended Federal 
Firearms License. 

(3) Agency form number, if any, and 
the applicable component of the 
Department of Justice sponsoring the 
collection: Form Number: ATF F 
5300.38. Bureau of Alcohol, Tobacco, 
Firearms and Explosives. 

(4) Affected public who will be asked 
or required to respond, as well as a brief 
abstract: Primary: Business or other for- 
profit. Other: Individual or households. 
Abstract: The form is used when a 
Federal firearms license makes 
application to change the location of the 
firearms business premises. The 
applicant must certify that the proposed 
new business premises will be in 
compliance with State and local law for 
that location. 

(5) An estimate of the total number of 
respondents and the amount of time 
estimated for an average respondent to 
respond: There will be an estimated 
18,000 respondents, who will complete 
the form within approximately 1 hour 
and 15 minutes. 

(6) An estimate of the total burden (in 
hours) associated with the collection: 
There are an estimated 22,500 total 
burden hours associated with this 
collection. 

If additional information is required 
contact: Lynn Murray, Department 
Clearance Officer, United States 
Department of Justice, Policy and 
Planning Staff, Justice Management 
Division, Room 2E–502, Two 

Constitution Square, 145 N Street, NE., 
Washington, DC 20530. 

Dated: October 27, 2010. 
Lynn Murray, 
Department Clearance Officer, PRA, United 
States Department of Justice. 
[FR Doc. 2010–27528 Filed 10–29–10; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–FY–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Office of the Secretary 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission for OMB 
Review; Comment Request; Senior 
Community Service Employment 
Program Performance Measurement 
System 

ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Labor 
(DOL) hereby announces submission of 
the Employment and Training 
Administration (ETA) sponsored 
information collection request (ICR), 
‘‘Senior Community Service 
Employment Program (SCSEP) 
Performance Measurement System,’’ to 
the Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) for review and approval for 
continued use in accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(PRA), Public Law 104–13, 44 U.S.C. 
chapter 35. 
DATES: Submit comments on or before 
December 1, 2010. 
ADDRESSES: A copy of this ICR, with 
applicable supporting documentation; 
including a description of the likely 
respondents, proposed frequency of 
response, and estimated total burden 
may be obtained from the RegInfo.gov 
Web site, http://www.reginfo.gov/
public/do/PRAMain or by contacting 
Michel Smyth by telephone at 202–693– 
4129 (this is not a toll-free number) or 
sending an email to 
dol_pra_public@dol.gov. 

Submit comments about this request 
to the Office of Information and 
Regulatory Affairs, Attn: OMB Desk 
Officer for the Department of Labor, 
Employment and Training 
Administration (ETA), Office of 
Management and Budget, Room 10235, 
Washington, DC 20503, Telephone: 
202–395–6881/Fax: 202–395–5806 
(these are not toll-free numbers), e-mail: 
OIRA_submission@omb.eop.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Michel Smyth by telephone at 202–693– 
4129 (this is not a toll-free number) or 
by e-mail at dol_pra_public@dol.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The DOL 
is seeking OMB reauthorization of 

information collections related to Senior 
Community Service Employment 
Program (SCSEP) Performance 
Measurement System. Originally 
authorized by the Older Americans Act 
of 1965, the SCSEP is funded for 
approximately $759 million for Program 
Year (PY) 2010 and will provide over 
78,000 positions in which nearly 
120,000 low-income persons aged 55 or 
older will be placed in community 
service employment. At current 
placement rates, this should allow about 
20,000 people to be exited from the 
program with the ultimate goal of 
unsubsidized placement in PY 2010. 

To ensure that the SCSEP is properly 
administered, and to implement the 
performance measures and sanctions 
authorized by the 2006 Amendments to 
the OAA (OAA–2006) and the Jobs for 
Veterans Act of 2002, it is necessary to 
modify existing data collection 
instruments. In addition, a collection of 
information is required under OMB 
Memorandum M–02–06, which has 
been adopted by the DOL. This 
requirement necessitates a revision of 
data collection instruments and 
revisions to the overall data collection 
burden. The legal authority for the 
collection of additional information may 
be found at sections 503, 508, 513, and 
515 of the OAA–2006. 

The (SCSEP) Performance 
Measurement System contains 
information collections subject to the 
PRA. A Federal agency generally cannot 
conduct or sponsor a collection of 
information, and the public is generally 
not required to respond to an 
information collection, unless it is 
currently approved by the OMB under 
the PRA and displays a currently valid 
OMB Control Number. In addition, 
notwithstanding any other provision of 
law, no person shall generally be subject 
to penalty for failing to comply with a 
collection of information if the 
collection of information does not 
display a currently valid OMB Control 
Number. See 5 CFR 1320.5(a) and 
1320.6. 

The DOL obtains approval for this 
information collection under OMB 
Control Number 1205–0040, and the 
current approval is scheduled to expire 
on October 31, 2010. For additional 
information, see the related notice 
published in the Federal Register on 
May 13, 2010 (75 FR 27001). 

The DOL, as part of its continuing 
effort to reduce paperwork and 
respondent burden, submits information 
collections for OMB consideration after 
conducting a preclearance consultation 
program to provide the public with an 
opportunity to comment on proposed 
and continuing information collection 
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requirements in accordance with the 
PRA. See 44 U.S.C. 3506(c)(2)(A). This 
program ensures that information is in 
the desired format, reporting burden 
(time and cost) is minimal, collection 
instruments are clearly understood, and 
the estimate of the information 
collection burden is accurate. 

Interested parties are encouraged to 
send comments to the OMB, Office of 
Information and Regulatory Affairs at 
the address shown in the ADDRESSES 
section within 30 days of publication of 
this notice in the Federal Register. In 
order to ensure appropriate 
consideration, comments should 
reference OMB Control Number 1205– 
0040. The OMB is particularly 
interested in comments that: 

• Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

• Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

• Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

• Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 
use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology, 
e.g., permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Agency: Employment and Training 
Administration (ETA). 

Type of Review: Revision of a 
currently approved collection. 

Title of Collection: Senior Community 
Service Employment Program (SCSEP) 
Performance Measurement System. 

Form Numbers: ETA–9120, ETA– 
9121, ETA–9122, ETA–9123, ETA–8705. 

OMB Control Number: 1205–0040. 
Affected Public: Private sector, 

Businesses, or other for-profits, Not-for- 
profit institutions; State, Local, and 
Tribal Governments; Individuals or 
Households. 

Total Estimated Number of 
Responses: 374,279. 

Total Estimated Annual Burden 
Hours: 52,347. 

Total Estimated Annual Costs Burden: 
$0. 

Dated: October 26, 2010. 
Michel Smyth, 
Departmental Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2010–27481 Filed 10–29–10; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4510–30–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Bureau of Labor Statistics 

Establishment of the Bureau of Labor 
Statistics Technical Advisory 
Committee 

The Secretary of Labor is announcing 
the establishment of a Federal Advisory 
Committee. In accordance with the 
provisions of the Federal Advisory 
Committee Act (FACA), 5 U.S.C. App. 2, 
the Secretary of Labor has determined 
that the establishment of the Bureau of 
Labor Statistics Technical Advisory 
Committee (the ‘‘Committee’’) is in the 
public interest in connection with the 
performance of duties imposed upon the 
Commissioner of Labor Statistics by 
29 U.S.C. 1 and 2. This determination 
follows consultation with the 
Committee Management Secretariat, 
General Services Administration. 

The Committee will present advice 
and make recommendations to the 
Bureau of Labor Statistics (BLS) on 
technical aspects of the collection and 
formulation of economic measures. 

The Committee will function solely as 
an advisory body to the BLS, on 
technical topics selected by the BLS. 
Important aspects of the Committee’s 
responsibilities include, but are not 
limited to: 

a. Provide comments on papers and 
presentations developed by BLS 
research and program staff. The 
comments will advise BLS as to whether 
the academic community will regard the 
work as being technically sound and 
reflecting best practices in the relevant 
fields. 

b. Conduct research on issues 
identified by BLS on which an objective 
technical opinion or recommendation 
from outside of BLS would be valuable. 

c. Recommend BLS conduct internal 
research projects to address technical 
problems with BLS statistics that have 
been identified in the academic 
literature. 

d. Participate in discussions of areas 
where the types or coverage of economic 
statistics could be expanded or 
improved and areas where statistics are 
no longer relevant. 

e. Establish working relationships 
with professional associations with an 
interest in BLS statistics, such as the 
American Statistical Association and 
the American Economic Association. 

The Committee will report to the 
Commissioner of Labor Statistics, 
agency head of the BLS. 

The Committee will consist of 
approximately sixteen members who 
serve as Special Government 
Employees. Members are appointed by 

the BLS and are approved by the 
Secretary of Labor. Committee members 
are economists, statisticians, and 
behavioral scientists and will be chosen 
to achieve a balanced membership 
across those disciplines. They are 
prominent experts in their fields and 
recognized for their professional 
achievements and objectivity. 

The Committee will function solely as 
an advisory body, in compliance with 
the provisions of the Federal Advisory 
Committee Act. The Charter will be 
filed under the Federal Advisory 
Committee Act. 

For Further Information Contact: 
Cheryl Kerr, Office of the 
Commissioner, Bureau of Labor 
Statistics, telephone: 202–691–7808, 
e-mail: kerr.cheryl@bls.gov. 

Signed at Washington, DC this 26th day of 
October 2010. 
Kimberley D. Hill, 
Chief, Division of Management Systems, 
Bureau of Labor Statistics. 
[FR Doc. 2010–27482 Filed 10–29–10; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4510–24–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Bureau of Labor Statistics 

Re-Establishment of the Bureau of 
Labor Statistics Data Users Advisory 
Committee 

The Secretary of Labor is announcing 
the re-establishment of a Federal 
Advisory Committee. In accordance 
with the provisions of the Federal 
Advisory Committee Act (FACA), 
5 U.S.C. App. 2, the Secretary of Labor 
has determined that the re- 
establishment of the Bureau of Labor 
Statistics Data Users Advisory 
Committee (the ‘‘Committee’’) is in the 
public interest in connection with the 
performance of duties imposed upon the 
Commissioner of Labor Statistics by 
29 U.S.C. 1 and 2. This determination 
follows consultation with the 
Committee Management Secretariat, 
General Services Administration. 

The Committee provides advice to the 
Bureau of Labor Statistics from the 
points of view of data users from 
various sectors of the U.S. economy, 
including the labor, business, research, 
academic and government communities, 
on technical matters related to the 
collection, analysis, dissemination, and 
use of the Bureau’s statistics, on its 
published reports, and on the broader 
aspects of its overall mission and 
function. 

The Committee will function solely as 
an advisory body to the BLS, on 
technical topics selected by the BLS. 
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