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1 See 12 U.S.C. 248(s). 
2 12 U.S.C. 248(s). 

types and amounts of collateral or assets 
pledged) after approximately a two year 
lag.1 The FR 2046 report is considered 
confidential until the fact that the 
institution borrowed from the discount 
window is disclosed. Until this point, 
the release of this report would reveal 
confidential commercial information 
about the borrower (i.e., the fact that the 
institution borrowed from the discount 
window, as only borrowers are required 
to file this form), which is reasonably 
likely to cause substantial harm to the 
competitive position of the institution 
that submitted the report if the 
institution is prematurely identified. 
Thus, the report is kept confidential 
under exemption 4 of the Freedom of 
Information Act (‘‘FOIA’’), 5 U.S.C. 
552(b)(4), which protects from 
disclosure ‘‘trade secrets and 
commercial or financial information 
obtained from a person [that is] 
privileged or confidential.’’ Once the 
fact that an institution borrowed from 
the discount window is disclosed, the 
FR 2046 report is no longer considered 
confidential in the event a FOIA request 
is received. 

Current actions: On July 19, 2019, the 
Board published a notice in the Federal 
Register (84 FR 34890) requesting 
public comment for 60 days on the 
extension, with revision, of the FR 2046. 
The Board proposed to update data 
element definitions to account for the 
introduction of the FFIEC 051 reporting 
form. In addition, the face of the FR 
2046 report will be updated to (1) reflect 
all of the legal statutes that authorize the 
collection of the report; (2) indicate that 
the report is ‘‘authorized’’ (not 
‘‘required’’) by law; and (3) clarify that, 
if the report is requested under the 
FOIA, the report will be treated as 
confidential unless the borrower’s 
identity has already been disclosed 
pursuant to the two year lag provided 
under the Dodd-Frank Wall Street 
Reform and Consumer Protection Act.2 
The comment period for this notice 
expired on September 17, 2019. The 
Board did not receive any comments. 
The revisions will be implemented as 
proposed. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, November 22, 2019. 

Michele Taylor Fennell, 
Assistant Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2019–25842 Filed 11–27–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6210–01–P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Formations of, Acquisitions by, and 
Mergers of Savings and Loan Holding 
Companies 

The companies listed in this notice 
have applied to the Board for approval, 
pursuant to the Home Owners’ Loan Act 
(12 U.S.C. 1461 et seq.) (HOLA), 
Regulation LL (12 CFR part 238), and 
Regulation MM (12 CFR part 239), and 
all other applicable statutes and 
regulations to become a savings and 
loan holding company and/or to acquire 
the assets or the ownership of, control 
of, or the power to vote shares of a 
savings association. 

The applications listed below are 
available for immediate inspection at 
the Federal Reserve Bank indicated. The 
applications also will be available for 
inspection at the offices of the Board of 
Governors. Interested persons may 
express their views in writing on 
whether the proposed transaction 
complies with the standards 
enumerated in the HOLA (12 U.S.C. 
1467a(e)). 

Unless otherwise noted, comments 
regarding each of these applications 
must be received at the Reserve Bank 
indicated or the offices of the Board of 
Governors Ann E. Misback, Secretary of 
the Board, 20th Street and Constitution 
Avenue NW, Washington, DC 20551– 
0001, not later than December 27, 2019. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of Chicago 
(Colette A. Fried, Assistant Vice 
President) 230 South LaSalle Street, 
Chicago, Illinois 60690–1414: 

1. Eaton Federal Mutual Holding 
Company and Eaton Federal Stock 
Holding Company, both of Charlotte, 
Michigan; to become a mutual savings 
and loan holding company and a mid- 
tier stock savings and loan holding 
company, respectively, by acquiring 
Eaton Federal Savings Bank, Charlotte, 
Michigan. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, November 22, 2019. 
Yao-Chin Chao, 
Assistant Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2019–25825 Filed 11–27–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Formations of, Acquisitions by, and 
Mergers of Bank Holding Companies 

The companies listed in this notice 
have applied to the Board for approval, 
pursuant to the Bank Holding Company 
Act of 1956 (12 U.S.C. 1841 et seq.) 
(BHC Act), Regulation Y (12 CFR part 
225), and all other applicable statutes 

and regulations to become a bank 
holding company and/or to acquire the 
assets or the ownership of, control of, or 
the power to vote shares of a bank or 
bank holding company and all of the 
banks and nonbanking companies 
owned by the bank holding company, 
including the companies listed below. 

The applications listed below, as well 
as other related filings required by the 
Board, if any, are available for 
immediate inspection at the Federal 
Reserve Bank indicated. The 
applications will also be available for 
inspection at the offices of the Board of 
Governors. Interested persons may 
express their views in writing on the 
standards enumerated in the BHC Act 
(12 U.S.C. 1842(c)). 

Comments regarding each of these 
applications must be received at the 
Reserve Bank indicated or the offices of 
the Board of Governors, Ann E. 
Misback, Secretary of the Board, 20th 
Street and Constitution Avenue NW, 
Washington DC 20551–0001, not later 
than December 30, 2019. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of Chicago 
(Colette A. Fried, Assistant Vice 
President) 230 South LaSalle Street, 
Chicago, Illinois 60690–1414: 

1. Bosshard Financial Group, Inc., La 
Crosse, Wisconsin; to merge with 
Northern Bankshares, Inc., and thereby 
indirectly acquire McFarland State 
Bank, both of McFarland, Wisconsin. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, November 25, 2019. 
Yao-Chin Chao, 
Assistant Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2019–25900 Filed 11–27–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Announcement of Board 
Approval Under Delegated Authority 
and Submission to OMB 

AGENCY: Board of Governors of the 
Federal Reserve System. 
SUMMARY: The Board of Governors of the 
Federal Reserve System (Board) is 
adopting a proposal to extend for three 
years, with revision, the Interchange 
Transaction Fees Survey. The revisions 
are applicable as of the collection of 
calendar year 2019. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Federal Reserve Board Clearance 
Officer—Nuha Elmaghrabi—Office of 
the Chief Data Officer, Board of 
Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, Washington, DC 20551, (202) 
452–3829. 

Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) Desk Officer—Shagufta Ahmed— 
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