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9 See PRA Supporting Statement for the OFCCP 
Recordkeeping and Requirements-Supply and 
Service Program, OMB Control No. 1250–0003, at 
https://www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAViewDocument?ref_nbr=201906-1250-001. 

employees may not have the type of 
written program summary that is 
required of larger contractors under the 
OFCCP regulations or any similar 
document that could be submitted as a 
workforce inclusion plan under the 
MWI Clause. Accordingly, such 
contractors or subcontractors may need 
to create a workforce inclusion plan to 
comply with the MWI Clause. 

In order to estimate the burden 
associated with creating a workforce 
inclusion plan, FHFA considered the 
OFCCP’s burden estimates for the time 
needed to develop the written program 
summaries required under its 
regulations.9 In its OMB Supporting 
Statement, the OFCCP estimated that a 
contractor with 50 to 100 employees 
would take approximately 73 hours to 
create an initial written program 
summary. While the OFCCP regulations 
require contractors to perform time- 
consuming quantitative analyses when 
developing their written program 
summaries, such analyses would not be 
required in connection with the creation 
of a workforce inclusion plan. For this 
reason, FHFA believes that a contractor 
could develop a workforce inclusion 
plan in about one-third of the time that 
it would take to develop the written 
program summary required under the 
OFCCP regulations. 

FHFA estimates that a contractor or 
subcontractor with fewer than 50 
employees would spend approximately 
25 hours creating a workforce inclusion 
plan for the first time. It is likely that, 
going forward, many small contractors 
and subcontractors will simply submit 
updated versions of workforce inclusion 
plans that they have submitted 
previously. For purposes of this burden 
estimate, however, FHFA has assumed 
that all small contractors and 
subcontractors will need to create a new 
plan every time they are required to 
submit information under the MWI 
clause. This results in an estimated 
average triennial recordkeeping burden 
on all contractors and subcontractors 
with fewer than 50 employees over the 
next three years of 450 hours (18 
respondents × 25 hours per respondent), 
with an annual burden of 150 hours. 

As with larger entities, FHFA 
estimates that it will take each 
contractor and subcontractor with fewer 
than 50 employees approximately one 
hour to retrieve, review, and submit the 
documentation specified in the MWI 
Clause. Thus, FHFA estimates that the 
average triennial reporting burden on all 

contractors and subcontractors with 
fewer than 50 employees will be 18 
hours (18 respondents × 1 hour per 
respondent), with an annual burden of 
6 hours. 

D. Comment Request 
FHFA requests written comments on 

the following: (1) Whether the collection 
of information is necessary for the 
proper performance of FHFA functions, 
including whether the information has 
practical utility; (2) the accuracy of 
FHFA’s estimates of the burdens of the 
collection of information; (3) ways to 
enhance the quality, utility, and clarity 
of the information collected; and (4) 
ways to minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on 
respondents, including through the use 
of automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 

Robert Winkler, 
Chief Information Officer, Federal Housing 
Finance Agency. 
[FR Doc. 2020–11259 Filed 5–26–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8070–01–P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Formations of, Acquisitions by, and 
Mergers of Bank Holding Companies 

The companies listed in this notice 
have applied to the Board for approval, 
pursuant to the Bank Holding Company 
Act of 1956 (12 U.S.C. 1841 et seq.) 
(BHC Act), Regulation Y (12 CFR part 
225), and all other applicable statutes 
and regulations to become a bank 
holding company and/or to acquire the 
assets or the ownership of, control of, or 
the power to vote shares of a bank or 
bank holding company and all of the 
banks and nonbanking companies 
owned by the bank holding company, 
including the companies listed below. 

The applications listed below, as well 
as other related filings required by the 
Board, if any, are available for 
immediate inspection at the Federal 
Reserve Bank indicated. The 
applications will also be available for 
inspection at the offices of the Board of 
Governors. Interested persons may 
express their views in writing on the 
standards enumerated in the BHC Act 
(12 U.S.C. 1842(c)). 

Comments regarding each of these 
applications must be received at the 
Reserve Bank indicated or the offices of 
the Board of Governors, Ann E. 
Misback, Secretary of the Board, 20th 
Street and Constitution Avenue NW, 
Washington, DC 20551–0001, not later 
than June 25, 2020. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of Chicago 
(Colette A. Fried, Assistant Vice 

President) 230 South LaSalle Street, 
Chicago, Illinois 60690–1414: 

1. Bath State Bancorp Employee Stock 
Ownership Plan With 401(k) Provisions, 
Bath, Indiana; to become a bank holding 
company by acquiring Bath State 
Bancorp, and thereby indirectly acquire 
control of Bath State Bank, both of Bath, 
Indiana. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, May 21, 2020. 
Yao-Chin Chao, 
Assistant Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2020–11326 Filed 5–26–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

FEDERAL TRADE COMMISSION 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission for OMB 
Review; Comment Request 

AGENCY: Federal Trade Commission 
(FTC). 
ACTION: Notice and request for comment. 

SUMMARY: The FTC requests that the 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) extend for three years the current 
Paperwork Reduction Act (PRA) 
clearance for information collection 
requirements contained in the Informal 
Dispute Settlement Procedures Rule (the 
Dispute Settlement Rule or the Rule). 
The current clearance expires on May 
31, 2020. 
DATES: Comments must be received by 
June 26, 2020. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAMain. Find this particular 
information collection by selecting 
‘‘Currently under 30-day Review—Open 
for Public Comments’’ or by using the 
search function. The reginfo.gov web 
link is a United States Government 
website produced by OMB and the 
General Services Administration (GSA). 
Under PRA requirements, OMB’s Office 
of Information and Regulatory Affairs 
(OIRA) reviews Federal information 
collections. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Christine M. Todaro, Attorney, Division 
of Marketing Practices, Bureau of 
Consumer Protection, Federal Trade 
Commission, 600 Pennsylvania Avenue 
NW, Washington, DC 20580, (202) 326– 
3711. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Title: Informal Dispute Settlement 
Procedures Rule (the Dispute Settlement 
Rule or the Rule), 16 CFR part 703. 

OMB Control Number: 3084–0113. 

VerDate Sep<11>2014 16:59 May 26, 2020 Jkt 250001 PO 00000 Frm 00045 Fmt 4703 Sfmt 4703 E:\FR\FM\27MYN1.SGM 27MYN1jb
el

l o
n 

D
S

K
JL

S
W

7X
2P

R
O

D
 w

ith
 N

O
T

IC
E

S

https://www.reginfo.gov/public/do/PRAViewDocument?ref_nbr=201906-1250-001
https://www.reginfo.gov/public/do/PRAViewDocument?ref_nbr=201906-1250-001
http://www.reginfo.gov/public/do/PRAMain
http://www.reginfo.gov/public/do/PRAMain


31781 Federal Register / Vol. 85, No. 102 / Wednesday, May 27, 2020 / Notices 

1 The Commission received six non-germane 
comments. 

Type of Review: Extension of a 
currently approved collection. 

Likely Respondents: Warrantors 
(Automobile Manufacturers) and 
Informal Dispute Settlement 
Mechanisms. 

Estimated Annual Burden Hours: 
9,055 (derived from 6,121 recordkeeping 
hours in addition to 2,040 reporting 
hours and 894 disclosure hours). 

Estimated Annual Labor Costs: 
$209,595. 

Estimated Annual Capital or Other 
Non-labor Costs: $314,566. 

Abstract: On March 16, 2020, the FTC 
sought public comment on the 
information collection requirements 
associated with the Rule. 85 FR 14939. 
No germane comments were received.1 
Pursuant to the OMB regulations, 5 CFR 
part 1320, that implement the PRA, 44 
U.S.C. 3501 et seq., the FTC is providing 
this second opportunity for public 
comment while seeking OMB approval 
to renew the pre-existing clearance for 
the Rule. 

The Dispute Settlement Rule is one of 
three rules that the FTC implemented 
pursuant to requirements of the 
Magnuson-Moss Warranty Act, 15 
U.S.C. 2301 et seq. (Warranty Act or 
Act). The Rule specifies the minimum 
standards which must be met by any 
informal dispute settlement mechanism 
(IDSM) that is incorporated into a 
written consumer product warranty and 
which the consumer is required to use 
before pursuing legal remedies under 
the Act in court (known as the ‘‘prior 
resort requirement’’). 

The Dispute Settlement Rule 
standards for IDSMs include 
requirements concerning the 
mechanism’s structure (e.g., funding, 
staffing, and neutrality), the 
qualifications of staff or decision 
makers, the mechanism’s procedures for 
resolving disputes (e.g., notification, 
investigation, time limits for decisions, 
and follow-up), recordkeeping, and 
annual audits. The Rule requires that 
IDSMs establish written operating 
procedures and provide copies of those 
procedures upon request. 

Request for Comment 

Your comment—including your name 
and your state—will be placed on the 

public record of this proceeding at the 
https://www.regulations.gov website. 
Because your comment will be made 
public, you are solely responsible for 
making sure that your comment does 
not include any sensitive personal 
information, such as anyone’s Social 
Security number; date of birth; driver’s 
license number or other state 
identification number, or foreign 
country equivalent; passport number; 
financial account number; or credit or 
debit card number. You are also solely 
responsible for making sure that your 
comment does not include any sensitive 
health information, such as medical 
records or other individually 
identifiable health information. In 
addition, your comment should not 
include any ‘‘trade secret or any 
commercial or financial information 
which . . . is privileged or 
confidential’’ —as provided by Section 
6(f) of the FTC Act, 15 U.S.C. 46(f), and 
FTC Rule 4.10(a)(2), 16 CFR 4.10(a)(2)— 
including in particular competitively 
sensitive information such as costs, 
sales statistics, inventories, formulas, 
patterns, devices, manufacturing 
processes, or customer names. 

Josephine Liu, 
Assistant General Counsel for Legal Counsel. 
[FR Doc. 2020–11293 Filed 5–26–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6750–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Administration for Children and 
Families 

Proposed Information Collection 
Activity; Adoption Call to Action Data 
Collection (New Data Collection) 

AGENCY: Administration on Children, 
Youth and Families; Administration for 
Children and Families; HHS. 
ACTION: Request for Public Comment. 

SUMMARY: The Administration on 
Children, Youth and Families (ACYF), 
Administration for Children and 
Families (ACF), U.S. Department of 
Health and Human Services (HHS), is 
proposing to collect data for a new 

descriptive study, Adoption Call to 
Action (ACTA) Data Collection. 
DATES: Comments due within 60 days of 
publication. In compliance with the 
requirements of Section 3506(c)(2)(A) of 
the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, 
ACF is soliciting public comment on the 
specific aspects of the information 
collection described above. 
ADDRESSES: Copies of the proposed 
collection of information can be 
obtained and comments may be 
forwarded by emailing infocollection@
acf.hhs.gov. Alternatively, copies can 
also be obtained by writing to the 
Administration for Children and 
Families, Office of Planning, Research 
and Evaluation (OPRE), 330 C Street 
SW, Washington, DC 20201, Attn: ACF 
Reports Clearance Officer. All requests, 
emailed or written, should be identified 
by the title of the information collection. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Description: The ACTA is an effort by 
the ACF Children’s Bureau. The 
purpose of the ACTA is to engage child 
welfare agencies to improve the 
timeliness and likelihood of 
permanency for children who are 
waiting for adoption. This new 
information collection will provide the 
Children’s Bureau with an 
understanding of agency target 
populations, specific strategies 
(interventions), and outcomes 
measurement, in order to inform 
technical assistance strategies and 
provide a national picture of the overall 
success of the initiative. Baseline data 
will be collected with an initial survey 
(Baseline Survey), followed by two 
administrations of a follow-up survey 
instrument (Progress Update Survey) 
designed to collect process and outcome 
measures at two additional points in 
time. The instruments focus on: (1) 
Identifying the target population(s) 
agencies are addressing, (2) 
understanding elements of intervention 
implementation (process measures), and 
(3) capturing information related to the 
outcomes of these efforts. 

Respondents: Respondents of these 
data collection instruments will include 
one representative from each of the 53 
child welfare agencies who are 
participating in ACTA activities. 

ANNUAL BURDEN ESTIMATES 

Instrument Total number 
of respondents 

Total number 
of responses 

per respondent 

Average 
burden hours 
per response 

Total burden 
hours 

Annual burden 
hours 

Adoption Call to Action: Baseline Survey ........................ 53 1 .33 18 6 

VerDate Sep<11>2014 16:59 May 26, 2020 Jkt 250001 PO 00000 Frm 00046 Fmt 4703 Sfmt 4703 E:\FR\FM\27MYN1.SGM 27MYN1jb
el

l o
n 

D
S

K
JL

S
W

7X
2P

R
O

D
 w

ith
 N

O
T

IC
E

S

https://www.regulations.gov
mailto:infocollection@acf.hhs.gov
mailto:infocollection@acf.hhs.gov

		Superintendent of Documents
	2020-05-27T07:14:53-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




