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DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request 

April 19, 2011. 
The Department of Agriculture has 

submitted the following information 
collection requirement(s) to OMB for 
review and clearance under the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, 
Public Law 104–13. Comments 
regarding (a) whether the collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
agency, including whether the 
information will have practical utility; 
(b) the accuracy of the agency’s estimate 
of burden including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; (c) 
ways to enhance the quality, utility and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; (d) ways to minimize the 
burden of the collection of information 
on those who are to respond, including 
through the use of appropriate 
automated, electronic, mechanical, or 
other technological collection 
techniques or other forms of information 
technology should be addressed to: Desk 
Officer for Agriculture, Office of 
Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB), 
OIRA_Submission@OMB.EOP.GOV or 
fax (202) 395–5806 and to Departmental 
Clearance Office, USDA, OCIO, Mail 
Stop 7602, Washington, DC 20250– 
7602. Comments regarding these 
information collections are best assured 
of having their full effect if received 
within 30 days of this notification. 
Copies of the submission(s) may be 
obtained by calling (202) 720–8958. 

An agency may not conduct or 
sponsor a collection of information 
unless the collection of information 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number and the agency informs 
potential persons who are to respond to 
the collection of information that such 
persons are not required to respond to 

the collection of information unless it 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number. 

Agricultural Research Service 

Title: Evaluation of User Satisfaction 
with NAL Internet Sites. 

OMB Control Number: 0518–0040. 
Summary of Collection: There is a 

need to measure user satisfaction with 
the National Agricultural Library (NAL) 
Internet sites in order for NAL to 
comply with Executive Order 12862, 
which directs federal agencies that 
provide significant services directly to 
the public to survey customers to 
determine the kind and quality of 
services they want and their level of 
satisfaction with existing services. NAL 
Internet sites are a vast collection of 
Web pages created and maintained by 
component organizations of NAL, and 
are visited by 4.6 million people per 
month on average. The information 
generated from this research will enable 
NAL to evaluate the success of this new 
modality in response to fulfilling its 
legislative mandate to disseminate vital 
agricultural information and truly 
become the national digital library of 
agriculture. 

Need and Use of the Information: The 
purpose of the research is to ensure that 
intended audiences find the information 
provided on the Internet sites easy to 
access, clear, informative, and useful. 
The research will provide a means by 
which to classify visitors to the NAL 
Internet sites, to better understand how 
to serve them. If the information is not 
collected, NAL will be hindered from 
advancing its mandate to provide 
accurate, timely information to its users 
community. 

Description of Respondents: 
Individuals or households; Business or 
other for-profit; Not-for-profit 
institutions; Farms; State, Local or 
Tribal Government. 

Number of Respondents: 10,800. 
Frequency of Responses: Reporting: 

Monthly. 
Total Burden Hours: 900. 

Ruth Brown, 
Departmental Information Collection 
Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2012–9871 Filed 4–24–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3410–03–P 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Food Safety and Inspection Service 

[Docket No. FSIS–2011–0008] 

Compliance Guide for Residue 
Prevention and Agency Testing Policy 
for Residues 

AGENCY: Food Safety and Inspection 
Service, USDA. 
ACTION: Notice of availability and 
opportunity for comments. 

SUMMARY: The Food Safety and 
Inspection Service (FSIS) is announcing 
the availability of a compliance guide 
for the prevention of violative residues 
in livestock slaughter establishments. 
FSIS has posted this compliance guide 
on its Web page and it may be used 
immediately. FSIS also welcomes 
comments on this compliance guide, 
which will be revised as needed. This 
notice also discusses changes to the 
FSIS Residue Repeat Violator List and 
announces the Agency’s intention to 
subject to increased testing animals 
from producers who are under an 
injunction obtained by the Food and 
Drug Administration because of drug 
use practices that have led to residue 
violations. 

DATES: Submit written comments by 
June 25, 2012. 
ADDRESSES: FSIS invites interested 
persons to submit comments on this 
notice and the compliance guide, which 
can be accessed at http:// 
www.fsis.usda.gov/ 
Regulations_&_Policies/ 
Compliance_Guides_Index/index.asp. 
Comments may be submitted by either 
of the following methods: 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: This 
Web site provides the ability to type 
short comments directly into the 
comment field on this Web page or 
attach a file for lengthier comments. Go 
to http://www.regulations.gov. Follow 
the online instructions at that site for 
submitting comments. 

• Mail, including floppy disks or CD– 
ROMs, and hand- or courier-delivered 
items: Send to U.S. Department of 
Agriculture (USDA), FSIS, Docket Clerk, 
Patriots Plaza 3, 1400 Independence 
Avenue SW., Room 8–163A, Mailstop 
3782, Washington, DC 20250–3700. 

Instructions: All items submitted by 
mail or electronic mail must include the 
Agency name and docket number FSIS– 
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