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Therefore, in conjunction with the 
conservative assumptions used to 
establish the TS required boron 
concentration and critical boron 
concentration, the boron dilution 
evaluation demonstrates that the 
underlying intent of 10 CFR 50.68(b)(1) 
is satisfied. 

3.3 Legal Basis for the Exemption 
Pursuant to 10 CFR 50.12, ‘‘Specific 

Exemption,’’ the staff reviewed the 
licensee’s exemption request to 
determine if the legal basis for granting 
an exemption had been satisfied, and 
concluded that the licensee has satisfied 
the requirements of 10 CFR 50.12. With 
regards to the six special circumstances 
listed in 10 CFR 50.12(a)(2), the staff 
finds that the licensee’s exemption 
request satisfies 50.12(a)(2)(ii), 
‘‘Application of the regulation in the 
particular circumstances would not 
serve the underlying purpose of the rule 
or is not necessary to achieve the 
underlying purpose of the rule.’’ 
Specifically, the staff concludes that 
since the licensee has satisfied the five 
criteria in Section 3.1 of this exemption, 
the application of the rule is not 
necessary to achieve its underlying 
purpose in this case. 

3.4 Staff Conclusion 
Based upon the review of the 

licensee’s exemption request to credit 
soluble boron during MPC loading, 
unloading, and handling in the SQN 
SFP, the staff concludes that pursuant to 
10 CFR 50.12(a)(2) the licensee’s 
exemption request is acceptable. 
However, the staff limits its approval to 
the loading, unloading, and handling of 
the components of the HI-STORM 100 
dual-purpose dry cask storage system at 
SQN. 

4.0 Conclusion 
Accordingly, the Commission has 

determined that, pursuant to 10 CFR 
50.12(a), the exemption is authorized by 
law, will not present an undue risk to 
the public health and safety, and is 
consistent with the common defense 
and security. Also, special 
circumstances are present. Therefore, 
the Commission hereby grants 
Tennessee Valley Authority an 
exemption from the requirements of 10 
CFR 50.68(b)(1) for the loading, 
unloading, and handling of the 
components of the HI–STORM 100 
dual-purpose dry cask storage system at 
SQN. Any changes to the cask system 
design features affecting criticality or its 
supporting criticality analyses will 
invalidate this exemption. 

Pursuant to 10 CFR 51.32, the 
Commission has determined that the 

granting of this exemption will not have 
a significant effect on the quality of the 
human environment (69 FR 31849). 

This exemption is effective upon 
issuance.

Dated in Rockville, Maryland, this 7th day 
of June, 2004.

For the Nuclear Regulatory Commission. 
Ledyard B. Marsh, 
Director, Division of Licensing Project 
Management, Office of Nuclear Reactor 
Regulation.
[FR Doc. 04–13253 Filed 6–10–04; 8:45 am] 
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The ACNW will hold a Planning and 
Procedures meeting on June 22, 2004, 
Room T–2B3, 11545 Rockville Pike, 
Rockville, Maryland. 

The entire meeting will be open to 
public attendance, with the exception of 
a portion that may be closed pursuant 
to 5 U.S.C. 552b(c)(2) and (6) to discuss 
organizational and personnel matters 
that relate solely to internal personnel 
rules and practices of ACNW, and 
information the release of which would 
constitute a clearly unwarranted 
invasion of personal privacy. 

The agenda for the subject meeting 
shall be as follows: 

Tuesday, June 22, 2004—8 a.m.–9:30 
a.m. 

The Committee will discuss proposed 
ACNW activities and related matters. 
The purpose of this meeting is to gather 
information, analyze relevant issues and 
facts, and formulate proposed positions 
and actions, as appropriate, for 
deliberation by the full Committee. 

Members of the public desiring to 
provide oral statements and/or written 
comments should notify the Designated 
Federal Official, Mr. Howard J. Larson 
(Telephone: 301/415–6805) between 
7:30 a.m. and 4:15 p.m. (ET) five days 
prior to the meeting, if possible, so that 
appropriate arrangements can be made. 
Electronic recordings will be permitted 
only during those portions of the 
meeting that are open to the public. 

Further information regarding this 
meeting can be obtained by contacting 
the Designated Federal Official between 
7:30 a.m. and 4:15 p.m. (ET). Persons 
planning to attend this meeting are 
urged to contact the above named 
individual at least two working days 
prior to the meeting to be advised of any 
potential changes in the agenda.

Dated: June 4, 2004. 

Ralph Caruso, 
Acting Associate Director for Technical 
Support, ACRS/ACNW.
[FR Doc. 04–13251 Filed 6–10–04; 8:45 am] 
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Advisory Committee on Reactor 
Safeguards Subcommittee Meeting on 
Future Plant Designs; Notice of 
Meeting 

The ACRS Subcommittee on Future 
Plant Designs will hold a meeting on 
June 25, 2004, Room T–2B3, 11545 
Rockville Pike, Rockville, Maryland. 

The entire meeting will be open to 
public attendance. 

The agenda for the subject meeting 
shall be as follows: 

Friday, June 25, 2004—8:30 a.m. until 
5 p.m.

The Subcommittee will review the 
AP1000 Final Safety Evaluation Report 
(FSER) and the resolution of any 
remaining open items and ACRS 
concerns. The Subcommittee will gather 
information, analyze relevant issues and 
facts, and formulate proposed positions 
and actions, as appropriate, for 
deliberation by the full Committee. 

Members of the public desiring to 
provide oral statements and/or written 
comments should notify the Designated 
Federal Official, Dr. Medhat M. El-
Zeftawy (telephone 301–415–6889) 
between 7:30 a.m. and 5 p.m. (ET) five 
days prior to the meeting, if possible, so 
that appropriate arrangements can be 
made. Electronic recordings will be 
permitted. 

Further information regarding this 
meeting can be obtained by contacting 
the Designated Federal Official between 
7:30 a.m. and 5 p.m. (ET). Persons 
planning to attend this meeting are 
urged to contact the above named 
individual at least two working days 
prior to the meeting to be advised of any 
potential changes to the agenda.

Dated: June 3, 2004. 

Ralph Caruso, 
Acting Associate Director for Technical 
Support, ACRS/ACNW.
[FR Doc. 04–13249 Filed 6–10–04; 8:45 am] 
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