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(b) Contents. The ROD will include a 
description of the proposed action and 
the environmental information specified 
in 40 CFR 1505.2. A ROD may be 
conditioned upon the approval of 
permits, licenses, and/or approvals that 
were not complete prior to issuance of 
the ROD. 

(c) Changes. If the Council wishes to 
take an action not identified as the 
preferred alternative in the final EIS, or 
proposes to make substantial changes to 
the findings discussed in a draft ROD, 
the Council will revise the ROD and 
process it internally in the same manner 
as EIS approval, in accordance with 
Section 12(c) of these Procedures. 

Will D. Spoon, 
Program Analyst. 
[FR Doc. 2015–00681 Filed 1–15–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–58–P 

CHEMICAL SAFETY AND HAZARD 
INVESTIGATION BOARD 

Sunshine Act Meeting 

TIME AND DATE: January 28, 2015, 6:00 
p.m.–9:00 p.m. PST. 
PLACE: Richmond City Hall, 450 Civic 
Center Plaza, Richmond, CA 94804. 
STATUS: Open to the public. 
MATTERS TO BE CONSIDERED: The 
Chemical Safety and Hazard 
Investigation Board (CSB) will convene 
a public meeting on January 28, 2015, 
starting at 6:00 p.m. PST at the 
Richmond City Hall, 450 Civic Center 
Plaza, Richmond, CA 94804. At the 
public meeting, the Board will consider 
and vote on the final report of the CSB’s 
investigation into the August 6, 2012, 
fire at the Chevron-Richmond refinery 
that endangered 19 workers and sent 
more than 15,000 local residents to seek 
medical attention. 

The public meeting is intended to 
provide the affected community and 
interested stakeholders with findings, 
conclusions and recommendations 
resulting from the CSB’s investigation 
into the Chevron incident. 

Following the staff presentation, the 
Board will hear comments from the 
public. All staff presentations are 
preliminary and are intended solely to 
allow the Board to consider in a public 
forum the issues and factors involved in 
the case. No factual analyses, 
conclusions, or findings presented by 
staff should be considered final. At the 
conclusion of the staff presentation, the 
Board may vote on the final product(s). 

Lastly, the Board may also consider 
such other items of business as 
determined by the Chairperson. 

Additional Information 

The meeting is free and open to the 
public. If you require a translator or 
interpreter, please notify the individual 
listed below as the ‘‘Contact Person for 
Further Information,’’ at least five 
business days prior to the meeting. 

The CSB is an independent federal 
agency charged with investigating 
accidents and hazards that result, or 
may result, in the catastrophic release of 
extremely hazardous substances. The 
agency’s Board Members are appointed 
by the President and confirmed by the 
Senate. CSB investigations look into all 
aspects of chemical accidents and 
hazards, including physical causes such 
as equipment failure as well as 
inadequacies in regulations, industry 
standards, and safety management 
systems. 

Public Comment 

Members of the public are invited to 
make brief statements to the Board at 
the conclusion of the staff presentation. 
The time provided for public statements 
will depend upon the number of people 
who wish to speak. Speakers should 
assume that their presentations will be 
limited to five minutes or less, but 
commenters may submit written 
statements for the record. 

Contact Person for Further Information 

Hillary J. Cohen, Communications 
Manager, hillary.cohen@csb.gov or (202) 
446–8094. General information about 
the CSB can be found on the agency 
Web site at: www.csb.gov. 

Dated: January 14, 2015. 
Daniel M. Horowitz, 
Managing Director. 
[FR Doc. 2015–00765 Filed 1–14–15; 4:15 pm] 

BILLING CODE 6350–01–P 

COMMISSION ON CIVIL RIGHTS 

Agenda and Notice of Public Meeting 
of the Wyoming State Advisory 
Committee 

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to 
the provisions of the rules and 
regulations of the U.S. Commission on 
Civil Rights (Commission), and the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act 
(FACA), that an orientation and 
planning meeting of the Wyoming State 
Advisory Committee to the Commission 
will convene at 11:00 a.m. (MDT) on 
Saturday, February 7, 2015, in the Sage 
Room, Laramie County Library, 2200 
Pioneer Avenue, Cheyenne, WY 82001. 
The purpose of the orientation meeting 
is to inform the newly appointed 
Committee members about the rules of 

operation of federal advisory 
committees and to select additional 
officers, as determined by the 
Committee. The purpose of the planning 
meeting is to discuss potential topics 
that the Committee may wish to study. 

Persons who desire additional 
information may contact the Rocky 
Mountain Regional Office, U.S. 
Commission on Civil Rights, 1961 Stout 
Street, Suite 13–201, Denver, CO 80294, 
phone 303–866–1040 and fax 303–866– 
1050, or email to Evelyn Bohor at 
ebohor@usccr.gov. 

Persons needing accessibility services 
should contact the Rocky Mountain 
Regional Office at least 10 working days 
before the scheduled date of the 
meeting. 

Records generated from this meeting 
may be inspected and reproduced at the 
Rocky Mountain Regional Office, as 
they become available, both before and 
after the meeting. Persons interested in 
the work of this advisory committee are 
advised to go to the Commission’s Web 
site, www.usccr.gov, or to contact the 
Rocky Mountain Regional Office at the 
above phone number, email or street 
address. 

The meeting will be conducted 
pursuant to the provision of the rules 
and regulations of the Commission and 
FACA. 

Dated: January 12, 2015. 
David Mussatt, 
Chief, Regional Programs Coordination Unit. 
[FR Doc. 2015–00582 Filed 1–15–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6335–01–P 

COMMISSION ON CIVIL RIGHTS 

Agenda and Notice of Public Meeting 
of the New Mexico Advisory 
Committee 

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to 
the provisions of the rules and 
regulations of the U.S. Commission on 
Civil Rights (Commission), and the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act 
(FACA), that an orientation and 
planning meeting of the New Mexico 
Advisory Committee to the Commission 
will convene at 1:00 p.m. (MDT) on 
Tuesday, February 10, 2015, in the 
Wells Fargo Board Room, Albuquerque 
Hispano Chamber of commerce, 1309 
Fourth Street NW., Albuquerque, NM 
87102. The purpose of the orientation 
meeting is to inform the newly 
appointed Committee members about 
the rules of operation of federal advisory 
committees and to select additional 
officers, as determined by the 
Committee. The purpose of the planning 
meeting is to discuss potential topics 
that the Committee may wish to study. 
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Persons who desire additional 
information may contact the Rocky 
Mountain Regional Office, U.S. 
Commission on Civil Rights, 1961 Stout 
Street, Suite 13–201, Denver, CO 80294, 
phone 303–866–1040 and fax 303–866– 
1050, or email to Evelyn Bohor at 
ebohor@usccr.gov. 

Persons needing accessibility services 
should contact the Rocky Mountain 
Regional Office at least 10 working days 
before the scheduled date of the 
meeting. 

Records generated from this meeting 
may be inspected and reproduced at the 
Rocky Mountain Regional Office, as 
they become available, both before and 
after the meeting. Persons interested in 
the word of this advisory committee are 
advised to go to the Commission’s Web 
site, www.usccr.gov, or to contact the 
Rocky Mountain Regional Office at the 
above phone number, email or street 
address. 

The meeting will be conducted 
pursuant to the provision of the rules 
and regulations of the Commission and 
FACA. 

Dated January 12, 2015. 
David Mussatt, 
Chief, Regional Programs Coordination Unit. 
[FR Doc. 2015–00581 Filed 1–15–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6335–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request 

The Department of Commerce will 
submit to the Office of Management and 
Budget (OMB) for clearance the 
following proposal for collection of 
information under the provisions of the 
Paperwork Reduction Act (44 U.S.C. 
Chapter 35). 

Agency: National Oceanic and 
Atmospheric Administration (NOAA). 

Title: Alaska Rockfish Program: 
Permits and Reports. 

OMB Control Number: 0648–0545. 
Form Number(s): None. 
Type of Request: Regular (revision 

and extension of a currently approved 
information collection). 

Number of Respondents: 9. 
Average Hours per Response: 

Application for Rockfish Cooperative 
Fishing Quota (CQ), 2 hours; 
Application for Inter-Cooperative 
Transfer of Rockfish CQ and Rockfish 
Volume & Value Report, 30 minutes; 
Annual Rockfish Cooperative Report, 40 
hours; Vessel Check-in/Check-out & 
Termination Report and Rockfish Fee 
Payment, 10 minutes each. 

Burden Hours: 498. 

Needs and Uses: This request is for 
revision and extension of a currently 
approved information collection. 

The Rockfish Program determines the 
access and allocation of the Central Gulf 
of Alaska (GOA) rockfish fisheries and 
associated halibut prohibited species 
catch (PSC), also known as the rights of 
access to the fishery. Cooperatives were 
established to receive exclusive harvest 
privileges for rockfish primary and 
secondary species. These resource 
allocations are used to assign the 
available resources in an economic way. 
In the case of halibut, a specific amount 
of halibut mortality is assigned to the 
cooperative, because halibut is often 
caught incidentally with rockfish. 

The rockfish fisheries are conducted 
in Federal waters near Kodiak, Alaska, 
primarily by trawl vessels, and to a 
lesser extent by longline vessels. The 
Rockfish Program allocates harvest 
privileges to holders of License 
Limitation Program (LLP) licenses with 
a history of Central GOA rockfish 
landings associated with those licenses. 

Revision: Two forms that are no 
longer applicable have been removed, 
and one has been added. 

Affected Public: Business or other for- 
profit organizations. 

Frequency: Annually and on occasion. 
Respondent’s Obligation: Required to 

obtain or retain benefits. 
This information collection request 

may be viewed at reginfo.gov. Follow 
the instructions to view Department of 
Commerce collections currently under 
review by OMB. 

Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to OIRA_Submission@
omb.eop.gov or fax to (202) 395–5806. 

Dated: January 13, 2015. 
Glenna Mickelson, 
Management Analyst, Office of the Chief 
Information Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2015–00631 Filed 1–15–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–22–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request 

The Department of Commerce will 
submit to the Office of Management and 
Budget (OMB) for clearance the 
following proposal for collection of 
information under the provisions of the 
Paperwork Reduction Act (44 U.S.C. 
Chapter 35). 

Agency: National Oceanic and 
Atmospheric Administration (NOAA). 

Title: Highly Migratory Species Vessel 
Logbooks and Cost-Earnings Data 
Reports. 

OMB Control Number: 0648–0371. 
Form Number(s): NOAA 88–191. 
Type of Request: Regular (extension of 

a currently approved information 
collection). 

Number of Respondents: 10,216. 
Average Hours per Response: Cost/

earnings summaries attached to logbook 
reports, 10 minutes; annual expenditure 
forms, 30 minutes; logbook catch 
reports, 12 minutes; negative logbook 
catch reports, 2 minutes. 

Burden Hours: 36,189. 
Needs and Uses: This request is for 

extension of a currently approved 
information collection. 

Under the provisions of the 
Magnuson-Stevens Fishery 
Conservation and Management Act (16 
U.S.C. 1801 et seq.), the National 
Oceanic and Atmospheric 
Administration’s (NOAA) National 
Marine Fisheries Service (NMFS) is 
responsible for management of the 
nation’s marine fisheries. In addition, 
NMFS must comply with the Atlantic 
Tunas Convention Act of 1975 (16 
U.S.C. 971 et seq.), which implements 
the International Commission for the 
Conservation of Atlantic Tunas (ICCAT) 
recommendations. 

NMFS collects information via vessel 
logbooks to monitor the U.S. catch of 
Atlantic swordfish, sharks, billfish, and 
tunas in relation to the quotas, thereby 
ensuring that the United States complies 
with its domestic and international 
obligations. HMS logbooks are verified 
using observer data that is collected 
under OMB Control No. 0648–0593 
(Observer Programs’ Information That 
Can Be Gathered Only Through 
Questions). In addition to HMS 
fisheries, the HMS logbook is also used 
to report catches of dolphin and wahoo 
by commercial and charter/headboat 
fisheries. The HMS logbooks collect 
data on incidentally-caught species, 
including sea turtles, which is necessary 
to evaluate the fisheries in terms of 
bycatch and encounters with protected 
species. For both directed and 
incidentally caught species, the 
information supplied through vessel 
logbooks also provides the catch and 
effort data on a per-set or per-trip level 
of resolution. 

These data are necessary to assess the 
status of highly migratory species, 
dolphin, and wahoo in each fishery. 
International stock assessments for 
tunas, swordfish, billfish, and some 
species of sharks are conducted and 
presented to the ICCAT periodically and 
provide, in part, the basis for ICCAT 
management recommendations which 
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