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92880–2882 applied to be registered as 
an importer of certain basic classes of 
controlled substances. No comments or 
objections were submitted for this 
notice. 

The DEA has considered the factors in 
21 U.S.C. 823, 952(a) and 958(a) and 
determined that the registration of 
Actavis Pharma, Inc. to import the basic 
classes of controlled substances is 
consistent with the public interest and 
with United States obligations under 
international treaties, conventions, or 
protocols in effect on May 1, 1971. The 
DEA investigated the company’s 
maintenance of effective controls 
against diversion by inspecting and 
testing the company’s physical security 
systems, verifying the company’s 
compliance with state and local laws, 
and reviewing the company’s 
background and history. 

Therefore, pursuant to 21 U.S.C. 
952(a) and 958(a), and in accordance 
with 21 CFR 1301.34, the above-named 
company is granted registration as an 
importer of the basic classes of 
controlled substances: 

Controlled substance Schedule 

Amphetamine (1100) .................... II 
Methylphenidate (1724) ................ II 
Oxycodone (9143) ........................ II 
Hydromorphone (9150) ................ II 

The company plans to import the 
listed controlled substances for 
analytical testing and clinical trials. 

The import of the above listed basic 
classes of controlled substances will be 
granted only for analytical testing and 
clinical trials. This authorization does 
not extend to the import of a finished 
FDA approved or non-approved dosage 
form for commercial distribution in the 
United States. 

Dated: April 14, 2015. 
Joseph T. Rannazzisi, 
Deputy Assistant Administrator. 
[FR Doc. 2015–09349 Filed 4–21–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–09P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Antitrust Division 

Notice Pursuant to the National 
Cooperative Research and Production 
Act of 1993—IMS Global Learning 
Consortium, Inc. 

Notice is hereby given that, on March 
24, 2015, pursuant to Section 6(a) of the 
National Cooperative Research and 
Production Act of 1993, 15 U.S.C. 4301 
et seq. (‘‘the Act’’), IMS Global Learning 
Consortium, Inc. (‘‘IMS Global’’) has 
filed written notifications 

simultaneously with the Attorney 
General and the Federal Trade 
Commission disclosing changes in its 
membership. The notifications were 
filed for the purpose of extending the 
Act’s provisions limiting the recovery of 
antitrust plaintiffs to actual damages 
under specified circumstances. 
Specifically, Bill & Melinda Gates 
Foundation, Seattle, WA; Microsoft, 
Redmond, WA; PARCC, Inc., 
Washington, DC; State of Michigan 
Department of Education, Lansing, MI; 
and University of Wisconsin, Madison, 
WI, have been added as parties to this 
venture. 

Also, Jenzabar, Cambridge, MA; 
SungKyunKwan University, Gyeonggi- 
do, REPUBLIC OF KOREA; and 
McGraw-Hill CTB, Nashville, TN, have 
withdrawn as parties to this venture. 

No other changes have been made in 
either the membership or planned 
activity of the group research project. 
Membership in this group research 
project remains open, and IMS Global 
intends to file additional written 
notifications disclosing all changes in 
membership. 

On April 7, 2000, IMS Global filed its 
original notification pursuant to Section 
6(a) of the Act. The Department of 
Justice published a notice in the Federal 
Register pursuant to Section 6(b) of the 
Act on September 13, 2000 (65 FR 
55283). 

The last notification was filed with 
the Department on December 8, 2014. A 
notice was published in the Federal 
Register pursuant to Section 6(b) of the 
Act on January 5, 2015 (80 FR 259). 

Patricia A. Brink, 
Director of Civil Enforcement, Antitrust 
Division. 
[FR Doc. 2015–09316 Filed 4–21–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Notice of Lodging of Proposed 
Consent Decree Under the Clean Water 
Act 

On April 16, 2015, the Department of 
Justice filed a Complaint and 
simultaneously lodged a proposed 
Consent Decree with the United States 
District Court for the Eastern District of 
Pennsylvania in the lawsuit entitled 
United States, et al, v. Allan Myers, Inc., 
et al, Civil Action No. 15–1992. 

This action involves the claim of the 
United States for civil penalties and 
injunctive relief brought pursuant to 
Section 309(b) and (d) of the Clean 
Water Act (‘‘CWA’’), 33 U.S.C. 1319(b) 
and (d), against Defendants for 
violations of the CWA at fourteen 

locations in Pennsylvania, Maryland, 
and Virginia, including: the discharge of 
pollutants in storm water without a 
permit in violation of CWA Section 301, 
33 U.S.C. 1311; failure to timely submit 
the information required to obtain 
coverage under an applicable permit for 
the discharge of storm water associated 
with its construction activities in 
violation of CWA Section 308, 33 U.S.C. 
1318; and for failure to comply with the 
conditions of permits (including various 
state general permits) issued pursuant to 
CWA Section 402, 33 U.S.C. 1342. The 
Consent Decree obligates the Defendants 
to pay a $455,000 civil penalty and 
requires the Defendants to implement a 
company-wide Stormwater Compliance 
Program that includes strict training, 
management, and reporting 
requirements to improve future 
compliance. 

The publication of this notice opens 
a period for public comment on the 
proposed Consent Decree. Comments 
should be addressed to the Assistant 
Attorney General, Environment and 
Natural Resources Division, and should 
refer to United States v. Allan Myers, 
Inc., et al, Civil Action No. 15–1992, D.J. 
Ref. No. 90–5–1–1–09042. All 
comments must be submitted no later 
than thirty (30) days after the 
publication date of this notice. 
Comments may be submitted either by 
email or by mail: 

To submit 
comments: Send them to: 

By email ....... pubcomment-ees.enrd@
usdoj.gov. 

By mail ......... Assistant Attorney General, 
U.S. DOJ—ENRD, P.O. 
Box 7611, Washington, DC 
20044–7611. 

During the public comment period, 
the proposed Consent Decree and 
Stipulated Judgment and Permanent 
Injunction may be examined and 
downloaded at this Justice Department 
Web site: http://www.usdoj.gov/enrd/
Consent_Decrees.html. We will provide 
a paper copy of the proposed Consent 
Decree and Stipulated Judgment and 
Permanent Injunction upon written 
request and payment of reproduction 
costs. Please mail your request and 
payment to: Consent Decree Library, 
U.S. DOJ—ENRD, P.O. Box 7611, 
Washington, DC 20044–7611. 

Please enclose a check or money order 
for $13.75 (25 cents per page 
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reproduction cost) payable to the United 
States Treasury. 

Robert Brook, 
Assistant Section Chief, Environmental 
Enforcement Section, Environment and 
Natural Resources Division. 
[FR Doc. 2015–09239 Filed 4–21–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–15–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Office of Disability Employment Policy 

Advisory Committee on Increasing 
Competitive Integrated Employment 
for Individuals With Disabilities; Notice 
of Meeting 

The Advisory Committee on 
Increasing Competitive Integrated 
Employment for Individuals with 
Disabilities (the Committee) was 
mandated by section 609 of the 
Rehabilitation Act of 1973, as amended 
by section 461 of the Workforce 
Innovation and Opportunity Act 
(WIOA). The Secretary of Labor 
established the Committee on 
September 15, 2014 in accordance with 
the provisions of the Federal Advisory 
Committee Act (FACA), as amended, 5 
U.S.C. App. 2. The purpose of the 
Committee is to study and prepare 
findings, conclusions and 
recommendations for Congress and the 
Secretary of Labor on (1) ways to 
increase employment opportunities for 
individuals with intellectual or 
developmental disabilities or other 
individuals with significant disabilities 
in competitive, integrated employment; 
(2) the use of the certificate program 
carried out under section 14(c) of the 
Fair Labor Standards Act (FLSA) of 
1938 (29 U.S.C. 214(c)); and (3) ways to 
improve oversight of the use of such 
certificates. 

The Committee is required to meet no 
less than eight times. It is also required 
to submit an interim report to the 
Secretary of Labor; the Senate 
Committee on Health, Education, Labor 
and Pensions; and the House Committee 
on Education and the Workforce within 
one year of the Committee’s 
establishment. A final report must be 
submitted to the same entities no later 
than two years from the Committee 
establishment date. The Committee 
terminates one day after the submission 
of the final report. 

The next meeting of the Committee 
will be open to the public and take 
place by Webinar on Monday, May 11, 
2015 and Tuesday, May 12, 2015. The 
meeting will take place each day from 
1:00 p.m. to 5:00 p.m., Eastern Daylight 
Time (EDT). 

On May 11th and 12th, the Committee 
will hear expert testimony on a number 
of topics, including, but not limited to: 
Section 503 of the Rehabilitation Act, as 
amended, by representatives from the 
U.S. Department of Labor’s (DOL) Office 
of Federal Contract Compliance 
Programs; and services for jobseekers 
with significant disabilities under 
WIOA by representatives from the U.S. 
Department of Education’s 
Rehabilitation Services Administration 
and DOL’s Employment and Training 
Administration. In addition, the 
Committee’s four subcommittees will 
report to the whole Committee on their 
efforts to date and will discuss next 
steps in their work. The four 
subcommittees are: The Transition to 
Careers Subcommittee, the Complexity 
and Needs in Delivering Competitive 
Integrated Employment Subcommittee, 
the Marketplace Dynamics 
Subcommittee, and the Building State 
and Local Capacity Subcommittee. The 
full Committee will deliberate on the 
subcommittee reports and presentations. 

Members of the public wishing to 
participate in the Webinar must register 
in advance of the meeting, by Monday, 
May 4th, using the following link— 
http://bit.ly/ACICIEID. This link will 
register members of the public for both 
days of the May meeting. 

Members of the public who wish to 
address the committee during the public 
comment period of the meeting on 
Monday, May 11th from 3:00 p.m. to 
4:00 p.m. (EDT), should send their 
name, their organization’s name (if 
applicable) and any additional materials 
(such as a copy of the proposed 
testimony) to 
IntegratedCompetitiveEmployment@
dol.gov or call David Berthiaume at 
DOL’s Office of Disability Employment 
Policy at (202) 693–7887 by Monday, 
May 4th. Please ensure that any 
attachments are in an accessible format 
or the submission will be returned. 
Also, note that public comments will be 
limited to 3 minutes in length. Due to 
time constraints, we will be able to 
accommodate up to 15 requests to 
address the committee. If more than 15 
requests are received, we will select a 
representative sample to speak and the 
remainder will be permitted to file 
written statements. Individuals with 
disabilities who need accommodations 
should also contact Mr. Berthiaume at 
the email address or phone number 
above. 

Organizations or members of the 
public wishing to submit a written 
statement may do so by submitting 30 
copies on or before May 4, 2015 to Mr. 
Berthiaume, Advisory Committee on 
Increasing Competitive Integrated 

Employment for Individuals with 
Disabilities, U.S. Department of Labor, 
Suite S–1303, 200 Constitution Avenue 
NW., Washington, DC 20210. 
Statements also may be submitted as 
email attachments to 
IntegratedCompetitiveEmployment@
dol.gov. Please ensure that any written 
submission is in an accessible format or 
the submission will be returned. 
Further, it is requested that statements 
not be included in the body of an email. 
Statements deemed relevant by the 
Committee and received on or before 
May 4, 2015 will be included in the 
record of the meeting. Do not include 
any personally identifiable information 
(such as name, address, or other contact 
information) or confidential business 
information that you do not want 
publicly disclosed. 

Signed at Washington, DC, this day 16 of 
April, 2015, 
Jennifer Sheehy, 
Acting Assistant Secretary, Office of Disability 
Employment Policy. 
[FR Doc. 2015–09254 Filed 4–21–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4510–23–P 

LIBRARY OF CONGRESS 

Copyright Royalty Board 

[Docket No. 15–0008–CRB–SATR (2015–19)] 

Determination of Royalty Rates for 
Secondary Transmissions of 
Broadcasts by Satellite Carriers and 
Distributors: Withdrawal 

AGENCY: Copyright Royalty Board, 
Library of Congress. 
ACTION: Notice of commencement of 
proceeding and solicitation of petitions 
to participate; withdrawal. 

SUMMARY: The announcement of the 
commencement of a proceeding 
published on March 30, 2015, 80 FR 
16702 is withdrawn. 
DATES: Effective Date: The 
commencement announcement 
published on March 30, 2015, is 
withdrawn April 22, 2015. 
ADDRESSES: This notice is also posted on 
the agency’s Web site (www.loc.gov/crb). 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Kimberly Whittle, Attorney Advisor, by 
telephone at (202) 707–7658 or email at 
crb@loc.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Copyright Royalty Judges have decided 
to withdraw the commencement of a 
proceeding based on a reconsideration 
of the congressional intent behind the 
enactment of the STELA 
Reauthorization Act of 2014 Public Law 
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