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3 18 CFR 157.205(e). 
4 18 CFR 385.214. 
5 18 CFR 157.10. 

6 Additionally, you may file your comments 
electronically by using the eComment feature, 
which is located on the Commission’s website at 
www.ferc.gov under the link to Documents and 
Filings. Using eComment is an easy method for 
interested persons to submit brief, text-only 
comments on a project. 

157.205(e) of the Commission’s 
regulations,3 and must be submitted by 
the protest deadline, which is December 
29, 2023. A protest may also serve as a 
motion to intervene so long as the 
protestor states it also seeks to be an 
intervenor. 

Interventions 
Any person has the option to file a 

motion to intervene in this proceeding. 
Only intervenors have the right to 
request rehearing of Commission orders 
issued in this proceeding and to 
subsequently challenge the 
Commission’s orders in the U.S. Circuit 
Courts of Appeal. 

To intervene, you must submit a 
motion to intervene to the Commission 
in accordance with Rule 214 of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure 4 and the regulations under 
the NGA 5 by the intervention deadline 
for the project, which is December 29, 
2023. As described further in Rule 214, 
your motion to intervene must state, to 
the extent known, your position 
regarding the proceeding, as well as 
your interest in the proceeding. For an 
individual, this could include your 
status as a landowner, ratepayer, 
resident of an impacted community, or 
recreationist. You do not need to have 
property directly impacted by the 
project in order to intervene. For more 
information about motions to intervene, 
refer to the FERC website at https://
www.ferc.gov/resources/guides/how-to/ 
intervene.asp. 

All timely, unopposed motions to 
intervene are automatically granted by 
operation of Rule 214(c)(1). Motions to 
intervene that are filed after the 
intervention deadline are untimely and 
may be denied. Any late-filed motion to 
intervene must show good cause for 
being late and must explain why the 
time limitation should be waived and 
provide justification by reference to 
factors set forth in Rule 214(d) of the 
Commission’s Rules and Regulations. A 
person obtaining party status will be 
placed on the service list maintained by 
the Secretary of the Commission and 
will receive copies (paper or electronic) 
of all documents filed by the applicant 
and by all other parties. 

Comments 
Any person wishing to comment on 

the project may do so. The Commission 
considers all comments received about 
the project in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken. To 
ensure that your comments are timely 

and properly recorded, please submit 
your comments on or before December 
29, 2023. The filing of a comment alone 
will not serve to make the filer a party 
to the proceeding. To become a party, 
you must intervene in the proceeding. 

How To File Protests, Interventions, and 
Comments 

There are two ways to submit 
protests, motions to intervene, and 
comments. In both instances, please 
reference the Project docket number 
CP24–10–000 in your submission. 

(1) You may file your protest, motion 
to intervene, and comments by using the 
Commission’s eFiling feature, which is 
located on the Commission’s website 
(www.ferc.gov) under the link to 
Documents and Filings. New eFiling 
users must first create an account by 
clicking on ‘‘eRegister.’’ You will be 
asked to select the type of filing you are 
making; first select ‘‘General’’ and then 
select ‘‘Protest’’, ‘‘Intervention’’, or 
‘‘Comment on a Filing’’; or 6 

(2) You can file a paper copy of your 
submission by mailing it to the address 
below. Your submission must reference 
the Project docket number CP24–10– 
000. 
To file via USPS: Kimberly D. Bose, 

Secretary, Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission, 888 First Street NE, 
Washington, DC 20426 

To file via any other method: Kimberly 
D. Bose, Secretary, Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission, 12225 
Wilkins Avenue, Rockville, Maryland 
20852 
The Commission encourages 

electronic filing of submissions (option 
1 above) and has eFiling staff available 
to assist you at (202) 502–8258 or 
FercOnlineSupport@ferc.gov. 

Protests and motions to intervene 
must be served on the applicant either 
by mail or email (with a link to the 
document) at: Joseph Moake, Cheniere 
Energy, Inc., 700 Milam Street, Suite 
1900, Houston, TX 77002, or email, 
Joseph.Moake@cheniere.com; or Chris 
Williams, Cheniere Energy, Inc., 700 
Milam Street, Suite 1900, Houston, TX 
77002, email, Chris.Williams@
cheniere.com. Any subsequent 
submissions by an intervenor must be 
served on the applicant and all other 
parties to the proceeding. Contact 
information for parties can be 
downloaded from the service list at the 
eService link on FERC Online. 

Tracking the Proceeding 

Throughout the proceeding, 
additional information about the project 
will be available from the Commission’s 
Office of External Affairs, at (866) 208– 
FERC, or on the FERC website at 
www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link 
as described above. The eLibrary link 
also provides access to the texts of all 
formal documents issued by the 
Commission, such as orders, notices, 
and rulemakings. 

In addition, the Commission offers a 
free service called eSubscription which 
allows you to keep track of all formal 
issuances and submittals in specific 
dockets. This can reduce the amount of 
time you spend researching proceedings 
by automatically providing you with 
notification of these filings, document 
summaries, and direct links to the 
documents. For more information and to 
register, go to www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/ 
esubscription.asp. 

Dated: October 30, 2023. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2023–24318 Filed 11–2–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. ER24–228–000] 

South Cheyenne Solar, LLC; 
Supplemental Notice That Initial 
Market-Based Rate Filing Includes 
Request for Blanket Section 204 
Authorization 

This is a supplemental notice in the 
above-referenced proceeding of South 
Cheyenne Solar, LLC’s application for 
market-based rate authority, with an 
accompanying rate tariff, noting that 
such application includes a request for 
blanket authorization, under 18 CFR 
part 34, of future issuances of securities 
and assumptions of liability. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest should file with the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE, Washington, DC 20426, 
in accordance with Rules 211 and 214 
of the Commission’s Rules of Practice 
and Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Anyone filing a motion to 
intervene or protest must serve a copy 
of that document on the Applicant. 

Notice is hereby given that the 
deadline for filing protests with regard 
to the applicant’s request for blanket 
authorization, under 18 CFR part 34, of 
future issuances of securities and 
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assumptions of liability, is November 
20, 2023. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper, using the 
FERC Online links at http://
www.ferc.gov. To facilitate electronic 
service, persons with internet access 
who will eFile a document and/or be 
listed as a contact for an intervenor 
must create and validate an 
eRegistration account using the 
eRegistration link. Select the eFiling 
link to log on and submit the 
intervention or protests. 

Persons unable to file electronically 
may mail similar pleadings to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street NE, Washington, DC 
20426. Hand delivered submissions in 
docketed proceedings should be 
delivered to Health and Human 
Services, 12225 Wilkins Avenue, 
Rockville, Maryland 20852. 

In addition to publishing the full text 
of this document in the Federal 
Register, the Commission provides all 
interested persons an opportunity to 
view and/or print the contents of this 
document via the internet through the 
Commission’s Home Page (http://
www.ferc.gov) using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field to access the document. At this 
time, the Commission has suspended 
access to the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room, due to the 
proclamation declaring a National 
Emergency concerning the Novel 
Coronavirus Disease (COVID–19), issued 
by the President on March 13, 2020. For 
assistance, contact the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or call 
toll-free, (886) 208–3676 or TYY, (202) 
502–8659. 

The Commission’s Office of Public 
Participation (OPP) supports meaningful 
public engagement and participation in 
Commission proceedings. OPP can help 
members of the public, including 
landowners, environmental justice 
communities, Tribal members and 
others, access publicly available 
information and navigate Commission 
processes. For public inquiries and 
assistance with making filings such as 
interventions, comments, or requests for 
rehearing, the public is encouraged to 
contact OPP at (202) 502–6595 or OPP@
ferc.gov. 

Dated: October 30, 2023. 
Debbie-Anne A. Reese, 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2023–24323 Filed 11–2–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. CP23–544–000] 

Northern Border Pipeline Company; 
Notice of Scoping Period Requesting 
Comments on Environmental Issues 
for the Proposed Bison XPress Project 

The staff of the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission (FERC or 
Commission) will prepare an 
environmental document, that will 
discuss the environmental impacts of 
the Bison XPress Project involving 
construction and operation of facilities 
by Northern Border Pipeline Company 
(Northern Border) in in McKenzie, 
Dunn, and Morton Counties, North 
Dakota. The Commission will use this 
environmental document in its 
decision-making process to determine 
whether the project is in the public 
convenience and necessity. 
Applications by Bison Pipeline, LLC 
(Docket No. CP23–543–000) and 
Wyoming Interstate Company, LLC and 
Fort Union Gas Gathering, LLC (Docket 
No. CP23–545–000) are associated 
projects being evaluated under the 
applicable Commission regulations. 

This notice announces the opening of 
the scoping process the Commission 
will use to gather input from the public 
and interested agencies regarding the 
project. As part of the National 
Environmental Policy Act (NEPA) 
review process, the Commission takes 
into account concerns the public may 
have about proposals and the 
environmental impacts that could result 
from its action whenever it considers 
the issuance of a Certificate of Public 
Convenience and Necessity. This 
gathering of public input is referred to 
as ‘‘scoping.’’ The main goal of the 
scoping process is to focus the analysis 
in the environmental document on the 
important environmental issues. 
Additional information about the 
Commission’s NEPA process is 
described below in the NEPA Process 
and Environmental Document section of 
this notice. 

By this notice, the Commission 
requests public comments on the scope 
of issues to address in the 
environmental document. To ensure 
that your comments are timely and 
properly recorded, please submit your 
comments so that the Commission 
receives them in Washington, DC on or 
before 5:00 p.m. Eastern Time on 
November 29, 2023. Comments may be 
submitted in written form. Further 
details on how to submit comments are 

provided in the Public Participation 
section of this notice. 

Your comments should focus on the 
potential environmental effects, 
reasonable alternatives, and measures to 
avoid or lessen environmental impacts. 
Your input will help the Commission 
staff determine what issues they need to 
evaluate in the environmental 
document. Commission staff will 
consider all written comments during 
the preparation of the environmental 
document. 

If you submitted comments on this 
project to the Commission before the 
opening of this docket on September 15, 
2023, you will need to file those 
comments in Docket No. CP23–544–000 
to ensure they are considered as part of 
this proceeding. 

This notice is being sent to the 
Commission’s current environmental 
mailing list for this project. State and 
local government representatives should 
notify their constituents of this 
proposed project and encourage them to 
comment on their areas of concern. 

If you are a landowner receiving this 
notice, a pipeline company 
representative may contact you about 
the acquisition of an easement to 
construct, operate, and maintain the 
proposed facilities. The company would 
seek to negotiate a mutually acceptable 
easement agreement. You are not 
required to enter into an agreement. 
However, if the Commission approves 
the project, the Natural Gas Act conveys 
the right of eminent domain to the 
company. Therefore, if you and the 
company do not reach an easement 
agreement, the pipeline company could 
initiate condemnation proceedings in 
court. In such instances, compensation 
would be determined by a judge in 
accordance with state law. The 
Commission does not subsequently 
grant, exercise, or oversee the exercise 
of that eminent domain authority. The 
courts have exclusive authority to 
handle eminent domain cases; the 
Commission has no jurisdiction over 
these matters. 

Northern Border provided landowners 
with a fact sheet prepared by the FERC 
entitled ‘‘An Interstate Natural Gas 
Facility On My Land? What Do I Need 
To Know?’’ which addresses typically 
asked questions, including the use of 
eminent domain and how to participate 
in the Commission’s proceedings. This 
fact sheet along with other landowner 
topics of interest are available for 
viewing on the FERC website 
(www.ferc.gov) under the Natural Gas, 
Landowner Topics link. 

VerDate Sep<11>2014 17:02 Nov 02, 2023 Jkt 262001 PO 00000 Frm 00036 Fmt 4703 Sfmt 4703 E:\FR\FM\03NON1.SGM 03NON1lo
tte

r 
on

 D
S

K
11

X
Q

N
23

P
R

O
D

 w
ith

 N
O

T
IC

E
S

1

mailto:FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov
http://www.ferc.gov
http://www.ferc.gov
http://www.ferc.gov
http://www.ferc.gov
mailto:OPP@ferc.gov
mailto:OPP@ferc.gov
http://www.ferc.gov

		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-11-03T07:27:34-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




