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complete version of the comment that 
includes information claimed as CBI, a 
copy of the comment that does not 
contain the information claimed as CBI 
must be submitted for inclusion in the 
public docket. Information so marked 
will not be disclosed except in 
accordance with procedures set forth in 
40 CFR part 2. 

2. Tips for preparing your comments. 
When preparing and submitting your 
comments, see the commenting tips at 
http://www.epa.gov/dockets/ 
comments.html. 

II. Registration Applications 
EPA has received applications to 

register new uses for pesticide products 
containing currently registered active 
ingredients. Pursuant to the provisions 
of FIFRA section 3(c)(4) (7 U.S.C. 
136a(c)(4)), EPA is hereby providing 
notice of receipt and opportunity to 
comment on these applications. Notice 
of receipt of these applications does not 
imply a decision by the Agency on these 
applications. 

EPA Registration Number: 100–1471, 
100–1475, 100–1478, 100–1480. Docket 
ID number: EPA–HQ–OPP–2017–0167. 
Applicant: Syngenta Crop Protection, 
LLC, P.O. Box 18300, Greensboro, NC 
27419. Active ingredient: 
Benzovindiflupyr. Product type: 
Fungicide. Proposed use: Grasses grown 
for seeds. Contact: RD. 

EPA Registration Number: 100–1489. 
Docket ID number: EPA–HQ–OPP– 
2016–0610. Applicant: Syngenta Crop 
Protection, LLC, P.O. Box 18300, 
Greensboro, NC 27419. Active 
ingredient: Chlorantraniliprole. Product 
type: Insecticide. Proposed Use: 
Greenhouses; commercial, ornamental 
plant nurseries. Contact: RD. 

EPA Registration Number or File 
Symbol: 100–RARO. Docket ID number: 
EPA–HQ–OPP–2017–0173. Applicant: 
Syngenta Crop Protection, LLC, P.O. 
Box 18300 Greensboro, NC 27419. 
Active ingredient: Thiamethoxam. 
Product type: Insecticide. Proposed Use: 
Termiticide. Contact: RD. 

EPA Registration Numbers: 279–3149, 
279–3220, 279–3370. Docket ID number: 
EPA–HQ–OPP–2017–0072. Applicant: 
FMC Corporation, 2929 Walnut Street, 
NW., Philadelphia, PA 19104. Active 
ingredient: Sulfentrazone. Product type: 
Herbicide. Proposed use: Peppermint, 
spearmint, chia, teff, a crop group 
expansion for the stalk and stem 
vegetable subgroup 22A, and crop group 
conversions for the brassica vegetable, 
head and stem group 5–16, the brassica 
leafy greens subgroup 4/16B, and the 
tree nut group 14–12. Contact: RD. 

EPA Registration Number: 55146–97, 
55149–99. Docket ID number: EPA–HQ– 

OPP–2017–0089. Applicant: Nufarm 
Americas Inc., 4020 Aerial Center 
Parkway, Suite 101, Morrisville, NC 
27545. Active ingredient: 
Oxytetracycline. Product type: 
Bactericide/Fungicide. Proposed use: 
Cherry sweet; Cherry, tart. Contact: RD. 

Authority: 7 U.S.C. 136 et seq. 

Dated: June 6, 2017. 
Delores Barber, 
Director, Information Technology and 
Resources Management Division, Office of 
Pesticide Programs. 
[FR Doc. 2017–15750 Filed 7–26–17; 8:45 am] 
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[FRL–9965–22–OW] 

Notice of Open Meeting of the 
Environmental Financial Advisory 
Board (EFAB) 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice of open meeting. 

SUMMARY: The EPA’s Environmental 
Financial Advisory Board (EFAB) will 
hold a public meeting on August 22–23, 
2017. EFAB is an EPA advisory 
committee chartered under the Federal 
Advisory Committee Act to provide 
advice and recommendations to EPA on 
creative approaches to funding 
environmental programs, projects, and 
activities. 

The purpose of this meeting is to hear 
from informed speakers on 
environmental finance issues, proposed 
legislation, and EPA priorities; to 
discuss activities, progress, and 
preliminary recommendations with 
regard to current EFAB work projects; 
and to consider requests for assistance 
from EPA program offices. 
Environmental finance discussions and 
presentations are expected on, but not 
limited to, the following topics: 
Decentralized wastewater systems; lead 
risk reduction; public-private 
partnerships; domestic recycling 
programs; water infrastructure financing 
and environmental justice; water quality 
restoration in the Chesapeake Bay 
Watershed; Rural Alaska Waste 
Backhaul Service Program; and drinking 
water and clean water state revolving 
fund (SRF) funding to address lead 
fixture replacement projects. The 
meeting is open to the public; however, 
seating is limited. All members of the 
public who wish to attend the meeting 
must register, in advance, no later than 
Monday, August 7, 2017. 

DATES: The full board meeting will be 
held Tuesday, August 22, 2017 from 
1:30 p.m.–5:00 p.m., and Wednesday, 
August 23, 2017 from 9:00 a.m.–5:00 
p.m. 
ADDRESSES: Marriott Kansas City 
Overland Park, 10800 Metcalf Avenue, 
Overland Park, KS 66210. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
information on access or services for 
individuals with disabilities, or to 
request accommodations for a disability, 
please contact Sandra Williams at (202) 
564–4999 or williams.sandra@epa.gov, 
at least 10 days prior to the meeting to 
allow as much time as possible to 
process your request. 

Dated: July 11, 2017. 
Sheila Frace, 
Acting Director, Office of Wastewater 
Management, Office of Water. 
[FR Doc. 2017–15723 Filed 7–26–17; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[EPA–HQ–OPPT–2017–0141; FRL–9963–92] 

Certain New Chemicals or Significant 
New Uses; Statements of Findings for 
May 2017 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: Section 5(g) of the Toxic 
Substances Control Act (TSCA) requires 
EPA to publish in the Federal Register 
a statement of its findings after its 
review of TSCA section 5(a) notices 
when EPA makes a finding that a new 
chemical substance or significant new 
use is not likely to present an 
unreasonable risk of injury to health or 
the environment. Such statements apply 
to premanufacture notices (PMNs), 
microbial commercial activity notices 
(MCANs), and significant new use 
notices (SNUNs) submitted to EPA 
under TSCA section 5. This document 
presents statements of findings made by 
EPA on TSCA section 5(a) notices 
during the period from May 1, 2017 to 
May 31, 2017. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT:

For technical information contact: 
Greg Schweer, Chemical Control 
Divison (7405M), Office of Pollution 
Prevention and Toxics, Environmental 
Protection Agency, 1200 Pennsylvania 
Ave. NW., Washington, DC 20460–0001; 
telephone number: 202–564–8469; 
email address: schweer.greg@epa.gov. 

For general information contact: The 
TSCA-Hotline, ABVI-Goodwill, 422 
South Clinton Ave., Rochester, NY 
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