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be taken, but will not serve to make 
protestants parties to the proceeding. 
Anyone filing a motion to intervene or 
protest must serve a copy of that 
document on the Applicant. In reference 
to filings initiating a new proceeding, 
interventions or protests submitted on 
or before the comment deadline need 
not be served on persons other than the 
Applicant. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper, using the 
FERC Online links at http:// 
www.ferc.gov. To facilitate electronic 
service, persons with Internet access 
who will eFile a document and/or be 
listed as a contact for an intervenor 
must create and validate an 
eRegistration account using the 
eRegistration link. Select the eFiling 
link to log on and submit the 
intervention or protests. 

Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the intervention or protest to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First St., NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

The filings in the above proceedings 
are accessible in the Commission’s 
eLibrary system by clicking on the 
appropriate link in the above list. They 
are also available for review in the 
Commission’s Public Reference Room in 
Washington, DC. There is an 
eSubscription link on the Web site that 
enables subscribers to receive e-mail 
notification when a document is added 
to a subscribed docket(s). For assistance 
with any FERC Online service, please e- 
mail FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or 
call (866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, 
call (202) 502–8659. 

Nathaniel J. Davis, Sr., 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E9–10159 Filed 5–1–09; 8:45 am] 
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April 24, 2009. 
Take notice that on April 23, 2009 the 

Connecticut Department of Public 
Utility Control and the Connecticut 
Office of Consumer Counsel 
(collectively, Connecticut 
Representatives) filed a formal 
complaint against ISO New England Inc. 
(ISO–NE) and Unidentified Installed 
Capacity Resources Committed to 
Import over the Northern New York AC 
Interface (NNY Capacity Resources) 
pursuant to sections 206, 222, and 309 
of the Federal Power Act, 16 U.S.C. 
824e, 824v, and 825h (2006), and Rule 
206 of the Commission’s Rules of 
Practice and Procedure, 18 CFR 385.206 
(2009), seeking a Commission 
investigation and hearing into installed 
capacity resources who received 
capacity payments but never provided 
any capacity services when called upon. 

Connecticut Representatives certify 
that copies of the complaint were served 
on the contacts for ISO–NE and New 
England Power Pool, Inc. (NEPOOL), as 
a representative of the Unidentified 
NNY Capacity Resources, as listed on 
the Commission’s list of Corporate 
Officials. Connecticut Representatives 
requests that NEPOOL post this 
complaint. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211, 385.214). 
Protests will be considered by the 
Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. The Respondent’s answer 
and all interventions, or protests must 
be filed on or before the comment date. 
The Respondent’s answer, motions to 
intervene, and protests must be served 
on the Complainants. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 

‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive e-mail notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please e-mail 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 
on May 11, 2009. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E9–10104 Filed 5–1–09; 8:45 am] 
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April 24, 2009. 
On April 6, 2009, Willwood Irrigation 

District filed an application, pursuant to 
section 4(f) of the Federal Power Act, 
proposing to study the feasibility of the 
Willwood Dam Hydroelectric Project. 
The project would be located on Federal 
lands in Park County in Wyoming, 
approximately nine miles southwest of 
Powell, Wyoming and would utilize the 
U.S. Bureau of Reclamation’s Willwood 
Diversion Dam. 

The proposed project using the U.S. 
Bureau of Reclamation’s Willwood 
Diversion Dam would consist of: (1) A 
short proposed penstock from the 
existing seven-foot-diameter opening in 
the dam to the proposed powerhouse; 
(2) a proposed powerhouse at the base 
of the existing dam containing one 
Kaplan turbine, a generator, and control 
systems with a total installed capacity of 
2,000 kilowatts, (3) a proposed 34.5-kV, 
two-mile-long transmission line. The 
project would have an annual 
generation of approximately 7.8 
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