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the Privacy Act of 1974. EAP records are 
located at various DOJ-operated and 
contractor-operated facilities, and you 
may make your request by writing 
directly to the Privacy Act Office of the 
component that maintains your EAP 
records. The appropriate address to use, 
and any additional requirements for 
submitting a request to a given 
component, are listed in Appendix I of 
28 CFR part 16. Further details are 
provided in Attachment B of the 
Department’s FOIA Reference Guide, 
available on the Department’s Web site 
here: http://www.justice.gov/oip/ 
04_3.html. If you cannot determine 
where within the Department to send 
your request, you may send it to the 
FOIA/PA Mail Referral Unit, Justice 
Management Division, U.S. Department 
of Justice, Room 115, LOC Building, 
Washington, DC 20530–0001, and the 
Mail Referral Unit will forward your 
request to the component(s) that it 
determines to be most likely to maintain 
your records. 

For the quickest possible handling, 
both the request letter and the envelope 
should be marked ‘‘Privacy Act 
Request.’’ The request should include a 
description of the records sought and 
must include sufficient information to 
verify your identity, including your full 
name, current address, and date and 
place of birth. You must sign and date 
your request, and your signature must 
either be notarized or submitted under 
28 U.S.C. 1746, a law that permits 
statements to be made under penalty of 
perjury as a substitute for notarization. 
(While no specific form is required, you 
may obtain a form (Form DOJ–361) for 
use in certification of your identity from 
the FOIA/PA Mail Referral Unit at the 
address listed above, or on the 
Department’s Web site at http:// 
www.justice.gov/oip/forms/ 
cert_ind.pdf.) If you desire to request 
amendment or correction of information 
maintained in your records, you should 
also comply with the additional 
provisions in Contesting Record 
Procedures, below. 

CONTESTING RECORD PROCEDURES: 

If you desire to contest and request 
amendment or correction of information 
about you maintained in the system, 
please follow the Record Access 
Procedures, above. In addition, you 
should also comply with the provisions 
of 28 CFR 16.46, which include 
requirements that you identify each 
particular record in question and state 
clearly and concisely what information 
is being contested, the reasons for 
contesting it, and the proposed 
amendment or correction that you want. 

RECORD SOURCE CATEGORIES: 

Records are generated by EAP 
personnel, the EAP client who is the 
subject of the record, the personnel 
office, employee relations/labor 
relations counsel, the EAP client’s 
supervisor, the EAP client’s co-workers, 
employee bargaining units, EAP 
contractors, referral counseling and 
treatment programs or individuals, and 
other outside sources. In the case of 
drug abuse counseling, records may also 
be generated by the staff of the Drug- 
Free Workplace Program and the 
medical review officer. 

EXEMPTIONS CLAIMED FOR THE SYSTEM: 

None. 
[FR Doc. 2012–2463 Filed 2–2–12; 8:45 am] 
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DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Antitrust Division 

Notice Pursuant to the National 
Cooperative Research and Production 
Act of 1993— Institute of Electrical and 
Electronics Engineers 

Notice is hereby given that, on 
January 10, 2012, pursuant to Section 
6(a) of the National Cooperative 
Research and Production Act of 1993, 
15 U.S.C. 4301 et seq. (‘‘the Act’’), the 
Institute of Electrical and Electronics 
Engineers (‘‘IEEE’’) has filed written 
notifications simultaneously with the 
Attorney General and the Federal Trade 
Commission disclosing additions or 
changes to its standards development 
activities. The notifications were filed 
for the purpose of extending the Act’s 
provisions limiting the recovery of 
antitrust plaintiffs to actual damages 
under specified circumstances. 
Specifically, 43 new standards have 
been initiated and 27 existing standards 
are being revised. More detail regarding 
these changes can be found at http:// 
standards.ieee.org/about/sba/ 
sep2011.html, http://standards.ieee.org/ 
about/sba/oct2011.html, http:// 
standards.ieee.org/about/sba/ 
dec2011.html. 

On September 17, 2004, IEEE filed its 
original notification pursuant to Section 
6(a) of the Act. The Department of 
Justice published a notice in the Federal 
Register pursuant to Section 6(b) of the 
Act on November 3, 2004 (69 FR 64105). 

The last notification was filed with 
the Department on July 1, 2011. A 
notice was published in the Federal 

Register pursuant to Section 6(b) of the 
Act on August 9, 2011 (76 FR 48884). 

Patricia A. Brink, 
Director of Civil Enforcement, Antitrust 
Division. 
[FR Doc. 2012–2381 Filed 2–2–12; 8:45 am] 
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DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Antitrust Division 

Notice Pursuant to the National 
Cooperative Research and Production 
Act of 1993—Portland Cement 
Association 

Notice is hereby given that, on 
January 6, 2012, pursuant to Section 6(a) 
of the National Cooperative Research 
and Production Act of 1993, 15 U.S.C. 
4301 et seq. (‘‘the Act’’), Portland 
Cement Association (‘‘PCA’’) has filed 
written notifications simultaneously 
with the Attorney General and the 
Federal Trade Commission disclosing 
changes in its membership. The 
notifications were filed for the purpose 
of extending the Act’s provisions 
limiting the recovery of antitrust 
plaintiffs to actual damages under 
specified circumstances. Specifically, 
W. L. Gore, Newark, DE, has been added 
as a party to this venture. Also, Texas- 
Lehigh Cement Company, Buda, TX; 
Arizona Cement Association, Phoenix, 
AZ; Concrete Promotion Council of 
Northern California, Roseville, CA; and 
Slag Cement Association, Sugar Land, 
TX, have withdrawn as parties to this 
venture. 

No other changes have been made in 
either the membership or planned 
activity of the group research project. 
Membership in this group research 
project remains open, and PCA intends 
to file additional written notifications 
disclosing all changes in membership. 

On January 7, 1985, PCA filed its 
original notification pursuant to Section 
6(a) of the Act. The Department of 
Justice published a notice in the Federal 
Register pursuant to Section 6(b) of the 
Act on February 5, 1985 (50 FR 5015). 

The last notification was filed with 
the Department on May 12, 2011. A 
notice was published in the Federal 
Register pursuant to Section 6(b) of the 
Act on June 13, 2011 (76 FR 34252). 

Patricia A. Brink, 
Director of Civil Enforcement, Antitrust 
Division. 
[FR Doc. 2012–2383 Filed 2–2–12; 8:45 am] 
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