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16 15 U.S.C. 78s(b)(3)(A)(ii). 
17 17 CFR 240.19b–4(f)(2). 18 17 CFR 200.30–3(a)(12). 

Providing the proposed discounts is not 
only to provide just customer services, 
but also to ensure that the Exchange’s 
pricing is equitable and competitive. 

C. Self-Regulatory Organization’s 
Statement on Comments on the 
Proposed Rule Change Received From 
Members, Participants, or Others 

Written comments were neither 
solicited nor received. 

III. Date of Effectiveness of the 
Proposed Rule Change and Timing for 
Commission Action 

The foregoing rule change has become 
effective pursuant to Section 
19(b)(3)(A)(ii) of the Act,16 and Rule 
19b–4(f)(2) 17 thereunder. At any time 
within 60 days of the filing of the 
proposed rule change, the Commission 
summarily may temporarily suspend 
such rule change if it appears to the 
Commission that such action is 
necessary or appropriate in the public 
interest, for the protection of investors, 
or otherwise in furtherance of the 
purposes of the Act. If the Commission 
takes such action, the Commission shall 
institute proceedings to determine 
whether the proposed rule should be 
approved or disapproved. 

IV. Solicitation of Comments 

Interested persons are invited to 
submit written data, views and 
arguments concerning the foregoing, 
including whether the proposed rule 
change is consistent with the Act. 
Comments may be submitted by any of 
the following methods: 

Electronic Comments 

• Use the Commission’s internet 
comment form (https://www.sec.gov/ 
rules/sro.shtml); or 

• Send an email to rule-comments@
sec.gov. Please include file number SR– 
MIAX–2025–13 on the subject line. 

Paper Comments 

• Send paper comments in triplicate 
to Secretary, Securities and Exchange 
Commission, 100 F Street NE, 
Washington, DC 20549–1090. 
All submissions should refer to file 
number SR–MIAX–2025–13. This file 
number should be included on the 
subject line if email is used. To help the 
Commission process and review your 
comments more efficiently, please use 
only one method. The Commission will 
post all comments on the Commission’s 
internet website (https://www.sec.gov/ 
rules/sro.shtml). Copies of the 
submission, all subsequent 

amendments, all written statements 
with respect to the proposed rule 
change that are filed with the 
Commission, and all written 
communications relating to the 
proposed rule change between the 
Commission and any person, other than 
those that may be withheld from the 
public in accordance with the 
provisions of 5 U.S.C. 552, will be 
available for website viewing and 
printing in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room, 100 F Street NE, 
Washington, DC 20549, on official 
business days between the hours of 10 
a.m. and 3 p.m. Copies of the filing also 
will be available for inspection and 
copying at the principal office of the 
Exchange. Do not include personal 
identifiable information in submissions; 
you should submit only information 
that you wish to make available 
publicly. We may redact in part or 
withhold entirely from publication 
submitted material that is obscene or 
subject to copyright protection. All 
submissions should refer to file number 
SR–MIAX–2025–13 and should be 
submitted on or before May 5, 2025. 

For the Commission, by the Division of 
Trading and Markets, pursuant to delegated 
authority.18 
Sherry R. Haywood, 
Assistant Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2025–06251 Filed 4–11–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8011–01–P 

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE 
COMMISSION 

[Investment Company Act Release No. 
35525; File No. 812–15712] 

BlackRock Growth Equity Fund LP, et 
al. 

April 8, 2025. 
AGENCY: Securities and Exchange 
Commission (‘‘Commission’’ or ‘‘SEC’’). 
ACTION: Notice. 

Notice of application for an order 
under sections 17(d) and 57(i) of the 
Investment Company Act of 1940 (the 
‘‘Act’’) and rule 17d–1 under the Act to 
permit certain joint transactions 
otherwise prohibited by sections 17(d) 
and 57(a)(4) of the Act and rule 17d–1 
under the Act. 
SUMMARY OF APPLICATION: Applicants 
request an order to permit certain 
business development companies 
(‘‘BDCs’’) and closed-end management 
investment companies to co-invest in 
portfolio companies with each other and 
with certain affiliated investment 

entities. The requested order includes 
streamlined terms and conditions as 
compared to past comparable orders. 
APPLICANTS: BlackRock Credit Strategies 
Fund, CREDX Subsidiary, LLC, 
BlackRock Direct Lending Corp., 
BlackRock Private Credit Fund, BDEBT 
Subsidiary LLC, BlackRock Private 
Credit Fund Leverage I, LLC, BlackRock 
Private Investments Fund, BPIF 
Subsidiary, LLC, Cayman Private 
Investments Fund, Ltd., BlackRock TCP 
Capital Corp., Special Value 
Continuation Partners LLC, TCPC 
Funding I, LLC, TCPC Funding II, LLC, 
TCPC SBIC, LP, TCPC SBIC GP, LLC, 
BCIC Merger Sub, LLC, BlackRock 
Capital Investment Advisors, LLC, 
Tennenbaum Capital Partners, LLC, 
SVOF/MM, LLC, and certain of their 
affiliated entities as described in 
Appendix A to the application. 
FILING DATES: The application was filed 
on March 4, 2025, and amended on 
March 20, 2025, April 3, 2025, and 
April 8, 2025. 
HEARING OR NOTIFICATION OF HEARING: An 
order granting the requested relief will 
be issued unless the Commission orders 
a hearing. Interested persons may 
request a hearing on any application by 
emailing the SEC’s Secretary at 
Secretarys-Office@sec.gov and serving 
the Applicants with a copy of the 
request by email, if an email address is 
listed for the relevant Applicant below, 
or personally or by mail, if a physical 
address is listed for the relevant 
Applicant below. Hearing requests 
should be received by the Commission 
by 5:30 p.m. on May 5, 2025, and 
should be accompanied by proof of 
service on the Applicants, in the form 
of an affidavit or, for lawyers, a 
certificate of service. Pursuant to rule 0– 
5 under the Act, hearing requests should 
state the nature of the writer’s interest, 
any facts bearing upon the desirability 
of a hearing on the matter, the reason for 
the request, and the issues contested. 
Persons who wish to be notified of a 
hearing may request notification by 
emailing the Commission’s Secretary at 
Secretarys-Office@sec.gov. 
ADDRESSES: The Commission: 
Secretarys-Office@sec.gov. Applicants: 
Diana Huffman, General Counsel, 
BlackRock Private Credit Fund, 50 
Hudson Yards, New York, New York 
10001, GroupBCIALCSupport@
blackrock.com; Laurence D. Paredes, 
Managing Director, BlackRock Capital 
Investment Advisors, LLC, 50 Hudson 
Yards, New York, New York 1000; Erik 
Cuellar, Director, Tennenbaum Capital 
Partners, LLC, 2951 28th Street, Suite 
1000, Santa Monica, California 90405; 
Ryan P. Brizek, Simpson Thacher & 
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Bartlett LLP, 900 G Street, NW, 
Washington, DC 20001; Michael 
Hoffman, Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher 
& Flom LLP, One Manhattan West, New 
York, New York 10019; and Margery K. 
Neale, Esq., Willkie Farr & Gallagher 
LLP, 787 Seventh Avenue, New York, 
New York 10019. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Adam Large, Senior Special Counsel, Jill 
Ehrlich, Senior Counsel, or Daniele 
Marchesani, Assistant Chief Counsel, at 
(202) 551–6825 (Division of Investment 
Management, Chief Counsel’s Office). 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: For 
Applicants’ representations, legal 
analysis, and conditions, please refer to 
Applicants’ third amended application, 
dated April 8, 2025, which may be 
obtained via the Commission’s website 
by searching for the file number at the 
top of this document, or for an 
Applicant using the Company name 
search field, on the SEC’s EDGAR 
system. The SEC’s EDGAR system may 
be searched at https://www.sec.gov/ 
edgar/searchedgar/ 
companysearch.html. You may also call 
the SEC’s Office of Investor Education 
and Advocacy at (202) 551–8090. 

For the Commission, by the Division of 
Investment Management, under delegated 
authority. 
Sherry R. Haywood, 
Assistant Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2025–06250 Filed 4–11–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8011–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

Federal Railroad Administration 

[Docket Number FRA–2010–0058] 

Canadian Pacific Railway’s Request To 
Amend Its Positive Train Control 
System 

AGENCY: Federal Railroad 
Administration (FRA), Department of 
Transportation (DOT). 
ACTION: Notice of availability and 
request for comments. 

SUMMARY: This document provides the 
public with notice that, on March 27, 
2025, Canadian Pacific Railway (CP) 
submitted a request for amendment 
(RFA) to its FRA-certified positive train 
control (PTC) system to temporarily 
disable the system for a period not to 
exceed three hours in order to increase 
the capacity of its PTC system in 
preparation for consolidation. As this 
RFA may involve a request for FRA’s 
approval of proposed material 
modifications to an FRA-certified PTC 
system, FRA is publishing this notice 

and inviting public comment on CP’s 
RFA to its PTC system. 
DATES: FRA will consider comments 
received by May 5, 2025. FRA may 
consider comments received after that 
date to the extent practicable and 
without delaying implementation of 
valuable or necessary modifications to a 
PTC system. 
ADDRESSES: 

Comments: Comments may be 
submitted by going to https://
www.regulations.gov and following the 
online instructions for submitting 
comments. 

Instructions: All submissions must 
include the agency name and the 
applicable docket number. The relevant 
PTC docket number for this host 
railroad is Docket No. FRA–2010–0058. 
For convenience, all active PTC dockets 
are hyperlinked on FRA’s website at 
https://railroads.dot.gov/research- 
development/program-areas/train- 
control/ptc/railroads-ptc-dockets. All 
comments received will be posted 
without change to https://
www.regulations.gov; this includes any 
personal information. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Gabe Neal, Staff Director, Signal, Train 
Control, and Crossings Division, 
telephone: 816–516–7168, email: 
Gabe.Neal@dot.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: In general, 
title 49 United States Code (U.S.C.) 
section 20157(h) requires FRA to certify 
that a host railroad’s PTC system 
complies with title 49 Code of Federal 
Regulations (CFR) part 236, subpart I, 
before the technology may be operated 
in revenue service. Before making 
certain changes to an FRA-certified PTC 
system or the associated FRA-approved 
PTC Safety Plan (PTCSP), a host railroad 
must submit, and obtain FRA’s approval 
of, an RFA to its PTC system or PTCSP 
under 49 CFR 236.1021. 

Under 49 CFR 236.1021(e), FRA’s 
regulations provide that FRA will 
publish a notice in the Federal Register 
and invite public comment in 
accordance with 49 CFR part 211, if an 
RFA includes a request for approval of 
a material modification of a signal or 
train control system. Accordingly, this 
notice informs the public that, on March 
27, 2025, CP submitted an RFA to its 
PTCSP for its Interoperable Electronic 
Train Management System, which seeks 
FRA’s approval for a temporary outage 
to increase the capacity of its PTC 
system and conduct a corresponding 
Back Office Server update. That RFA is 
available in Docket No. FRA–2010– 
0058. 

Interested parties are invited to 
comment on CP’s RFA by submitting 

written comments or data. During FRA’s 
review of CP’s RFA, FRA will consider 
any comments or data submitted within 
the timeline specified in this notice and 
to the extent practicable, without 
delaying implementation of valuable or 
necessary modifications to a PTC 
system. See 49 CFR 236.1021; see also 
49 CFR 236.1011(e). Under 49 CFR 
236.1021, FRA maintains the authority 
to approve, approve with conditions, or 
deny a railroad’s RFA at FRA’s sole 
discretion. 

Privacy Act Notice 
In accordance with 49 CFR 211.3, 

FRA solicits comments from the public 
to better inform its decisions. DOT posts 
these comments, without edit, including 
any personal information the 
commenter provides, to https://
www.regulations.gov, as described in 
the system of records notice (DOT/ALL– 
14 FDMS), which can be reviewed at 
https://www.transportation.gov/privacy. 
See https://www.regulations.gov/ 
privacy-notice for the privacy notice of 
regulations.gov. To facilitate comment 
tracking, we encourage commenters to 
provide their name, or the name of their 
organization; however, submission of 
names is completely optional. If you 
wish to provide comments containing 
proprietary or confidential information, 
please contact FRA for alternate 
submission instructions. 

Issued in Washington, DC. 
Carolyn R. Hayward-Williams, 
Director, Office of Railroad Systems and 
Technology. 
[FR Doc. 2025–06326 Filed 4–11–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4910–06–P 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

National Highway Traffic Safety 
Administration 

[Docket No. NHTSA–2025–0013; Notice 1] 

Evenflo Company, Inc., Receipt of 
Petition for Decision of 
Inconsequential Noncompliance 

AGENCY: National Highway Traffic 
Safety Administration (NHTSA), 
Department of Transportation (DOT). 
ACTION: Receipt of petition. 

SUMMARY: Evenflo Company, Inc. 
(Evenflo) has determined that certain 
Evenflo All4One child restraint systems 
do not fully comply with Federal Motor 
Vehicle Safety Standard (FMVSS) No. 
213, Child Restraint Systems. Evenflo 
filed a noncompliance report dated 
January 27, 2025, and subsequently 
petitioned NHTSA (the ‘‘Agency’’) on 
February 14, 2025, for a decision that 
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