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Dated: July 3, 2014. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2014–16196 Filed 7–10–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. CP14–505–000] 

WBI Energy Transmission, Inc.; Notice 
of Request Under Blanket 
Authorization 

Take notice that on June 24, 2014, 
WBI Energy Transmission, Inc., (WBI 
Energy), 1250 West Century Avenue, 
Bismarck, North Dakota 58503, filed in 
Docket No. CP14–505–000, a prior 
notice request pursuant to sections 
157.205 and 157.210 of the 
Commission’s regulations under the 
Natural Gas Act to replace natural gas 
compression facilities at its Baker 
Compressor Station located in Fallon 
County, Montana. Specifically, WBI 
Energy proposes to replace two Ingersoll 
Rand 6SVG 330 horsepower (HP) 
natural gas fired compressor units 
(Units 6 and 7) with one Ajax 2802LE 
384 HP natural gas driven compressor 
unity (Unit 10). The certificated 
horsepower at the Baker Compressor 
Station will decrease from 4,780 HP to 
4,504 HP, all as more fully set forth in 
the application which is on file with the 
Commission and open to public 
inspection. The filing may also be 
viewed on the Web at http://
www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field to access the document. For 
assistance, contact FERC at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or call 
toll-free, (866) 208–3676 or TTY, (202) 
502–8659. 

Any questions regarding this 
Application should be directed to Keith 
A. Tiggelaar, Director of Regulatory 
Affairs, WBI Energy Transmission, Inc., 
1250 West Century Avenue, Bismarck, 
North Dakota 58503, or by calling (701) 
530–1560, or by email keith.tiggelaar@
wbienergy.com. 

Any person may, within 60 days after 
the issuance of the instant notice by the 
Commission, file pursuant to Rule 214 
of the Commission’s Procedural Rules 
(18 CFR 385.214) a motion to intervene 
or notice of intervention. Any person 
filing to intervene or the Commission’s 
staff may, pursuant to section 157.205 of 
the Commission’s Regulations under the 
NGA (18 CFR 157.205) file a protest to 
the request. If no protest is filed within 

the time allowed therefore, the proposed 
activity shall be deemed to be 
authorized effective the day after the 
time allowed for protest. If a protest is 
filed and not withdrawn within 30 days 
after the time allowed for filing a 
protest, the instant request shall be 
treated as an application for 
authorization pursuant to section 7 of 
the NGA. 

Pursuant to section 157.9 of the 
Commission’s rules, 18 CFR 157.9, 
within 90 days of this Notice the 
Commission staff will either: omplete its 
environmental assessment (EA) and 
place it into the Commission’s public 
record (eLibrary) for this proceeding; or 
issue a Notice of Schedule for 
Environmental Review. If a Notice of 
Schedule for Environmental Review is 
issued, it will indicate, among other 
milestones, the anticipated date for the 
Commission staff’s issuance of the final 
environmental impact statement (FEIS) 
or EA for this proposal. The filing of the 
EA in the Commission’s public record 
for this proceeding or the issuance of a 
Notice of Schedule for Environmental 
Review will serve to notify federal and 
state agencies of the timing for the 
completion of all necessary reviews, and 
the subsequent need to complete all 
federal authorizations within 90 days of 
the date of issuance of the Commission 
staff’s FEIS or EA. 

Persons who wish to comment only 
on the environmental review of this 
project should submit an original and 
two copies of their comments to the 
Secretary of the Commission. 
Environmental commenter’s will be 
placed on the Commission’s 
environmental mailing list, will receive 
copies of the environmental documents, 
and will be notified of meetings 
associated with the Commission’s 
environmental review process. 
Environmental commenter’s will not be 
required to serve copies of filed 
documents on all other parties. 
However, the non-party commentary, 
will not receive copies of all documents 
filed by other parties or issued by the 
Commission (except for the mailing of 
environmental documents issued by the 
Commission) and will not have the right 
to seek court review of the 
Commission’s final order. 

The Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filings of comments, protests, 
and interventions via the internet in lieu 
of paper. See 18 CFR 385.2001(a)(1)(iii) 
and the instructions on the 
Commission’s Web site (www.ferc.gov) 
under the ‘‘e-Filing’’ link. Persons 
unable to file electronically should 
submit an original and 5 copies of the 
protest or intervention to the Federal 

Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE., Washington, DC 20426. 

Dated: July 3, 2014. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2014–16195 Filed 7–10–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[FRL–9913–39–OGC] 

Proposed Consent Decree, Clean Air 
Act Citizen Suit 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice of Proposed Consent 
Decree; Request for Public Comment. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with section 
113(g) of the Clean Air Act, as amended 
(‘‘CAA’’ or the ‘‘Act’’), notice is hereby 
given of a proposed consent decree to 
address a lawsuit filed by the National 
Parks Conservation Association, et al., 
(‘‘Plaintiffs’) in the United States 
District Court for the District of 
Minnesota: National Parks Conservation 
Association v. McCarthy, Civil Action 
No. 12–3043 (RHK/JSM) (D. Minn.). On 
December 5, 2012, Plaintiffs filed a 
complaint alleging that Gina McCarthy, 
in her official capacity as Administrator 
of the United States Environmental 
Protection Agency (‘‘EPA’’), failed to 
perform a mandatory duty to respond to 
a 2009 certification by the Department 
of the Interior (‘‘DOI’’) that visibility 
impairment in Minnesota’s Voyageurs 
National Park and Michigan’s Isle 
Royale National Park is reasonably 
attributable to emissions from Xcel 
Energy’s coal-fired Sherburne County 
Generating Station (‘‘Sherco’’) in 
Minnesota. The proposed consent 
decree would establish deadlines for 
EPA to take such action. 
DATES: Written comments on the 
proposed consent decree must be 
received by August 11, 2014. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your comments, 
identified by Docket ID number EPA– 
HQ–OGC–2014–0508 online at 
www.regulations.gov (EPA’s preferred 
method); by email to oei.docket@
epa.gov; by mail to EPA Docket Center, 
Environmental Protection Agency, 
Mailcode: 2822T, 1200 Pennsylvania 
Ave. NW., Washington, DC 20460–0001; 
or by hand delivery or courier to EPA 
Docket Center, EPA West, Room 3334, 
1301 Constitution Ave. NW., 
Washington, DC, between 8:30 a.m. and 
4:30 p.m. Monday through Friday, 
excluding legal holidays. Comments on 
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