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consider these comments in 
determining the appropriate action to be 
taken, but the filing of a comment alone 
will not serve to make the filer a party 
to the proceeding. The Commission’s 
rules require that persons filing 
comments in opposition to the project 
provide copies of their protests only to 
the party or parties directly involved in 
the protest. 

Persons who wish to comment only 
on the environmental review of this 
project should submit an original and 
two copies of their comments to the 
Secretary of the Commission. 
Environmental commenters will be 
placed on the Commission’s 
environmental mailing list, will receive 
copies of the environmental documents, 
and will be notified of meetings 
associated with the Commission’s 
environmental review process. 
Environmental commenters will not be 
required to serve copies of filed 
documents on all other parties. 
However, the non-party commenters 
will not receive copies of all documents 
filed by other parties or issued by the 
Commission (except for the mailing of 
environmental documents issued by the 
Commission) and will not have the right 
to seek court review of the 
Commission’s final order. 

Motions to intervene, protests and 
comments may be filed electronically 
via the internet in lieu of paper; see, 18 
CFR 385.2001(a)(1)(iii) and the 
instructions on the Commission’s Web 
site under the ‘‘e-Filing’’ link. The 
Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filings. 

Comment Date: December 29, 2008. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E8–30928 Filed 12–29–08; 8:45 am] 
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December 19, 2008. 
In accordance with the National 

Environmental Policy Act of 1969 and 
the Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission’s (Commission) 
regulations, 18 CFR Part 380 (Order No. 
486, 52 FR 47897), the Office of Energy 
Projects has reviewed the applications 
for original license for the proposed 

Greenfield Hydroelectric Project No. 
12548–002, Woods Hydroelectric 
Project No. 12540–002, A–Drop 
Hydroelectric Project No. 12549–002, 
and Johnson Hydroelectric Project No. 
12545–002, located on the Greenfields 
Main Canal and Greenfields South 
Canal in Teton and Cascade counties, 
Montana, and has prepared an 
Environmental Assessment (EA) for the 
projects. The projects would be located 
on private lands over which the U.S. 
Bureau of Reclamation holds a 
dominant easement. 

The EA contains the staff’s analysis of 
the potential environmental impacts of 
the projects and concludes that 
licensing the projects, with appropriate 
environmental protective measures, 
would not constitute a major federal 
action that would significantly affect the 
quality of the human environment. 

A copy of the EA is available for 
review at the Commission in the Public 
Reference Room or may be viewed on 
the Commission’s Web site at http:// 
www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket numbers, excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field, to access the document. For 
assistance, contact FERC Online 
Support at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or toll- 
free at 1–866–208–3676, or for TTY, 
(202) 502–8659. 

You may also register online at 
http://www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/ 
esubscription.asp to be notified via e- 
mail of new filings and issuances 
related to these or other pending 
projects. For assistance, contact FERC 
Online Support. 

Any comments should be filed within 
30 days from the date of this notice and 
should be addressed to: Kimberly D. 
Bose, Secretary, Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission, 888 First 
Street, NE., Washington, DC 20426. 
Please affix Project Nos. 12548–002, 
12540–002, 12549–002, and 12545–002 
to all comments. Comments may be 
filed electronically via the Internet in 
lieu of paper. The Commission strongly 
encourages electronic filings. See 18 
CFR 385.2001(a)(1)(iii) and the 
instructions on the Commission’s Web 
site (http://www.ferc.gov) under the ‘‘e- 
Filing’’ link. 

For further information, contact 
Dianne Rodman at (202) 502–6077. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E8–30924 Filed 12–29–08; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket Nos. ER96–1361–013, ER99–2781– 
011, ER98–4138–009, ER00–1770–019, 
ER02–453–010, ER98–3096–015, ER07–903– 
002, ER05–1054–003, ER01–202–008, ER04– 
472–007] 

Atlantic City Electric Company, 
Delmarva Power & Light Company, 
Potomac Electric Power Company, 
Conectiv Energy Supply, Inc., Conectiv 
Atlantic Generation, LLC, Conectiv 
Delmarva, Generation LLC, Conectiv 
Bethlehem, LLC, Pepco Energy 
Services, Inc., Bethlehem Renewable 
Energy, LLC, Eastern Landfill Gas, 
LLC, Potomac Power Resources, LLC, 
Fauquier Landfill Gas, LLC; Notice of 
Filing 

December 22, 2008. 
Take notice that on December 5, 2008, 

Atlantic City Electric Company, 
Delmarva Power & Light Company, 
Potomac Electric Power Company, 
Conectiv Energy Supply, Inc., Conectiv 
Atlantic Generation, LLC, Conectiv 
Delmarva Generation, LLC, Conectiv 
Bethlehem, LLC, Pepco Energy Services, 
Inc., Bethlehem Renewable Energy, LLC, 
Eastern Landfill Gas, LLC, Potomac 
Power Resources, LLC, and Fauquier 
Landfill Gas filed a request for 
continuation of waivers of the affiliate 
restrictions, as previously granted by the 
Commission, pursuant to Order 697. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211, 385.214). 
Protests will be considered by the 
Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed on or before the 
comment date. Anyone filing a motion 
to intervene or protest must serve a copy 
of that document on the Applicant and 
all the parties in this proceeding. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
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