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Associate Director for Science and staff 
promote and support an environment of 
scientific excellence and integrity, and 
the rapid dissemination of scientific 
innovations, technology, and 
information. Activities in support of the 
mission include: (1) Advises the CDC 
Director and Senior Staff on science 
matters and represents CDC in these 
areas to the Department, other agencies, 
and Congress; (2) maintains the integrity 
and productivity of CDC’s scientists by 
resolving controversial scientific issues, 
developing scientific policies and 
procedures, supporting training and 
information exchange, and presenting 
awards for outstanding scientific efforts; 
(3) assures the protection of human 
subjects in public health research; (4) 
integrates behavioral and social sciences 
research into public health research; (5) 
provides advice and guidance on the 
management of intellectual property; 
interprets policies, rules, and 
regulations, especially those related to 
the Federal Technology Transfer Act; (6) 
promotes and facilitates the timely 
transfer of technology, knowledge, 
products, and processes that improve 

public health through the use of patents, 
trademarks, Biological Materials 
Licensing Agreements, and Cooperative 
Research and Development Agreements; 
(7) provides leadership, vision, and 
coordination for CDC Public Health 
Research, both for research conducted 
within CDC and for research conducted 
by external partners and grantees; (8) 
advises the Secretary of HHS and 
Director of CDC about the most 
appropriate use of vaccines and 
immunization practices for effective 
disease control in the population 
through the Advisory Committee for 
Immunization Practices; and (9) 
manages the CDC and ATSDR Specimen 
and Data Bank, an archive of biological 
materials, including blood components, 
tissue, bacterial isolates, DNA, and other 
biological and environmental 
specimens.

Dated: March 8, 2004. 
William H. Gimson, 
Chief Operating Officer, Centers for Disease 
Control and Prevention.
[FR Doc. 04–6874 Filed 3–26–04; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4160–18–M

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Administration for Children and 
Families 

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request 

Title: Quarterly Performance Report, 
ORR–6. 

OMB No.: 0970–0036. 
Description: We ask for the 

information on this form in order to 
determine the effectiveness of the state 
cash and medical assistance, social 
services, and targeted assistance 
programs as required by 412(e) of the 
Immigration and Naturalization Act. We 
also calculate state-by-state Refugee 
Cash Assistance and Refugee Medical 
Assistance utilization rates for use in 
formulating program initiatives, 
priorities, standards, budget requests, 
and assistance policies. The Office of 
Refugee Resettlement (ORR) regulations 
require that this form be completed in 
order to participate in the program. 

Respondents: ORR State Agencies.

ANNUAL BURDEN ESTIMATES 

Instrument Number of
respondents 

Number of
responses per 

respondent 

Average
burden hours 
per response 

Total
burden hours 

ORR–6 ............................................................................................................. 48 4 3.875 744 

Estimated total annual burden hours ....................................................... ........................ ........................ ........................ 744

Additional Information: Copies of the 
proposed collection may be obtained by 
writing to the Administration for 
Children and Families, Office of 
Administration, Offices of Information 
Services, 370 L’Enfant Promenade, SW., 
Washington, DC 20447, Attn: ACF 
Reports Clearance Officer. All requests 
should be identified by the title of the 
information collection. E-mail address: 
grjohnson@acf.hhe.gov.

OMB Comment: OMB is required to 
make a decision concerning the 
collection of information between 30 
and 60 days after publication of this 
document in the Federal Register. 
Therefore, a comment is best assured of 
having its full effect if OMB receives it 
within 30 days of publication. Written 
comments and recommendations for the 
proposed information collection should 
be sent directly to the following: Office 
of Management and Budget, Paperwork 
Reduction Project, Attn: Desk Officer for 

ACF, E-mail address: 
katherine_t._astrich@omb.eop.gov.

Dated: March 22, 2004. 
Robert Sargis, 
Reports Clearance Officer.
[FR Doc. 04–6872 Filed 3–26–04; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4184–01–M

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Administration for Children and 
Families 

Proposed Information Collection 
Activity; Comment Request Proposed 
Projects 

Title: IV–E Foster Care and Adoption 
Financial Report (IV–E–1). 

OMB No.: 0970–0205. 
Description: This form is used by 

states, the District of Columbia and 

Puerto Rico to facilitate the reporting of 
expenditures for the Foster Care and 
Adoption Assistance programs. State 
agencies (including the District of 
Columbia and Puerto Rico) use this form 
to report data on a quarterly basis. The 
form provides specific data regarding 
financial disbursements, obligations and 
estimates. It provides states with a 
mechanism to request grant awards and 
certify the availability of state matching 
funds. Failure to collect this data would 
seriously compromise the 
Administration for Children and 
Families’ (ACF) ability to issue grant 
awards and monitor expenditures. This 
form is also used to prepare the ACF 
budget submission to Congress. ACF is 
implementing the On-Line Data 
Collection System (OLDC) to allow 
grantees the option to electronically 
submit the data. 

Respondents: States, the District of 
Columbia and Puerto Rico.
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ANNUAL BURDEN ESTIMATES 

Instrument Number of 
respondents 

Number of 
responses 

per respond-
ent 

Average bur-
den hours 

per response 

Total burden 
hours 

IV–E–1 ..................................................................................................................... 52 4 25 5200 

Estimated Total Annual Burden 
Hours: 5200. 

In compliance with the requirements 
of section 3506(c)(2)(A) of the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, the 
Administration for Children and 
Families is soliciting public comment 
on the specific aspects of the 
information collection described above. 
Copies of the proposed collection of 
information can be obtained and 
comments may be forwarded by writing 
to the Administration for Children and 
Families, Office of Administration, 
Office of Information Services, 370 
L’Enfant Promenade, SW., Washington, 
DC 20447, Attn: ACF Reports Clearance 
Officer, E-mail address: 
grjohnson@acf.hhs.gov. All requests 
should be identified by the title of the 
information collection. 

The Department specifically requests 
comments on: (a) Whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information shall have 
practical utility; (b) the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information ; (c) 
the quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and (d) 
ways to minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on 
respondents, including through the use 
of automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 
Consideration will be given to 
comments and suggestions submitted 
within 60 days of this publication.

Dated: March 23, 2004. 

Robert Sargis, 
Reports Clearance Officer.
[FR Doc. 04–6922 Filed 3–26–04; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4184–01–M

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Administration for Children and 
Families 

Federal Allotments to State 
Developmental Disabilities Councils 
and Protection and Advocacy Formula 
Grant Programs for Fiscal Year 2005

AGENCY: Administration on 
Developmental Disabilities (ADD), 
Administration for Children and 
Families, Department of Health and 
Human Services.
ACTION: Notification of fiscal year 2005 
Federal allotments to State 
Developmental Disabilities Councils 
and Protection and Advocacy Formula 
Grant programs. 

SUMMARY: This notice sets forth Fiscal 
Year (FY) 2005 individual allotments 
and percentages of the total 
appropriation to States administering 
the State Developmental Disabilities 
Councils and Protection and Advocacy 
programs, pursuant to Section 122 and 
Section 142 of the Developmental 
Disabilities Assistance and Bill of Rights 
Act (Act). The allotment amounts are 
based on the FY 2005 President’s 
Budget request and are contingent on 
congressional appropriations for FY 
2005. If the Congress enacts a different 
appropriation amount in FY 2005, these 
allotments will be adjusted accordingly. 
The State allotments are available on the 
ADD homepage on the Internet: http://
www.acf.hhs.gov/programs/add/.
EFFECTIVE DATE: October 1, 2004.
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Catherine Wade, Grants Fiscal 
Management Specialist, Office of Grants 
Management, Office of Administration, 
Administration for Children and 
Families, telephone (202) 401–5798.
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Section 
122(a)(2) of the Act requires that 
adjustments in the amounts of State 
allotments shall be made not more often 
than annually and that States must be 

notified no less than six (6) months 
before the beginning of the fiscal year in 
which such adjustment is to take effect. 
The Catalog of Federal Domestic 
Assistance (CFDA) number is 93.630. In 
relation to the State Developmental 
Disabilities Council allotments, the 
descriptions of service needs were 
reviewed in the State plans and are 
consistent with the results obtained 
from the data elements and projected 
formula amounts for each State (Section 
122(a)(5)). 

The Administration on 
Developmental Disabilities has updated 
the following data elements for issuance 
of Fiscal Year 2005 allotments for both 
of the Developmental Disabilities 
formula grant programs. 

A. The number of beneficiaries in 
each State and Territory under the 
Childhood Disabilities Beneficiary 
Program are from Table 5.J10 of the 
‘‘Annual Statistical Supplement, 2002, 
to the Social Security Bulletin’’ issued 
by the Social Security Administration; 

B. State data on Average Per Capita 
Income are from Table B—Per Capita 
Personal Income, 1999–2001 of the 
‘‘Survey of Current Business,’’ October, 
2002, issued by the Bureau of Economic 
Analysis, U.S. Department of 
Commerce. The most recent comparable 
data for the Territories were obtained 
from the Department of Commerce 
September 2002; and 

C. State data on Total Population is 
based on ‘‘State Population Estimates: 
July 1, 2003’’ issued December 2003 by 
the U.S. Census Bureau. The State 
working population (ages 18–64) is 
based on the ‘‘Estimate of Resident 
Population of the U.S. by Selected Age 
Groups and Sex, July 1, 2002’’ issued by 
the U.S. Census Bureau. Total 
population estimates for the Territories 
are based on Census 2000 data issued by 
the U.S. Census Bureau. The Territories 
working population is based on 
‘‘Population and Housing Profile: 2000’’ 
issued by the U.S. Census Bureau from 
Census 2000 data.
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