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Right-to-Know Act (‘‘EPCRA’’), 42 
U.S.C. 1101–11050; and Clean Water 
Act (‘‘CWA’’), 33 U.S.C. 1251–1387, and 
their implementing regulations. The 
complaint alleges numerous violations 
of federal and state environmental laws 
that occurred at Defendant’s polyvinyl 
chloride (‘‘PVC’’) manufacturing and 
resin compounding plant, which was 
formerly located at 26000 Springbrook 
Avenue, Saugus, Los Angeles County, 
California (the ‘‘Facility’’). 

Under the proposed Consent Decree, 
all civil claims in the Complaint are 
resolved for the following payments to 
be made by Keysor in Keysor’s Chapter 
11 bankruptcy liquidation proceeding: a 
$307,000 administrative expense 
payment; the allowance of $735,420 
classified as a subordinated allowed 
general unsecured claim; and the 
allowance of $168,855 classified as an 
allowed general unsecured claim. In 
addition, Keysor is subjected to 
injunctive relief, including: cessation of 
discharges of pollutants from the 
Facility; certification that the vinyl 
chloride plant was shut down and will 
not be re-opened; general certification 
that the defendant is currently in 
compliance with all provisions of CAA, 
RCRA, EPCRA, and CWA; and an 
agreement that emission reductions 
resulting from the shutdown of the 
Facility shall not be banked or 
otherwise used as emission reduction 
credits to offset new emissions from 
other facilities in the District. 

The Department of Justice will 
receive, for a period of thirty (30) days 
from the date of this publication, 
comments relating to the Consent 
Decree. Comments should be addressed 
to the Assistant Attorney General, 
Environmental and Natural Resources 
Division, PO Box 7611, U.S. Department 
of Justice, Washington, D.C. 20044–
7611, and should refer to United States 
of America, State of California, and 
South Coast Air Quality Management 
District v. Keysor-Century Corporation, 
DOJ Ref. #90–5–2–1–07856/1. 

The Consent Decree may be examined 
at the Office of the United States 
Attorney, 300 North Los Angeles Street, 
Los Angeles, California 90012, and the 
Region IX Office of the Environmental 
Protection Agency, 75 Hawthorne 
Street, San Francisco, CA 94105. During 
the public comment period, the Consent 
Decree may also be examined on the 
following Department of Justice Web 
site: http://www.usdoj.gov/enrd/
open.html. A copy of the Consent 
Decree may also be obtained by mail 
from the Consent Decree Library, PO 
Box 7611, U.S. Department of Justice, 
Washington, DC 20044–7611, or by 
faxing or e-mailing a request to Tonia 

Fleetwood, tonia.fleetwood@usdoj.gov, 
Fax No. (202) 514–0097, phone 
confirmation number (202) 514–1547. In 
requesting a copy from the Consent 
Decree Library, please enclose a check 
in the amount of $15.50 (25 cents per 
page reproduction cost) payable to the 
U.S. Treasury, to obtain a copy of the 
Consent Decree.

Ellen Mahan, 
Assistant Section Chief, Environmental 
Enforcement Section, Environment and 
Natural Resources Division.
[FR Doc. 04–10840 Filed 5–12–04; 8:45 am] 
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DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

Notice of Lodging of Consent Decree 
Between the United States of America 
v. Koch Industries, Inc., Koch Pipeline 
Company, L.P., and Flint Hill 
Resources, L.P. Under the 
Comprehensive Environmental 
Response, Compensation, and Liability 
Act 

Under 28 CFR 50.7, notice is hereby 
given that on April 29, 2004, a proposed 
Consent Decree (‘‘Consent Decree’’) in 
the case of United States of America v. 
Koch Industries, Inc., Koch Pipeline 
Company, L.P., and Flint Hill 
Resources, L.P., Civil Action No. 6:04–
cv–01134–MLB–KMH, was lodged with 
the United States District Court for the 
District of Kansas. 

The Consent Decree resolves the 
United States’ claims against Koch 
Industries, Inc., Koch Pipeline 
Company, L.P., and Flint Hill 
Resources, L.P., under section 107(a) of 
the Comprehensive Environmental 
Response, Compensation and Liability 
Act (‘‘CERCLA’’) 42 U.S.C. 9607(a), for 
recovery of response costs incurred in 
connection with the 57th and North 
Broadway Superfund Site (‘‘Site’’), near 
Wichita, Kansas. The Consent Decree 
requires Koch Industries to pay 
$250,000 plus 5% of EPA’s response 
costs that exceed $5,097,435. In 
exchange, the Consent Decree grants 
Koch Industries, Inc., Koch Pipeline 
Company, L.P., and Flint Hill 
Resources, L.P. contribution protection 
and covenants not to sue under CERCLA 
Sections 106 and 107, 42 U.S.C. 9606 & 
9607. 

The Department of Justice will receive 
comments relating to the Consent 
Decree for a period of thirty days from 
the date of this publication. Comments 
should be addressed to the Assistant 
Attorney General, Environment and 
Natural Resources Division, PO Box 
7611, U.S. Department of Justice, 
Washington, DC 20044–7611, and 

should refer to United States v. Koch 
Industries, Inc., Koch Pipeline 
Company, L.P. and Flint Hill Resources, 
L.P., D.J. Reference No. 90–11–3–1737. 

The Consent Decree may be examined 
during the public comment period on 
the following Department of Justice Web 
site: http://www.usdoj.gov/enrd/
open.html. A copy of the Consent 
Decree may also be obtained by mail 
from the consent Decree Library, PO 
Box 7611, U.S. Department of Justice, 
Washington, DC 20044–7611, or by 
faxing or e-mailing a request to Tonia 
Fleetwood (tonia.fleetwood@usdoj.gov), 
fax no. (202) 514–0097, phone 
confirmation number (202) 514–1547. In 
requesting a copy from the Consent 
Decree Library, please enclose a check 
in the amount of $725 (25 cents per page 
reproduction cost) payable to the United 
States Treasury for payment.

Robert Maher, 
Assistant Section Chief, Environmental 
Enforcement Section, Environment and 
Natural Resources Division.
[FR Doc. 04–10843 Filed 5–12–04; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4410–15–M

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

Notice of Lodging of Consent Decree 
Under the Comprehensive 
Environmental Response, 
Compensation, and Liability Act 

Notice is hereby given that on April 
16, 2004, an electronic version of a 
proposed consent decree was lodged in 
United States v. Madison County, 
Florida, et al., No. 4:02 CV 215 SPM/
WW (N.D. Fla.). 

In the civil action, the United States 
alleges claims on behalf of the 
Administrator of the Environmental 
Protection Agency (‘‘EPA’’) against 
Madison County, Florida (the ‘‘County’’) 
and the City of Madison, Florida (the 
‘‘City’’) under section 107 of the 
Comprehensive Environmental 
Response, Compensation, and Liability 
Act (‘‘CERCLA’’), 42 U.S.C. 9607, for 
response costs in connection with the 
Madison County Sanitary Landfill 
Superfund Site, in Madison County, 
Florida (the ‘‘Site’’). 

The proposed consent decree requires 
the County and the City to reimburse all 
of EPA’s outstanding past costs of 
$797.19 and to pay future oversight 
costs in connection with oversight of a 
remedial action being performed by the 
County and the City under a unilateral 
administrative order issued by EPA. 

The Department of Justice will receive 
for a period of thirty (30) days from the 
date of this publication comments 
relating to the Consent Decree. 
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Comments should be addressed to the 
Assistant Attorney General, 
Environmental and Natural Resources 
Division, P.O. Box 7611, U.S. 
Department of Justice, Washington, DC 
20044–7611, and should refer to United 
States v. Madison County, Florida, et 
al., No. 4:02 CV 215 SPM/WW (N.D. 
Fla.), DOJ # 90–11–3–1053/1. 

The Consent Decree may be examined 
at the Office of the United States 
Attorney for the Northern District of 
Florida 111 N. Adams Street, 4th Floor, 
Tallahassee, FL 32301. During the 
public comment period, the Consent 
Decree may also be examined on the 
following Department of Justice Web 
site: http://www.usdoj.gov/enrd/
open.html. A copy of the Consent 
Decree may also be obtained by mail 
from the Consent Decree Library, PO 
Box 7611, U.S. Department of Justice, 
Washington, DC 20044–7611, or by 
faxing or e-mailing a request to Tonia 
Fleetwood, tonia.fleetwood@usdoj.gov, 
Fax No. (202) 514–0097, phone 
confirmation number (202) 514–1547. In 
requesting a copy from the Consent 
Decree Library, please enclose a check 
in the amount of $8.50 (25 cents per 
page reproduction cost) payable to the 
U.S. Treasury.

Ellen M. Mahan, 
Assistant Chief, Environmental Enforcement 
Section, Environment and Natural Resources 
Division.
[FR Doc. 04–10838 Filed 5–12–04; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4410–15–M

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

Notice of Lodging of Consent Decree 
Under the Clean Water Act 

Under 28 CFR § 50.7, notice is hereby 
given that on April 27, 2004, a proposed 
Consent Decree in United States and 
State of Louisiana v. City of Monroe, 
Civil Action No. 04–0944 was lodged 
with the United States District Court for 
the Western District of Louisiana. 

In this action the United States, and 
its co-plaintiff the State of Louisiana, 
sought injunctive relief and a civil 
penalty to address sanitary sewer 
overflows and other violations of the 
Clean Water Act and the City of 
Monroe’s National Pollutant Discharge 
Elimination System (‘‘NPDES’’) permit. 
Under the Consent Decree, the City will 
(i) carry out specific projects listed in 
the Consent Decree to upgrade the City’s 
wastewater treatment plant and sewage 
collection system, (ii) identify and make 
other necessary upgrades to City’s sewer 
collection system, (iii) prepare and 
implement a sewage collection system 
preventive maintenance plan, and (iv) 

prepare and implement a sewage 
treatment plant preventive maintenance 
plan. The City will also pay a civil 
penalty of $235,000 ($164,500 to the 
United States and $70,500 to the State) 
and, as a supplemental environmental 
project, spend at least $500,000 
maintaining for five years a public waste 
disposal facility at a boat dock at 
Forsythe Point in Monroe, Louisiana. 

The Department of Justice will receive 
for a period of thirty (30) days from the 
date of this publication comments 
relating to the Consent Decree. 
Comments should be addressed to the 
Assistant Attorney General, 
Environment and Natural Resources 
Division, P.O. Box 7611, U.S. 
Department of Justice, Washington, DC 
20044–7611, and should refer to United 
States v. City of Monroe, D.J. Ref. No. 
90–5–1–1–06820. 

The Consent Decree may be exmained 
during the public comment period on 
the following Department of Justice Web 
site: http://www.usdoi.gov/enrd/
open.html. A copy of the Consent 
Decree may also be obtained by mail 
from the Consent Decree Library, PO 
Box 7611, U.S. Department of Justice, 
Washington, DC 20044–7611 or by 
faxing or e-mailing a request to Tonia 
Fleetwood (tonia.fleetwood@usdoj.gov), 
fax no. (202) 514–0097, phone 
confirmation number (202) 514–1547. In 
requesting a copy from the Consent 
Decree Library, please enclose a check 
in the amount of $16.25 (25 cents per 
page reproduction cost) payable to the 
U.S. Treasury.

Thomas A. Mariani Jr., 
Assistant Section Chief, Environmental 
Enforcement Section, Environment and 
Natural Resources Divison.
[FR Doc. 04–10841 Filed 5–12–04; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4410–15–M

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

Notice of Lodging of Consent Decree 
Under the Comprehensive 
Environmental Response, 
Compensation and Liability Act 

Under 28 CFR 50.7, notice is hereby 
given that on April 28, 2004, a proposed 
consent decree in United States v. 
Precision National Plating Services, Inc., 
Civil Action No. 3:04 CV 936 was 
lodged with the United States District 
Court for the Middle District of 
Pennsylvania. 

In this action the United States sought 
cost recovery for costs incurred in 
connection with the Precision National 
Plating Services Superfund Site (the 
‘‘Site’’), located near Clarks Summit, 
Lackawanna County, Pennsylvania. 

Under the terms of the consent decree, 
the proposed settling defendant would 
pay $800,000 to EPA to cover past 
response costs. 

The Department of Justice will receive 
for a period of thirty (30) days from the 
date of this publication comments 
relating to the consent decree. 
Comments should be addressed to the 
Assistant Attorney General, 
Environment and Natural Resources 
Division, PO box 7611, U.S. Department 
of Justice, Washington, DC 20044–7611, 
and should refer to United States v. 
Precision National Plating Services, Inc., 
Civil Action No. 3:04 CV 936, D.J. Ref. 
90–11–3–07298. 

The consent decree may be examined 
at the Office of the United States 
Attorney, Suite 311, 235 N. Washington 
Avenue, Scranton, Pennsylvania 18503, 
and at U.S. EPA Region III, 1650 Arch 
Street, Philadelphia, Pennsylvania 
19103–2029. A copy of the consent 
decree may also be examined on the 
following Department of Justice Web 
site, http://www.usdoj.gov/enrd/
open.html. A copy of the consent decree 
may also be obtained by mail from the 
Consent Decree Library, PO Box 7611, 
U.S. Department of Justice, Washington, 
DC 20044–7611 or by faxing or e-
mailing a request to Tonia Fleetwood 
(tonia.fleetwood@usdoj.gov), fax no. 
(202) 514–0097, phone confirmation 
number (202) 514–1547. In requesting a 
copy of the consent decree, please 
enclose a check in the amount of $5.00 
(25 cents per page reproduction cost) 
payable to the U.S. Treasury.

Robert Brook, 
Assistant Section Chief, Environmental 
Enforcement Section, Environment and 
Natural Resources Division.
[FR Doc. 04–10839 Filed 5–12–04; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4410–15–M

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

Notice of Lodging of a Consent Decree 
Under the Clean Air Act 

Under 28 CFR 50.7, notice is hereby 
given that on April 28, 2004, a proposed 
Consent Decree in United States v. 
Manufacturing Company, Civil Action 
No. 4:04CV495–JCH was lodged with 
the United States District Court for the 
Eastern District of Missouri. 

The complaint alleges that True 
violated the Clean Air Act in the (1) 
construction and operation of various 
modifications at its refrigeration 
manufacturing plant without obtaining a 
construction/operation permit as 
required by the federally approved 
Missouri New Source Review (‘‘NSR’’) 
Rules, codified at Rule 10 CSR 10–6.060 
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