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on the registration review case have 
been completed. 

Authority: 7 U.S.C. 136 et seq. 

Dated: January 8, 2016. 
Michael Goodis, 
Acting Director, Pesticide Re-Evaluation 
Division, Office of Pesticide Programs. 
[FR Doc. 2016–00849 Filed 1–19–16; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[FRL–9941–45–OARM] 

Good Neighbor Environmental Board; 
Notification of Public Advisory 
Committee Meeting 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice of Public Advisory 
Committee Meeting. 

SUMMARY: Pursuant to the Federal 
Advisory Committee Act, Public Law 
92–463, notice is hereby given that the 
Good Neighbor Environmental Board 
will hold a public meeting on 
Wednesday, February 10 and Thursday, 
February 11, 2016 in Brownsville, TX. 
The meeting is open to the public. 
DATES: The Good Neighbor 
Environmental Board will hold an open 
meeting on Wednesday, February 10 
from 9:00 a.m. (registration at 8:30 a.m.) 
to 5:30 p.m. The following day, 
Thursday, February 11, the Board will 
meet from 8:30 a.m. (registration at 8:00 
a.m.) until 2:00 p.m. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Background: The Good Neighbor 
Environmental Board (Board) is a 
federal advisory committee chartered 
under the Federal Advisory Committee 
Act, PL 92463. By statute, the Board is 
required to submit an annual report to 
the President and Congress on 
environmental and infrastructure issues 
along the U.S. border with Mexico. 

Purpose of Meeting: The purpose of 
this meeting is to begin discussion on 
the Good Neighbor Environmental 
Board’s Seventeenth Report. The report 
will focus on climate change resiliency 
in the U.S.-Mexico border region. 
ADDRESSES: The meeting will be held at 
the Ringgold Civic Pavilion, 501 E 
Ringgold St., Brownsville, TX 78520. 
The number is (956) 547–6850. The 
meeting is open to the public, with 
limited seating on a first-come, first- 
serve basis. 

General Information: The agenda will 
be available at http://www2.epa.gov/
faca/gneb. General information about 
the Board can be found on its Web site 

at http://www2.epa.gov/faca/gneb. If 
you wish to make oral comments or 
submit written comments to the Board, 
please contact Ann-Marie Gantner at 
least five days prior to the meeting. 
Written comments should be submitted 
Ann-Marie Gantner at gantner.ann- 
marie@epa.gov. 

Meeting Access: For information on 
access or services for individuals with 
disabilities, please contact Ann-Marie 
Gantner at (202) 564–4330 or email at 
gantner.ann-marie@epa.gov. To request 
accommodation of a disability, please 
contact Ann-Marie Gantner at least 10 
days prior to the meeting to give EPA as 
much time as possible to process your 
request. 

Dated: January 11, 2016. 
Ann-Marie Gantner, 
Acting Designated Federal Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2016–01018 Filed 1–19–16; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS 
COMMISSION 

[OMB 3060–1185] 

Information Collection Being Reviewed 
by the Federal Communications 
Commission 

AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: As part of its continuing effort 
to reduce paperwork burdens, and as 
required by the Paperwork Reduction 
Act (PRA) of 1995 (44 U.S.C. 3501– 
3520), the Federal Communications 
Commission (FCC or the Commission) 
invites the general public and other 
Federal agencies to take this 
opportunity to comment on the 
following information collection. 
Comments are requested concerning: 
Whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
Commission, including whether the 
information shall have practical utility; 
the accuracy of the Commission’s 
burden estimate; ways to enhance the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information collected; ways to minimize 
the burden of the collection of 
information on the respondents, 
including the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology; and ways to 
further reduce the information 
collection burden on small business 
concerns with fewer than 25 employees. 
The FCC may not conduct or sponsor a 
collection of information unless it 

displays a currently valid control 
number. No person shall be subject to 
any penalty for failing to comply with 
a collection of information subject to the 
PRA that does not display a valid Office 
of Management and Budget (OMB) 
control number. 
DATES: Written PRA comments should 
be submitted on or before March 21, 
2016. If you anticipate that you will be 
submitting comments, but find it 
difficult to do so within the period of 
time allowed by this notice, you should 
advise the contact listed below as soon 
as possible. 
ADDRESSES: Direct all PRA comments to 
Cathy Williams, FCC, via email PRA@
fcc.gov and to Cathy.Williams@fcc.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
additional information about the 
information collection, contact Cathy 
Williams at (202) 418–2918. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

OMB Control Number: 3060–1185. 
Title: Annual Report for Mobility 

Fund Phase I Support, FCC Form 690 
and Record Retention Requirements. 

Form Number: FCC Form 690. 
Respondents: Business or other for- 

profit entities, not-for-profit institutions, 
and state, local or tribal government. 

Number of Respondents and 
Responses: 34 respondents; 880 
responses. 

Estimated Time per Response: 1–18 
hours. 

Frequency of Response: Annual 
reporting requirement and 
recordkeeping requirement. 

Obligation to Respond: Required to 
obtain or retain benefits. The statutory 
authority for this information collection 
is contained in 47 U.S.C. 154, 254 and 
303(r) of the Communications Act of 
1934, as amended. 

Total Annual Burden: 15,874 hours. 
Total Annual Cost: No cost. 
Privacy Impact Assessment: No 

impact(s). 
Nature and Extent of Confidentiality: 

There is no need for confidentiality. The 
information collected on FCC Form 690 
will be made available for public 
inspection. Applicants may request 
materials or information submitted to 
the Commission be given confidential 
treatment under 47 CFR 0.459 of the 
Commission’s rules. 

Needs and Uses: The Commission 
uses the information contained in this 
collection to ensure that each winning 
bidder is meeting its obligations for 
receiving Mobility Fund Phase I 
support. On November 18, 2011, the 
Federal Communications Commission 
released a Report and Order in the 
Universal Service Fund & Intercarrier 
Compensation Transformation Order 
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